Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> <Quote: Q011790>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* ADIDAS, STYLE #71 [2B No Bid $17.98 No Bid
<1.000> $17.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #21 [2B No Bid $22.48 No Bid
<2.000> $22.48
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #14 [2B No Bid $28.80 No Bid
<3.000> $28.80
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $32.48 No Bid
<4.000> $32.48
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #14 [2B No Bid $23.45 No Bid
<5.000> $23.45
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #14 [2B No Bid $23.45 No Bid
<6.000> $23.45
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $36.98 No Bid
<7.000> $36.98
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #32 [2B No Bid $9.98 No Bid
<8.000> $9.98
PACK 1.0 NB NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> <Quote: Q011790>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $39.24 No Bid
<9.000> $39.24
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $28.80 No Bid
<10.000> $28.80
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $39.24 No Bid
<11.000> $39.24
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $52.45 No Bid
<12.000> $52.45
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #71 [2B No Bid $88.45 No Bid
<13.000> $88.45
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #26 [2B No Bid $59.24 No Bid
<14.000> $59.24
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $31.98 No Bid
<15.000> $31.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #14 [2B No Bid $17.98 No Bid
<16.000> $17.98
PR 1.0 NB NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> <Quote: Q011790>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* ADIDAS, STYLE #21 [2B No Bid $16.98 No Bid
<17.000> $16.98
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #17 [2B No Bid $16.98 No Bid
<18.000> $16.98
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $16.98 No Bid
<19.000> $16.98
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #20 [2B No Bid $16.98 No Bid
<20.000> $16.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #33 [2B No Bid $9.98 No Bid
<21.000> $9.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #33 [2B No Bid $10.48 No Bid
<22.000> $10.48
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $28.80 No Bid
<23.000> $28.80
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #14 [2B No Bid $23.48 No Bid
<24.000> $23.48
EA 1.0 NB NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> <Quote: Q011790>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* ADIDAS, STYLE #14 [2B No Bid $28.80 No Bid
<25.000> $28.80
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #14 [2B No Bid $23.48 No Bid
<26.000> $23.48
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #20 [2B No Bid $16.24 No Bid
<27.000> $16.24
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $44.24 No Bid
<28.000> $44.24
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $30.98 No Bid
<29.000> $30.98
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $44.24 No Bid
<30.000> $44.24
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $30.98 No Bid
<31.000> $30.98
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $39.24 No Bid
<32.000> $39.24
EA 1.0 NB NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> <Quote: Q011790>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $34.48 No Bid
<33.000> $34.48
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $39.24 No Bid
<34.000> $39.24
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $28.80 No Bid
<35.000> $28.80
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $34.48 No Bid
<36.000> $34.48
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $24.98 No Bid
<37.000> $24.98
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $34.48 No Bid
<38.000> $34.48
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $31.98 No Bid
<39.000> $31.98
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $36.98 No Bid
<40.000> $36.98
EA 1.0 NB NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> <Quote: Q011790>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* ADIDAS, STYLE #33 [2B No Bid $36.98 No Bid
<41.000> $36.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $36.98 No Bid
<42.000> $36.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $36.98 No Bid
<43.000> $36.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $30.98 No Bid
<44.000> $30.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $30.98 No Bid
<45.000> $30.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $30.98 No Bid
<46.000> $30.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $23.45 No Bid
<47.000> $23.45
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $23.45 No Bid
<48.000> $23.45
EA 1.0 NB NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> <Quote: Q011790>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $23.45 No Bid
<49.000> $23.45
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $23.45 No Bid
<50.000> $23.45
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $23.45 No Bid
<51.000> $23.45
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $32.48 No Bid
<52.000> $32.48
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $32.48 No Bid
<53.000> $32.48
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $32.48 No Bid
<54.000> $32.48
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $28.80 No Bid
<55.000> $28.80
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $28.80 No Bid
<56.000> $28.80
EA 1.0 NB NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $28.80 No Bid
<57.000> $28.80
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $28.80 No Bid
<58.000> $28.80
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $28.80 No Bid
<59.000> $28.80
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $31.98 No Bid
<60.000> $31.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #16 [2B No Bid $31.98 No Bid
<61.000> $31.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #35 [2B No Bid $17.24 No Bid
<62.000> $17.24
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #32 [2B No Bid $9.98 No Bid
<63.000> $9.98
PK 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #32 [2B No Bid $9.98 No Bid
<64.000> $9.98
PK 1.0 NB NB

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C  (015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790> <Quote: Q011792> <Quote: Q012194>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* ADIDAS, STYLE #32 [2B No Bid $9.48 No Bid No Bid
<65.000> $9.48
PK 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #32 [2B No Bid $9.48 No Bid No Bid
<66.000> $9.48
PK 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #32 [2B No Bid $9.48 No Bid No Bid
<67.000> $9.48
PK 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #32 [2B No Bid $7.49 No Bid No Bid
<68.000> $7.49
PK 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #32 [2B No Bid $7.49 No Bid No Bid
<69.000> $7.49
PK 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #32 [2B No Bid $7.49 No Bid No Bid
<70.000> $7.49
PK 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STYLE #21 [2B No Bid $21.25 No Bid No Bid
<71.000> $21.25
EA 1.0 NB NB
* DON ALLESON, MESH [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<72.000>
PR 1.0 NB NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C  (015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
Info: <Quote: Q011788> <Quote: Q011790> <Quote: Q011792> <Quote: Q012194>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* ASICS TF37/36 5" [2BP( No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<73.000>
PR 1.0 NB NB NB
* ASICS TF31/30 MEN [2B No Bid $26.98 No Bid No Bid
<74.000> $26.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ASICS YT78/YB48 W [2E No Bid $64.24 No Bid No Bid
<75.000> $64.24
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ASICS TF29 WOMENS [; No Bid $25.98 No Bid No Bid
<76.000> $25.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* ASICS YT65 YB65 M [2B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<77.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* ASICS YB66 TEARAW [2 No Bid $24.98 No Bid No Bid
<78.000> $24.98
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ASICS GB62 APTITU [2E No Bid $16.98 No Bid No Bid
<79.000> $16.98
EA 1.0 NB NB
* BASEBALL SOCKS, T [2 No Bid $46.00 No Bid No Bid
<80.000> $46.00
Dz 1.0 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI
Info: <Quote: Q011788>

Item Info:

* BASKETBALL, GIRLS [2I No Bid

<81.000>

EA 1.0 NB
* BASKETBALL, GIRLS [2I No Bid

<82.000>

EA 1.0 NB
* BASKETBALL, GIRLS [2I No Bid

<83.000>

PR 1.0 NB
* BASKETBALL, SNAP- [2 No Bid

<84.000>

PR 1.0 NB
* BASKETBALL, PULLO [2 No Bid

<85.000>

EA 1.0 NB
* BASKETBALL, PULLO [z No Bid

<86.000>

EA 1.0 NB
* BASKETBALL, OVERS [ No Bid

<87.000>

EA 1.0 NB
* BASKETBALL, OVERS [ No Bid

<88.000>

EA 1.0

NB

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011789>

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011790>

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI
Info: <Quote: Q011788>

Item Info:

* BASKETBALL, OVERS [ No Bid

<89.000>

PR 1.0 NB
* CAP, RICHARDSON P [2 No Bid

<90.000>

EA 1.0 NB
** CAP, BASEBALL, NE [2E No Bid

<91.000>

EA 1.0 NB
** CAP, BASEBALL, NE [2E No Bid

<92.000>

EA 1.0 NB
** CAP, BASEBALL, NE [2E No Bid

<93.000>

EA 1.0 NB
** CAP, BASEBALL, NE [2E No Bid

<94.000>

EA 1.0 NB
* CAP, BASEBALL RIC [2E No Bid

<95.000>

EA 1.0 NB
* CAP, BASEBALL, RI [2BI No Bid

<96.000>

EA 1.0

NB

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011789>

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011790>

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C  (015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790> <Quote: Q011792> <Quote: Q012194>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* CHAMPION BRAND LF [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<97.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* CHAMPION T-SHIRTS [2 No Bid $4.78 No Bid No Bid
<98.000> $4.78
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* CHAMPION T-SHIRTS [2 No Bid $4.98 No Bid No Bid
<99.000> $4.98
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* CHAMPION T-SHIRTS [2 No Bid $5.50 No Bid No Bid
<100.000> $5.50
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* CHAMPION "PDJ" WH [2 No Bid $33.00 No Bid No Bid
<101.000> $33.00
Dz 1.0 NB NB
* CHAMPION "PDJ" WH [2 No Bid $33.00 No Bid No Bid
<102.000> $33.00
Dz 1.0 NB NB
* CHAMPION "PDJ" WH [2 No Bid $33.00 No Bid No Bid
<103.000> $33.00
Dz 1.0 NB NB
* CHAMPION "1/4" WH [2E No Bid $36.00 No Bid No Bid
<104.000> $36.00
Dz 1.0 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI
Info: <Quote: Q011788>

Item Info:
* CHAMPION "1/4" WH [2E No Bid
<105.000>
Dz 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION "1/4" WH [2E No Bid
<106.000>
Dz 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION SHORTS, [: No Bid
<107.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION SHORTS, [: No Bid
<108.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION REVERSE | No Bid
<109.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION REVERSE | No Bid
<110.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION REVERSE | No Bid
<111.000>
PR 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION POWERBLE No Bid

<112.000>

EA 1.0

NB

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011789>

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011790>

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

$36.00 No Bid No Bid
$36.00

NB NB
$36.00 No Bid No Bid
$36.00

NB NB
$11.00 No Bid No Bid
$11.00

NB NB
$12.00 No Bid No Bid
$12.00

NB NB
$17.00 No Bid No Bid
$17.00

NB NB
$19.00 No Bid No Bid
$19.00

NB NB
$17.00 No Bid No Bid
$17.00

NB NB
$10.50 No Bid No Bid
$10.50

NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* CHAMPION POWERBLE No Bid
<113.000>
PR 1.0
* CHAMPION POWERBLE No Bid
<114.000>
PR 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION, JERSEY [2 No Bid
<115.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION, JERSEY [2 No Bid
<116.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION REVERSE | No Bid $24.72
<117.000> $24.72
EA 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION REVERSE | No Bid $26.72
<118.000> $26.72
EA 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION POWERBLE No Bid
<119.000>
EA 1.0
* CHAMPION POWERBLE No Bid

<120.000>

EA 1.0

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011790>

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

$11.00 No Bid No Bid
$11.00
NB NB
$11.50 No Bid No Bid
$11.50
NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid
NB NB
No Bid No Bid
NB NB
$13.50 No Bid No Bid
$13.50
* NB NB
$15.00 No Bid No Bid
$15.00
NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* CHAMPION W053 MES | No Bid $11.44
<121.000> $11.44
PR 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION W053 LON [ No Bid $12.44
<122.000> $12.44
PR 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION P1048 RE [2 No Bid
<123.000>
PR 1.0
* CHAMPION REVERSE | No Bid
<124.000>
PR 1.0
* CHAMPION REVESE W No Bid
<125.000>
EA 1.0
* CHAMPION REVERSE | No Bid
<126.000>
EA 1.0
* CHAMPION WO053 6" [2E No Bid $11.44
<127.000> $11.44
PR 1.0 NB
* CHAMPION WO053 8" [2E No Bid $12.44
<128.000> $12.44
PR 1.0 NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011790>

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid No Bid
NB NB
No Bid No Bid
NB NB
$17.00 No Bid No Bid
$17.00
* NB NB
$17.00 No Bid No Bid
$17.00
* NB NB
$17.00 No Bid No Bid
$17.00
* NB NB
$22.00 No Bid No Bid
$22.00
* NB NB
No Bid No Bid
NB NB
No Bid No Bid
NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C  (015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790> <Quote: Q011792> <Quote: Q012194>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* CHAMPION S2000 CO [: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<129.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* CHAMPION S2110 CO [: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<130.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* CHAMPION SPANDEX/ | No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid
<131.000> $16.00
EA 1.0 NB NB
* CHEERLEADING, VAR [; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<132.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* CHEERLEADING, VAR [; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<133.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* CHEERLEADING, VAR [; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<134.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* DELTA TEE SHIRT, [2Bl No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid
<135.000> $1.75
EA 1.0 * NB NB
* DELTA TEE SHIRT, [2BI No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid
<136.000> $4.00
EA 1.0 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI
Info: <Quote: Q011788>

Item Info:
* DELTA TEE SHIRT, [2BI No Bid
<137.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* DELTA TEE SHIRT, [2BI No Bid
<138.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* FOOTBALL, RUSSELL [Z No Bid
<139.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* FOOTBALL, RUSSELL [Z No Bid
<140.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* FOOTBALL, RUSSELL [Z No Bid
<141.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* FOOTBALL, RUSSELL [Z No Bid
<142.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* FOOTBALL, RUSSELL [Z No Bid
<143.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* FOOTBALL, RUSSELL [Z No Bid

<144.000>

PR 1.0

NB

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011789>

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011790>

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

$4.00 No Bid No Bid
$4.00
NB NB
$5.00 No Bid No Bid
$5.00
NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI
Info: <Quote: Q011788>

Item Info:
* FOOTBALL, RUSSELL [Z No Bid
<145.000>
PR 1.0 NB
* FOOTBALL, RUSSELL [Z No Bid
<146.000>
PR 1.0 NB
* FOOTBALL PRACTICE [ No Bid
<147.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* HAYNES, AMERICAN [2 No Bid
<148.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* MCDAVID LINED RAC [2 No Bid
<149.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* MESH, SCRIMMAGE V [ No Bid
<150.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* MJSOFEE 11.5 OZ. [2B} No Bid
<151.000>
SET 1.0 NB
* MJSOFEE 11.5 OZ. [2B} No Bid

<152.000>

SET 1.0

NB

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011789>

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR

<Quote: Q011790>

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C  (015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790> <Quote: Q011792> <Quote: Q012194>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* MJSOFEE 11.5 OZ. [2BH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<153.000>
SET 10 NB NB NB
* MJSOFEE 11.5 OZ. [2BH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<154.000>
SET 10 NB NB NB
* MJSOFEE 11.5 OZ. [2BH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<155.000>
SET 10 NB NB NB
* MJSOFEE 11.5 OZ. [2BH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<156.000>
SET 10 NB NB NB
* MIZUNO NATIONAL J [2 No Bid $26.49 $31.00 No Bid
<157.000> $26.49 $31.00
EA 10 NB NB
* MIZUNO LOW RIDER [2 No Bid $14.44 $17.00 No Bid
<158.000> $14.44 $17.00
PR 10 NB NB
* MIZUNO AVALANCHE [ No Bid $26.49 $32.00 No Bid
<159.000> $26.49 $32.00
EA 10 NB NB
* MIZUNO AVALANCHE [ No Bid $24.48 $29.00 No Bid
<160.000> $24.48 $29.00
PR 10 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* MIZUNO HOODIE WAR | No Bid $29.89 $33.00
<161.000> $29.89 $33.00
EA 1.0 NB
* MIZUNO KNEE HI SO [2| No Bid $12.88 $14.00
<162.000> $12.88 $14.00
PK 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM PASS RU [2 No Bid No Bid
<163.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM PASS RU [2 No Bid No Bid
<164.000>
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM PASS RU [2 No Bid No Bid
<165.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM TOUCHBA [ No Bid No Bid
<166.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM OPEN FI [2E No Bid No Bid
<167.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM FIELD D [2B No Bid No Bid
<168.000>
EA 1.0 NB

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790>

Item Info: <Quote: Q011789>
* NIKE COACHES L/S [2E No Bid No Bid
<169.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM STRONG [2 No Bid No Bid
<170.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE VINTAGE WOOL [Z No Bid No Bid
<171.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM DRI FIT [2B} No Bid No Bid
<172.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE CLIMA-FIT RA [2B} $41.70 No Bid $38.00
<173.000> $41.70 $38.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE CLIMA-FIT RA [2B} $29.20 No Bid $27.00
<174.000> $29.20 $27.00
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE CHAMPIONSHIP [Z $39.40 No Bid $29.75
<175.000> $39.40 $29.75
EA 1.0 NB *
* NIKE CHAMPIONSHIP [Z $31.65 No Bid $24.75
<176.000> $31.65 $24.75
PR 1.0 NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790>

Item Info: <Quote: Q011789>
* NIKE CHAMPIONSHIP [Z $33.20 No Bid $30.50
<177.000> $33.20 $30.50
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE PLAYER JACKE [2 $59.70 No Bid $54.00
<178.000> $59.70 $54.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE STAFF LINED [2BI $34.60 No Bid $32.00
<179.000> $34.60 $32.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE STAFF UNLINE [2E $29.20 No Bid $25.00
<180.000> $29.20 $25.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE SWEATER VEST [. $34.60 No Bid $32.00
<181.000> $34.60 $32.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE TWILL PANT, [2BF $39.00 No Bid $34.00
<182.000> $39.00 $34.00
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE TWILL SHORT, [2E $34.00 No Bid $27.00
<183.000> $34.00 $27.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE DRI FIT COLO [2BI $35.30 No Bid $34.00
<184.000> $35.30 $34.00
EA 1.0 NB

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790>

tem Info: <Quote: Q011789>
* NIKE POWER SWEEP | $29.20 No Bid $26.00
<185.000> $20.20 $26.00
EA 10 NB
* NIKE PIQUE POLO, [2B $24.80 No Bid $20.00
<186.000> $24.80 $20.00
EA 10 NB
* NIKE WOMEN~'S DRI [2 $29.20 No Bid $25.00
<187.000> $20.20 $25.00
EA 10 NB
* NIKE HOODED FLEEC [ $32.10 No Bid $27.00
<188.000> $32.10 $27.00
EA 10 NB
* NIKE FLEECE PANT, [2E $26.40 No Bid $22.00
<189.000> $26.40 $22.00
PR 10 NB
* NIKE FLEECE PANT, [2E $24.80 No Bid $21.00
<190.000> $24.80 $21.00
PR 10 NB
* NIKE DRI FIT LONG [2BI $23.65 No Bid $20.00
<191.000> $23.65 $20.00
EA 10 NB
* NIKE DRI-FIT SHOR [2B $22.55 No Bid $18.00
<192.000> $22.55 $18.00
EA 10 NB

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790>

Item Info: <Quote: Q011789>
* NIKE LONG SLEEVE [2I $20.60 No Bid $15.00
<193.000> $20.60 $15.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE 5.8 OZ NIKE [2BPt¢ $9.45 No Bid $8.00
<194.000> $9.45 $8.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE 5.5 OZ NIKE [2BPt¢ No Bid No Bid $4.40
<195.000> $4.40
EA 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE DRI-FIT BRA [2BP $20.60 No Bid $17.00
<196.000> $20.60 $17.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE REVERSIBLE M [2 $17.85 No Bid $14.00
<197.000> $17.85 $14.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE BIG AND BAGG [2I $18.20 No Bid $15.00
<198.000> $18.20 $15.00
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE WOMEN~'S REVE $17.85 No Bid $15.00
<199.000> $17.85 $15.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE DRI-FIT POCK [2BI $24.80 No Bid $20.00
<200.000> $24.80 $20.00
PR 1.0 NB

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790>

Item Info: <Quote: Q011789>
* NIKE TEAM SWOOSH [ $12.30 No Bid $9.50
<201.000> $12.30 $9.50
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM CAMPUS [2 $9.35 No Bid $7.30
<202.000> $9.35 $7.30
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM VISOR, [2B $9.35 No Bid $7.30
<203.000> $9.35 $7.30
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM KNIT CA [2E $7.90 No Bid $6.00
<204.000> $7.90 $6.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM DRI-FIT [2BI $9.70 No Bid $9.00
<205.000> $9.70 $9.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE TEAM DRI-FIT [2BI $12.30 No Bid $9.50
<206.000> $12.30 $9.50
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE CREW SOCK, # [2I $26.30 No Bid
<207.000> $26.30
PK 1.0
* NIKE QUARTER SOCK [ $23.40 No Bid
<208.000> $23.40
PK 1.0

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
$18.90 No Bid
$18.90
NB
$16.05 No Bid
$16.05

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790>

Item Info: <Quote: Q011789>
* NIKE PRO DRI FIT [2BP $17.40 No Bid $15.00
<209.000> $17.40 $15.00
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE PRO DRI FIT [2BP $25.80 No Bid $23.00
<210.000> $25.80 $23.00
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE PRO DRI FIT [2BP $22.80 No Bid $20.00
<211.000> $22.80 $20.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE PRO DRI FIT [2BP $31.35 No Bid $28.00
<212.000> $31.35 $28.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE CLASSIC LONG [2 No Bid No Bid $27.00
<213.000> $27.00
EA 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE CLASSIC TEAR [2t No Bid No Bid $27.00
<214.000> $27.00
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE LEXINGTON GA [2 No Bid No Bid
<215.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE LEXINGTON GA [2 No Bid No Bid
<216.000>
PR 1.0 NB

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid No Bid
NB NB
No Bid No Bid
NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790>

Item Info: <Quote: Q011789>
* NIKE STORRS SHOOT [ No Bid No Bid
<217.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE BRASILIA JER [2BI $28.30 No Bid $23.00
<218.000> $28.30 $23.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE BRASILIA SHO [2B $19.30 No Bid $16.00
<219.000> $19.30 $16.00
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE PARK L/S JER [2BI $21.20 No Bid $17.00
<220.000> $21.20 $17.00
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE VAPOR GOALKE [: $33.65 No Bid
<221.000> $33.65
EA 1.0
* NIKE PARK SOCK, # [2B $4.35 No Bid No Bid
<222.000> $4.35
PK 1.0 NB
* NIKE PARK SOCK, # [2B $4.35 No Bid No Bid
<223.000> $4.35
PK 1.0 NB
* NIKE CHAMPION WAR [ $39.40 No Bid
<224.000> $39.40
EA 1.0 NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid No Bid
NB NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO

Item Info: <Quote: Q011789>
* NIKE CHAMPION WAR [ $31.65 No Bid
<225.000> $31.65
PR 1.0
* NIKE SPHERE RAIN [2E $77.50 No Bid
<226.000> $77.50
EA 1.0
* NIKE PIQUE POLO, [2B $24.80 No Bid
<227.000> $24.80
EA 1.0
* NIKE PENNIES, VES [2B $5.80 No Bid
<228.000> $5.80
EA 1.0
* NIKE PENNIES, VES [2B $5.80 No Bid
<229.000> $5.80
EA 1.0
* NIKE PENNIES, VES [2B $5.80 No Bid
<230.000> $5.80
EA 1.0
* NIKE CAPTAIN BAND [2 No Bid No Bid
<231.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* NIKE HOODED, #NFL [2 $32.10 No Bid
<232.000> $32.10
EA 1.0

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011790>

No Bid

$25.00
$25.00

$64.00
$64.00

$17.00
$17.00

$4.00
$4.00

$4.00
$4.00

$4.00
$4.00

NB

$25.65
$25.65

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$24.25
$24.25

NB

$17.40
$17.40

NB

NB

NB

NB

$23.95
$23.95

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

* NIKE SOCCER TRAIN [2
<233.000>
EA 1.0
* NIKE PROMO T-SHIR [2
<234.000>
EA 1.0
* REVERSIBLE MESH T [2
<235.000>
EA 1.0
* RUSSELL, ATHLETIC [2I
<236.000>
EA 1.0
* RUSSELL, MEN~'S MI [2
<237.000>
PR 1.0
* RUSSELL, MEN~'S ME [.
<238.000>
PR 1.0
* RUSSELL, WOMEN~'S |
<239.000>
PR 1.0
* RUSSELL, WOMEN~'S |

<240.000>

PR 1.0

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI
<Quote: Q011788>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$8.65
$8.65

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(000929) GROGAN

MARCIANO

<Quote: Q011789>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

$11.88
$11.88

$3.54
$3.54

NB

NB

$13.30
$13.30

NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011790>

$7.60
$7.60
$4.40
$4.40

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid

NB

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011792>

No Bid
NB
$3.95
$3.95

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI
Info: <Quote: Q011788>

Item Info:
* RUSSELL, FOOTBALL [z No Bid
<241.000>
PR 1.0 NB
* RUSSELL, WHITE CR [2 No Bid
<242.000>
Dz 1.0 NB
* RUSSELL, WHITE CR [2 No Bid
<243.000>
Dz 1.0 NB
* RUSSELL, ATHLETIC [2I No Bid
<244.000>
PR 1.0 NB
* SWIMMING, WOMEN~'S No Bid
<245.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* SWIMMING, MEN~'S L [Z No Bid
<246.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* SWIMMING, MEN~'S L [Z No Bid
<247.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* SWIMMING, WOMEN~'S No Bid

<248.000>

EA 1.0

NB

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011789>

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011790>

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI
Info: <Quote: Q011788>

Item Info:
* SWIMMING, MEN~'S P [ No Bid
<249.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* UNDER ARMOR FULL [ No Bid
<250.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* UNDER ARMOR SLEEV No Bid
<251.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* UNDER ARMOR SHORT No Bid
<252.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* UNDER ARMOR MOCK No Bid
<253.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* UNDER ARMOR GRIPP No Bid
<254.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* UNDER ARMOR MEN~'¢ No Bid
<255.000>
PR 1.0 NB
* UNDER ARMOR WOMEI No Bid

<256.000>

PR 1.0

NB

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011789>

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011790>

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011792>

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT

<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB
$17.00 $14.90 No Bid
$17.00 $14.90
* NB
$16.50 $14.65 No Bid
$16.50 $14.65
* NB
$16.00 $14.00 No Bid
$16.00 $14.00
* NB
$34.00 $29.25 No Bid
$34.00 $29.25
NB
No Bid $22.40 No Bid
$22.40
NB NB
$32.00 $27.70 No Bid
$32.00 $27.70
* NB
$32.00 $27.70 No Bid
$32.00 $27.70
NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

* UNDER ARMOR SNOW
<257.000>
EA 1.0
* UNDER ARMOR CREW
<258.000>
EA 1.0
* UNDER ARMOR BRANC
<259.000>
EA 1.0
* UNDER ARMOR BRANC
<260.000>
EA 1.0
* UNDER ARMOR BRANC
<261.000>
EA 1.0
* UNDER ARMOR COMPF
<262.000>
PR 1.0
* VOLLEYBALL, NIKE [2B
<263.000>
PR 1.0
* VOLLEYBALL, NIKE [2B

<264.000>

PR 1.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI
<Quote: Q011788>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011789>

$32.79
$32.79

$26.79
$26.79

$26.79
$26.79

$18.46
$18.46

$16.71
$16.71

$13.66
$13.66

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011790>

$37.00
$37.00

$32.00
$32.00

$34.00
$34.00

$24.00
$24.00

$20.50
$20.50

$17.00
$17.00

NB

NB

No Bid

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011792>

$32.10
$32.10

$27.70
$27.70

$29.25
$29.25

$17.80
$17.80

$14.90
$14.90

$14.90
$14.90

$15.00
$15.00

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C  (015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
Info: <Quote: Q011788> MARCIANO <Quote: Q011790> <Quote: Q011792> <Quote: Q012194>
<Quote: Q011789>
Item Info:
* VOLLEYBALL, NIKE [2B No Bid No Bid $20.00 No Bid
<265.000> $20.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* VOLLEYBALL, NIKE [2B No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid
<266.000> $15.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* VOLLEYBALL, NIKE [2B No Bid No Bid $7.25 No Bid
<267.000> $7.25
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* WIGWAM MARINO SCR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<268.000>
DZ 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* WIGWAM MARINO SCR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<269.000>
DZ 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* WIGWAM MARINO SCR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<270.000>
DZ 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* WIGWAM, WOMEN~'S & No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<271.000>
DZ 1.0 NB NB NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03848

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

* DANSKIN BODYSUIT, [2
<272.000>

EA 1.0
Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI
<Quote: Q011788>

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

$1,334.20
$0.00
$0.00

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011789>

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

$5,015.11
$0.00
$2,653.67

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011790>

No Bid

NB

$3,138.85
$0.00
$1,136.55

Eval Codes: NI

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011792>

No Bid

NB

$2,823.55
$0.00
$2,476.70
Eval Codes: NI

(015063) VARSITY SPIRIT
<Quote: Q012194>

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

$135.65
$0.00
$135.65



