
(008400) BULLSEYE SHOOTI
<Quote: Q016673>

(015921) EAGLE POINT GUN
<Quote: Q016674>

(015619) JUREK BROS INC
<Quote: Q016676>

(022190) LAW
ENFORCEMENT

<Quote: Q016678>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05779

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

MILITEC, 1 GAL. CONT [2B
<1.000>

10.0EA

$77.75

$777.50

* NB

No Bid $97.35

$973.50

NB

No Bid

CLAY PIGEONS - 135/C [2
<2.000>

37.0CS

$9.95

$368.15

*,Tie NB

No Bid $9.95

$368.15

*,Tie NB

No Bid

CLEANING BRUSHES HOP
<3.000>

200.0EA

$0.90

$180.00

$0.80

$160.00

*

$0.84

$168.00

$0.99

$198.00

CLEANING BRUSHES HOP
<4.000>

200.0EA

$0.90

$180.00

$0.80

$160.00

*

$0.84

$168.00

$0.99

$198.00

CLEANING BRUSHES HOP
<5.000>

200.0EA

$0.90

$180.00

$0.80

$160.00

*

$0.84

$168.00

$0.99

$198.00

CLEANING BRUSHES HOP
<6.000>

20.0EA

$0.90

$18.00

$0.80

$16.00

*

$0.84

$16.80

$0.99

$19.80

CLEANING BRUSHES HOP
<7.000>

60.0EA

$1.38

$82.80

$1.02

$61.20

*

$1.10

$66.00

$1.09

$65.40

CLEANING PATCHES HOP
<8.000>

55.0PKG

$1.99

$109.45

$0.70

$38.50

*

$21.00

$1,155.00

$25.90

$1,424.50

CLEANING PATCHES HOP
<9.000>

55.0PKG

$2.69

$147.95

$0.70

$38.50

*

$18.60

$1,023.00

$17.90

$984.50

CLEANING PATCHES HOP
<10.000>

55.0PKG

$1.75

$96.25

$0.70

$38.50

*

$10.60

$583.00

$10.30

$566.50

CLEANING PATCHES, .3 [2
<11.000>

20.0BAG

$12.56

$251.20

$11.00

$220.00

*

$14.95

$299.00

NB

No Bid



(008400) BULLSEYE SHOOTI
<Quote: Q016673>

(015921) EAGLE POINT GUN
<Quote: Q016674>

(015619) JUREK BROS INC
<Quote: Q016676>

(022190) LAW
ENFORCEMENT

<Quote: Q016678>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05779

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

EAR PLUGS, FOAM 200/ [2
<12.000>

6.0BOX

$14.75

$88.50

*

$30.00

$180.00

$28.00

$168.00

$17.95

$107.70

"GUN SCRUBBER" SPRAY
<13.000>

10.0CTN

$66.90

$669.00

$60.00

$600.00

$33.72

$337.20

*

$60.00

$600.00

HOPPE~'S (10-2 1/4 OZ [2B
<14.000>

2.0CTN

$19.63

$39.26

$14.00

$28.00

*

$17.30

$34.60

$45.50

$91.00

LUBRICATE/CLEANER BR
<15.000>

10.0PT

$14.95

$149.50

$10.50

$105.00

*

$11.50

$115.00

NB

No Bid

NO. 9 SOLVENT, HOPPE [
<16.000>

3.0QT

$13.65

$40.95

$11.60

$34.80

*

$13.95

$41.85

NB

No Bid

PIPE CLEANERS, 44/PA [2
<17.000>

400.0PKG

$1.59

$636.00

*,Tie NB

No Bid $1.59

$636.00

*,Tie NB

No Bid

ROUNDS BALL 5.56MM . [2
<18.000>

30.0M

$182.82

$5,484.60

$138.40

$4,152.00

*

$179.00

$5,370.00

NB

No Bid

ROUNDS 40 CALIBER SM 
<19.000>

105.0M

$84.84

$8,908.20

*

$112.00

$11,760.00

$159.00

$16,695.00

NB

No Bid

ROUNDS 40 CALIBER, S [2
<20.000>

12.5M

$233.32

$2,916.50

$175.00

$2,187.50

*

$219.00

$2,737.50

NB

No Bid

ROUNDS FEDERAL 168 G
<21.000>

6.0M

$463.04

$2,778.24

$420.00

$2,520.00

*

$495.00

$2,970.00

NB

No Bid

ROUNDS FEDERAL .223  [
<22.000>

1.0M

$471.74

$471.74

$410.00

$410.00

$249.00

$249.00

* NB

No Bid



(008400) BULLSEYE SHOOTI
<Quote: Q016673>

(015921) EAGLE POINT GUN
<Quote: Q016674>

(015619) JUREK BROS INC
<Quote: Q016676>

(022190) LAW
ENFORCEMENT

<Quote: Q016678>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05779

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

ROUNDS 12 GAUGE 2 3/ [
<23.000>

27.0CS

$106.00

$2,862.00

$54.00

$1,458.00

*

$79.00

$2,133.00

NB

No Bid

ROUNDS 12 GAUGE 2 3/ [
<24.000>

20.0CS

$55.46

$1,109.20

$38.00

$760.00

*

$52.00

$1,040.00

NB

No Bid

ROUNDS SHOT 12 GAUGE
<25.000>

20.0M

$158.84

$3,176.80

$112.00

$2,240.00

*

$164.00

$3,280.00

NB

No Bid

ROUNDS WINCHESTER, 1
<26.000>

5.0M

$221.88

$1,109.40

$184.00

$920.00

*

$208.00

$1,040.00

NB

No Bid

ROUNDS WINCHESTER 1
<27.000>

25.0CS

$109.34

$2,733.50

$61.00

$1,525.00

*

$87.00

$2,175.00

NB

No Bid

ROUNDS WINCHESTER 1
<28.000>

22.0CS

$80.46

$1,770.12

$63.00

$1,386.00

*

$82.00

$1,804.00

NB

No Bid

ROUNDS WINCHESTER 2
<29.000>

1.5M

$201.62

$302.43

$131.00

$196.50

*

$180.00

$270.00

NB

No Bid

SHOTGUN TEAR GUN CA
<30.000>

2.0LOT NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $179.00

$358.00

* NB

No Bid

ARMY "L" TARGETS B-2 [2
<31.000>

50.0C

$23.49

$1,174.50

$17.50

$875.00

*

$23.00

$1,150.00

NB

No Bid

CORRUGATED TARGET B
<32.000>

50.0C

$1.80

$90.00

*

$168.00

$8,400.00

$195.00

$9,750.00

$64.50

$3,225.00

POLICE SILHOUETTE TA 
<33.000>

150.0C

$35.93

$5,389.50

$4.00

$600.00

*

$4.50

$675.00

$27.00

$4,050.00



(008400) BULLSEYE SHOOTI
<Quote: Q016673>

(015921) EAGLE POINT GUN
<Quote: Q016674>

(015619) JUREK BROS INC
<Quote: Q016676>

(022190) LAW
ENFORCEMENT

<Quote: Q016678>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05779

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

POLICE SILHOUETTE TA 
<34.000>

150.0EA

$18.60

$2,790.00

$15.50

$2,325.00

$0.18

$27.00

*

$0.27

$40.50

TARGET FBI - Q PAPER [2
<35.000>

50.0C

$28.51

$1,425.50

$17.00

$850.00

*

$28.00

$1,400.00

$17.95

$897.50

TARGET FBI-Q-CB (19" [2B
<36.000>

50.0EA

$0.64

$32.00

$0.50

$25.00

*

$0.75

$37.50

$0.67

$33.50

TARGETS, PAPER DOT-2 
<37.000>

500.0EA

$4.97

$2,485.00

$0.12

$60.00

* NB

No Bid $0.169

$84.50

TARGET FBI - QCB - F [2B
<38.000>

50.0C

$23.34

$1,167.00

*

$23.50

$1,175.00

NB

No Bid $25.00

$1,250.00

TARGET #530 (5 BULLS [2
<39.000>

50.0C

$36.57

$1,828.50

$24.00

$1,200.00

$36.00

$1,800.00

$17.95

$897.50

*

TARGETS, CAT-1V US C [2
<40.000>

500.0EA

$0.39

$195.00

$0.25

$125.00

$0.32

$160.00

$0.169

$84.50

*

TARGET BACKERS, PLAS
<41.000>

50.0EA

$4.96

$248.00

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $2.25

$112.50

*

TARGET BACKERS, PLAS
<42.000>

50.0EA

$4.96

$248.00

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $2.49

$124.50

*

TARGET BACKERS, PLAS
<43.000>

50.0EA

$8.24

$412.00

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $5.25

$262.50

*

TARGET BACKERS, PLAS
<44.000>

50.0EA

$8.24

$412.00

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $5.45

$272.50

*



(008400) BULLSEYE SHOOTI
<Quote: Q016673>

(015921) EAGLE POINT GUN
<Quote: Q016674>

(015619) JUREK BROS INC
<Quote: Q016676>

(022190) LAW
ENFORCEMENT

<Quote: Q016678>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05779

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

TARGET BACKERS, PLAS
<45.000>

50.0EA

$4.96

$248.00

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $2.69

$134.50

*

SPEER .357 SIG TMJ ( [2B
<46.000>

1.0M

$165.22

$165.22

$136.00

$136.00

*

$213.00

$213.00

NB

No Bid

SPEER .357 SIG GDHP  [2
<47.000>

1.0M

$273.92

$273.92

$235.00

$235.00

*

$317.00

$317.00

NB

No Bid

CCI BLAZER 180 GR .4 [2B
<48.000>

1.0M

$139.13

$139.13

$113.00

$113.00

*

$159.00

$159.00

NB

No Bid

FEDERAL TACTICAL RIF [
<49.000>

1.0CS

$820.65

$820.65

$150.00

$150.00

*

$228.00

$228.00

NB

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$57,181.16

$0.00

$2,033.00

$47,624.50

$0.00

$44,267.50

$62,359.10

$0.00

$3,100.15

$15,922.90

$0.00

$2,488.50


