
(006855) EASTERN MINERAL
<Quote: Q016080>

(006518) EASTERN SALT CO
<Quote: Q016081>

(001008) MORTON INTERNAT
<Quote: Q016082>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05557

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

(1) NORTHWEST DIVISI [2
<1.000>

1.0TON

$53.50

$53.50

$66.25

$66.25

$42.93

$42.93

*

(2) PROVIDENCE DIVIS [2
<2.000>

1.0TON

$53.50

$53.50

$65.00

$65.00

$41.77

$41.77

*

(3) KENT DIVISION   [2BPO
<3.000>

1.0TON

$54.50

$54.50

$65.60

$65.60

$41.82

$41.82

*

BID A PRICE TO INCLU [2B
<4.000>

1.0TON

$55.50

$55.50

$66.68

$66.68

$43.15

$43.15

*

BID A PRICE TO INCLU [2B
<5.000>

1.0TON

$56.50

$56.50

$68.65

$68.65

$44.62

$44.62

*

(6) BRISTOL DIVISION [2B
<6.000>

1.0TON

$53.50

$53.50

$65.25

$65.25

$41.67

$41.67

*

(7)  NEWPORT DIVISIO [2B
<7.000>

1.0TON

$56.50

$56.50

$66.35

$66.35

$43.49

$43.49

*

RATE FOR SALT PICKED 
<8.000>

1.0TON NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $45.00

$45.00

*



(006855) EASTERN MINERAL
<Quote: Q016080>

(006518) EASTERN SALT CO
<Quote: Q016081>

(001008) MORTON INTERNAT
<Quote: Q016082>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05557

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

RATE FOR SALT PICKED 
<9.000>

1.0TON NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $45.00

$45.00

*

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$383.50

$0.00

$0.00

$463.78

$0.00

$0.00

$389.45

$0.00

$389.45


