
(003051) BAKER TRACTOR C
<Quote: Q015251>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05205

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

OIL FILTER - PART #1 [2B
<1.000>

1.0EA

$8.18

$8.18

*

FUEL FILTER - PART # [2B
<2.000>

1.0EA

$12.69

$12.69

*

HYDRAULIC FILTER - P [2
<3.000>

1.0EA

$19.42

$19.42

*

OUTER AIR FILTER - P [2B
<4.000>

1.0EA

$43.24

$43.24

*

LS DOOR FRAME - PART 
<5.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid

DOOR GLASS UPPER - P 
<6.000>

1.0EA

$98.23

$98.23

*

DOOR GLASS LOWER - P 
<7.000>

1.0EA

$347.65

$347.65

*

3 POINT LOWER LINK - [2
<8.000>

1.0EA

$242.06

$242.06

*

3 POINT TOP LINK - P [2B
<9.000>

1.0EA

$93.16

$93.16

*

BOLT - PART #05.411. [2B
<10.000>

1.0EA

$5.96

$5.96

*

NUT - PART #05.295.0 [2B
<11.000>

1.0EA

$5.30

$5.30

*



(003051) BAKER TRACTOR C
<Quote: Q015251>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05205

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

COLLAR - PART #42.59 [2B
<12.000>

1.0EA

$10.76

$10.76

*

TEETH - PART #46.402 [2B
<13.000>

1.0EA

$39.61

$39.61

*

LP BLADE - PART #890 [2B
<14.000>

1.0EA

$15.44

$15.44

*

LP SKID - PART #NONE [2
<15.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid

BOLT ON BUCKET EDGE  
<16.000>

1.0EA

$197.80

$197.80

*

BOLTS FOR ABOVE - PA [
<17.000>

1.0EA

$2.53

$2.53

*

NUTS FOR ABOVE - PAR 
<18.000>

1.0EA

$0.60

$0.60

*

OIL FILTER - PART #0 [2B
<19.000>

1.0EA

$7.29

$7.29

*

FUEL FILTER - PART # [2B
<20.000>

1.0EA

$9.57

$9.57

*

HYDRAULIC  FILTER -  [2B
<21.000>

1.0EA

$40.64

$40.64

*

OUTER AIR  FILTER -  [2B
<22.000>

1.0EA

$33.99

$33.99

*



(003051) BAKER TRACTOR C
<Quote: Q015251>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05205

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

LS DOOR FRAME - PART 
<23.000>

1.0EA

$923.12

$923.12

*

DOOR GLASS UPPER - P 
<24.000>

1.0EA

$175.49

$175.49

*

DOOR GLASS LOWER - P 
<25.000>

1.0EA

$132.13

$132.13

*

FRONT BKT. BOLT ON E [
<26.000>

1.0EA

$205.60

$205.60

*

BOLTS FOR ABOVE  - P [2
<27.000>

1.0EA

$1.56

$1.56

*

NUTS FOR ABOVE  - PA [2
<28.000>

1.0EA

$0.56

$0.56

*

BH BUCKET BUSHING  - [2
<29.000>

1.0EA

$7.96

$7.96

*

BH BUCKET PINS  - PA [2B
<30.000>

1.0EA

$67.00

$67.00

*

OIL FILTER  - PART # [2BP
<31.000>

1.0EA

$14.03

$14.03

*

FUEL FILTER  - PART  [2B
<32.000>

1.0EA

$18.27

$18.27

*

HYDRAULIC FILTER  -  [2B
<33.000>

1.0EA

$61.67

$61.67

*



(003051) BAKER TRACTOR C
<Quote: Q015251>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05205

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

OUTER AIR FILTER  -  [2B
<34.000>

1.0EA

$45.82

$45.82

*

WELD ON BUCKET EDGE 
<35.000>

1.0EA

$182.82

$182.82

*

LOADER BUCKET PINS   [
<36.000>

1.0EA

$67.87

$67.87

*

OIL FILTER  - PART # [2BP
<37.000>

1.0EA

$6.58

$6.58

*

FUEL FILTER  - PART  [2B
<38.000>

1.0EA

$6.15

$6.15

*

HYDRAULIC FILTER  -  [2B
<39.000>

1.0EA

$61.67

$61.67

*

OUTER AIR FILTER  -  [2B
<40.000>

1.0EA

$45.21

$45.21

*

WELD ON BUCKET EDGE 
<41.000>

1.0EA

$78.40

$78.40

*

LOADER BUCKET PINS   [
<42.000>

1.0EA

$33.99

$33.99

*

OIL FILTER  - PART # [2BP
<43.000>

1.0EA

$6.58

$6.58

*

FUEL FILTER  - PART  [2B
<44.000>

1.0EA

$6.15

$6.15

*



(003051) BAKER TRACTOR C
<Quote: Q015251>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05205

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

HYDRAULIC FILTER  -  [2B
<45.000>

1.0EA

$16.92

$16.92

*

OUTER AIR FILTER  -  [2B
<46.000>

1.0EA

$42.62

$42.62

*

LS DOOR FRAME  - PAR [2
<47.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid

DOOR GLASS UPPER  -  [2
<48.000>

1.0EA

$288.07

$288.07

*

DOOR GLASS LOWER  -  [
<49.000>

1.0EA

$182.34

$182.34

*

BH BUCKET BUSHING  - [2
<50.000>

1.0EA

$27.98

$27.98

*

BH BUCKET PINS  - PA [2B
<51.000>

1.0EA

$117.06

$117.06

*

FRONT CUTTING EDGE   
<52.000>

1.0EA

$154.05

$154.05

*

OIL FILTER  - PART # [2BP
<53.000>

1.0EA

$9.71

$9.71

*

FUEL FILTER  - PART  [2B
<54.000>

1.0EA

$7.01

$7.01

*

HYDRAULIC FILTER  -  [2B
<55.000>

1.0EA

$56.27

$56.27

*



(003051) BAKER TRACTOR C
<Quote: Q015251>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05205

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

OUTER AIR FILTER  -  [2B
<56.000>

1.0EA

$30.22

$30.22

*

FRONT BKT EDGE  - PA [2
<57.000>

1.0EA

$236.18

$236.18

*

3PT LOWER LINK  - PA [2B
<58.000>

1.0EA

$290.31

$290.31

*

3PT TOP LINK  - PART [2B
<59.000>

1.0EA

$297.29

$297.29

*

Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$5,138.78

$0.00

$5,138.78


