
(000080) BAY STATE ENVEL
<Quote: Q014478>

(015128) STEC-STEADFAST 
<Quote: Q014482>

(000983) W B MASON CO IN
<Quote: Q014484>

(001040) WORCESTER ENVEL
<Quote: Q014485>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04898

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

#6 3/4 WHITE WOVE, 2 [2BPO]
<1.000>

41.0M

$11.99

$491.59

$18.49

$758.09

$15.10

$619.10

$11.33

$464.53

*

#6 3/4 WHITE WOVE, 2 [2BPO]
<2.000>

10.0M

$14.00

$140.00

$25.64

$256.40

$18.64

$186.40

$12.26

$122.60

*

#9 WHITE WOVE, 24# E [2BPO]
<3.000>

268.0M

$11.75

$3,149.00

$17.22

$4,614.96

$19.44

$5,209.92

$10.51

$2,816.68

*

#9 WHITE WOVE, 24# E [2BPO]
<4.000>

10.0M

$14.00

$140.00

$28.17

$281.70

NB

No Bid $11.54

$115.40

*

#9 WHITE WOVE, 24#   [2BPO]
<5.000>

10.0M

$14.50

$145.00

$24.44

$244.40

$22.87

$228.70

$12.36

$123.60

*

#9 WHITE WOVE, 24#   [2BPO]
<6.000>

5.0M

$15.75

$78.75

$28.17

$140.85

NB

No Bid $14.42

$72.10

*

#10 WHITE WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<7.000>

2010.0M

$12.15

$24,421.50

$16.65

$33,466.50

$9.42

$18,934.20

*

$10.30

$20,703.00

#10 WHITE WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<8.000>

20.0M

$13.15

$263.00

$28.17

$563.40

$22.05

$441.00

$11.54

$230.80

*

#10 WHITE WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<9.000>

1800.0M

$14.25

$25,650.00

$18.47

$33,246.00

$18.36

$33,048.00

$12.15

$21,870.00

*

#10 WHITE WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<10.000>

100.0M

$15.20

$1,520.00

$24.12

$2,412.00

$28.12

$2,812.00

$14.42

$1,442.00

*

#10 WHITE WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<11.000>

40.0M

$16.20

$648.00

$26.12

$1,044.80

$28.47

$1,138.80

$15.14

$605.60

*



(000080) BAY STATE ENVEL
<Quote: Q014478>

(015128) STEC-STEADFAST 
<Quote: Q014482>

(000983) W B MASON CO IN
<Quote: Q014484>

(001040) WORCESTER ENVEL
<Quote: Q014485>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04898

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

#10 WHITE WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<12.000>

10.0M

$18.00

$180.00

*

$34.12

$341.20

$28.12

$281.20

$31.97

$319.70

#11 WHITE WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<13.000>

122.0M

$19.80

$2,415.60

$34.28

$4,182.16

NB

No Bid $17.30

$2,110.60

*

#11 WHITE WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<14.000>

10.0M

$24.50

$245.00

$36.28

$362.80

NB

No Bid $18.44

$184.40

*

#11 WHITE WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<15.000>

2.0M

$25.00

$50.00

$42.28

$84.56

NB

No Bid $19.36

$38.72

*

#11 WHITE WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<16.000>

1.0M

$29.00

$29.00

$46.25

$46.25

NB

No Bid $21.42

$21.42

*

#63 - 6 1/2" X 9 1/2 [2BPO]
<17.000>

24.0BX

$8.00

$192.00

$9.68

$232.32

$5.46

$131.04

*,Tie

$5.46

$131.04

*,Tie

#63 - 6 1/2" X 9 1/2 [2BPO]
<18.000>

5.0BX

$10.00

$50.00

$10.65

$53.25

NB

No Bid $5.46

$27.30

*

#75 - 7 1/2" X 10 1/ [2BPO]
<19.000>

14.0BX

$9.00

$126.00

$10.37

$145.18

$6.11

$85.54

*

$6.39

$89.46

#75 - 7 1/2" X 10 1/ [2BPO]
<20.000>

5.0BX

$10.00

$50.00

$11.57

$57.85

NB

No Bid $6.39

$31.95

*

#93 - 9 1/2" X 12 1/ [2BPO]
<21.000>

50.0BX

$20.80

$1,040.00

$11.35

$567.50

$6.99

$349.50

$6.70

$335.00

*

#93 - 9 1/2" X 12 1/ [2BPO]
<22.000>

10.0BX

$23.00

$230.00

$11.91

$119.10

NB

No Bid $6.70

$67.00

*



(000080) BAY STATE ENVEL
<Quote: Q014478>

(015128) STEC-STEADFAST 
<Quote: Q014482>

(000983) W B MASON CO IN
<Quote: Q014484>

(001040) WORCESTER ENVEL
<Quote: Q014485>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04898

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

#95 - 10" X 12" 100/ [2BPO]
<23.000>

10.0BX

$10.00

$100.00

$12.25

$122.50

$8.69

$86.90

$7.00

$70.00

*

#95 - 10" X 12" 100/ [2BPO]
<24.000>

5.0BX

$21.00

$105.00

$12.25

$61.25

NB

No Bid $7.00

$35.00

*

#98 - 10" X 15" 100/ [2BPO]
<25.000>

30.0BX

$23.00

$690.00

$13.87

$416.10

$8.65

$259.50

*

$18.54

$556.20

#98 - 10" X 15" 100/ [2BPO]
<26.000>

5.0BX

$24.00

$120.00

$15.87

$79.35

* NB

No Bid $18.54

$92.70

#105 - 11 1/2" X 14  [2BPO]
<27.000>

10.0BX

$28.50

$285.00

$15.87

$158.70

$9.98

$99.80

$9.89

$98.90

*

#105 - 11 1/2" X 14  [2BPO]
<28.000>

5.0BX

$29.00

$145.00

$16.87

$84.35

NB

No Bid $9.89

$49.45

*

#110 - 12" X 15 1/2" [2BPO]
<29.000>

100.0BX

$29.00

$2,900.00

$16.87

$1,687.00

$10.11

$1,011.00

$9.58

$958.00

*

#110 - 12" X 15 1/2" [2BPO]
<30.000>

10.0BX

$31.00

$310.00

$18.87

$188.70

$10.78

$107.80

$9.58

$95.80

*

CATALOG ENVELOPE, BR [2BPO]
<31.000>

75.0M

$47.50

$3,562.50

$68.22

$5,116.50

$57.90

$4,342.50

$39.45

$2,958.75

*

CATALOG ENVELOPE, BR [2BPO]
<32.000>

25.0M

$59.40

$1,485.00

$74.22

$1,855.50

NB

No Bid $39.45

$986.25

*

CATALOG ENVELOPE, WH [2BPO]
<33.000>

40.0M

$53.86

$2,154.40

$68.22

$2,728.80

$85.24

$3,409.60

$42.23

$1,689.20

*



(000080) BAY STATE ENVEL
<Quote: Q014478>

(015128) STEC-STEADFAST 
<Quote: Q014482>

(000983) W B MASON CO IN
<Quote: Q014484>

(001040) WORCESTER ENVEL
<Quote: Q014485>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04898

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

CATALOG ENVELOPE, WH [2BPO]
<34.000>

10.0M

$63.00

$630.00

*

$82.52

$825.20

NB

No Bid $94.64

$946.40

#9 GREEN WOVE, 24# R [2BPO]
<35.000>

40.0M

$15.45

$618.00

*

$36.65

$1,466.00

NB

No Bid $17.40

$696.00

#9 GREEN WOVE, 24# R [2BPO]
<36.000>

10.0M

$15.45

$154.50

*

$38.65

$386.50

NB

No Bid $17.40

$174.00

#9 BLUE  WOVE, 24# R [2BPO]
<37.000>

80.0M

$15.45

$1,236.00

$36.65

$2,932.00

NB

No Bid $14.63

$1,170.40

*

#9 BLUE  WOVE, 24# R [2BPO]
<38.000>

20.0M

$15.45

$309.00

$38.65

$773.00

NB

No Bid $14.63

$292.60

*

#10 BLUE  WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<39.000>

80.0M

$15.45

$1,236.00

*

$36.65

$2,932.00

NB

No Bid $15.55

$1,244.00

#10 BLUE  WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<40.000>

20.0M

$15.45

$309.00

*

$38.65

$773.00

NB

No Bid $15.55

$311.00

#10 PINK  WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<41.000>

40.0M

$15.45

$618.00

*

$36.65

$1,466.00

NB

No Bid $17.91

$716.40



(000080) BAY STATE ENVEL
<Quote: Q014478>

(015128) STEC-STEADFAST 
<Quote: Q014482>

(000983) W B MASON CO IN
<Quote: Q014484>

(001040) WORCESTER ENVEL
<Quote: Q014485>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04898

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

#10 PINK  WOVE, 24#  [2BPO]
<42.000>

10.0M

$15.45

$154.50

*

$38.65

$386.50

NB

No Bid $17.91

$179.10

Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$78,376.34

$0.00

$0.00

$107,660.22

$0.00

$0.00

$72,782.50

$0.00

$0.00

$65,243.05

$0.00

$65,243.05


