
(000198) HB COMMUNICATIO
<Quote: Q013059>

(014320) PERLMUTTER PURC
<Quote: Q013060>

(010444) VISUAL INTERACT
<Quote: Q013061>

(003565) VALLEY COMMUNIC
<Quote: Q013062>

(007384) VALIANT INC
<Quote: Q013063>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04388

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

13" COLOR TV, CABLE  [2BPO]
<1.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid $98.00

$98.00

*

$99.00

$99.00

$100.00

$100.00

$99.57

$99.57

19" COLOR TV, PORTAB [2BPO]
<2.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $133.00

$133.00

$130.00

$130.00

*

$134.40

$134.40

20" COLOR TV, CABLE  [2BPO]
<3.000>

1.0EA

$259.00

$259.00

$132.00

$132.00

*

$133.00

$133.00

$172.00

$172.00

$134.40

$134.40

27" COLOR TV, REMOTE [2BPO]
<4.000>

1.0EA

$279.00

$279.00

$208.00

$208.00

$211.00

$211.00

$223.00

$223.00

$207.00

$207.00

*

32" COLOR TV, S-VHS  [2BPO]
<5.000>

1.0EA

$449.00

$449.00

$363.00

$363.00

$367.00

$367.00

$358.00

$358.00

*

$360.00

$360.00

36" COLOR TV, INPUTS [2BPO]
<6.000>

1.0EA

$875.00

$875.00

$504.00

$504.00

*

$533.00

$533.00

$958.00

$958.00

$544.95

$544.95

46"-50" WIDE SCREEN  [2BPO]
<7.000>

1.0EA

$1,499.00

$1,499.00

$1,228.00

$1,228.00

*

$1,245.00

$1,245.00

$1,930.00

$1,930.00

$1,274.70

$1,274.70

13" TV-VCR COMBINATI [2BA]
<8.000>

1.0EA

$200.00

$200.00

NB

No Bid $119.00

$119.00

*

$129.00

$129.00

NB

No Bid



(000198) HB COMMUNICATIO
<Quote: Q013059>

(014320) PERLMUTTER PURC
<Quote: Q013060>

(010444) VISUAL INTERACT
<Quote: Q013061>

(003565) VALLEY COMMUNIC
<Quote: Q013062>

(007384) VALIANT INC
<Quote: Q013063>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04388

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

19"/20" TV-VCR COMBI [2BPO]
<9.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $195.00

$195.00

$184.00

$184.00

* NB

No Bid

25" TV-VCR COMBINATI [2BPO]
<10.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $503.00

$503.00

$418.00

$418.00

* NB

No Bid

VCR, 4 HEAD, ON SCRE [2BPO]
<11.000>

1.0EA

$60.00

$60.00

$70.00

$70.00

$57.00

$57.00

$69.00

$69.00

$54.10

$54.10

*

DVD PLAYER, DOLBY DI [2BPO]
<12.000>

1.0EA

$90.00

$90.00

$64.00

$64.00

$79.00

$79.00

$98.00

$98.00

$49.50

$49.50

*

DVD/VCR COMBINATION  [2BPO]
<13.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid $132.00

$132.00

$125.00

$125.00

$116.00

$116.00

$96.88

$96.88

*

14" TV/DVD COMBINATI [2BPO]
<14.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid $189.00

$189.00

$155.00

$155.00

NB

No Bid $143.00

$143.00

*

20" STEREO TV-DVD CO [2BPO]
<15.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid $264.00

$264.00

$267.00

$267.00

$244.00

$244.00

*

$273.00

$273.00

20" STEREO TV VCR -  [2BPO]
<16.000>

1.0EA

$349.00

$349.00

$337.00

$337.00

$341.00

$341.00

$316.00

$316.00

*

$318.15

$318.15



(000198) HB COMMUNICATIO
<Quote: Q013059>

(014320) PERLMUTTER PURC
<Quote: Q013060>

(010444) VISUAL INTERACT
<Quote: Q013061>

(003565) VALLEY COMMUNIC
<Quote: Q013062>

(007384) VALIANT INC
<Quote: Q013063>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04388

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

27" TV-DVD COMBINATI [2BA]
<17.000>

1.0EA

$489.00

$489.00

NB

No Bid $509.00

$509.00

$418.00

$418.00

* NB

No Bid

27" TV-DVD-VCR COMBI [2BPO]
<18.000>

1.0EA

$489.00

$489.00

$498.00

$498.00

$509.00

$509.00

$418.00

$418.00

*

$456.75

$456.75

CAMCORDER, PALM SIZE [2BPO]
<19.000>

1.0EA

$239.00

$239.00

$349.00

$349.00

$219.00

$219.00

*

$286.00

$286.00

NB

No Bid

13" COLOR SERCUREVIE [2BA]
<20.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$5,277.00

$0.00

$0.00

$4,436.00

$0.00

$3,696.00

$5,799.00

$0.00

$1,387.00

$6,567.00

$0.00

$0.00

$4,146.40

$0.00

$0.00


