
(001298) AMERCARE
PRODUC

<Quote: Q013099>

(000385) THE CLAFLIN CO
<Quote: Q013100>

(000385) THE CLAFLIN CO
<Quote: Q013101>

(000849) GERIATRIC MEDIC
<Quote: Q013102>

(000849) GERIATRIC MEDIC
<Quote: Q013103>

(006205) GULF SOUTH MEDI
<Quote: Q013104>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04348

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

ADULT BRIEFS - YOUTH [2BPO]
<1.000>

1.0EA

$0.245

$0.245

$0.2898

$0.2898

$0.2406

$0.2406

$0.2813

$0.2813

$0.23

$0.23

*

$0.2593

$0.2593

ADULT BRIEFS SMALL  [2BPO]
<2.000>

1.0EA

$0.245

$0.245

$0.2875

$0.2875

$0.276

$0.276

$0.2813

$0.2813

$0.235

$0.235

*,Tie

$0.2647

$0.2647

ADULT BRIEFS MEDIUM [2BPO]
<3.000>

1.0EA

$0.24

$0.24

$0.2237

$0.2237

$0.2319

$0.2319

$0.2194

$0.2194

$0.237

$0.237

$0.2679

$0.2679

ADULT BRIEFS LARGE  [2BPO]
<4.000>

1.0EA

$0.315

$0.315

$0.2979

$0.2979

$0.3092

$0.3092

$0.2925

$0.2925

$0.313

$0.313

$0.3529

$0.3529

ADULT BRIEFS X-LARG [2BPO]
<5.000>

1.0EA

$0.378

$0.378

$0.3575

$0.3575

$0.371

$0.371

$0.351

$0.351

$0.371

$0.371

$0.4184

$0.4184

ADULT BRIEGS XX LAR [2BA]
<6.000>

1.0EA

$0.378

$0.378

* NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

DISPOSABLE UNDERPADS [2BPO]
<7.000>

1.0EA

$0.0784

$0.0784

$0.0954

$0.0954

$0.0813

$0.0813

$0.0933

$0.0933

$0.07

$0.07

*,Tie

$0.0789

$0.0789



(001298) AMERCARE
PRODUC

<Quote: Q013099>

(000385) THE CLAFLIN CO
<Quote: Q013100>

(000385) THE CLAFLIN CO
<Quote: Q013101>

(000849) GERIATRIC MEDIC
<Quote: Q013102>

(000849) GERIATRIC MEDIC
<Quote: Q013103>

(006205) GULF SOUTH MEDI
<Quote: Q013104>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04348

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

PULL ON UNDERGARMENT [2BPO]
<8.000>

1.0EA

$0.435

$0.435

$0.4388

$0.4388

$0.53

$0.53

$0.4265

$0.4265

$0.44

$0.44

$0.4979

$0.4979

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:
* = Low Item Price or Low Quote Total

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$2.3144

$0.00

$0.00

$1.9905

$0.00

$0.00

$2.04

$0.00

$0.00

$1.9452

$0.00

$0.00

$1.896

$0.00

$0.00

$2.14

$0.00

$0.00



(016973) INDUSTRIAL SOLU
<Quote: Q013105>

(000473) MCKESSON MEDICA
<Quote: Q013106>

(015610) PRIMECARE SERVI
<Quote: Q013107>

(015610) PRIMECARE SERVI
<Quote: Q013108>

(017230) XPEDX
<Quote: Q013109>

(000473) MCKESSON MEDICA
<Quote: Q013177>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04348

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

ADULT BRIEFS - YOUTH [2BPO]
<1.000>

1.0EA

$0.34

$0.34

$0.2747

$0.2747

$0.2479

$0.2479

NB

No Bid $0.2854

$0.2854

$0.2354

$0.2354

ADULT BRIEFS SMALL  [2BPO]
<2.000>

1.0EA

$0.32

$0.32

$0.2747

$0.2747

$0.2865

$0.2865

NB

No Bid $0.301

$0.301

$0.2404

$0.2404

*,Tie

ADULT BRIEFS MEDIUM [2BPO]
<3.000>

1.0EA

$0.32

$0.32

$0.2003

$0.2003

*

$0.237

$0.237

$0.237

$0.237

$0.301

$0.301

$0.2432

$0.2432

ADULT BRIEFS LARGE  [2BPO]
<4.000>

1.0EA

$0.42

$0.42

$0.2671

$0.2671

*

$0.316

$0.316

$0.316

$0.316

$0.4014

$0.4014

$0.3206

$0.3206

ADULT BRIEFS X-LARG [2BPO]
<5.000>

1.0EA

$0.42

$0.42

$0.3091

$0.3091

*

$0.3792

$0.3792

$0.3792

$0.3792

$0.4014

$0.4014

$0.38

$0.38

ADULT BRIEGS XX LAR [2BA]
<6.000>

1.0EA

$0.68

$0.68

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $49.90

$49.90

NB

No Bid

DISPOSABLE UNDERPADS [2BPO]
<7.000>

1.0EA

$0.10

$0.10

$0.0696

$0.0696

*,Tie

$0.0831

$0.0831

NB

No Bid $0.088

$0.088

$0.0716

$0.0716

*,Tie



(016973) INDUSTRIAL SOLU
<Quote: Q013105>

(000473) MCKESSON MEDICA
<Quote: Q013106>

(015610) PRIMECARE SERVI
<Quote: Q013107>

(015610) PRIMECARE SERVI
<Quote: Q013108>

(017230) XPEDX
<Quote: Q013109>

(000473) MCKESSON MEDICA
<Quote: Q013177>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04348

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

PULL ON UNDERGARMENT [2BPO]
<8.000>

1.0EA

$0.51

$0.51

$0.4121

$0.4121

*

$0.5415

$0.5415

$0.5264

$0.5264

$0.7208

$0.7208

$0.4521

$0.4521

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$3.11

$0.00

$0.00

$1.8076

$0.00

$1.8076

$2.0912

$0.00

$0.00

$1.4586

$0.00

$0.00

$52.399

$0.00

$0.00

$1.9433

$0.00

$0.00


