Bid Tab for Bid# B03363

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

FUN BALLS FOR WIFFLE
<1.000>

EA 6.0

FUN BALLS FOR WIFFLE
<2.000>

EA 6.0

FUN BALLS FOR WIFFLE
<3.000>

EA 6.0

FUN BALLS FOR WIFFLE
<4.000>

EA 6.0

FUN BALLS FOR WIFFLE
<5.000>

EA 6.0

FUN BALLS FOR WIFFLE
<6.000>

EA 6.0

LANYARDS FOR WHISTL
<7.000>

EA 12.0
WONDER WHEELER STO
<8.000>

EA 2.0

FLOOR/STREET HOCKEY
<9.000>

EA 2.0
TABLE TOP SCORER GY
<10.000>

EA 4.0

COLORED OLYMPIA WHI¢
<11.000>

EA 6.0

(001939) FIVE SEASONS SP
<Quote: Q010379>

$0.78
$4.68

*,.DD

$0.78
$4.68

*,.DD

$0.78
$4.68

*,.DD

$0.78
$4.68

*,.DD

$0.78
$4.68

*,.DD

$0.78
$4.68

*,.DD

$0.41
$4.92

DD

$48.65
$97.30

*.DD

$189.87
$379.74

DD

$36.28
$145.12

DD

$0.88
$5.28

DD

(000471) RECREATION EQUI
<Quote: Q010380>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

$179.00
$358.00

*,.DD,NB

$38.00
$152.00

NB,DD

DD,NB

(003134) SS ARTS CRAF
<Quote: Q010381>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

$2.45
$14.70

DD,NB

$0.17
$2.04

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

$12.49
$49.96

DD,NB

$0.19
$1.14

*NB,DD

(017056) GREGG UNITED SP
<Quote: Q010399>

$1.40
$8.40

DD,NB

$1.40
$8.40

NB,DD

$1.40
$8.40

DD,NB

$1.40
$8.40

NB,DD

$1.40
$8.40

DD,NB

$1.40
$8.40

NB,DD

$0.165
$1.98

*,.DD,NB

$52.74
$105.48

NB,DD

$182.35
$364.70

DD,NB

$11.33
$45.32

*NB,DD

$0.59
$3.54

DD,NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03363

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

COLORED OLYMPIA WHIS
<12.000>
EA 6.0
HOCKEY STICKS 47" ST [;
<13.000>
EA 1.0
"ALUMINATOR" HOO74P |
<14.000>
EA 2.0
GOALIE PADS 27" (MED [
<15.000>
EA 2.0
STICK GLOVE - SENIOR [
<16.000>
EA 2.0
CATCH GLOVES - SENIO
<17.000>
EA 2.0
ULTRA PRO GOALIE MAS
<18.000>
EA 1.0
ULTRA PRO GOALIE MAS
<19.000>
EA 1.0
TWO GOAL NET LARGE N
<20.000>
EA 2.0

27" FOAM COVERED SAF
<21.000>

EA 4.0
DELUXE WOOD TOP TAB
<22.000>

EA 6.0

(001939) FIVE SEASONS SP
<Quote: Q010379>

$0.88
$5.28

DD

$163.94
$163.94

DD

$19.46
$38.92

DD

$54.69
$109.38

DD

$55.66
$111.32

DD

$68.22
$136.44

DD

$42.56
$42.56

DD

$42.56
$42.56

DD

$56.90
$113.80

DD

$9.84
$39.36

DD

$378.00
$2,268.00

DD

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(000471) RECREATION EQUI
<Quote: Q010380>

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

$52.00
$104.00

NB,DD

DD,NB

$332.00
$1,992.00

NB,DD

(003134) SS ARTS CRAF
<Quote: Q010381>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.19
$1.14

*,.DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

(017056) GREGG UNITED SP
<Quote: Q010399>

$0.59
$3.54

NB,DD

$161.45
$161.45

*,.DD,NB

$14.09
$28.18

*NB,DD

$47.44
$94.88

*,DD,NB

$45.43
$90.86

*NB,DD

$62.39
$124.78

*,DD,NB

$37.29
$37.29

*NB,DD

$37.29
$37.29

*,DD,NB

$47.44
$94.88

*NB,DD

$4.40
$17.60

*,DD,NB

$293.25
$1,759.50

*NB,DD



Bid Tab for Bid# B03363

Quote
Info:
Item Info:
TOURNAMENT NET AND |
<23.000>
EA 1.0

HALEX ECONOMY CLASE
<24.000>
EA 1.0
UNBREAKABLE POLY TAL
<25.000>
EA 2.0
BASKETBALL NET (AQUA
<26.000>
EA 2.0
WATER POLO GOAL AND
<27.000>
EA 2.0

WATER POLO BALLS BA |
<28.000>

EA 4.0

DELUXE TABLE COVER [

<29.000>

EA 6.0

Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:
$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

(001939) FIVE SEASONS SP
<Quote: Q010379>

$14.80
$14.80

DD

$29.66
$29.66

DD

$92.84
$185.68

*.DD

$296.00
$592.00

DD

$1,350.00
$2,700.00

*,DD

$15.40
$61.60

DD

$58.86
$353.16

DD

$7,668.90
$0.00
$0.00

DD = Delivery Date Greater Than Requested Date

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

(000471) RECREATION EQUI
<Quote: Q010380>

$17.60
$17.60

DD,NB

$32.50
$32.50

NB,DD

$169.00
$338.00

DD,NB

$66.00
$132.00

*NB,DD

No Bid

DD,NB

$12.90
$51.60

NB,DD

$45.00
$270.00

*,.DD,NB

$3,447.70
$0.00
$0.00
Eval Codes: NI

(003134) SS ARTS CRAF
<Quote: Q010381>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB,DD

$21.14
$21.14

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

NB,DD

$6.72
$26.88

*,.DD,NB

NB,DD

$117.00
$0.00
$0.00

(017056) GREGG UNITED SP
<Quote: Q010399>

No Bid

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

$11.21
$11.21

*,DD,NB

$9.50
$9.50

*NB,DD

$108.94
$217.88

DD,NB

NB,DD

DD,NB

$14.32
$57.28

NB,DD

$46.90
$281.40

DD,NB

$3,598.94
$0.00
$3,598.94



