Bid Tab for Bid# B01535

Quote (000094) ADVANCED
Info: COMMOD
<Quote: Q004573>
Item Info:
SPEC NO. 2052-168 [2B} No Bid
<1.000>
LB 300.0 NB
SPEC NO. 2052-176 B [2B No Bid
<2.000>
LB 100.0 NB
SPEC NO. 2052-135A [2E $1.69
<3.000> $5,915.00
LB 3500.0
BEEF, SHAVED WAFER T No Bid
<4.000>
LB 3000.0 NB
SPEC NO. 2052-601 B [2B No Bid
<5.000>
LB 500.0 NB
FINE GROUND LAMB, N [ No Bid
<6.000>
LB 200.0 NB
SPEC NO. 2052-1335R [2I No Bid
<7.000>
LB 200.0 NB
SPEC NO. 2052-1398 [2B No Bid
<8.000>
LB 200.0 NB

(010217) AGAR SUPPLY CO
<Quote: Q004574>

$1.35
$405.00

$3.09
$309.00

$1.52
$5,320.00

$1.42
$4,260.00

$1.34
$670.00

$2.30
$460.00

$3.10
$620.00

$1.35
$270.00

(000154) CARA DONNA PROV  (002985) CLARK'S TRADING

<Quote: Q004575>

$1.35
$405.00

$3.65
$365.00

No Bid

NB

$1.58
$4,740.00

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$3.29
$658.00

$1.45
$290.00

<Quote: Q004576>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(007661) JAMES J DERBA |
<Quote: Q004577>

$1.24
$372.00

$3.55
$355.00

$1.48
$5,180.00

$1.59
$4,770.00

$1.79
$895.00

$2.40
$480.00

$3.25
$650.00

$1.39
$278.00

(000276) PORTION MEAT AS
<Quote: Q004578>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$1.33
$3,990.00

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B01535

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

SPEC NO. 2052-168 [2B}
<1.000>
LB 300.0
SPEC NO. 2052-176 B [2E
<2.000>
LB 100.0
SPEC NO. 2052-135A [2B
<3.000>
LB 3500.0
BEEF, SHAVED WAFER T
<4.000>
LB 3000.0
SPEC NO. 2052-601 B [2E
<5.000>
LB 500.0
FINE GROUND LAMB, N [
<6.000>
LB 200.0
SPEC NO. 2052-1335R [2I
<7.000>
LB 200.0
SPEC NO. 2052-1398 [2B

<8.000>

LB 200.0

(000296) QUALITY BEEF CO
<Quote: Q004579>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$1.89
$6,615.00

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$2.35
$470.00
$3.35
$670.00

No Bid

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B01535
Quote (000296) QUALITY BEEF CO

Info: <Quote: Q004579>
Item Info:
VEAL PATTY, 100% VEA [. No Bid
<9.000>
LB 2000.0 NB
SPEC NO. 2052-413 P [2B $1.50
<10.000> $450.00
LB 300.0
SPEC NO. 2052-416 P [2B No Bid
<11.000>
LB 100.0 NB
SPEC NO. 2052-1412 [2B $2.17
<12.000> $1,085.00
LB 500.0
SPEC NO. 2052-508 P [2B $1.79
<13.000> $1,611.00
LB 900.0 i
SPEC NO. 2052-539 P [2B $1.54
<14.000> $770.00
LB 500.0
SPEC NO. 2052-800 [2B} No Bid
<15.000>
LB 2500.0 NB
SPEC NO. 2052-801 B [2B No Bid
<16.000>

LB 2500.0 NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B01535

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

BOLOGNA, LOW SALT-NC
<17.000>
LB 100.0
SPEC NO. 2052-804 S [2E
<18.000>
LB 500.0
SALAMI, LOW SALT-NO [
<19.000>
LB 100.0
SPEC NO. 2052-813 K [2E
<20.000>
LB 200.0
SPEC NO. 2052-815 M [2E
<21.000>
LB 50.0
SPEC NO. 2052-822 S [2E
<22.000>
LB 300.0
SPEC NO. 2052-822 S [2E
<23.000>
LB 300.0
HAM, LOW SALT-NO MOR

<24.000>

LB 100.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(000296) QUALITY BEEF CO
<Quote: Q004579>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B01535

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

PEPPER STEAKS, TOPPE
<25.000>
LB 100.0
FINE GROUND PORK, NO
<26.000>
LB 500.0
FDA STANDARDS #19, 9 [
<27.000>
LB 100.0
PASTRAMI, (KOSHER ST
<28.000>
LB 50.0
HOUSE OF RAEFORD OR
<29.000>
LB 2400.0
LAMB, LEG, BONELESS [
<30.000>
LB 50.0
FINE GROUND LAMB, NO
<31.000>
LB 50.0
VEAL FOR STEWING. #2 [

<32.000>

LB 50.0

(000296) QUALITY BEEF CO
<Quote: Q004579>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

$0.94
$470.00

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B01535
Quote (000296) QUALITY BEEF CO

Info: <Quote: Q004579>
Item Info:
SWISS STEAKS, 6 OZ. [2t No Bid
<33.000>
LB 100.0 NB
Totals: Net $ Total: $12,141.00
$ Discount: $0.00
$ Awarded: $2,381.00
Eval Codes: NI

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems



Bid Tab for Bid# B01535

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

VEAL PATTY, 100% VEA[:

<9.000>

LB

SPEC NO.

<10.000>

LB

SPEC NO.

<11.000>

LB

SPEC NO.

<12.000>

LB

SPEC NO.

<13.000>

LB

SPEC NO.

<14.000>

LB

SPEC NO.

<15.000>

LB

SPEC NO.

<16.000>

LB

2000.0

2052-413 P [2E

300.0

2052-416 P [2E

100.0

2052-1412 [2B

500.0

2052-508 P [2E

900.0

2052-539 P [2E

500.0

2052-800 [2B}

2500.0

2052-801 B [2E

2500.0

(000094) ADVANCED
COMMOD
<Quote: Q004573>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$1.22
$3,050.00
$1.00
$2,500.00

(010217) AGAR SUPPLY CO
<Quote: Q004574>

No Bid

NB

$1.41
$423.00

$1.14
$114.00

$1.94
$970.00

$1.93
$1,737.00

$1.50
$750.00

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

(000154) CARA DONNA PROV
<Quote: Q004575>

$1.19
$2,380.00

No Bid

NB

$1.29
$129.00

No Bid

NB

$2.04
$1,836.00

No Bid

NB

$1.39
$3,475.00

$1.39
$3,475.00

(002985) CLARK'S TRADING
<Quote: Q004576>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.11
$2,220.00

$1.38
$414.00

NB

$2.08
$1,040.00

NB

NB

NB

$0.98
$2,450.00

(007661) JAMES J DERBA |
<Quote: Q004577>

$1.11
$2,220.00

$1.40
$420.00

$1.30
$130.00

$1.90
$950.00

$1.90
$1,710.00

$1.89
$945.00

$1.49
$3,725.00

$1.49
$3,725.00

(000276) PORTION MEAT AS
<Quote: Q004578>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.08
$2,160.00

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B01535

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

BOLOGNA, LOW SALT-NC
<17.000>
LB 100.0
SPEC NO. 2052-804 S [2E
<18.000>
LB 500.0
SALAMI, LOW SALT-NO [;
<19.000>
LB 100.0
SPEC NO. 2052-813 K [2E
<20.000>
LB 200.0
SPEC NO. 2052-815 M [2E
<21.000>
LB 50.0
SPEC NO. 2052-822 S [2E
<22.000>
LB 300.0
SPEC NO. 2052-822 S [2E
<23.000>
LB 300.0
HAM, LOW SALT-NO MOR

<24.000>

LB 100.0

(000094) ADVANCED
COMMOD
<Quote: Q004573>

(010217) AGAR SUPPLY CO (000154) CARA DONNA PROV (002985) CLARK'S TRADING
<Quote: Q004574> <Quote: Q004575> <Quote: Q004576>

(007661) JAMES J DERBA |
<Quote: Q004577>

(000276) PORTION MEAT AS
<Quote: Q004578>

No Bid $1.69 $1.69 No Bid $1.66 No Bid
$169.00 $169.00 $166.00
NB NB * NB
$1.08 $1.36 $1.39 $1.07 $1.45 No Bid
$540.00 $680.00 $695.00 $535.00 $725.00
* NB
No Bid $1.67 $1.69 No Bid $1.95 No Bid
$167.00 $169.00 $195.00
NB * NB NB
$1.27 $1.29 $1.79 No Bid $1.95 No Bid
$254.00 $258.00 $358.00 $390.00
* NB NB
No Bid $1.67 $1.69 No Bid $1.95 No Bid
$83.50 $84.50 $97.50
NB * NB NB
$1.21 $1.23 $1.29 No Bid $1.29 No Bid
$363.00 $369.00 $387.00 $387.00
* NB NB
$1.28 $1.23 $1.29 No Bid $1.29 No Bid
$384.00 $369.00 $387.00 $387.00
* NB NB
No Bid $2.14 $2.25 No Bid $2.49 No Bid
$214.00 $225.00 $249.00

NB * NB NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B01535

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

PEPPER STEAKS, TOPPE
<25.000>
LB 100.0
FINE GROUND PORK, NO
<26.000>
LB 500.0
FDA STANDARDS #19, 9 [
<27.000>
LB 100.0
PASTRAMI, (KOSHER ST
<28.000>
LB 50.0
HOUSE OF RAEFORD OR
<29.000>
LB 2400.0
LAMB, LEG, BONELESS [
<30.000>
LB 50.0
FINE GROUND LAMB, NO
<31.000>
LB 50.0
VEAL FOR STEWING. #2 [

<32.000>

LB 50.0

(000094) ADVANCED
COMMOD
<Quote: Q004573>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(010217) AGAR SUPPLY CO
<Quote: Q004574>

No Bid

NB

$0.90
$450.00

$1.55
$155.00

$2.00
$100.00

No Bid

NB

$2.49
$124.50

$2.35
$117.50

$2.00
$100.00

(000154) CARA DONNA PROV  (002985) CLARK'S TRADING

<Quote: Q004575>

$1.79
$179.00

$1.24
$620.00

$1.49
$149.00

$1.99
$99.50

$1.40
$3,360.00

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$1.49
$74.50

<Quote: Q004576>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(007661) JAMES J DERBA |
<Quote: Q004577>

No Bid

$2.57
$257.00

$0.92
$460.00

$1.65
$165.00

$1.95
$97.50

NB

$3.19
$159.50

$3.00
$150.00

$3.00
$150.00

(000276) PORTION MEAT AS

<Quote: Q004578>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B01535

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

SWISS STEAKS, 6 OZ. [2t
<33.000>

LB 100.0
Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

(000094) ADVANCED

COMMO

D

<Quote: Q004573>

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

$13,006.00
$0.00
$3,667.00

(010217) AGAR SUPPLY CO
<Quote: Q004574>

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

$19,664.50
$0.00
$3,851.00

(000154) CARA DONNA PROV

<Quote: Q004575>

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

$24,709.50
$0.00
$3,762.50

(002985) CLARK'S TRADING
<Quote: Q004576>

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

$6,659.00
$0.00
$3,399.00

(007661) JAMES J DERBA |
<Quote: Q004577>

Eval Codes: NI

$1.85

$185.00

$31,025.50
$0.00
$6,950.50

(000276) PORTION MEAT AS
<Quote: Q004578>

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

$6,150.00
$0.00
$6,150.00



