
 

State of Rhode Island, Department of Administration 
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One Capitol Hill 
Providence, Rhode Island  02908 
www.purchasing.ri.gov        (401)574-8100 

 
 
This solicitation has been awarded to the following vendor(s): 
 
 
Vendor Name PO Number 
MADISON SECURITY 3216761 
IMPERIAL SECURITY 3216762 
US SECURITY ASSOCIATION 3216764 
SECURITAS SECURITY 3216763 
 
 
 
 



MPA-296 TABULATION
SECURITY GUARD SERVICES  7448017
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# 1

MPA-296 - 3/1/1/11 - 12/31/13 - BID AN HOURLY PRICE PER SHIFT - 
ONE GUARD - MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 7:30 AM - 4:00 PM - NO 
HOLIDAY Hour  $       15.00  $    13.90  $    16.75  $    13.75  $    14.90  $    13.25  $    14.85  $    14.95  $    14.92  $    20.74  $    15.40  $    13.48 

# 2

MPA-296 - 3/1/11 - 12/31/13 - BID AN HOURLY PRICE PER SHIFT - ONE 
GUARD - MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 7:30 AM - 4:00 PM - HOLIDAY AND 
WEEKENDS Hour  $       15.00  $    13.90  $    16.75  $    14.25  $    14.90  $    13.25  $    14.85  $    14.95  $    14.92  $    13.88  $    15.40  $    13.48 

# 3

MPA-296 - 3/1/11 - 12/31/13 - BID AN HOURLY PRICE PER SHIFT - ONE 
GUARD - MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 4:00 PM - 12:00 AM MIDNIGHT - NO 
HOLIDAY Hour  $       15.00  $    13.90  $    16.75  $    13.75  $    14.90  $    13.25  $    14.85  $    14.95  $    14.92  $    13.88  $    15.40  $    13.48 

# 4

MPA-296 - 3/1/11 - 12/31/13 - BID AN HOURLY PRICE PER SHIFT - ONE 
GUARD - MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 4:00 PM - 12:00 MIDNIGHT - 
HOLIDAY AND WEEKENDS Hour  $       15.00  $    13.90  $    16.75  $    14.25  $    14.90  $    13.25  $    14.85  $    14.95  $    14.92  $    13.88  $    15.40  $    13.48 

# 5

MPA-296 - 3/1/11 - 12/31/13 - BID AN HOURLY PRICE PER SHIFT - ONE 
GUARD - MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 12:00 MIDNIGHT - 7:30 AM  - NO 
HOLIDAY Hour  $       15.00  $    13.90  $    16.75  $    13.75  $    14.90  $    13.25  $    14.85  $    14.95  $    14.92  $    13.88  $    15.40  $    13.48 

# 6

MPA-296 - 3/1/11 - 12/31/13 - BID AN HOURLY PRICE PER SHIFT - ONE 
GUARD - MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 12:00 MIDNIGHT - 7:30 AM  - 
HOLIDAYS AND WEEKENDS Hour  $       15.00  $    13.90  $    16.75  $    14.25  $    14.90  $    13.25  $    14.85  $    14.95  $    14.92  $    13.88  $    15.40  $    13.48 

# 7
MPA-296 - 1/1/14 - 12/31/15 - BID AN HOURLY PRICE PER SHIFT - ONE 
GUARD - MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 7:30 AM - 4:00 PM - NO HOLIDAY Hour  $       15.00  $    14.32  $    17.50  $    14.25  $    15.50  $    13.25  $    14.85  $    14.95  $    15.52  $    13.88  $    15.40  $    13.48 

# 8

MPA-296 - 1/1/14 - 12/31/15 - BID AN HOURLY PRICE PER SHIFT - ONE 
GUARD - MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 7:30 AM - 4:00 PM - HOLIDAY AND 
WEEKENDS Hour  $       15.00  $    14.32  $    17.50  $    14.75  $    15.50  $    13.25  $    14.85  $    14.95  $    15.52  $    13.88  $    15.40  $    13.48 

# 9

MPA-296 - 1/1/14 - 12/31/15 - BID AN HOURLY PRICE PER SHIFT - ONE 
GUARD - MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 4:00 PM - 12:00 AM MIDNIGHT - NO 
HOLIDAY Hour  $       15.00  $    14.32  $    17.50  $    14.25  $    15.50  $    13.25  $    14.85  $    14.95  $    15.52  $    13.88  $    15.40  $    13.48 

# 10

MPA-296 - 1/1/14 - 12/31/15 - BID AN HOURLY PRICE PER SHIFT - ONE 
GUARD - MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 4:00 PM - 12:00 MIDNIGHT - 
HOLIDAY AND WEEKENDS Hour  $       15.00  $    14.32  $    17.50  $    14.75  $    15.50  $    13.25  $    14.85  $    14.95  $    15.52  $    13.88  $    15.40  $    13.48 

# 11

MPA-296 - 1/1/14 - 12/31/15 - BID AN HOURLY PRICE PER SHIFT - ONE 
GUARD - MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 12:00 MIDNIGHT - 7:30 AM  - NO 
HOLIDAY Hour  $       15.00  $    14.32  $    17.50  $    14.25  $    15.50  $    13.25  $    14.85  $    14.95  $    15.52  $    13.88  $    15.40  $    13.48 

# 12

MPA-296 - 1/1/14 - 12/31/15 - BID AN HOURLY PRICE PER SHIFT - ONE 
GUARD - MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 12:00 MIDNIGHT - 7:30 AM  - 
HOLIDAYS AND WEEKENDS Hour  $       15.00  $    14.32  $    17.50  $    14.75  $    15.50  $    13.25  $    14.85  $    14.95  $    15.52  $    13.88  $    15.40  $    13.48 

# 13

MPA-296 3/1/11 - 12/31/13 PROVIDE MARKED PATROL VEHICLE(S)  - 
COST TO BE ALL INCLUSIVE - GAS, INSURANCE, MILEAGE, ETC - BID 
A COST PER VEHICLE PER DAY Day  $       35.00  $    48.57  $      4.00  $    21.00  $    45.00  $    15.00 NO BID  $    90.00  $    40.00  $    31.33  $    42.50  $    33.00 

# 14

MPA-296 1/1/14 - 12/31/15 PROVIDE MARKED PATROL VEHICLE(S) - 
COST TO BE ALL INCLUSIVE - GAS, INSURANCE, MILEAGE, ETC - BID 
A COST PER VEHICLE PER DAY Day  $       35.00  $    50.03  $      4.00  $    22.00  $    60.00  $    15.00 NO BID  $  100.00  $    50.00  $    31.33  $    47.50  $    33.00 

# 15

MPA-296 3/1/11 - 12/31/13 BID AN HOURLY RATE TO PROVIDE A 
MARKED PATROL  VEHICLE (NON SPECIFIC TO AN AGENCY) 
(MILEAGE WILL BE ADDITIONAL) Hour  $       25.00  $    19.65  NO BID  $      1.00  $    35.00  $    10.00 NO BID  $      3.75  $    35.00  $    20.00  $    35.00  $      5.68 

# 16

MPA-296 1/1/14 - 12/31/15 BID AN HOURLY RATE TO PROVIDE A 
MARKED PATROL VEHICLE (NON SPECIFIC TO AN AGENCY) 
(MILEAGE WILL BE ADDITIONAL) Hour  $       25.00  $    20.24  NO BID  $      1.50  $    45.00  $    10.00 NO BID  $      4.16  $    45.00  $    20.00  $    42.50  $      5.68 

# 17
MPA-296 3/1/11 - 12/31/13 BID A COST PER MILE FOR VEHICLE 
REFERENCED IN LINE ITEM 15 Mile  $         0.50  $      4.25  NO BID  $      0.40  $      0.50  $      0.36 NO BID  $      0.55  $      0.51  $      0.20  $      1.25  $      0.42 

# 18
MPA-296 1/1/14 - 12/31/15 BID A COST PER MILE FOR VEHICLE 
REFERENCED IN LINE ITEM 16 Mile  $         0.50  $      4.38  NO BID  $      0.50  $      0.50  $      0.36 NO BID 0.55  $      0.51  $      0.20  $      1.45  $      0.42 

TOTAL 1-18  $     301.00  $  316.44  $  217.40  $  368.40  $  209.72  $  378.41 353.66$  276.48$  355.00$  239.96$  
2 1 4 3
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