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EAGLE POINT GUN 3204338 
 
 
 
 



RFQ # 7361671
MPA # 31

AMMUNITION

Line Description Unit Quote Est Qty EAGLE POINT LAWMEN'S & SHOOTERS JUREK BROS INC
# 1 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - MILITEC, 1 GAL. CONTAINER (SYNTHEIC BASED METAL CONDITIONER) NO SUBSTITUTION Each 0.00$       10 NO BID
# 1 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - MILITEC, 1 GAL. CONTAINER (SYNTHEIC BASED METAL CONDITIONER) NO SUBSTITUTION Each 0.00$       10 NO BID
# 1 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - MILITEC, 1 GAL. CONTAINER (SYNTHEIC BASED METAL CONDITIONER) NO SUBSTITUTION Each 0.00$       10 NO BID
# 2 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLAY PIGEONS - 135/CASE - LAW ENFORCEMENT T Case 0.00$       37 NO BID
# 2 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLAY PIGEONS - 135/CASE - LAW ENFORCEMENT T Case 0.00$       37 NO BID
# 2 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLAY PIGEONS - 135/CASE - LAW ENFORCEMENT T Case 0.00$       37 NO BID
# 3 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES HOPPE'S .22 CALIBER BRONZE BORE Each 0.00$       200 NO BID
# 3 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES HOPPE'S .22 CALIBER BRONZE BORE Each 0.85$       200 170.00$           
# 3 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES HOPPE'S .22 CALIBER BRONZE BORE Each 1.14$       200 228.00$                             
# 4 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES - HOPPES .40 CALIBER BRONZE BORE Each 0.00$       200 NO BID
# 4 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES - HOPPES .40 CALIBER BRONZE BORE Each 0.85$       200 170.00$           
# 4 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES - HOPPES .40 CALIBER BRONZE BORE Each 1.14$       200 228.00$                             
# 5 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES HOPPE'S .45 CALIBER BRONZE  BORE Each 0.00$       200 NO BID
# 5 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES HOPPE'S .45 CALIBER BRONZE  BORE Each 0.85$       200 170.00$           
# 5 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES HOPPE'S .45 CALIBER BRONZE  BORE Each 1.14$       200 228.00$                             
# 6 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES HOPPE'S .223 CALIBER Each 0.00$       20 NO BID
# 6 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES HOPPE'S .223 CALIBER Each 0.90$       20 18.00$             
# 6 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES HOPPE'S .223 CALIBER Each 1.14$       20 22.80$                               
# 7 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES HOPPE'S 12 GA SHOTGUN Each 0.00$       60 NO BID
# 7 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES HOPPE'S 12 GA SHOTGUN Each 1.08$       60 64.80$             
# 7 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING BRUSHES HOPPE'S 12 GA SHOTGUN Each 1.37$       60 82.20$                               
# 8 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING PATCHES HOPPE'S - 12 GA. 25/PK NO. 1205, 1,000/PACK Package 0.00$       55 NO BID
# 8 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING PATCHES HOPPE'S - 12 GA. 25/PK NO. 1205, 1,000/PACK Pkg/500 12.00$     55 660.00$           
# 8 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING PATCHES HOPPE'S - 12 GA. 25/PK NO. 1205, 1,000/PACK Pkg/25 1.02$       55 1,122.00$                          
# 9 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING PATCHES HOPPE'S - .38/357 40/PK NO. 1204, 1,000/PACK Package 0.00$       55 NO BID
# 9 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING PATCHES HOPPE'S - .38/357 40/PK NO. 1204, 1,000/PACK Package 15.00$     55 825.00$           
# 9 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING PATCHES HOPPE'S - .38/357 40/PK NO. 1204, 1,000/PACK Package 1.02$       55 1,402.50$                          
# 10 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING PATCHES HOPPE'S - .22 CAL 60/PK NO. 1202, 1,000/PACK Package 0.00$       55 NO BID
# 10 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING PATCHES HOPPE'S - .22 CAL 60/PK NO. 1202, 1,000/PACK Package 10.00$     55 550.00$           
# 10 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING PATCHES HOPPE'S - .22 CAL 60/PK NO. 1202, 1,000/PACK Package 1.02$       55 935.02$                             
# 11 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING PATCHES, .357, CALIBER 1,000/BAG BULK KLEEN BORE Bag 0.00$       20 NO BID
# 11 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING PATCHES, .357, CALIBER 1,000/BAG BULK KLEEN BORE Bag 10.79$     20 215.80$                             
# 11 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CLEANING PATCHES, .357, CALIBER 1,000/BAG BULK KLEEN BORE Bag 15.00$     20 300.00$           
# 12 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - EAR PLUGS, FOAM 200/BOX AEARO-TASCO Box 0.00$       6 NO BID
# 12 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - EAR PLUGS, FOAM 200/BOX AEARO-TASCO Box 0.00$       6 NO BID
# 12 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - EAR PLUGS, FOAM 200/BOX AEARO-TASCO Box 17.00$     6 102.00$           
# 13 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 -"GUN SCRUBBER" SPRAY CAN, 16 OZ., 10/CARTON BIRCHWOOD CASEY Carton 0.00$       10 NO BID
# 13 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 -"GUN SCRUBBER" SPRAY CAN, 16 OZ., 10/CARTON BIRCHWOOD CASEY Carton 52.83$     10 528.30$                             
# 13 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 -"GUN SCRUBBER" SPRAY CAN, 16 OZ., 10/CARTON BIRCHWOOD CASEY Carton 60.00$     10 600.00$           
# 14 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - HOPPE'S (10-2 1/4 OZ. CANS PER CARTON) 1003B NO. 1003 Carton 0.00$       2 NO BID
# 14 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - HOPPE'S (10-2 1/4 OZ. CANS PER CARTON) 1003B NO. 1003 Carton 18.50$     2 88.80$             
# 14 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - HOPPE'S (10-2 1/4 OZ. CANS PER CARTON) 1003B NO. 1003 Carton 46.10$     2 92.20$                               
# 15 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - LUBRICATE/CLEANER BREAK FREE, PINT CLP-5 Pint 0.00$       10 NO BID
# 15 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - LUBRICATE/CLEANER BREAK FREE, PINT CLP-5 Pint 0.00$       10 NO BID
# 15 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - LUBRICATE/CLEANER BREAK FREE, PINT CLP-5 Pint 14.00$     10 140.00$           
# 16 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - NO. 9 SOLVENT, HOPPE'S, QUART NO. 932 Quart 0.00$       3 NO BID
# 16 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - NO. 9 SOLVENT, HOPPE'S, QUART NO. 932 Quart 14.00$     3 42.00$             
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# 16 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - NO. 9 SOLVENT, HOPPE'S, QUART NO. 932 Quart 15.13$     3 45.39$                               
# 17 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - PIPE CLEANERS, 44/PACK B.J. LONGS Package 0.00$       400 NO BID
# 17 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - PIPE CLEANERS, 44/PACK B.J. LONGS Package 0.00$       400 NO BID
# 17 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - PIPE CLEANERS, 44/PACK B.J. LONGS Package 0.00$       400 NO BID
# 18 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS BALL 5.56MM .223 CAL 55 GR FMJ - WINCHEST Q3131 Thousand 0.00$       30 NO BID
# 18 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS BALL 5.56MM .223 CAL 55 GR FMJ - WINCHEST Q3131 Thousand 290.00$   30 8,700.00$        
# 18 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS BALL 5.56MM .223 CAL 55 GR FMJ - WINCHEST Q3131 Thousand 337.00$   30 10,110.00$          
# 19 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS 40 CALIBER SMITH & WESSON, 180 GRAIN, FULL METAL CASE - WINCHESTER Q4238 Thousand 0.00$       105 NO BID
# 19 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS 40 CALIBER SMITH & WESSON, 180 GRAIN, FULL METAL CASE - WINCHESTER Q4238 Thousand 185.00$   105 19,425.00$      
# 19 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS 40 CALIBER SMITH & WESSON, 180 GRAIN, FULL METAL CASE - WINCHESTER Q4238 Thousand 231.00$   105 24,255.00$          
# 20 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - MPA-31 - 7/1/07 - 6/30/08 - ROUNDS 40 CALIBER, SMITH & WESSON, 180 GRAIN, WINCHESTER AMMUNITION RA Thousand 0.00$       12.5 NO BID
# 20 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - MPA-31 - 7/1/07 - 6/30/08 - ROUNDS 40 CALIBER, SMITH & WESSON, 180 GRAIN, WINCHESTER AMMUNITION RA Thousand 232.00$   12.5 2,900.00$        
# 20 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - MPA-31 - 7/1/07 - 6/30/08 - ROUNDS 40 CALIBER, SMITH & WESSON, 180 GRAIN, WINCHESTER AMMUNITION RA Thousand 312.00$   12.5 3,900.00$            
# 21 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS FEDERAL 168 GRAIN HOLLOW POINT BOAT TAIL (WHITE BOX MATCH) ,. 308 CALIBER Thousand 0.00$       6 NO BID
# 21 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS FEDERAL 168 GRAIN HOLLOW POINT BOAT TAIL (WHITE BOX MATCH) ,. 308 CALIBER Thousand 0.00$       6 NO BID
# 21 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS FEDERAL 168 GRAIN HOLLOW POINT BOAT TAIL (WHITE BOX MATCH) ,. 308 CALIBER Thousand 660.00$   6 3,960.00$        
# 22 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS FEDERAL .223 CAL (5.56 MM) T223F NOSLER BALLISTIC TIP, 500 ROUNDS/CASE Thousand 0.00$       1 NO BID
# 22 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS FEDERAL .223 CAL (5.56 MM) T223F NOSLER BALLISTIC TIP, 500 ROUNDS/CASE Thousand 0.00$       1 NO BID
# 22 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS FEDERAL .223 CAL (5.56 MM) T223F NOSLER BALLISTIC TIP, 500 ROUNDS/CASE Thousand 600.00$   1 600.00$           
# 23 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS 12 GAUGE 2 3/4" 00 BUCK WINCHESTER CASE 250 RD. XB 1200 Case 0.00$       27 NO BID
# 23 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS 12 GAUGE 2 3/4" 00 BUCK WINCHESTER CASE 250 RD. XB 1200 Case 85.00$     27 2,295.00$        
# 23 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS 12 GAUGE 2 3/4" 00 BUCK WINCHESTER CASE 250 RD. XB 1200 Case 114.00$   27 3,078.00$            
# 24 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS 12 GAUGE 2 3/4" #9 SHOT, WINCHESTER, 250 ROUNDS/CASE AA 129 Case 0.00$       20 NO BID
# 24 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS 12 GAUGE 2 3/4" #9 SHOT, WINCHESTER, 250 ROUNDS/CASE AA 129 Case 45.00$     20 900.00$           
# 24 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS 12 GAUGE 2 3/4" #9 SHOT, WINCHESTER, 250 ROUNDS/CASE AA 129 Case 75.00$     20 1,500.00$            
# 25 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - GAUGE 2 3/4" #8 SHOT, LOW BRASS, WINCHESTER XU 126, XU128 Thousand 0.00$       20 NO BID
# 25 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - GAUGE 2 3/4" #8 SHOT, LOW BRASS, WINCHESTER XU 126, XU128 Thousand 152.00$   20 3,040.00$        
# 25 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - GAUGE 2 3/4" #8 SHOT, LOW BRASS, WINCHESTER XU 126, XU128 Thousand 250.00$   20 5,000.00$            
# 26 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS WINCHESTER, 12 GAUGE, LOW RECOIL AAL 129 Thousand 0.00$       5 NO BID
# 26 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS WINCHESTER, 12 GAUGE, LOW RECOIL AAL 129 Thousand 248.00$   5 1,240.00$        
# 26 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS WINCHESTER, 12 GAUGE, LOW RECOIL AAL 129 Thousand 300.00$   5 1,500.00$            
# 27 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS WINCHESTER 12 GA RIFLE SLUG CASE 250 RD X 12RS15 Case 0.00$       25 NO BID
# 27 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS WINCHESTER 12 GA RIFLE SLUG CASE 250 RD X 12RS15 Case 83.00$     25 2,075.00$        
# 27 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS WINCHESTER 12 GA RIFLE SLUG CASE 250 RD X 12RS15 Case 118.75$   25 2,968.75$            
# 28 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS WINCHESTER 12 GA RIFLE SLUG, REDUCED RECOIL, 250 RD RA 12RS 15 Case 0.00$       22 NO BID
# 28 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS WINCHESTER 12 GA RIFLE SLUG, REDUCED RECOIL, 250 RD RA 12RS 15 Case 90.00$     22 1,980.00$        
# 28 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS WINCHESTER 12 GA RIFLE SLUG, REDUCED RECOIL, 250 RD RA 12RS 15 Case 118.75$   22 2,612.50$            
# 29 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS WINCHESTER 230 GRAIN BALL, 45 CALIBER Q4170 Thousand 0.00$       1.5 NO BID
# 29 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS WINCHESTER 230 GRAIN BALL, 45 CALIBER Q4170 Thousand 210.00$   1.5 315.00$           
# 29 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ROUNDS WINCHESTER 230 GRAIN BALL, 45 CALIBER Q4170 Thousand 275.00$   1.5 412.50$               
# 30 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11- SHOTGUN TEAR GUN CARTRIDGE CS/CN 12 GA 25/PK FERRET/DEF TEC Lot 0.00$       2 NO BID
# 30 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11- SHOTGUN TEAR GUN CARTRIDGE CS/CN 12 GA 25/PK FERRET/DEF TEC Lot 0.00$       2 NO BID
# 30 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11- SHOTGUN TEAR GUN CARTRIDGE CS/CN 12 GA 25/PK FERRET/DEF TEC Lot 0.00$       2 NO BID
# 31 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ARMY "L" TARGETS B-22 ROCKWOOD Hundred 0.00$       50 NO BID
# 31 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ARMY "L" TARGETS B-22 ROCKWOOD Hundred 20.00$     50 1,000.00$        
# 31 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - ARMY "L" TARGETS B-22 ROCKWOOD Hundred 22.28$     50 1,114.00$                          
# 32 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CORRUGATED TARGET BACKING - 36" X 48" 275 T QAS, ROCKWOOD, LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS Hundred 0.00$       50 NO BID
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# 32 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CORRUGATED TARGET BACKING - 36" X 48" 275 T QAS, ROCKWOOD, LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS Hundred 150.00$   50 7,500.00$        
# 32 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CORRUGATED TARGET BACKING - 36" X 48" 275 T QAS, ROCKWOOD, LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS Hundred 163.35$   50 8,167.50$                          
# 33 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - POLICE SILHOUETTE TARGETS B-21X 25' ROCKWOOD, LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS Hundred 0.00$       150 NO BID
# 33 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - POLICE SILHOUETTE TARGETS B-21X 25' ROCKWOOD, LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS Hundred 3.96$       150 594.00$                             
# 33 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - POLICE SILHOUETTE TARGETS B-21X 25' ROCKWOOD, LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS Hundred 4.00$       150 600.00$           
# 34 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - POLICE SILHOUETTE TARGETS B-21 X 50' ROCKWOOD, LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS Each 0.00$       150 NO BID
# 34 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - POLICE SILHOUETTE TARGETS B-21 X 50' ROCKWOOD, LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS Each 0.14$       150 21.00$                               
# 34 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - POLICE SILHOUETTE TARGETS B-21 X 50' ROCKWOOD, LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS Each 0.16$       150 24.00$             
# 35 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET FBI - Q PAPER TARGETS ROCKWOOD, LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS, INC. Hundred 0.00$       50 NO BID
# 35 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET FBI - Q PAPER TARGETS ROCKWOOD, LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS, INC. Hundred 23.50$     50 1,175.00$        
# 35 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET FBI - Q PAPER TARGETS ROCKWOOD, LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS, INC. Hundred 24.20$     50 1,210.00$                          
# 36 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET FBI-Q (19" X 31" CARDBOARD) Each 0.00$       50 NO BID
# 36 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET FBI-Q (19" X 31" CARDBOARD) Each 0.63$       50 31.50$             
# 36 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET FBI-Q (19" X 31" CARDBOARD) Each 0.64$       50 32.00$                               
# 37 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGETS, PAPER DOT-2 (20" X 20 1/2" DOTS) Each 0.00$       500 NO BID
# 37 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGETS, PAPER DOT-2 (20" X 20 1/2" DOTS) Each 0.11$       500 55.00$             
# 37 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGETS, PAPER DOT-2 (20" X 20 1/2" DOTS) Each 0.12$       500 60.00$                               
# 38 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET - QCB - FAC (FACER ON TARGET) LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS, INC. Hundred 0.00$       50 NO BID
# 38 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET - QCB - FAC (FACER ON TARGET) LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS, INC. Hundred 55.00$     50 2,750.00$        
# 38 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET - QCB - FAC (FACER ON TARGET) LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS, INC. Hundred 57.20$     50 2,860.00$                          
# 39 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET #530 (5 BULLSEYE) LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS, INC. Hundred 0.00$       50 NO BID
# 39 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET #530 (5 BULLSEYE) LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS, INC. Hundred 30.80$     50 1,540.00$                          
# 39 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET #530 (5 BULLSEYE) LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS, INC. Hundred 32.00$     50 1,600.00$        
# 40 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGETS, CAT-1V US CUSTOMS Each 0.00$       500 NO BID
# 40 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGETS, CAT-1V US CUSTOMS Each 0.28$       500 140.00$           
# 40 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGETS, CAT-1V US CUSTOMS Each 0.28$       500 140.00$                             
# 41 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 24" X 35" #BAC-PLAS 1 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 0.00$       50 NO BID
# 41 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 24" X 35" #BAC-PLAS 1 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 1.00$       50 50.00$             
# 41 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 24" X 35" #BAC-PLAS 1 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 1.00$       50 50.00$                               
# 42 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 24" X 45", #BAC-PLAS 2 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 0.00$       50 NO BID
# 42 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 24" X 45", #BAC-PLAS 2 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 1.00$       50 50.00$             
# 42 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 24" X 45", #BAC-PLAS 2 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 1.40$       50 70.00$                               
# 43 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 35" X 45" #BAC-PLAS 3 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 0.00$       50 NO BID
# 43 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 35" X 45" #BAC-PLAS 3 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 1.20$       50 60.00$             
# 43 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 35" X 45" #BAC-PLAS 3 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 1.40$       50 70.00$                               
# 44 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 36" X 48" #BAC-PLAS 4 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 0.00$       50 NO BID
# 44 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 36" X 48" #BAC-PLAS 4 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 1.50$       50 75.00$             
# 44 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 36" X 48" #BAC-PLAS 4 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 1.82$       50 91.00$                               
# 45 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 24" X 48" #BAC-PLAS 5 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 0.00$       50 NO BID
# 45 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 24" X 48" #BAC-PLAS 5 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 1.00$       50 50.00$             
# 45 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - TARGET BACKERS, PLASTIC CARDBOARD, 24" X 48" #BAC-PLAS 5 (LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGETS ITEM #) Each 1.65$       50 82.50$                               
# 46 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - SPEER .357 SIG TMJ (TOTAL METAL JACKET) #53919 Thousand 0.00$       1 NO BID
# 46 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - SPEER .357 SIG TMJ (TOTAL METAL JACKET) #53919 Thousand 0.00$       1 NO BID
# 46 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - SPEER .357 SIG TMJ (TOTAL METAL JACKET) #53919 Thousand 210.00$   1 210.00$           
# 47 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - SPEER .357 SIG GDHP (GOLD DOT HOLLOW POINT) #54234 Thousand 0.00$       1 NO BID
# 47 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - SPEER .357 SIG GDHP (GOLD DOT HOLLOW POINT) #54234 Thousand 0.00$       1 NO BID
# 47 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - SPEER .357 SIG GDHP (GOLD DOT HOLLOW POINT) #54234 Thousand 331.00$   1 331.00$           
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RFQ # 7361671
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AMMUNITION

Line Description Unit Quote Est Qty EAGLE POINT LAWMEN'S & SHOOTERS JUREK BROS INC
Suppliers Totals

# 48 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CCI BLAZER 180 GR .40 CALIBER FMJ CCI 3592 Thousand 0.00$       1 NO BID
# 48 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CCI BLAZER 180 GR .40 CALIBER FMJ CCI 3592 Thousand 0.00$       1 NO BID
# 48 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CCI BLAZER 180 GR .40 CALIBER FMJ CCI 3592 Thousand 185.00$   1 185.00$           
# 49 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - FEDERAL TACTICAL RIFLE CARTRIDGE 223 REMINGTON 55 GRAIN TACTICAL LOAD #LE 223T1 200/CASE Case 0.00$       1 NO BID
# 49 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - FEDERAL TACTICAL RIFLE CARTRIDGE 223 REMINGTON 55 GRAIN TACTICAL LOAD #LE 223T1 200/CASE Case 0.00$       1 NO BID
# 49 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - FEDERAL TACTICAL RIFLE CARTRIDGE 223 REMINGTON 55 GRAIN TACTICAL LOAD #LE 223T1 200/CASE Case 215.00$   1 215.00$           
# 50 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - 49 S&W 125 GRAIN NTF ITEM CODE #040-125TFP-M3 1,000/CS Case 0.00$       150 NO BID
# 50 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - 49 S&W 125 GRAIN NTF ITEM CODE #040-125TFP-M3 1,000/CS Case 0.00$       150 NO BID
# 50 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - 49 S&W 125 GRAIN NTF ITEM CODE #040-125TFP-M3 1,000/CS Case 330.00$   150 49,500.00$      
# 51 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - 40 S&W 125 GRAIN HP STD ITEM CODE #040-125XHP-M 1,000/CS Case 0.00$       75 NO BID
# 51 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - 40 S&W 125 GRAIN HP STD ITEM CODE #040-125XHP-M 1,000/CS Case 0.00$       75 NO BID
# 51 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - 40 S&W 125 GRAIN HP STD ITEM CODE #040-125XHP-M 1,000/CS Case 0.00$       75 NO BID
# 52 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - .45 AUTO 155 GRAIN FP NTF ITEM CODE #045-155TFP-M1 1,000/CS Case 0.00$       100 NO BID
# 52 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - .45 AUTO 155 GRAIN FP NTF ITEM CODE #045-155TFP-M1 1,000/CS Case 0.00$       100 NO BID
# 52 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - .45 AUTO 155 GRAIN FP NTF ITEM CODE #045-155TFP-M1 1,000/CS Case 340.00$   100 34,000.00$      
# 53 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - .45 AUTO 155 GRAIN HP STD ITEM CODE #045-155XHP-MX 1,000/CS Case 0.00$       15 NO BID
# 53 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - .45 AUTO 155 GRAIN HP STD ITEM CODE #045-155XHP-MX 1,000/CS Case 0.00$       15 NO BID
# 53 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - .45 AUTO 155 GRAIN HP STD ITEM CODE #045-155XHP-MX 1,000/CS Case 0.00$       15 NO BID
# 54 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - 12 GAUGE (9 PELLET) 270 GRAIN STD ITEM CODE #012-Q09SHT-C2 250/CS Case 0.00$       120 NO BID
# 54 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - 12 GAUGE (9 PELLET) 270 GRAIN STD ITEM CODE #012-Q09SHT-C2 250/CS Case 0.00$       120 NO BID
# 54 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - 12 GAUGE (9 PELLET) 270 GRAIN STD ITEM CODE #012-Q09SHT-C2 250/CS Case 220.00$   120 26,400.00$      
# 55 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 -  12 GAUGE (SLUG) 325 GRAIN STD ITEM CODE #012-325SLG-CX 250/CS Case 0.00$       20 NO BID
# 55 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 -  12 GAUGE (SLUG) 325 GRAIN STD ITEM CODE #012-325SLG-CX 250/CS Case 0.00$       20 NO BID
# 55 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 -  12 GAUGE (SLUG) 325 GRAIN STD ITEM CODE #012-325SLG-CX 250/CS Case 214.00$   20 4,280.00$        
# 56 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - .223 REM 42 GRAIN RTP-STD ITEM CODE #223-042 RTP - M 1,000/CS Case 0.00$       100 NO BID
# 56 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - .223 REM 42 GRAIN RTP-STD ITEM CODE #223-042 RTP - M 1,000/CS Case 0.00$       100 NO BID
# 56 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - .223 REM 42 GRAIN RTP-STD ITEM CODE #223-042 RTP - M 1,000/CS Case 690.00$   100 69,000.00$      
# 57 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CCI SPEER #53368 RHT .357 SIG 100 GRAIN NON-LEAD, 1000 ROUNDS PER PACKAGE - NO SUBSTITUTION Each 0.00$       30 NO BID
# 57 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CCI SPEER #53368 RHT .357 SIG 100 GRAIN NON-LEAD, 1000 ROUNDS PER PACKAGE - NO SUBSTITUTION Each 0.00$       30 NO BID
# 57 MPA-31 - 7/1/10 - 6/30/11 - CCI SPEER #53368 RHT .357 SIG 100 GRAIN NON-LEAD, 1000 ROUNDS PER PACKAGE - NO SUBSTITUTION Each 320.00$   30 9,600.00$        

VENDOR,S TOTALS: 260,212.10$   21,232.21$                       55,336.75$          

NOTES:  Item # 8 - Eagle Point bid on Package of 500 while Lawmen,s & Shooters', bid on packages of 25.
                    To compare the two we multiplied Lawmen's price for 25/pkg by 20.
    Item # 9 - Eagle Point bid on Package of 1,000 while Lawmen's & Shooters' bid on 40/pkg. 
                    Therefore, we multiplied Lawmen's pricing by 25 to compare.
    Item # 10-Eagle Point bid on Package of 1000 while Lawmen's & Shooters' bid on 60/pkg.
                    Therefore, we multiplied Lawmen's pricing by 16.6667 to compare.
    Item # 14-Eagle Point bid on 10 cans per box while Lawmen's & Shooters bid on 24 Cans/box
                   Therefore we multiplied Eagle Point's bid price by 2.4 to compare.
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