
COMMODITY: CUPS CONTAINERS (MPA 150)
BID #:   7089877  CLOSING DATE TIME:  6/19/08 - 11:15 AM
BLANKET REQUIREMENTS: 7/1/08 - 7/31/09

ATTACHMENT "A" 1

NO. BRAND & PKG UNIT BRAND & PKGUNIT NO.BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT
STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE

1 DART 6J6 CS              $15.01 /M DART 6J6 CS              $14.63 /M1 DART 6J6 CS $14.28/M 1 DART 6J6 CS        $14.01      /M 1 DART 6J6 CS      $19.25/M

BRAND:  DART $15.01/CS BRAND:  DART $1463/CS BRAND: $14.28/CS   DART $14.01/CS BRAND:  DART /CS
STOCK #:  6J6 1000/CS CT STOCK #:  6J6 1M/CS CT STOCK #: 1M/CS CT STOCK #:6J6 1000/CS CT STOCK #:DRC6J6 /CS CT

2 DART 6JL CS              $10.21 /M DART 6JL CS             $9.95  /M 2 DART 6JL CS   $9.65  /M 2 DART 6JL CS   $9.53            /M 2 DART 6JL CS         $13.50/M

BRAND:  DART $10.21/CS BRAND:  DART $9.95/CS BRAND: $9.65/CS BRAND  DART: $9.53/CS BRAND:  DART /CS
STOCK #:  6JL 1000/CS CT STOCK #:  6JL 1M/CS CT STOCK #: 1M/CS CT STOCK #:6JL 1000/CS CT STOCK #DRC6JL: /CS CT

3 DART 8J8 CS $16.50/M DART 8J8 CS $17.13/M 3 DART 8J8 CS $16.61/M 3 DART 8J8 CS $16.41 3 DART 8J8 CS $15.80/M

BRAND:  DART $16.50/CS BRAND:  DART $17.13/CS BRAND: $16.61/CS BRAND  DART: $16.41/CS BRAND: DART /CS
STOCK #:  8J8  1000 /CSCT STOCK #:  8J8 1M /CSCT STOCK #: 1M /CSCT STOCK #:8J8 1000  /CSCT STOCK #:DRC8J8   /CSCT

4 DART 8JL CS $10.40/M DART 8JL CS $10.18/M 4 DART 8JL CS $9.87/M 4 DART 8JL CS $9.75/M 4 DART 8JL CS $14.14/M

BRAND:  DART $10.40/CS BRAND:  DART $10.18/CS BRAND: $9.87/CS BRAND: DART $9.75/CS BRAND: DART /CS
STOCK #:  8JL 1000/CS CT STOCK #:  8JL 1M/CS CT STOCK #: 1M/CS CT STOCK #:8JL 1000/CS CT DRC8JL /CS CT

5 DART 12J12 CS $24.90/M DART 12J12 CS $24.29/M 5 DART 12J12 CS $23.55/M 5 DART 12J12 CS $23.26/M 5 DART 12J12 CS $23.30/M

BRAND:  DART $24.90/CS BRAND: $24.29/CS BRAND: $23.55/CS BRAND:  DART $23.26/CS BRAND:  DART /CS
STOCK #:  12J12 1000/CS.CT STOCK #: 1M /CSCT STOCK #: 1M/CS.CT STOCK #:12J12 1000/CS.CT STOCK #:  DRC12J12 /CS.CT

6 SWEETHEART RD5 CS $22.70/M SWEETHEART RD5 CS /M 6 SWEETHEART RD5 CS $22.78/M 6 SWEETHEART RD5 CS /M 6 SWEETHEART RD5 CS $29.50/M

BRAND:  SOLO $68.11/CS BRAND: /CS BRAND: Solo $68.34/CS BRAND: /CS BRAND:  DIXIE /CS
STOCK #:  RD5N 3000/CS.CT. STOCK #: /CS.CT. STOCK #:  R53 3M/CS.CT. STOCK #: /CS.CT. STOCK #:DXE58SAGE /CS.CT.

7 GENPAK 100PL CS $6.78/M GENPAK 100PL CS /M 7 GENPAK 100PL CS $6.88/M 7 GENPAK 100PL CS $8.55/M 7 GENPAK 100PL CS /M

BRAND  GENPAK $33.92/CS BRAND /CS BRAND $34.39/CS BRAND GENPAK $42.75/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  F100 5000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # 5M/CS.CT. STOCK #F100 5000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

8 SOLO P200 CS $9.64/M SOLO P200 CS $12.21/M 8 SOLO P200 CS $9.19/M 8 SOLO P200 CS $10.01/M 8 SOLO P200 CS /M

BRAND  FABRIKAL $24.11/CS BRAND  FABRIKAL $30.54/CS BRAND FABRICAL $22.98/CS BRAND DART $25.07/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  PC200 2500/CS.CT. STOCK #PC200 2500/CS.CT. STOCK # PC200 2500/CS.CT. STOCK #200PC 2500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

9 DART 9 PWC CS $27.70/M DART 9 PWC CS $28.18/M 9 DART 9 PWC CS $26.95/M 9 DART 9 PWC CS $27.00/M 9 DART 9 PWC CS $43.72/M

BRAND  DART / PACTIV $13.85/CS BRAND  DART $14.09/CS BRAND GENPAK $13.47/CS BRAND  DART $13.50/CS BRAND $21.86/CS
STOCK #  9PWC / THI-0009 500/CS.CT. STOCK #9PWC 500/CS.CT. STOCK #80900 500/CS.CT. STOCK #9PWC 500/CS.CT. STOCK #WCP9PWC 500/CS.CT.

10 PREMIERE 226 CS $8.90/M PREMIERE 226 CS /M 10 PREMIERE 226 CS $38.58/M 10 PREMIERE 226 CS $39.50/M 10 PREMIERE 226 CS $54.10/M

VENDOR:  W. B. MASONVENDOR:  EASTERN BAG VENDOR:  E.B. THOMSEN VENDOR:  MANSFIELD PAPER VENDOR:  TAA DISTRIBUTION



COMMODITY: CUPS CONTAINERS (MPA 150)
BID #:   7089877  CLOSING DATE TIME:  6/19/08 - 11:15 AM
BLANKET REQUIREMENTS: 7/1/08 - 7/31/09

ATTACHMENT "A" 2

NO. BRAND & PKG UNIT BRAND & PKGUNIT NO.BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT
STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE

VENDOR:  W. B. MASONVENDOR:  EASTERN BAG VENDOR:  E.B. THOMSEN VENDOR:  MANSFIELD PAPER VENDOR:  TAA DISTRIBUTION

BRAND  ASPEN $8.90/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  GREENWAVE $38.58/CS BRAND  BERKLEY $39.50/CS BRAND DIXIE $54.10/CS
STOCK #  PD6W10 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #TWP00001 1M/CS.CT. STOCK #ENVYPO6 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #DXEUX6SAGECT 1000/CS.CT.

11 PREMIERE 229 CS $27.04/M PREMIERE 229 CS /M 11 PREMIERE 229 CS $88.20/M 11 PREMIERE 229 CS $87.98/M 11 PREMIERE 229 CS $61.84/M

BRAND  SOLO $27.04/CS BRAND /CS BRAND GREENWAVE $44.10/CS BRAND  BERKLEY $43.99/CS BRAND  DIXIE $61.84/CS
STOCK #  CPD910 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #TWP00010 500/CS.CT. STOCK #ENVYPO9 500/CS.CT. STOCK #DXEUX9SAGECT 1000/CS.CT.

12 PACTIV M25-0044 CS $125.94/M PACTIV M25-0044 CS /M 12 PACTIV M25-0044 CS $100.44/M 12 PACTIV M25-0044 CS /M 12 PACTIV M25-0044 CS $76.46/M

BRAND  PACTIV $60.97/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  GREENWAVE $50.22/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  CHINEXT $76.46/CS
STOCK #  M25-0044 500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #TWP00005 500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #HTMVSTACT 1000/CS.CT.

13 DART 35BWNC CS $12.70/M DART 35BWNC CS $16.37/M 13 DART 35BWNC CS $15.75/M 13 DART 35BWNC CS $15.67/M 13 DART 35BWNC CS /M

BRAND  PACTIV $12.70/CS BRAND  DART $16.37/CS BRAND  GENPAK $15.75/CS BRAND $15.67/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  THI-0004 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #35BWWC 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #80500 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

14 DART 8B20 CS $29.40/M DART 8B20 CS $30.98/M 14 DART 8B20 CS $29.98/M 14 DART 8B20 CS $29.67/M 14 DART 8B20 CS /M

BRAND  DART $29.40/CS BRAND  DART $30.98/CS BRAND  DART $29.98/CS BRAND  DART $29.67/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  8B20 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #8B20 1M/CS.CT. STOCK #8B20 1M/CS.CT. STOCK #8B20 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

15 DART 95HT3 CS $72.05/M DART 95HT3 CS $77.95/M 15 DART 95HT3 CS $78.58/M 15 DART 95HT3 CS $75.85/M 15 DART 95HT3 CS /M

BRAND  PACTIV $14.41/CS BRAND GEN PAK $15.59/CS BRAND  GENPAK $14.71/CS BRAND  DART $15.17/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  TDI-9903 200/CS.CT. STOCK #SN 203 200/CS.CT. STOCK #2030V 200/CS.CT. STOCK #95HT3 200/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

16 GENPAK 10600 CS $55.52/M GENPAK 10600 CS /M 16 GENPAK 10600 CS $57.88/M 16 GENPAK 10600 CS $51.00/M 16 GENPAK 10600 CS /M

BRAND  PACTIV $27.76/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  GENPAK $25.94/CS BRAND  GENPAK $25.50/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  THI-0601 500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #106 500/CS.CT. STOCK #10600 500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

17 GENPAK 10500 CS $37.10/M GENPAK 10500 CS /M 17 GENPAK 10500 CS $35.94/M 17 GENPAK 10500 CS $37.50/M 17 GENPAK 10500 CS /M

BRAND  PACTIV $18.55/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  GENPAK $17.97/CS BRAND  GENPAK $18.75/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  THI-0500 500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #105 500/CS.CT. STOCK #10500 500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

18 PLASTIQUES 34 WHT CS NO BID /M PLASTIQUES 34 WHT CS /M 18 PLASTIQUES 34 WHT CS /M 18 PLASTIQUES 34 WHT CS /M 18 PLASTIQUES 34 WHT CS /M

BRAND NO  BID /CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

19 SOLO RKNCSN CS $7.10/M SOLO RKNCSN CS /M 19 SOLO RKNCSN CS $6.58/M 19 SOLO RKNCSN CS $8.25/M 19 SOLO RKNCSN CS $13.63/M

BRAND  BANYAN $7.10/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  BERK $6.58/CS BRAND  MERIT $8.25/CS BRAND  DIXIE /CS
STOCK #  MKP01 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #RKDCSN 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #DXEPKM21 /CS.CT.



COMMODITY: CUPS CONTAINERS (MPA 150)
BID #:   7089877  CLOSING DATE TIME:  6/19/08 - 11:15 AM
BLANKET REQUIREMENTS: 7/1/08 - 7/31/09

ATTACHMENT "A" 3

NO. BRAND & PKG UNIT BRAND & PKGUNIT NO.BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT
STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE

VENDOR:  W. B. MASONVENDOR:  EASTERN BAG VENDOR:  E.B. THOMSEN VENDOR:  MANSFIELD PAPER VENDOR:  TAA DISTRIBUTION

20 SOLO RFKCSN CS $7.10/M SOLO RFKCSN CS /M 20 SOLO RFKCSN CS $6.58/M 20 SOLO RFKCSN CS $8.25/M 20 SOLO RFKCSN CS $13.63/M

BRAND  BANYAN $7.10/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  BERK $6.58/CS BRAND  MERIT $8.25/CS BRAND  DIXIE /CS
STOCK #  MFP01 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #  RFKCSN 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #DXEPFM21 /CS.CT.

21 SOLO RSOUPCSN CS $7.10/M SOLO RSOUPCSN CS /M 21 SOLO RSOUPCSN CS $6.58/M 21 SOLO RSOUPCSN CS $8.25/M 21 SOLO RSOUPCSN CS $27.56/M

BRAND  BANYAN $7.1/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  BERK $6.58/CS BRAND  MERIT $8.25/CS BRAND DIXIE /CS
STOCK #  MSSP01 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #RSO0PCSN 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #DXEPSM21 /CS.CT.

22 SOLO RSPC5N CS $7.10/M SOLO RSPC5N CS /M 22 SOLO RSPC5N CS $6.58/M 22 SOLO RSPC5N CS $8.25/M 22 SOLO RSPC5N CS $13.63/M

BRAND  BANYAN $7.10/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  BERK $6.58/CS BRAND  MERIT $8.25/CS BRAND  DIXIE /CS
STOCK #  MTP01 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #RSPCSN 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #DXEPTM21 /CS.CT.

23 DART 4J6 CS $18.00/M DART 4J6 CS $17.63/M 23 DART 4J6 CS $17.10/M 23 DART 4J6 CS $16.88/M 23 DART 4J6 CS /M

BRAND  DART $18.00/CS BRAND $17.63/CS BRAND  DART $17.10/CS BRAND  DART $16.88/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  4J6 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #456 1M/CS.CT. STOCK #4J6 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

24 SAFETYZONE GDPL-XL-5 CS NO BID /BX SAFETYZONE GDPL-XL-5 CS /BX 24 SAFETYZONE GDPL-XL-5 CS $5.78/BX 24 SAFETYZONE GDPL-XL-5 CS /BX 24 SAFETYZONE GDPL-XL-5 CS /BX

BRAND /CS BRAND /CS BRAND  SAFETY ZONE $57.82/CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS
STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #GDPL -XL-5 10M/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

25 IMPERIAL DFR-12-CONT. CS NO BID /M IMPERIAL DFR-12-CONT. CS /M 25 IMPERIAL DFR-12-CONT. CS $132.38/M 25 IMPERIAL DFR-12-CONT. CS $174.00/M 25 IMPERIAL DFR-12-CONT. CS /M
IMPERIAL LFRFH-12-LID IMPERIAL LFRFH-12-LID IMPERIAL LFRFH-12-LID IMPERIAL LFRFH-12-LID IMPERIAL LFRFH-12-LID
BRAND /CS BRAND /CS BRAND  IMPERIAL $132.38/CS BRAND  INT. PAPER $43.50/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #LFRFH-12 1M/CS.CT. STOCK #DFRC-12 250/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

BRAND IMPERIAL $119.89/M COMBO
STOCK #LFRFH-12 $119.89/CS

1M/CS.CT.
26 SWEETHEART 8XTX CS $38.68/M SWEETHEART 8XTX CS /M 26 SWEETHEART 8XTX CS $45.99/M 26 SWEETHEART 8XTX CS $20.37/M 26 SWEETHEART 8XTX CS /M

BRAND  SOLO $38.68/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  SOLO $45.99/CS BRAND  DART $20.37/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  X8 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #X8 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

27 SWEETHEART 12XTX CS $53.91/M SWEETHEART 12XTX CS /M 27 SWEETHEART 12XTX CS $60.98/M 27 SWEETHEART 12XTX CS $32.17/M 27 SWEETHEART 12XTX CS /M

BRAND  SOLO $53.91/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  SOLO $60.98/CS BRAND  DART $32.17/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  X12 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #X12 1M/CS.CT. STOCK #12LX16E 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.



COMMODITY: CUPS CONTAINERS (MPA 150)
BID #:   7089877  CLOSING DATE TIME:  6/19/08 - 11:15 AM
BLANKET REQUIREMENTS: 7/1/08 - 7/31/09

ATTACHMENT "A" 4

NO. BRAND & PKG UNIT BRAND & PKGUNIT NO.BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT
STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE

VENDOR:  W. B. MASONVENDOR:  EASTERN BAG VENDOR:  E.B. THOMSEN VENDOR:  MANSFIELD PAPER VENDOR:  TAA DISTRIBUTION

28 SWEETHEART 16XTX CS $64.18/M SWEETHEART 16XTX CS /M 28 SWEETHEART 16XTX CS $78.48/M 28 SWEETHEART 16XTX CS $40.70/M 28 SWEETHEART 16XTX CS /M

BRAND  SOLO $64.18/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  SOLO $58.86/CS BRAND  DART $40.70/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  X16 750/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #X16 750/CS.CT. STOCK #16LX16E 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

29 SWEETHEART 20XTX CS $73.86/M SWEETHEART 20XTX CS /M 29 SWEETHEART 20XTX CS $97.62/M 29 SWEETHEART 20XTX CS $50.16/M 29 SWEETHEART 20XTX CS /M

BRAND  SOLO $55.40/CS BRAND /CS BRAND SOLO $73.21/CS BRAND  DART $25.08/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  X20 750/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #X20 750/CS.CT. STOCK #20LX16E 500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

30 SWEETHEART LX125B CS $14.28/M SWEETHEART LX125B CS /M 30 SWEETHEART LX125B CS $35.45 30 SWEETHEART LX125B CS $15.26/M 30 SWEETHEART LX125B CS /M

BRAND  SOLO $28.57/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  SOLO $35.45/CS BRAND  DART $15.26/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  LX125B 2000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #LGX12R 1M/CS.CT. STOCK #16FTH 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

31 SWEETHEART S55DB CS $26.31/M SWEETHEART S55DB CS /M 31 SWEETHEART S55DB CS $71.25/M 31 SWEETHEART S55DB CS $18.75/M 31 SWEETHEART S55DB CS /M

BRAND  SOLO $26.31/CS BRAND /CS BRAND SOLO $71.25/CS BRAND  DART $18.75/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  RS50B 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #SS5DBY 1M/CS.CT. SBWWQ 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

32 SWEETHEART SS12BX CS $28.21/M SWEETHEART SS12BX CS /M 32 SWEETHEART SS12BX CS $85.97/M 32 SWEETHEART SS12BX CS $18.75/M 32 SWEETHEART SS12BX CS $39.75/M

BRAND  SOLO $28.21/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  SOLO $85.97/CS BRAND  DART $18.75/CS BRAND  SOLO $39.75/CS
STOCK #  R512B 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #SS12BN 1M/CS.CT. STOCK #12BWWQ 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #SLORS12BNW 1000/CS.CT.

33 SWEETHEART SS6BP CS $23.80/M SWEETHEART SS6BP CS /M 33 SWEETHEART SS6BP CS $79.68/M 33 SWEETHEART SS6BP CS $12.95/M 33 SWEETHEART SS6BP CS $51.12/M

BRAND  SOLO $23.80/CS BRAND /CS BRAND SOLO $79.68/CS BRAND  DART $12.95/CS BRAND SOLO $6.39/CS
STOCK #  RS6BP 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #SS6BPY 1M/CS.CT. STOCK #6PWC 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #SLO6BPMD 125/CS.CT.

34 SWEETHEART SS105 CS $19.32/M SWEETHEART SS105 CS /M 34 SWEETHEART SS105 CS $188.74/M 34 SWEETHEART SS105 CS $49.28/M 34 SWEETHEART SS105 CS $71.36/M

BRAND  SOLO $38.65/CS BRAND /CS BRAND SOLO $94.37/CS BRAND  DART $24.64/CS BRAND  BOARDWALK $35.68/CS
STOCK # RS105 500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #SS105Y 500/CS.CT. STOCK #10PWQ 500/CS.CT. STOCK #BWK10FPL 500/CS.CT.

35 SWEETHEART SS11P CS $214.78/M SWEETHEART SS11P CS /M 35 SWEETHEART SS11P CS $223.63/M 35 SWEETHEART SS11P CS $53.32/M 35 SWEETHEART SS11P CS /M

BRAND  SOLO $107.39/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  SOLO $111.81/CS BRAND  DART $26.66/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  SS11P 500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #SS11PY 500/CS.CT. STOCK #11PRWQ 500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

36 SWEETHEART LS5DB CS NO BID /M SWEETHEART LS5DB CS /M 36 SWEETHEART LS5DB CS $114.91/M 36 SWEETHEART LS5DB CS /M 36 SWEETHEART LS5DB CS /M

BRAND /CS BRAND /CS BRAND SOLO $114.91/CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS
STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #LS5DBC 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

37 SWEETHEART LCGTKK CS $267.52/M SWEETHEART LCGTKK CS /M 37 SWEETHEART LCGTKK CS $383.95/M 37 SWEETHEART LCGTKK CS /M 37 SWEETHEART LCGTKK CS /M

BRAND  SOLO $66.88/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  SOLO $95.98/CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS



COMMODITY: CUPS CONTAINERS (MPA 150)
BID #:   7089877  CLOSING DATE TIME:  6/19/08 - 11:15 AM
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ATTACHMENT "A" 5

NO. BRAND & PKG UNIT BRAND & PKGUNIT NO.BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT
STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE

VENDOR:  W. B. MASONVENDOR:  EASTERN BAG VENDOR:  E.B. THOMSEN VENDOR:  MANSFIELD PAPER VENDOR:  TAA DISTRIBUTION

STOCK #  LC6TKX 250/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #LC6TKX 250/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

38 SWEETHEART LS10CY CS NO BID /M SWEETHEART LS10CY CS /M 38 SWEETHEART LS10CY CS $525.98/M 38 SWEETHEART LS10CY CS /M 38 SWEETHEART LS10CY CS /M

BRAND /CS BRAND /CS BRAND  SOLO $131.49/CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS
STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #LC10TK 250/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

39 SWEETHEART LS11P CS NO BID /M SWEETHEART LS11P CS /M 39 SWEETHEART LS11P CS $285.03/M 39 SWEETHEART LS11P CS /M 39 SWEETHEART LS11P CS /M

BRAND /CS BRAND /CS BRAND SOLO $142.51/CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS
STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #LS11P 520/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

40 PACTIV, PCA 9395 CS $104.42/M PACTIV, PCA 9395 CS /M 40 PACTIV, PCA 9395 CS /M 40 PACTIV, PCA 9395 CS $105.00/M 40 PACTIV, PCA 9395 CS /M

BRAND  PACTIV $52.21/CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS BRAND  AMERICAN $52.50/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  C18-5032 500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #APCTR32 500/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

41 PAC/ECKO 1174/605070 CS $853.40/M PAC/ECKO 1174/605070 CS /M 41 PAC/ECKO 1174/605070 CS $789.87/M 41 PAC/ECKO 1174/605070 CS $770.00/M 41 PAC/ECKO 1174/605070 CS /M

BRAND  HFA $42.67/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  DURABLE $39.49/CS BRAND  DURABLE $38.50/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  2019-70 50/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #6050-70 50/CS.CT. STOCK #7900 50/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

42 PAC/ECKO 1120-70 CS $455.60/M PAC/ECKO 1120-70 CS /M 42 PAC/ECKO 1120-70 CS $427.55/M 42 PAC/ECKO 1120-70 CS $459.80/M 42 PAC/ECKO 1120-70 CS /M

BRAND  HFA $22.78/CS BRAND /CS BRAND DURABLE $21.37/CS BRAND  DURABLE $22.99/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  2050-45 50/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #1120-45 50/CS.CT. STOCK #8900 50/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

43 PACTIVE/ECKO 6012-40 CS $286.20/M PACTIVE/ECKO 6012-40 CS /M 43 PACTIVE/ECKO 6012-40 CS $257.20/M 43 PACTIVE/ECKO 6012-40 CS $490.00/M 43 PACTIVE/ECKO 6012-40 CS /M

BRAND  HFA $28.62/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  DURABLE $25.72/CS BRAND  DURABLE $24.50/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  320.35 100/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #6012-40 100/CS.CT. STOCK #4200 50/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

44 AMCEL AMCEL5PRO CS $7.10/M AMCEL AMCEL5PRO CS /M 44 AMCEL AMCEL5PRO CS $6.58/M 44 AMCEL AMCEL5PRO CS $8.25/M 44 AMCEL AMCEL5PRO CS $13.63/M

BRAND  BANYAN $7.10/CS BRAND /CS BRAND BERK $6.58/CS BRAND  MERIT $8.25/CS BRAND  DIXIE $13.63/CS
STOCK #  MTP01 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #RSPCSN 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #DXEPTM21 1000/CS.CT.

45 AMCEL AM5PTO CS $7.10/M AMCEL AM5PTO CS /M 45 AMCEL AM5PTO CS $6.58/M 45 AMCEL AM5PTO CS $8.25/M 45 AMCEL AM5PTO CS $27.56/M

BRAND  BANYAN $7.10/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  BERK $6.58/CS BRAND  MERIT $8.25/CS BRAND  DIXIE 27.56/CS
STOCK #  MSSP01 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #RSOOPCSN 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #  DXEPSM21 1000/CS.CT.

46 AMCEL AMFPRO CS $7.10/M AMCEL AMFPRO CS /M 46 AMCEL AMFPRO CS $6.58/M 46 AMCEL AMFPRO CS $8.25/M 46 AMCEL AMFPRO CS $13.63/M

BRAND  BANYAN $7.10/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  BERK $6.58/CS BRAND  MERIT $8.25/CS BRAND  DIXIE $13.63/CS
STOCK #  MFP01 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #RFKCSN 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #DXEPFM21 1000/CS.CT.

47 AMCEL AMKPRO CS $7.10/M AMCEL AMKPRO CS /M 47 AMCEL AMKPRO CS $6.58/M 47 AMCEL AMKPRO CS $8.25/M 47 AMCEL AMKPRO CS $13.63/M



COMMODITY: CUPS CONTAINERS (MPA 150)
BID #:   7089877  CLOSING DATE TIME:  6/19/08 - 11:15 AM
BLANKET REQUIREMENTS: 7/1/08 - 7/31/09

ATTACHMENT "A" 6

NO. BRAND & PKG UNIT BRAND & PKGUNIT NO.BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT
STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE

VENDOR:  W. B. MASONVENDOR:  EASTERN BAG VENDOR:  E.B. THOMSEN VENDOR:  MANSFIELD PAPER VENDOR:  TAA DISTRIBUTION

BRAND  BANYAN $7.10/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  BERK $6.58/CS BRAND  MERIT $8.25/CS BRAND  DIXIE $13.63/CS
STOCK #  MKP01 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #RKNCSN 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #DXEPKM21 1000/CS.CT.

48 DUNI 12646 CS $19.03/M DUNI 12646 CS /M 48 DUNI 12646 CS $17.32/M 48 DUNI 12646 CS /M 48 DUNI 12646 CS $3.71/M

BRAND  FONDA $19.03/CS BRAND /CS BRAND DUNI $17.32/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  MARCAL $14.85/CS
STOCK #020393 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #288061 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #MRC28CT 4000/CS.CT.

49 DUNI 12736 CS $19.03/M DUNI 12736 CS /M 49 DUNI 12736 CS $17.32/M 49 DUNI 12736 CS /M 49 DUNI 12736 CS $3.71/M

BRAND  FONDA $19.03/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  DUNI $17.32/CS BRAND /CS BRAND MARCAL $14.85/CS
STOCK #  020393 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #288063 1M/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #MRC28CT 4000/CS.CT.

50 ATLANIC MILLS 8311A CS NO BID /M ATLANIC MILLS 8311A CS /M 50 ATLANIC MILLS 8311A CS $114.58/M 50 ATLANIC MILLS 8311A CS /M 50 ATLANIC MILLS 8311A CS /M

BRAND /CS BRAND /CS BRAND  ATLANTIC MILLS $22.91/CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS
STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #8311A 200/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

51 ATLANTIC MILLS 8292A CS NO BID /M ATLANTIC MILLS 8292A CS /M 51 ATLANTIC MILLS 8292A CS /M 51 ATLANTIC MILLS 8292A CS /M 51 ATLANTIC MILLS 8292A CS /M

BRAND /CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS BRAND /CS
STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

52 FORTUNE 3360 CS $158.80/M FORTUNE 3360 CS /M 52 FORTUNE 3360 CS $287.10/M 52 FORTUNE 3360 CS /M 52 FORTUNE 3360 CS $272.00/M

BRAND  CERTO $31.76/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  BERRY $28.71/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  JAGLAR $27.20/CS
STOCK #  3858 200/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #PG63858X3B 100/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #JAGL385817 100/CS.CT.

53 ANCHOR 12" 910 CS $9.23/ ROLL ANCHOR 12" 910 CS /M 53 ANCHOR 12" 910 CS $7.66/Roll 53 ANCHOR 12" 910 CS $8.70/Roll 53 ANCHOR 12" 910 CS $15.88/Roll

BRAND  ANCHOR $9.23/CS BRAND /CS BRAND AEP $7.66/Roll BRAND POLYVINYL $8.70/CS BRAND  ANCHOR $15.88/CS
STOCK #  12" 1 /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #910 1 Roll/CS.CT. STOCK #1220 1/CS.CT. STOCK #UFSPW121 1000/CS.CT.

/M /M /M
$14.00 /ROLL

54 ANCHOR PW182 CS ANCHOR PW182 CS 54 ANCHOR PW182 CS 54 ANCHOR PW182 CS 54 ANCHOR PW182 CS $17.88/Roll
$14.00/CS /CS l $11.99/Roll $17.88/CS

BRAND  ANCHOR 1 /CS.CT. BRAND /CS.CT. BRAND AEP $11.41/Roll BRAND POLYVINYL 1Roll/CS.CT. BRAND 1000/CS.CT.
STOCK #  18" STOCK # STOCK #914 1 Roll/CS.CT. STOCK #1820 STOCK #

55 DURABLE 51807 CS $27.30/ROLL DURABLE 51807 CS /ROLL 55 DURABLE 51807 CS /ROLL 55 DURABLE 51807 CS $22.00/ROLL 55 DURABLE 51807 CS /ROLL

BRAND  HFA $27.30/CS BRAND /CS BRAND DURABLE $25.60/CS BRAND  DURABLE /CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  51807 1 /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #57807 Roll/CS.CT. STOCK #81805 /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.



COMMODITY: CUPS CONTAINERS (MPA 150)
BID #:   7089877  CLOSING DATE TIME:  6/19/08 - 11:15 AM
BLANKET REQUIREMENTS: 7/1/08 - 7/31/09

ATTACHMENT "A" 7

NO. BRAND & PKG UNIT BRAND & PKGUNIT NO.BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT NO. BRAND & PKG. UNIT
STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE STOCK # CT. PRICE

VENDOR:  W. B. MASONVENDOR:  EASTERN BAG VENDOR:  E.B. THOMSEN VENDOR:  MANSFIELD PAPER VENDOR:  TAA DISTRIBUTION

56 TINCUM TR-R49 CS $28.80/M TINCUM TR-R49 CS /M 56 TINCUM TR-R49 CS $29.94/M 56 TINCUM TR-R49 CS $29.50/M 56 TINCUM TR-R49 CS /M

BRAND  BAGCRAFT $28.80/CS BRAND /CS BRAND MC NAIRN $29.94/CS BRAND  MARCAL $29.50/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  19010 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #LO10 1M/CS.CT. STOCK #5107 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

57 HANDY FUEL HF-03008 CS $493.19 HANDY FUEL HF-03008 CS /M 57 HANDY FUEL HF-03008 CS $645.90/M 57 HANDY FUEL HF-03008 CS $577.00/M 57 HANDY FUEL HF-03008 CS /M

BRAND  CANDLE LAMP $35.51/CS BRAND /CS BRAND FANCY HEAT $46.50/CS BRAND  LE-JO $41.50/CS BRAND /CS
STOCK #  PH0001 72/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #174800 72 STOCK #DHB1000 72/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT.

58 MED HANDLER 102-114 CS $35.47/M MED HANDLER 102-114 CS /M 58 MED HANDLER 102-114 CS $30.37/M 58 MED HANDLER 102-114 CS $34.80/M 58 MED HANDLER 102-114 CS $49.90/M

BRAND  FOOD HANDLER $35.47/CS BRAND /CS BRAND SIEDMAN $30.37/CS BRAND  MEDHANDLER $34.80/CS BRAND  MEDLINE $4.99/CS
STOCK #  102-114 /CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #GVP9-MD 1M/CS.CT. STOCK #102-114 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #MIIMPS192075 100/CS.CT.

59 MED HANDLER 102-116 CS $35.47/M MED HANDLER 102-116 CS /M 59 MED HANDLER 102-116 CS $30.37/M 59 MED HANDLER 102-116 CS $34.80/M 59 MED HANDLER 102-116 CS $49.90/M

BRAND  FOOD HANDLER $35.47/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  SIEDMAN $30.37/CS BRAND  MEDHANDLER $34.80/CS BRAND  MEDLINE $4.99/CS
STOCK #  102-116 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #GVP9-LG /CS.CT. STOCK #102-116 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #MIIMPS192076 100/CS.CT.

60 MED HANDLER 102-118 CS $35.47/M MED HANDLER 102-118 CS /M 60 MED HANDLER 102-118 CS $30.37/M 60 MED HANDLER 102-118 CS $34.80/M 60 MED HANDLER 102-118 CS $49.90/M

BRAND  FOOD HANDLER $35.47/CS BRAND /CS BRAND  SIEDMAN $30.37/CS BRAND  MEDHANDLER $34.80/CS BRAND  MEDLINE $4.99/CS
STOCK #  102-118 1000/CS.CT. STOCK # /CS.CT. STOCK #GVP9-XL 1M/CS.CT. STOCK #102-118 1000/CS.CT. STOCK #MIIMPS192077 100/CS.CT.


