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11/1/14 - 10/31/15 - Winter Sand - Northwest Division -
Includes Gloster (Appox 3,000 Tons) Clayville (Approx
1,700 Tons)

S 15.72

16.96

no bid

no bid

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 - Winter Sand - Providence Division -
(Lincoln (Approx 5,400 Tons), Smithfield (RT 116 & 7)
Approx 4,000 Tons), RT 6 & 295 9Approx 2,000 Tons),
Smithfield & 295 GWHighway (2,000 Tons)

S 14.47

16.49

no bid

S 18.78

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 Winter Sand Kent Division, RT 37
Jefferson Blvd. (Approx 1,700 Tons) Mid State (Approx
4,500 Tons) Summit Stockpile (Approx 500)

no bid

13.39

14.25

no bid

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 -Winter Sand - Washington North
Division (includes 4 & 4A) - Belleville (Aproxx 4,100
Tons) Dillons Corner (Aproxx 700 Tons)

no bid

no bid

15.50

S 16.49

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 -Winter Sand - Washington South
Division - Hope Valley (Approx 1,500 Tons) Westerly
(Approx 1,200 Tons) Charlestown (Approx 1,000 Tons)

no bid

no bid

no bid

S 16.49

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 - Winter Sand - Newport Division -
Porthsmouth (Approx 1,500 Tons) Lawton Valley
(Approx 500 Tons) Little Compton (approx 1,000 Tons)
Warren Yard (approx 500 Tons)

no bid

19.98

no bid

S 19.39

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 - Winter Sand Bristol Division - East
Shore Expressway (Approx 2,200 Tons) Pawtucket

Stockpile (Aproxx 300 Tons)

S 17.63

14.10

15.50

no bid
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