

State of Rhode Island, Department of Administration
Division of Purchases
One Capitol Hill
Providence, Rhode Island 02908
www.purchasing.ri.gov (401)574-8100

This solicitation has been awarded to the following vendor(s):

Vendor Name	PO Number	
3M COMPANY	3655662	
OSBURN ASSOCIATES INC	3655661	
ORAFOL AMERICAS INC	3655699	
AMERICAN TRAFFIC SAFETY MATERIALS INC	3655660	

SOLICITATION NUMBER 7599778 BLANKET DATES; 10/01/2019-09/30/2022

LINE ITEM	ORAFOL AMERICAS	3M COMPANY	AMERICAN TRAFFIC SAFETY	OSBURN ASSOCIATES
GREEN REPRESENTS THE LINES	NO BID \$	NDING VENDOR AT TOP OF PA 0.64	\$ 0.90	\$ 0.76
LINE 2: 10/01/19-09/30/20- ASTM TYPE IV HI INTENSITY PRISMATIC	NO BID \$	0.65	\$ 1.75	\$ 1.18
LINE 3: 10/01/19-09/30/20- ASTM THE IV THINTENSITY PRISMATIC	NO BID \$	1.76	\$ 4.78	\$ 2.99
LINE 4: 10/01/19-09/30/20- ASTM TYPE XI PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE FLOR ORANGE	NO BID \$	1.76	\$ 4.09	Š 2.99
LINE 5: 10/01/19-09/30/20- ASTM TYPE XI PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE FLOR VICTORY LINE 5: 10/01/19-09/30/20- ASTM TYPE XI PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE FLOR YELLOW	NO BID \$	1.76	\$ 5.17	\$ 2.99
LINE 6: 10/01/19-09/30/20-ELECTRONIC CUTTABLE TRANSPARENT ACRYLIC FILM	NO BID \$	0.64	\$ 1.15	\$ 0.93
LINE 7: 10/01/19-09/30/20-ELECTRONIC CUTTABLE TRANSPARENT ACRYLIC FILM CLEAR	NO BID \$	0.57	NO BID	\$ 0.61
LINE 8: 10/01/19-09/30/20-ELECTRONIC COTTABLE TRANSPARENT ACRYLIC FILM BLACK	NO BID \$	0.64	\$ 1.15	\$ 0.98
LINE 9: 10/01/19-09/30/20-DOT-C2 PRISMATIC CONSPICUITY TAPE RIGID	\$ 48.50 \$	56.25	NO BID	\$ 70.00
LINE 10: 10/01/19-09/30/20-DOT-C2 PRISMATIC CONSPICUITY TAPE FLEXIBLE	\$ 48.50 \$	36.25	\$ 97.00	\$ 70.00
LINE 11: 10/01/19-09/30/20-DISTREE PRINTMANCE CONSPICENT PAPE PERMISELLINE 11: 10/01/19-09/30/20-HIGH PERFORMANCE CAST VINYL BLACK	\$ 0.60 \$	0.66	\$ 0.47	NO BID
LINE 12: 10/01/19-09/30/20-HIGH PERFORMANCE CAST VINYL WHITE	\$ 0.60 \$	0.66	\$ 0.47	NO BID
LINE 13: 10/01/19-09/30/20-HIGH PERFORMANCE CAST VINVE WHITE	\$ 0.60 \$	0.66	\$ 0.56	NO BID
LINE 14: 10/01/19-09/30/20-HIGHT EN GRANANCE GAST VINTE SALTTIME BEGE	\$ 1.11 \$	0.79	NO BID	NO BID
LINE 15: 10/01/19-09/30/20-HIGH PERFORMANCE INKIET VINYL WHITE	\$ 1.11 \$	0.79	NO BID	NO BID
LINE 16: 10/01/19-09/30/20- PAPER TRANSFER (PRE-SPACING) TAPE	NO BID \$	0.15	\$ 0.10	NO BID
LINE 17: 10/01/19-09/30/20- CLEAR TRANSFER (PRE-SPACING) TAPE	NO BID \$	0.25	\$ 0.10	NO BID
LINE 18: 10/01/19-09/30/20-OVERLAMINATE SURF PROTECTION FILM	\$ 0.81 \$	0.74	NO BID	NO BID
	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 8.63
LINE 19: 10/01/19-09/30/20- FHWA MUTCD R1-1 30-INCH STOP SIGN FACE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.66
LINE 20: 10/01/19-09/30/20- FHWA MUTCD R1-1 36-INCH YIELD SIGN FACE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 8.6
LINE 21: 10/01/19-09/30/20- FHWA MUTCD R1-1 30-INCH DO NOT ENTER SIGN FACE		0.64	\$ 0.90	
LINE 22: 10/01/20-09/30/21- ASTM TYPE I RETRORFLECTIVE SHEETING	THE RESIDENCE OF THE PARTY OF T	0.65		\$ 0.7
LINE 23: 10/01/20-09/30/21- ASTM TYPE IV HI INTENSITY PRISMATIC		1.76	\$ 1.75 \$ 5.17	\$ 1.18 \$ 2.99
LINE 24: 10/01/20-09/30/21- ASTM TPE XI PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE YG			\$ 5.17	\$ 2.99
LINE 25: 10/01/20-09/30/21- ASTM TYPE XI PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE FLOR ORANGE	NO BID \$	1.76	The state of the s	
LINE 26: 10/01/20-09/30/21- ASTM TYPE XI PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE FLOR YELLOW	NO BID \$	1.76	\$ 5.17	\$ 2.99
LINE 27: 10/01/20-09/30/21-ELECTRONIC CUTTABLE TRANSPARENT ACRYLIC FILM	NO BID \$	0.64	\$ 1.15	\$ 0.93
LINE 28: 10/01/20-09/30/21-ELECTRONIC CUTTABLE TRANSPARENT ACRYLIC FILM CLEAR	NO BID \$	0.57	NO BID	\$ 0.6
LINE 29: 10/01/20-09/30/21-ELECTRONIC CUTTABLE TRANSPARENT ACRYLIC FILM BLACK	NO BID \$	0.64	\$ 1.15	\$ 0.93
LINE 30: 10/01/20-09/30/21-DOT-C2 PRISMATIC CONSPICUITY TAPE RIGID	\$ 48.50 \$	56.25	NO BID	\$ 70.00
LINE 31: 10/01/20-09/30/21-DOT-C2 PRISMATIC CONSPICUITY TAPE FLEXIBLE	\$ 48.50 \$	36.25	\$ 97.00	\$ 70.00
LINE 32: 10/01/20-09/30/21-HIGH PERFORMANCE CAST VINYL BLACK	\$ 0.60 \$	0.66	\$ 0.47	NO BID
LINE 33: 10/01/20-09/30/21-HIGH PERFORMANCE CAST VINYL WHITE	\$ 0.60 \$	0.66	\$ 0.47	NO BID
LINE 34: 10/01/20-09/30/21-HIGH PERFORMANCE CAST VINYL SAPPHIRE BLUE	\$ 0.60 \$	0.66	\$ 0.56	NO BID
LINE 35: 10/01/20-09/30/21-HIGH PERFORMANCE INKJET VINYL CLEAR	\$ 1.11 \$	0.79	NO BID	NO BID
LINE 36: 10/01/20-09/30/21-HIGH PERFORMANCE INKJET VINYL WHITE	\$ 1.11 \$	0.79	NO BID	NO BID
LINE 37: 10/01/20-09/30/21- PAPER TRANSFER (PRE-SPACING) TAPE	NO BID \$	0.15	\$ 0.10	NO BID
LINE 38: 10/01/20-09/30/21- CLEAR TRANSFER (PRE-SPACING) TAPE	NO BID \$	0.25	\$ 0.10	NO BID
LINE 39: 10/01/20-09/30/21-OVERLAMINATE SURF PROTECTION FILM	\$ 0.81 \$	0.74	NO BID	NO BID
LINE 40: 10/01/20-09/30/21- FHWA MUTCD R1-1 30-INCH STOP SIGN FACE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 8.63
LINE 41: 10/01/20-09/30/21- FHWA MUTCD R1-1 36-INCH YIELD SIGN FACE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.66
LINE 42: 10/01/20-09/30/21- FHWA MUTCD R1-1 30-INCH DO NOT ENTER SIGN FACE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 8.63
LINE 43: 10/01/21-09/30/22- ASTM TYPE I RETRORFLECTIVE SHEETING	NO BID \$	0.64	\$ 0.90	\$ 0.76
LINE 44: 10/01/21-09/30/22- ASTM TYPE IV HI INTENSITY PRISMATIC	NO BID \$	0.65	\$ 1.75	\$ 1.1
LINE 45: 10/01/21-09/30/22- ASTM TPE XI PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE YG	NO BID \$	1.76	\$ 5.17	\$ 2.9
LINE 46: 10/01/21-09/30/22- ASTM TYPE XI PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE FLOR ORANGE	NO BID \$	1.76	\$ 5.17	\$ 2.9
INE 47: 10/01/21-09/30/22- ASTM TYPE XI PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE FLOR YELLOW	NO BID \$	1.76	\$ 5.17	\$ 2.9
INE 48: 10/01/21-09/30/22-ELECTRONIC CUTTABLE TRANSPARENT ACRYLIC FILM	NO BID \$	0.64	\$ 1.15	\$ 0.9
Line 49: 10/01/21-09/30/22-ELECTRONIC CUTTABLE TRANSPARENT ACRYLIC FILM CLEAR	NO BID \$	0.57	NO BID	\$ 0.6
INE 50: 10/01/21-09/30/22-ELECTRONIC CUTTABLE TRANSPARENT ACRYLIC FILM BLACK	NO BID \$	0.64	\$ 1.15	\$ 0.9
INE 51: 10/01/21-09/30/22-DOT-C2 PRISMATIC CONSPICUITY TAPE RIGID	\$ 48.50	56.25	NO BID	\$ 70.0
LINE 52: 10/01/21-09/30/22-DOT-C2 PRISMATIC CONSPICUITY TAPE FLEXIBLE	\$ 48.50 \$	36.25	\$ 97.00	\$ 70.0
INE 53: 10/01/21-09/30/22-HIGH PERFORMANCE CAST VINYL BLACK	\$ 0.60 \$	0.66	\$ 0.47	NO BID
INE 54: 10/01/21-09/30/22-HIGH PERFORMANCE CAST VINYL WHITE	\$ 0.60 \$	0.66	\$ 0.47	NO BID
INE 55: 10/01/21-09/30/22-HIGH PERFORMANCE CAST VINYL SAPPHIRE BLUE	\$ 0,60 \$	0.66	\$ 0.54	NO BID
INE 56: 10/01/21-09/30/22-HIGH PERFORMANCE INKJET VINYL CLEAR	\$ 1.11 \$	0.79	NO BID	NO BID
INE 57: 10/01/21-09/30/22-HIGH PERFORMANCE INKJET VINYL WHITE	\$ 1.11 \$	0.79	NO BID	NO BID
INE 58: 10/01/21-09/30/22- PAPER TRANSFER (PRE-SPACING) TAPE	NO BID \$	0.15	\$ 0.10	NO BID
LINE 59: 10/01/21-09/30/22- CLEAR TRANSFER (PRE-SPACING) TAPE	NO BID \$	0.25	\$ 0.10	NO BID
INE 60: 10/01/21-09/30/22-OVERLAMINATE SURF PROTECTION FILM	\$ 0.81 \$	0.74	NO BID	NO BID
LINE 61: 10/01/21-09/30/22- FHWA MUTCD R1-1 30-INCH STOP SIGN FACE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 8.6
LINE 62: 10/01/21-09/30/22- FHWA MUTCD R1-1 36-INCH YIELD SIGN FACE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.6
LINE 63: 10/01/21-09/30/22- FHWA MUTCD R1-1 30-INCH DO NOT ENTER SIGN FACE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 8.63
LINE 63 ATTACHMENT: VENDOR DISCOUNT % ON LIST FOR UNSPECIFIED ITEMS			PROPERTY AND ADDRESS OF THE PROPERTY AND ADDRESS OF THE PARTY.	