



State of Rhode Island, Department of Administration  
Division of Purchases  
One Capitol Hill  
Providence, Rhode Island 02908  
[www.purchasing.ri.gov](http://www.purchasing.ri.gov) (401)574-8100

This solicitation has been awarded to the following vendor(s):

<u>Vendor Name</u>	<u>PO Number</u>
SHOE CORPORATION OF BIRMINGHAM INC	3593818

## Award RFQ: SLIP-ON SNEAKERS/SHOWER SANDALS – DOC

RFQ 7596643 Close Date 9/27/2018 10:00 RFQ Currency USD	Quotes Received 4 Active Quotes 4 Shortlisted Quotes 4	
---	--	--

### Header

	SHOE CORPORATION OF BIRMINGHAM INC	THOMASTON CORPORATION THE Quote 2595638	VICTORY SUPPLY LLC Quote 2595637	BOB BARKER CO INC Quote 2595636
Supplier Site				
Contact	CALHOUN, JIM	Corey, Nicole	HULL, CHERYL	DEBOESER, ANGELA
Quote Status	Active	Active	Active	Active
Shortlist Status	Included	Included	Included	Included
Quote Total	31,413.90	33,986.49	34,680.24	38,071.23
Total Award Amount				
Time of Quote	9/21/2018 9:08	9/24/2018 11:01	9/26/2018 9:42	9/26/2018 9:46
Quote Valid Until				
Supplier's Quote Number				
Note to Buyer				
Attachments	No	No	No	No

File Download Time 10/3/2018 15:44

**Award RFQ: SLIP-ON SNEAKERS/SHOWER SANDALS - DOC**

RFQ 758643  
 Close Date 9/27/2018 10:00  
 RFQ Currency USD

Quotes Received 4  
 Active Quotes 4  
 Shortlisted Quotes 4

**Line Summary**

Line	Supplier	Unit	Estimated Quantity	Rank	Quote Price	Quote Number	Category	Line Type
1 7/1/20-6/30/21 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: WHITE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	THOMASTON CORPORATION THE	Pair	228	-	NO BID	2595638	201.73	Goods
1 7/1/20-6/30/21 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: WHITE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	SHOE CORPORATION OF BIRMINGHAM INC	Pair	228	1	1.75	2595639	201.73	Goods
1 7/1/20-6/30/21 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: WHITE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	BOB BARKER CO INC	Pair	228	2	2.1	2595636	201.73	Goods
1 7/1/20-6/30/21 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: WHITE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	VICTORY SUPPLY LLC	Pair	228	3	2.12	2595637	201.73	Goods
2 7/1/20-6/30/21 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: ORANGE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	THOMASTON CORPORATION THE	Pair	108	-	NO BID	2595638	201.73	Goods
2 7/1/20-6/30/21 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: ORANGE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	SHOE CORPORATION OF BIRMINGHAM INC	Pair	108	1	1.75	2595639	201.73	Goods
2 7/1/20-6/30/21 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: ORANGE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	BOB BARKER CO INC	Pair	108	2	1.99	2595636	201.73	Goods
2 7/1/20-6/30/21 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: ORANGE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	VICTORY SUPPLY LLC	Pair	108	3	2.12	2595637	201.73	Goods
3 7/1/20-6/30/21 HEAVY DUTY STEP-INS / COLOR: NAVY, SIZES: 3 THRU 15 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	SHOE CORPORATION OF BIRMINGHAM INC	Dozen	495	1	30.48	2595639	800.32	Goods
3 7/1/20-6/30/21 HEAVY DUTY STEP-INS / COLOR: NAVY, SIZES: 3 THRU 15 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	VICTORY SUPPLY LLC	Dozen	495	2	33.48	2595637	800.32	Goods
3 7/1/20-6/30/21 HEAVY DUTY STEP-INS / COLOR: NAVY, SIZES: 3 THRU 15 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	THOMASTON CORPORATION THE	Dozen	495	3	34.68	2595638	800.32	Goods
3 7/1/20-6/30/21 HEAVY DUTY STEP-INS / COLOR: NAVY, SIZES: 3 THRU 15 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	BOB BARKER CO INC	Dozen	495	4	37.57	2595636	800.32	Goods
4 9/1/18-6/30/19 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: WHITE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	THOMASTON CORPORATION THE	Pair	192	-	NO BID	2595638	201.73	Goods
4 9/1/18-6/30/19 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: WHITE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	SHOE CORPORATION OF BIRMINGHAM INC	Pair	192	1	1.75	2595639	201.73	Goods
4 9/1/18-6/30/19 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: WHITE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	BOB BARKER CO INC	Pair	192	2	2	2595636	201.73	Goods
4 9/1/18-6/30/19 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: WHITE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	VICTORY SUPPLY LLC	Pair	192	3	2.12	2595637	201.73	Goods
5 7/1/19-6/30/20 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: WHITE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	THOMASTON CORPORATION THE	Pair	198	-	NO BID	2595638	201.73	Goods
5 7/1/19-6/30/20 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: WHITE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	SHOE CORPORATION OF BIRMINGHAM INC	Pair	198	1	1.75	2595639	201.73	Goods
5 7/1/19-6/30/20 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: WHITE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	BOB BARKER CO INC	Pair	198	2	2.04	2595636	201.73	Goods
5 7/1/19-6/30/20 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: WHITE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	VICTORY SUPPLY LLC	Pair	198	3	2.12	2595637	201.73	Goods
6 9/1/18-6/30/19 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: ORANGE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	THOMASTON CORPORATION THE	Pair	48	-	NO BID	2595638	201.73	Goods
6 9/1/18-6/30/19 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: ORANGE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	SHOE CORPORATION OF BIRMINGHAM INC	Pair	48	1	1.75	2595639	201.73	Goods
6 9/1/18-6/30/19 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: ORANGE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	BOB BARKER CO INC	Pair	48	2	1.9	2595636	201.73	Goods
6 9/1/18-6/30/19 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: ORANGE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	VICTORY SUPPLY LLC	Pair	48	3	2.12	2595637	201.73	Goods
7 7/1/19-6/30/20 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: ORANGE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	THOMASTON CORPORATION THE	Pair	108	-	NO BID	2595638	201.73	Goods
7 7/1/19-6/30/20 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: ORANGE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	SHOE CORPORATION OF BIRMINGHAM INC	Pair	108	1	1.75	2595639	201.73	Goods
7 7/1/19-6/30/20 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: ORANGE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	BOB BARKER CO INC	Pair	108	2	1.93	2595636	201.73	Goods
7 7/1/19-6/30/20 VERSATILE SLIP-ON PVC SHOWER SANDALS / COLOR: ORANGE, SIZES: 8 THRU 13 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	VICTORY SUPPLY LLC	Pair	108	3	2.12	2595637	201.73	Goods
8 9/1/18-6/30/19 HEAVY DUTY STEP-INS / COLOR: NAVY, SIZES: 3 THRU 15 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	SHOE CORPORATION OF BIRMINGHAM INC	Dozen	485	1	30.48	2595639	800.32	Goods
8 9/1/18-6/30/19 HEAVY DUTY STEP-INS / COLOR: NAVY, SIZES: 3 THRU 15 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	VICTORY SUPPLY LLC	Dozen	485	2	33.48	2595637	800.32	Goods
8 9/1/18-6/30/19 HEAVY DUTY STEP-INS / COLOR: NAVY, SIZES: 3 THRU 15 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	THOMASTON CORPORATION THE	Dozen	485	3	34.68	2595638	800.32	Goods
8 9/1/18-6/30/19 HEAVY DUTY STEP-INS / COLOR: NAVY, SIZES: 3 THRU 15 (AS PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS)	BOB BARKER CO INC	Dozen	485	4	36.48	2595636	800.32	Goods