

State of Rhode Island, Department of Administration
Division of Purchases
One Capitol Hill
Providence, Rhode Island 02908
www.purchasing.ri.gov (401)574-8100

This solicitation has been awarded to the following vendor(s):

Vendor Name	PO Number 3626647			
DEDHAM SPORTSMEN'S CENTER				
ON TARGET AMMUNICATION LLC	3626646			

	BID 7598786									
	AMMUNITON - DOC				- Day					
			DEDHAM		EAGLE POINT				ON TARGET	
		CASES	SPORTSMEN'S		GUN/TJ MORRIS		JUREK		AMMUNITION,	
LINES		NEEDED	CENTER, INC		& SON		BROTHERS INC.		rrc	
			UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
	1 AE40R1 40 CAL 180GR FML 1000 PER CASE	150	\$238.16	\$35,724.00	\$240.00	\$36,000.00	NO BID		NO BID	
;	2 5.56MM 55GR FJM 100 PER CASE	100	\$159.68	\$15,968.00	\$150.00	\$15,000.00	\$150.00	\$15,000.00	\$128.50	\$12,850.00
	FEDERAL 132 OO BUCK 250 80 PER CASE	80	\$113.66	\$9,092.80	\$115.00	\$9,200.00	NO BID		NO BID	
			1							
				\$60,784.80		\$60,200.00		\$15,000.00		\$12,850.00
				•	Control			WINCHESTER		
LINES							LINE 2	#Q3131L		