Bid Tab for Bid# B06419
Quote (000116) CALISE SONSB  (000241) HOMESTEAD BAKIN (002075) SUPERIOR BAKERY

Info: <Quote: Q018345> <Quote: Q018346> <Quote: Q018347>
Item Info:
WHITE PULLMAN - 350, [2 No Bid No Bid
<1.000>
LOAF 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
WHEAT PULLMAN - 6,00 [: No Bid No Bid
<2.000>
LOAF 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
RYE PULLMAN, SEEDLES No Bid No Bid
<3.000>
LOAF 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
TEXAS STYLE TOAST, 3 [. No Bid No Bid
<4.000>
LOAF 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
FRANKFURT ROLLS, SLI | No Bid No Bid
<5.000>
DOz 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
HAMBURGER BUNS, SLIC No Bid No Bid
<6.000>
DOz 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
WIENER ROLLS, 5-1/2" [2F No Bid No Bid
<7.000>
DOz 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
DINNER ROLLS - 10,00 [2t No Bid No Bid
<8.000>
DOz 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
DINNER ROLLS - WHOLE No Bid No Bid
<9.000>
DOz 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
SALAD ROLLS - 1,500 [2B No Bid No Bid
<10.000>
DOz 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
ENGLISH MUFFINS - 3, [2I No Bid No Bid
<11.000>
DOz 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD




Bid Tab for Bid# B06419

Quote (000116) CALISE SONSB  (000241) HOMESTEAD BAKIN (002075) SUPERIOR BAKERY

Info: <Quote: Q018345> <Quote: Q018346> <Quote: Q018347>
Item Info:
BREAD, RAISIN - 1,20 [2BI No Bid No Bid
<12.000>
LOAF 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
BREAD CRUMBS (WHITE) No Bid No Bid
<13.000>
LB 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
BAGELS, ASSORTED FRE No Bid No Bid
<14.000>
DOz 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
WHITE, LOW-FAT, LOW- [: No Bid No Bid
<15.000>
LOAF 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
WHEAT, LOW-FAT, LOW- No Bid No Bid
<16.000>
LOAF 1.0 NB,DD NB,DD
BREAD, ITALIAN, SLIC [2E $0.84 No Bid
<17.000> $0.84
LOAF 1.0 NB,DD DD,NB
PAN BAKED DINNER ROL $1.15 No Bid
<18.000> $1.15
DOz 1.0 NB,DD DD,NB
TORPEDO ROLLS, PRECL $1.50 No Bid
<19.000> $1.50
DOz 1.0 NB,DD DD,NB
BULKIE ROLLS, SPLIT, [2E $1.52 No Bid
<20.000> $1.52
DOz 1.0 NB,DD DD,NB
BULKIE ROLL, SPLIT W [2 $2.64 No Bid
<21.000> $2.64
DOz 1.0 NB,DD DD,NB
FRESH SYRIAN BREAD, | $2.28 No Bid
<22.000> $2.28
DOz 1.0 NB,DD DD,NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B06419

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

LAVASH WHEAT WRAPS
<23.000>

DOz 1.0
Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

(000116) CALISE SONS B
<Quote: Q018345>

$3.00
$3.00

NB,DD

$12.93
$0.00
$0.00

Eval Codes: NI

DD = Delivery Date Greater Than Requested Date

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

(000241) HOMESTEAD BAKIN (002075) SUPERIOR BAKERY
<Quote: Q018346>

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

DD,NB

$20.30
$0.00
$20.30

<Quote: Q018347>

$2.80
$2.80

*NB,DD

$10.46
$0.00
$10.46

Eval Codes: NI



