Bid Tab for Bid# B05493

Quote (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL

Info:
Item Info:

BEDSIDE CABINET 29. [2E
<1.000>

EA 8.0

OVER BED TABLE ADJU [
<2.000>

EA 8.0

MIDMARK CRIB (REFURB
<3.000>

EA 1.0

BASSINET WITH BASKET
<4.000>

EA 1.0

NURSING KID (VITALSI [2I
<5.000>

EA 1.0

10 LEG (FOR NURSING [z
<6.000>

EA 1.0

VITALSIM SIMULATES [2t
<7.000>

EA 3.0

NURSING ANNE (VITALS |
<8.000>

EA 4.0

BREAST EXAM MODULE {
<9.000>

EA 2.0
MASTECTOMY MODULE (
<10.000>

EA 2.0
FUNDUS SKILLS AND AS
<11.000>

EA 2.0

<Quote: Q015951>

(020247) TECH MED INDUST
<Quote: Q015952>

No Bid

DD,NB

No Bid

NB,DD

No Bid

DD,NB

No Bid

NB,DD

$4,303.01
$4,303.01

DD,NB

$430.17
$430.17

NB,DD

$1,995.00
$5,985.00

DD,NB

$7,285.32
$29,141.28

NB,DD

$292.20
$584.40

*,DD,NB

No Bid

NB,DD

No Bid

DD,NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B05493

Quote (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL

Info:
Item Info:

WOUND CARE AND ASSE
<12.000>

EA 2.0

KANGAROO FEEDING PU
<13.000>

EA 1.0

ANATOMICAL CHART SEF
<14.000>

EA 1.0

DISEASES AND DISORDE
<15.000>

EA 1.0

SYSTEMS AND STRUCTU
<16.000>

EA 1.0
Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

<Quote: Q015951>

$29,253.75
$0.00
$29,253.75

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

DD = Delivery Date Greater Than Requested Date

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

(020247) TECH MED INDUST
<Quote: Q015952>

No Bid
NB,DD

No Bid
DD,NB
$83.09
$83.09
NB,DD

No Bid
DD,NB

No Bid
NB,DD
$40,526.95
$0.00
$0.00

Eval Codes: NI




