
(000008) A A ASBESTOS CO
<Quote: Q015480>

(020955) ASBESTOS
CONTRO

<Quote: Q015481>

(015232) FLEET INDUSTRIA
<Quote: Q015482>

(018759) GENERAL ENVIRON
<Quote: Q015483>

(001924) OCEAN STATE BLD
<Quote: Q015484>

(001951) SITECON CORPORA
<Quote: Q015485>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05326

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

CLEANUP PERSONNEL W
<1.000>

4309.0HR

$38.25

$164,819.25

$34.00

$146,506.00

*

$90.00

$387,810.00

$63.15

$272,113.35

$38.00

$163,742.00

$50.00

$215,450.00

HEPA VACUUM (NILFISK [
<2.000>

75.0DAY NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $175.00

$13,125.00

$4.25

$318.75

*

$10.00

$750.00

$65.00

$4,875.00

NEG. PRESSURE UNIT ( [2
<3.000>

10.0DAY NB

No Bid $300.00

$3,000.00

$100.00

$1,000.00

$9.00

$90.00

*

$30.00

$300.00

$53.00

$530.00

HIGH VOL. SAMPLE PUM 
<4.000>

10.0DAY NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $100.00

$1,000.00

NB

No Bid $10.00

$100.00

*

$25.00

$250.00

PERSONAL SAMPLE PUM
<5.000>

52.0DAY NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $60.00

$3,120.00

$4.00

$208.00

*

$10.00

$520.00

$18.00

$936.00

AIR PRESSURE MONITOR
<6.000>

10.0DAY NB

No Bid $200.00

$2,000.00

$25.00

$250.00

$4.25

$42.50

*

$15.00

$150.00

$85.00

$850.00

DECON [2BPO]
<7.000>

10.0DAY NB

No Bid $200.00

$2,000.00

$140.00

$1,400.00

$20.00

$200.00

*

$30.00

$300.00

$650.00

$6,500.00
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(000008) A A ASBESTOS CO
<Quote: Q015480>

(020955) ASBESTOS
CONTRO

<Quote: Q015481>

(015232) FLEET INDUSTRIA
<Quote: Q015482>

(018759) GENERAL ENVIRON
<Quote: Q015483>

(001924) OCEAN STATE BLD
<Quote: Q015484>

(001951) SITECON CORPORA
<Quote: Q015485>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05326

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

DISPOSAL [2BPO]
<8.000>

412.0CYL

$45.00

$18,540.00

$22.00

$9,064.00

*

$65.00

$26,780.00

$41.00

$16,892.00

$35.00

$14,420.00

$37.00

$15,244.00

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$183,359.25

$0.00

$0.00

$162,570.00

$0.00

$0.00

$434,485.00

$0.00

$0.00

$289,864.60

$0.00

$0.00

$180,282.00

$0.00

$180,282.00

$244,635.00

$0.00

$0.00
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(001634) TMC SERVICES IN
<Quote: Q015486>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05326

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

CLEANUP PERSONNEL W
<1.000>

4309.0HR

$62.00

$267,158.00

HEPA VACUUM (NILFISK [
<2.000>

75.0DAY

$50.00

$3,750.00

NEG. PRESSURE UNIT ( [2
<3.000>

10.0DAY

$65.00

$650.00

HIGH VOL. SAMPLE PUM 
<4.000>

10.0DAY

$25.00

$250.00

PERSONAL SAMPLE PUM
<5.000>

52.0DAY

$20.00

$1,040.00

AIR PRESSURE MONITOR
<6.000>

10.0DAY

$50.00

$500.00

DECON [2BPO]
<7.000>

10.0DAY

$60.00

$600.00



(001634) TMC SERVICES IN
<Quote: Q015486>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05326

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

DISPOSAL [2BPO]
<8.000>

412.0CYL

$75.00

$30,900.00

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Comments:

$304,848.00

$0.00

$0.00


