Bid Tab for Bid# B05273

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q015402>

WHOLE MILK, HOMOGEN
<1.000>

1/4 PT 15000.0

$0.0985
$1,477.50

*NB,DD

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2E
<2.000>

1/4 PT. 33000.0

$0.089
$2,937.00

*,DD,NB

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2E
<3.000>

1/2 PT. 80000.0

$0.1429
$11,432.00

*NB,DD

WHOLE MILK, HOMOGEN
<4.000>

1/2 PT. 500.0

$0.1605
$80.25

*,DD,NB

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2E
<5.000>

1/2 GAL. 9360.0

$0.96
$8,985.60

*NB,DD

SKIM MILK PLEASE [2BP
<6.000>

1/4 PT. 1000.0

$0.087
$87.00

*,DD,NB

WHOLE MILK, HOMOGEN
<7.000>

1/2 GAL. 1872.0

$1.085
$2,031.12

*NB,DD

SKIM MILK PLEASE [2BP
<8.000>

1/2 GAL. 90.0

$0.92
$82.80

*,DD,NB

COFFEE MILK, LOW FAT |
<9.000>

1/2 PT. 500.0

$0.158
$79.00

NB,DD

CHOCOLATE MILK, LOW
<10.000>

1/2 PT. 500.0

$0.148
$74.00

*,DD,NB

1/2 & 1/2 INDIVIDUAL [2BF
<11.000>

3/8 OZ. 46800.0

$0.0152
$711.36

*NB,DD

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q015403>



Bid Tab for Bid# B05273

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q015402>

SOUR CREAM, INDIVIDU |
<12.000>

10z 3000.0

$0.071
$213.00

*,DD,NB

SOUR CREAM 1LB. [2BF
<13.000>

LB. 60.0

$0.91
$54.60

NB,DD

SOUR CREAM 5 LB. [2BF
<14.000>

LB. 500.0

$0.76
$380.00

*,DD,NB

HEAVY CREAM QUART [:
<15.000>

QT. 24.0

$2.13
$51.12

*NB,DD

LITE CREAM QUART [2BF
<16.000>

QT. 24.0

$1.35
$32.40

*Tie,DD,NB

COTTAGE CHEESE, LOW
<17.000>

LB. 1300.0

$0.89
$1,157.00

*NB,DD

RICOTTA CHEESE 2 [2BI
<18.000>

LB. 288.0

$1.28
$368.64

*,DD,NB

INDIVIDUAL CREAM CHE
<19.000>

oz 3000.0

$0.144
$432.00

*NB,DD

CREAM CHEESE 3 OR [2I
<20.000>

LB. 364.0

$1.60
$582.40

DD,NB

YOGURT, STRAWBERRY,
<21.000>

LB. 3120.0

$0.845
$2,636.40

NB,DD

SOY MILK, CHOCOLATE,
<22.000>

1/2 GAL. 104.0

No Bid

DD,NB

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q015403>



Bid Tab for Bid# B05273

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2E
<27.000>

1/2 PT. 2800000.0

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2E
<28.000>

1/2 GAL. 6000.0

LACT-AID MILK, LOW F [2|
<29.000>

QTS. 50.0

COTTAGE CHEESE 5 [2E
<30.000>

LB. 100.0

YOGURT, LOW FAT, ASS
<31.000>

1/2 PT. 50.0

Quote (005942) GARELICK FARMS
Info: <Quote: Q015402>

Item Info:
LACTOSE FREE MILK 10 | $1.06
<23.000> $7.288.56
QTS. 6876.0 * NB,DD
EGG NOG PLEASE IN [2B $0.99
<24.000> $63.36
QTS. 64.0 * DD,NB
MOZZARELLA CHEESE | No Bid
<25.000>
LB. 40.0 NB,DD
MOZZARELLA CHEESE-S No Bid
<26.000>
LB. 40.0 DD,NB
1 Total $41,237.11

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q015403>

$48,082.04

$0.149
$417,200.00

DD

$1.09
$6,540.00

DD

$1.39
$69.50

DD

$0.98
$98.00

DD

$0.60
$30.00

DD




Bid Tab for Bid# B05273

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

PASSOVER KOSHER MILI
<32.000>

(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q015402>

1/2 GAL. 75.0
2 Total $397,319.50
LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2E $0.1429

<33.000>

1/2 PT. 320000.0

$45,728.00

*,NB,DD

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2E
<34.000>

1/2 GAL. 1400.0

$0.96
$1,344.00

*,DD,NB

SKIM MILK PLEASE [2BP
<35.000>

1/2 PT. 15600.0

$0.1365
$2,129.40

*,NB,DD

CHOCOLATE MILK, LOW
<36.000>

1/2 PT. 32000.0

$0.145
$4,640.00

*,DD,NB

COFFEE MILK, LOW FAT |
<37.000>

1/2 PT. 32000.0

$0.155
$4,960.00

*,NB,DD

RICOTTA CHEESE 2 [2BI
<38.000>

LB. 800.0

$1.28
$1,024.00

*,DD,NB

YOGURT, LOW FAT, ASS
<39.000>

6 OZ. 42000.0

$0.51
$21,420.00

NB,DD

LACTOSE FREE MILK [2t
<40.000>

QTS. 1300.0

$1.05
$1,365.00

*,DD,NB

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q015403>

$1.35
$101.25

DD

$424,038.75



Bid Tab for Bid# B05273
Quote (005942) GARELICK FARMS (001004) GUIDA DAIRY

Info: <Quote: Q015402> <Quote: Q015403>
Item Info:
CREAM CHEESE, INDIVI [ No Bid
<41.000>
LB. 1600.0 NB,DD
3 Total $82,610.40 $88,913.80

HOMOGENIZED MILK [2E $0.102
<42.000> $43,350.00
1/4 PT. 425000.0 DD
BULK, HOMOGENIZED MI $2.42
<43.000> $726.00
GAL.BK 300.0 DD
SKIM MILK PLEASE [2BP $1.08
<44.000> $378.00
1/2 GAL. 350.0 DD
SKIM MILK PLEASE [2BP $0.089
<45.000> $11,125.00
1/4 PT. 125000.0 DD
SKIM MILK 24 QT. [2BPO $0.62
<46.000> $1488.00
QT. 2400.0 DD
CHOCOLATE MILK, LOW $0.16
<47.000> $160.00
1/2 PT. 1000.0 DD
COFFEE MILK, LOW FAT | $0.16
<48.000> $160.00
1/2 PT. 1000.0 DD
LACTOSE FREE MILK [2t $2.45
<49.000> $2.940.00
1/2 GAL. 1200.0 DD
LACTOSE FREE MILK - [2 $0.32
<50.000> $3200.00
12 PT 10000.0 *DD




Bid Tab for Bid# B05273

Quote (005942) GARELICK FARMS

Info:
Item Info:

RICOTTA CHEESE 2 [2BI
<51.000>

LB. 400.0

COTTAGE CHEESE 5 [2E
<52.000>

LB. 100.0

SOUR CREAM 5 LB. [2BF
<53.000>

LB. 200.0

1/2 & 1/2 INDIVIDUAL [2BF
<54.000>

3/8 OZ. 20000.0

1/2 & 1/2 QUARTS [2BPO
<55.000>

QTSs. 400.0

YOGURT, LOW FAT, (13 [2
<56.000>

1/4 PT. 40000.0

HOMOGENIZED MILK [2E
<57.000>

1/2 GAL. 100.0

SOUR CREAM (INDIVIDU
<58.000>

<Quote: Q015402>

10z 17500.0
4 Total $74,679.20
WHOLE MILK HOMOGENI $0.098

<59.000>

1/4 PT. 100000.0

$9,800.00

*,NB,DD

WHOLE MILK HOMOGENI
<60.000>

1/2 PT. 100.0

$0.161
$16.10

*,DD,NB

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q015403>

$1.45
$580.00

DD

$0.98
$98.00

DD

$0.85
$170.00

DD

$0.0199
$398.00

DD

$0.95
$380.00

*,DD

$0.26
$10,400.00

*,DD

$1.26
$126.00

DD

$0.1175
$2,056.25

DD

$77,735.25




Bid Tab for Bid# B05273

Quote (005942) GARELICK FARMS
Info: <Quote: Q015402>

Item Info:
WHOLE MILK HOMOGENI $1.07
<61.000> $14,980.00
1/2 GAL. 14000.0 * NB,DD
LOW FAT (1%) HOMOGEN $0.088
<62.000> $17.600.00
1/4 PT. 200000.0 * DD,NB
SKIM MILK PLEASE [2BP $0.085
<63.000> $170.00
1/4 PT. 2000.0 * NB,DD
LOW FAT (1%) HOMOGEN $0.149
<64.000> $14.90
1/2 PT. 100.0 * DD,NB
SKIM MILK PLEASE [2BP $0.138
<65.000> $276.00
1/2 PT. 2000.0 * NB,DD
LACTAID MILK (LACTOS [; $0.359
<66.000> $5.385.00
1/2 PT. 15000.0 DD,NB
LOW FAT (1%) HOMOGEN $0.91
<67.000> $10,010.00
1/2 GAL. 11000.0 * NB,DD
LACTAID (LACTOSE FRE $1.05
<68.000> $2.625.00
QTS. 2500.0 * DD,NB

SKIM MILK PLEASE [2BP
<69.000>

1/2 GAL. 100.0

$0.94
$94.00

*NB,DD

COFFEE MILK, LOW FAT |
<70.000>

1/2 PT. 16000.0

$0.158
$2,528.00

*,DD,NB

CHOCOLATE MILK, LOW
<71.000>

1/2 PT. 8000.0

$0.145
$1,160.00

*NB,DD

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q015403>



Bid Tab for Bid# B05273

Quote (005942) GARELICK FARMS
Info: <Quote: Q015402>

Item Info:
HALF & HALF PLEAS [2B} $1.69
<72.000> $1.014.00
1/2 GAL. 600.0 * DD,NB
1/2 & 1/2 INDIVIDUAL [2BF $0.0152
<73.000> $1520.00
3/8 OZ. 100000.0 * NB,DD
HEAVY CREAM QUART [: $2.12
<74.000> $1.060.00
QT. 500.0 * DD,NB
SOUR CREAM 1 LB. [2BF $0.89
<75.000> $445.00
LB. 500.0 NB,DD
SOUR CREAM, LOW FAT No Bid
<76.000>
LB 500.0 DD,NB
INDIVIDUAL CREAM CHE $0.149
<77.000> $1.490.00
OZ. 10000.0 NB,DD
INDIVIDUAL LOW FAT C [: $0.145
<78.000> $1.450.00
OZ. 10000.0 * Tie,DD,NB
CREAM CHEESE 3 LB [2E $1.32
<79.000> $792.00
LB. 600.0 * NB,DD
CREAM CHEESE, LOW F# No Bid
<80.000>
LB 600.0 DD,NB
COTTAGE CHEESE 5 [2E $0.98
<81.000> $196.00
LB. 200.0 * Tie,NB,DD
COTTAGE CHEESE, LOW $0.92
<82.000> $920.00
LB. 1000.0 * DD,NB

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q015403>



Bid Tab for Bid# B05273

Quote (005942) GARELICK FARMS
Info: <Quote: Q015402>

Item Info:
RICOTTA CHEESE 2 [2BI $1.30
<83.000> $130.00
LB. 100.0 * NB,DD
MOZZARELLA CHEESE | $1.90
<84.000> $1.710.00
LB. 900.0 * DD,NB

YOGURT, ALL NATURAL,
<85.000>

1/2 PT. 200.0

$0.5125
$102.50

*NB,DD

YOGURT, LOW FAT ASST
<86.000>

1/2 PT. 10000.0

$0.5125
$5,125.00

*,DD,NB

YOGURT, FAT FREE, SU |
<87.000>

1/2 PT. 12000.0

$0.5125
$6,150.00

*NB,DD

PLAIN YOGURT QUAR [2I
<88.000>

QT. 900.0

$1.69
$1,521.00

*,DD,NB

BUTTERMILK QUART [2B
<89.000>

QT. 100.0

$0.62
$62.00

*NB,DD

YOGURT, ASSORTED FL#
<90.000>

QT. 20.0

$1.58
$31.60

*,DD,NB

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q015403>



Bid Tab for Bid# B05273

Quote (005942) GARELICK FARMS

Info:

Item Info:

SPRING WATER BOTTLEI
<91.000>

CS. 32000.0
5 Total
Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:
$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

<Quote: Q015402>

$4.296
$137,472.00

*,NB,DD

$225,850.10

$821,696.31
$0.00
$471,998.70

Eval Codes: NI

DD = Delivery Date Greater Than Requested Date

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q015403>

$6.10
$195,200.00

DD

$307,307.70

$946,077.54
$0.00
$444,303.54



