
(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<1.000>

40.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $91.82

$3,672.80

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<2.000>

10.0QT DD,NB

No Bid $27.10

$271.00

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<3.000>

10.0PT NB,DD

No Bid $16.14

$161.40

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<4.000>

45.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $105.04

$4,726.80

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<5.000>

10.0QT NB,DD

No Bid $30.20

$302.00

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<6.000>

10.0PT DD,NB

No Bid $17.71

$177.10

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<7.000>

10.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $124.78

$1,247.80

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<8.000>

10.0QT DD,NB

No Bid $35.29

$352.90

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<9.000>

10.0PT NB,DD

No Bid $19.78

$197.80

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<10.000>

10.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $148.52

$1,485.20

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<11.000>

10.0QT NB,DD

No Bid $41.17

$411.70

*,DD,NC



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<12.000>

10.0PT DD,NB

No Bid $23.10

$231.00

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<13.000>

10.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $182.68

$1,826.80

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<14.000>

10.0QT DD,NB

No Bid $49.66

$496.60

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CENTARI PAINT 
<15.000>

10.0PT NB,DD

No Bid $27.24

$272.40

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CENTARI 99A B 
<16.000>

40.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $74.42

$2,976.80

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CHROMABASE 1
<17.000>

5.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $42.31

$211.55

*,DD,NC

DUPONT 259S PAINT AD [
<18.000>

12.0PT DD,NB

No Bid $16.77

$201.24

*,NC,DD

DUPONT 793S PAINT GL [
<19.000>

150.0PT NB,DD

No Bid $38.80

$5,820.00

*,DD,NC

DUPONT 2505S  PRIME  [2
<20.000>

48.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $92.35

$4,432.80

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CHROMABASE P
<21.000>

20.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $162.91

$3,258.20

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CHROMABASE P
<22.000>

15.0QT DD,NB

No Bid $47.62

$714.30

*,NC,DD



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

DUPONT CHROMABASE P
<23.000>

10.0PT NB,DD

No Bid $28.16

$281.60

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CHROMABASE P
<24.000>

10.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $186.97

$1,869.70

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CHROMABASE P
<25.000>

10.0QT NB,DD

No Bid $54.65

$546.50

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CHROMABASE P
<26.000>

10.0PT DD,NB

No Bid $32.29

$322.90

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CHROMABASE P
<27.000>

10.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $266.60

$2,666.00

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CHROMABASE P
<28.000>

10.0QT DD,NB

No Bid $77.99

$779.90

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CHROMABASE P
<29.000>

10.0PT NB,DD

No Bid $45.96

$459.60

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CHROMABASE P
<30.000>

10.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $366.85

$3,668.50

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CHROMABASE P
<31.000>

10.0QT NB,DD

No Bid $107.29

$1,072.90

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CHROMABASE P
<32.000>

10.0PT DD,NB

No Bid $63.81

$638.10

*,NC,DD

DUPONT 8022S VOC COM
<33.000>

100.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $19.83

$1,983.00

*,DD,NC



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

DUPONT 7900S CLEAR  [2
<34.000>

20.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $100.63

$2,012.60

*,NC,DD

DUPONT 7175S MID-TEM 
<35.000>

70.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $40.21

$2,814.70

*,DD,NC

DUPONT 7975S ACTIVAT 
<36.000>

20.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $32.61

$652.20

*,NC,DD

DUPONT 4531S-QT   UN [2
<37.000>

4.0QT NB,DD

No Bid $33.65

$134.60

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CRONAR PAINT 
<38.000>

12.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $184.90

$2,218.80

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CRONAR PAINT 
<39.000>

2.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $215.94

$431.88

*,DD,NC

DUPONT CRONAR PAINT 
<40.000>

2.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $288.90

$577.80

*,NC,DD

DUPONT CRONAR PAINT 
<41.000>

2.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $401.31

$802.62

*,DD,NC

DUPONT 131S FILL-N-S [2
<42.000>

26.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $87.59

$2,277.34

*,NC,DD

DUPONT 1101S-GL URO [
<43.000>

2.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $79.66

$159.32

*,DD,NC

DUPONT 1104S-GL URO [
<44.000>

2.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $79.66

$159.32

*,NC,DD



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

DUPONT 1107S-GL URO [
<45.000>

2.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $79.66

$159.32

*,DD,NC

DUPONT 2510S DTM PR [2
<46.000>

18.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $97.32

$1,751.76

*,NC,DD

NAS 481-16-5G UNIVE [2B
<47.000>

65.0GAL

$7.50

$487.50

*,NB,DD

$22.14

$1,439.10

DD,NC

NORTON P/N 58000 RE [2
<48.000>

20.0BX

$9.75

$195.00

*,DD,NB

$10.24

$204.80

NC,DD

NORTON P/N 58002 GR [2
<49.000>

20.0BX

$9.75

$195.00

*,NB,DD

$10.24

$204.80

DD,NC

SAS P/N 8615 DUST M [2B
<50.000>

20.0BX

$10.00

$200.00

DD,NB

$8.58

$171.60

*,NC,DD

PLX 8257-5G LACQUER [2
<51.000>

100.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $73.67

$7,367.00

*,DD,NC

NASON 496-00 CLEAR  [2B
<52.000>

40.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $48.38

$1,935.20

*,NC,DD

NASON 483-7 CLEAR AC [
<53.000>

40.0QT NB,DD

No Bid $21.49

$859.60

*,DD,NC

3M PN5960 GLAZING-PU [
<54.000>

12.0TUBE

$15.00

$180.00

DD,NB

$13.44

$161.28

*,NC,DD

3M PN07048 DUST MASK 
<55.000>

550.0BX

$13.95

$7,672.50

NB,DD

$12.79

$7,034.50

*,DD,NC



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

3M 7447 SCOTCH BRITE [
<56.000>

20.0BX

$9.75

$195.00

*,DD,NB

$13.26

$265.20

NC,DD

RUBBER SANDING BLOCK
<57.000>

25.0EA

$3.00

$75.00

*,NB,DD

$3.52

$88.00

DD,NC

3M 7448 SCOTCH BRITE [
<58.000>

20.0BX

$9.75

$195.00

*,DD,NB

$13.26

$265.20

NC,DD

3M ROCKER PANEL SPRA
<59.000>

20.0CS

$216.00

$4,320.00

NB,DD

$189.48

$3,789.60

*,DD,NC

3M PERFECT-IT FOAM P [
<60.000>

5.0EA

$25.00

$125.00

DD,NB

$22.05

$110.25

*,NC,DD

3M PERFECT-IT III FI [2BP
<61.000>

5.0BTL

$17.80

$89.00

NB,DD

$15.76

$78.80

*,DD,NC

3M PERFECT-IT III RU [2B
<62.000>

5.0BTL

$21.00

$105.00

DD,NB

$18.14

$90.70

*,NC,DD

3M PERFECT-IT III FO [2B
<63.000>

52.0BTL

$28.10

$1,461.20

NB,DD

$24.98

$1,298.96

*,DD,NC

3M SUPER DUTY RUBBIN
<64.000>

5.0BTL

$40.10

$200.50

DD,NB

$36.32

$181.60

*,NC,DD

3M ALL-AROUND AUTOBO
<65.000>

10.0CS

$114.00

$1,140.00

NB,DD

$101.16

$1,011.60

*,DD,NC

1/2" X 20 YDS. DOUBL [2B
<66.000>

10.0ROLL

$20.00

$200.00

DD,NB

$16.25

$162.50

*,NC,DD



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

WEATHER STRIP ADHESI
<67.000>

12.0TUBE

$4.10

$49.20

NB,DD

$3.95

$47.40

*,DD,NC

AMT PG27075 3/4" MAS [2
<68.000>

2.0CS

$76.00

$152.00

DD,NB

$72.75

$145.50

*,NC,DD

AMT PG27200  2" MASK [2
<69.000>

2.0CS

$110.00

$220.00

NB,DD

$99.95

$199.90

*,DD,NC

FIBER GLASS EVERCOAT
<70.000>

20.0CAN

$16.40

$328.00

DD,NB

$12.28

$245.60

*,NC,DD

10" HALF ROUND CHEES 
<71.000>

5.0BX

$18.00

$90.00

NB,DD

$11.40

$57.00

*,DD,NC

NORTON 03344 POLYMAS
<72.000>

15.0ROLL

$18.00

$270.00

DD,NB

$17.95

$269.25

*,NC,DD

MWB SURIGICAL BLUE T 
<73.000>

15.0BX

$6.25

$93.75

NB,DD

$4.25

$63.75

*,DD,NC

HEAD SOCKS OR EQUIVA
<74.000>

25.0BX

$13.00

$325.00

DD,NB

$11.28

$282.00

*,NC,DD

ELEPHANT WIPES  EEZ [2
<75.000>

12.0ROLL

$45.00

$540.00

NB,DD

$40.10

$481.20

*,DD,NC

CNM WASH AND WAX CA
<76.000>

6.0GAL

$8.00

$48.00

DD,NB

$7.01

$42.06

*,NC,DD

SEYMOUR SEY 98-32 SI [2
<77.000>

72.0CAN

$3.64

$262.08

NB,DD

$2.72

$195.84

*,DD,NC



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

SEYMOUR SEY 98-18 GL 
<78.000>

150.0CAN

$3.20

$480.00

DD,NB

$2.72

$408.00

*,NC,DD

SEYMOUR SEY 98-30 FL [
<79.000>

150.0CAN

$3.20

$480.00

NB,DD

$2.72

$408.00

*,DD,NC

SEYMORE FLAT WHITE S
<80.000>

50.0CAN

$3.20

$160.00

DD,NB

$2.72

$136.00

*,NC,DD

SEYMORE GLOSS  WHITE
<81.000>

50.0CAN

$2.00

$100.00

*,NB,DD

$2.72

$136.00

DD,NC

SEYMORE FLAT BLACK S
<82.000>

75.0CAN

$3.20

$240.00

DD,NB

$2.72

$204.00

*,NC,DD

2 3/4" X 16 1/2" PSA [2BPO
<83.000>

6.0BX

$19.90

$119.40

*,NB,DD

$21.32

$127.92

DD,NC

2 3/4" X 16 1/2" PSA [2BPO
<84.000>

6.0BX

$32.10

$192.60

DD,NB

$31.97

$191.82

*,NC,DD

80G, 6" PSA DA PAPER [2
<85.000>

10.0BX

$29.60

$296.00

*,NB,DD

$34.56

$345.60

DD,NC

150G, 6" PSA DA PAPE [2B
<86.000>

15.0BX

$28.00

$420.00

*,DD,NB

$31.92

$478.80

NC,DD

220G, 6" PSA DA PAPE [2B
<87.000>

20.0BX

$28.00

$560.00

*,NB,DD

$31.92

$638.40

DD,NC

2000A 9 X 11 W/D #39 [2BP
<88.000>

5.0BX

$37.00

$185.00

DD,NB

$17.10

$85.50

*,NC,DD



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

320G, 6" PSA DA PAPE [2B
<89.000>

25.0ROLL

$28.00

$700.00

*,NB,DD

$31.92

$798.00

DD,NC

WET/DRY SANDPAPER 12
<90.000>

5.0BX

$25.00

$125.00

*,DD,NB

$34.20

$171.00

NC,DD

WET/DRY SANDPAPER 15
<91.000>

5.0BX

$26.10

$130.50

*,NB,DD

$34.20

$171.00

DD,NC

WET/DRY SANDPAPER 22
<92.000>

5.0BX

$22.50

$112.50

DD,NB

$22.29

$111.45

*,NC,DD

WET/DRY SANDPAPER 40
<93.000>

5.0BX

$22.50

$112.50

NB,DD

$22.29

$111.45

*,DD,NC

WET/DRY SANDPAPER 60
<94.000>

5.0BX

$22.50

$112.50

DD,NB

$22.29

$111.45

*,NC,DD

WET/DRY SANDPAPER 10
<95.000>

5.0BX

$25.00

$125.00

*,NB,DD

$34.20

$171.00

DD,NC

WET/DRY SANDPAPER 32
<96.000>

5.0BX

$22.50

$112.50

DD,NB

$22.29

$111.45

*,NC,DD

3" DIAMETER CUT-OFF  [2
<97.000>

3.0BX

$2,225.00

$6,675.00

NB,DD

$64.00

$192.00

*,DD,NC

ROUGH SERVICE SHOP L
<98.000>

24.0EA

$1.25

$30.00

DD,NB

$0.65

$15.60

*,NC,DD

E-Z PRODUCTS SUPER P
<99.000>

10.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $5.10

$51.00

*,DD,NC



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

ONE STEP RUST CONVER
<100.000>

30.0EA DD,NB

No Bid $8.42

$252.60

*,NC,DD

1 1/2" PILE HEIGHT W [2B
<101.000>

8.0EA

$7.00

$56.00

NB,DD

$6.66

$53.28

*,DD,NC

GO JO HAND CLEANER 1 
<102.000>

12.0DR

$15.00

$180.00

DD,NB

$10.12

$121.44

*,NC,DD

MEGUIR~'S MIRROR GLAZ
<103.000>

5.0BTL

$26.00

$130.00

NB,DD

$21.98

$109.90

*,DD,NC

6" GREEN MASKING PAP 
<104.000>

4.0SLV DD,NB

No Bid $15.05

$60.20

*,NC,DD

12" GREEN MASKING PA 
<105.000>

6.0SLV NB,DD

No Bid $15.05

$90.30

*,DD,NC

18" GREEN MASKING PA 
<106.000>

8.0SLV DD,NB

No Bid $15.05

$120.40

*,NC,DD

36" GREEN MASKING PA 
<107.000>

8.0ROLL

$18.00

$144.00

NB,DD

$15.05

$120.40

*,DD,NC

NORTON 82776 UNDERCO
<108.000>

50.0CAN

$3.90

$195.00

DD,NB

$2.86

$143.00

*,NC,DD

SPRAYWAY WINDOW CLE
<109.000>

12.0CAN

$2.50

$30.00

NB,DD

$2.07

$24.84

*,DD,NC

BOOTH FILTER 20" X 2 [2B
<110.000>

10.0CS

$90.00

$900.00

*,DD,NB

$111.19

$1,111.90

NC,DD



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

BOOTH FILTER 20" X 2 [2B
<111.000>

10.0CS

$81.00

$810.00

*,NB,DD

$97.99

$979.90

DD,NC

ACCORDIAN FILTERS 36 
<112.000>

10.0CS

$92.00

$920.00

DD,NB

$51.25

$512.50

*,NC,DD

BINKS MODEL 2001 REB [
<113.000>

5.0EA NB,DD

No Bid $12.95

$64.75

*,DD,NC

BINKS MODEL 18 REBUI [
<114.000>

5.0EA

$23.00

$115.00

DD,NB

$17.69

$88.45

*,NC,DD

BINKS MODEL 7 KIT #6 [2B
<115.000>

5.0EA

$24.00

$120.00

NB,DD

$18.71

$93.55

*,DD,NC

PLEX 8 UNIVERSAL THI [2
<116.000>

15.0CAN

$30.00

$450.00

DD,NB

$22.14

$332.10

*,NC,DD

4" PLASTIC YELLOW SP [2
<117.000>

5.0EA

$2.55

$12.75

NB,DD

$0.20

$1.00

*,DD,NC

6" PLASTIC YELLOW SP [2
<118.000>

5.0EA

$3.75

$18.75

DD,NB

$0.29

$1.45

*,NC,DD

2" X 3" RUBBER SQUEE [2
<119.000>

5.0EA

$2.50

$12.50

NB,DD

$0.37

$1.85

*,DD,NC

DEVILBIS DRIP FREE D [2
<120.000>

5.0KIT

$27.00

$135.00

DD,NB

$23.31

$116.55

*,NC,DD

DEVILBIS TRI-SEAL GA [2
<121.000>

5.0KIT

$21.00

$105.00

NB,DD

$17.69

$88.45

*,DD,NC



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

DEVILBIS M.B.C. GUN  [2B
<122.000>

5.0KIT

$36.00

$180.00

DD,NB

$32.90

$164.50

*,NC,DD

DEVILBIS JG SERIES   [2B
<123.000>

5.0KIT

$28.00

$140.00

NB,DD

$27.48

$137.40

*,DD,NC

DURAGLASS - USC 2403 [
<124.000>

8.0GAL

$29.00

$232.00

DD,NB

$27.52

$220.16

*,NC,DD

LAK 1417 TYVEK ELAST [2
<125.000>

5.0BX

$125.00

$625.00

NB,DD

$109.50

$547.50

*,DD,NC

LAK 1417 TYVEK ELAST [2
<126.000>

5.0BX

$125.00

$625.00

DD,NB

$109.50

$547.50

*,NC,DD

SURVIVAL AIR SYSTEMS 
<127.000>

10.0BX

$31.30

$313.00

NB,DD

$24.00

$240.00

*,DD,NC

SURVIVAL AIR SYSTEMS 
<128.000>

10.0BX

$32.60

$326.00

DD,NB

$25.43

$254.30

*,NC,DD

SURVIVAL AIR SYSTEMS 
<129.000>

4.0BX

$17.80

$71.20

NB,DD

$13.59

$54.36

*,DD,NC

SURVIVAL AIR SYSTEMS 
<130.000>

10.0EA

$47.30

$473.00

DD,NB

$36.94

$369.40

*,NC,DD

SURVIVAL AIR SYSTEMS 
<131.000>

10.0EA

$47.30

$473.00

NB,DD

$35.47

$354.70

*,DD,NC

2" ROLOC PAD - NORTO [
<132.000>

5.0EA

$12.00

$60.00

DD,NB

$10.07

$50.35

*,NC,DD



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

3" ROLOC PAD - NORTO [
<133.000>

5.0EA

$15.00

$75.00

NB,DD

$12.35

$61.75

*,DD,NC

6" DA PSA PAD - HUTC [2B
<134.000>

10.0EA

$15.00

$150.00

*,DD,NB

$18.53

$185.30

NC,DD

MSC 149 CHAMOIS [2BPO
<135.000>

5.0EA

$11.00

$55.00

NB,DD

$10.42

$52.10

*,DD,NC

MTW 00-16 STEELWOOL [
<136.000>

8.0SLEEVE

$5.00

$40.00

DD,NB

$2.68

$21.44

*,NC,DD

MIL 775 (MILTON BRAN [2
<137.000>

10.0EA

$3.90

$39.00

*,NB,DD

$4.45

$44.50

DD,NC

MIL 727 (MILTON BRAN [2
<138.000>

10.0EA

$1.60

$16.00

DD,NB

$0.77

$7.70

*,NC,DD

MIL 728 (MILTON BRAN [2
<139.000>

10.0EA

$1.60

$16.00

NB,DD

$0.83

$8.30

*,DD,NC

P-HC-4528 MALE HOSE  [2
<140.000>

10.0EA

$5.30

$53.00

DD,NB

$5.23

$52.30

*,NC,DD

Z-GRIP FILLER -  FGE [2B
<141.000>

8.0PAIL

$70.00

$560.00

NB,DD

$55.15

$441.20

*,DD,NC

SANDING BLOCKS - (NO [
<142.000>

10.0EA

$6.70

$67.00

DD,NB

$5.43

$54.30

*,NC,DD

MAG ALUMINUM CLEANE
<143.000>

5.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $15.58

$77.90

*,DD,NC



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

TIRE DRESSING - (CAR [2
<144.000>

5.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $11.71

$58.55

*,NC,DD

BODY WASH - PLEX #11 [2
<145.000>

4.0GAL

$40.00

$160.00

*,NB,DD

$48.46

$193.84

DD,NC

1/8" DOUBLE END DRIL [2
<146.000>

5.0PK

$7.50

$37.50

DD,NB

$4.20

$21.00

*,NC,DD

URO PRIMER ACTIVATOR
<147.000>

12.0QT NB,DD

No Bid $40.47

$485.64

*,DD,NC

URO PRIMER CONVERTE
<148.000>

12.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid $24.00

$288.00

*,NC,DD

URO PRIMER FILLER #1 [2
<149.000>

12.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $149.83

$1,797.96

*,DD,NC

25 FOOT AIR LINE RIB [2B
<150.000>

8.0EA

$34.00

$272.00

DD,NB

$21.00

$168.00

*,NC,DD

50 FOOT AIR LINE RIB [2B
<151.000>

8.0EA

$60.00

$480.00

NB,DD

$42.00

$336.00

*,DD,NC

BLR 13214  3/8" DE  [2BPO
<152.000>

5.0PKG

$15.00

$75.00

DD,NB

$12.31

$61.55

*,NC,DD

BLR 13217 PILOT PIN [2BP
<153.000>

2.0PKG

$4.50

$9.00

NB,DD

$3.09

$6.18

*,DD,NC

GER 010201 - (4) MED [2B
<154.000>

8.0CS DD,NB

No Bid $46.77

$374.16

*,NC,DD



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

GER 020002T - (144)  [2BP
<155.000>

72.0BOX

$7.25

$522.00

NB,DD

$4.35

$313.20

*,DD,NC

MMM 02602 - SUPERFIN [2
<156.000>

2.0BOX

$30.00

$60.00

DD,NB

$27.27

$54.54

*,NC,DD

MMM 02604 - FINE SAN [2
<157.000>

5.0BOX

$30.00

$150.00

NB,DD

$27.27

$136.35

*,DD,NC

MMM 02606- MED  SAND [
<158.000>

5.0BOX

$30.00

$150.00

DD,NB

$27.27

$136.35

*,NC,DD

PLX 1-5G - LACQUER T [2
<159.000>

3.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $43.56

$130.68

*,DD,NC

PLX 5287-5G - (10) L [2BPO
<160.000>

3.0GAL DD,NB

No Bid

*,NC,DD

No Charge

PLX 6001-5G - SG CLR [2B
<161.000>

1.0GAL NB,DD

No Bid $79.88

$79.88

*,DD,NC

EMM98000950-D - (100 [2B
<162.000>

200.0CS

$29.00

$5,800.00

*,DD,NB

$30.00

$6,000.00

NC,DD

EMM98100950 - (100)  [2B
<163.000>

100.0CS

$29.00

$2,900.00

NB,DD

$18.00

$1,800.00

*,DD,NC



(006034) COOPER LEWIS IN
<Quote: Q015075>

(004398) PROVIDENCE LACQ
<Quote: Q015080>

Bid Tab for Bid# B05108

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

3 X 4 SHEET METAL -  [2B
<164.000>

100.0EA

$18.00

$1,800.00

DD,NB

$11.99

$1,199.00

*,NC,DD

Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

DD = Delivery Date Greater Than Requested Date
NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items
NC = No Charge

$52,220.93

$0.00

$0.00

$117,891.03

$0.00

$117,891.03


