Bid Tab for Bid# B05035

Quote (001746) DULGARIAN BROTH

Info:

Item Info:

GILDEN SHORT SLEEVE
<1.000>

EA 120.0

HARVARD SQUARE LONC
<2.000>

EA 120.0

REDKAP 80z. WORK PAN
<3.000>

EA 90.0

ALASKA BAY 3-SEASON
<4.000>

EA 30.0

LOGO SETUP FEE

<5.000>

EA 1.0

Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:
$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

<Quote: Q014911>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$14.00
$1,260.00

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$1,260.00
$0.00
$0.00

Eval Codes: NI

(020709) SHERBRO SERVICE (020722) WORK N GEAR LLC
<Quote: Q014913>

<Quote: Q014912>

$9.50
$1,140.00

$15.75
$1,890.00

$12.28
$1,105.20

$37.50
$1,125.00

$15.00
$15.00

$5,275.20
$0.00
$0.00

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

$13.99
$1,678.80

$17.49
$2,098.80

$13.99
$1,259.10

$37.99
$1,139.70

NB

$6,176.40
$0.00
$6,176.40



