Bid Tab for Bid# B05021

Quote (001334) CENTRAL POLY CO

Info:

Item Info:

CUPS, 10 OZ., COLD D [2E
<18.000>

M 1.0
LIDS, 10 OZ., (FOR A [2BA
<19.000>

M 1.0
BUTTER CHIPS, PAPER [Z
<68.000>

M 1.0
FRENCH FRY BAGS, 4 1.
<73.000>

M 1.0
BANANA BOATS - PLAST
<76.000>

M 1.0
PLATES, PAPER 7" PL [2B
<86.000>

M 1.0
FLATWARE - FOOD SERV
<89.000>

SET 1.0
LID, HOT CUPS DOME S |
<96.000>

M 1.0
BOWL, 3.5 0Z., JAZZ [2BF
<97.000>

M 1.0
10 INCH PLATE, JAZZ [2B
<101.000>

M 1.0

LID, CLEAR PLASTIC [2B
<103.000>

<Quote: Q014922>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001204) CIRELLI FOODS |
<Quote: Q014926>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$0.077
$0.077
*

No Bid
NB
$55.78
$55.78
$173.76
$173.76

No Bid
NB

(000245) EB THOMSEN INC
<Quote: Q014927>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$0.086
$0.086

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid

NB

(001873) EASTERN BAG P
<Quote: Q014928>

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$6.24
$6.24

$89.73
$89.73

No Bid

NB

$0.109
$0.109

No Bid

NB

$18.36
$18.36

$122.42
$122.42

No Bid

NB


dianet
Highlight


Bid Tab for Bid# B05021

Quote (001334) CENTRAL POLY CO

Info:

Item Info:

LID, CLEAR PLASTIC [2B,
<104.000>

M 1.0
LID, CLEAR PLASTIC [2B
<105.000>

M 1.0
LID, CLEAR PLASTIC [2B
<106.000>

M 1.0
LID, CLEAR PLASTIC [2B
<107.000>

M 1.0
LID, CLEAR PLASTIC [2B
<108.000>

M 1.0
7 1/2 INCH PLATE, PR [2B
<109.000>

M 1.0
PLATE, PRESTIGE BONE
<110.000>

M 1.0
BOWL, PRESTIGE BONE

<111.000>

M 1.0
SHOWCASE, 32 0Z., CL [Z
<114.000>

M 1.0
SHOWCASE, 24 OZ., CL [Z
<115.000>

M 1.0

LID, CLEAR PLASTIC, [2B
<116.000>

<Quote: Q014922>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001204) CIRELLI FOODS |

<Quote: Q014926>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(000245) EB THOMSEN INC
<Quote: Q014927>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

$95.72
$95.72

$87.12
$87.12

$73.44
$73.44

(001873) EASTERN BAG P
<Quote: Q014928>

No Bid

NB

$91.37
$91.37

$278.24
$278.24

$391.28
$391.28

$285.80
$285.80

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$108.24
$108.24

$91.62
$91.62

$82.70
$82.70
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Highlight

dianet
Highlight


Bid Tab for Bid# B05021

Quote (001334) CENTRAL POLY CO

Info:

Item Info:

SOUFFLE CUP, 2 OZ., [2E
<117.000>

M 1.0
SOUFFLE CUP LID,2 0 [2
<118.000>

M 1.0
FOOD TRAY, COLOR TEA
<125.000>

M 1.0
FOOD TRAY, COLOR TEA
<126.000>

M 1.0
DISPOSABLE BUTANE, 8

<127.000>

M 1.0
TRAY, OVAL 15" BLACK [z
<128.000>

M 1.0
DOME LID, 15" CLEAR [2t
<129.000>

M 1.0
TRAY, CATERWARE ECLI
<130.000>

M 1.0
DOME LID, CLEAR PLAS [
<131.000>

M 1.0
TEASPOON, PLASTIC, M |
<132.000>

M 1.0

SOUPSPOON, PLASTIC, |
<133.000>

<Quote: Q014922>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001204) CIRELLI FOODS |
<Quote: Q014926>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

$6.68
$6.68

$6.68
$6.68

(000245) EB THOMSEN INC

<Quote: Q014927>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001873) EASTERN BAG P
<Quote: Q014928>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

$6.70
$6.70

$6.70
$6.70


dianet
Highlight

dianet
Highlight


Bid Tab for Bid# B05021

Quote (001334) CENTRAL POLY CO

Info:

Item Info:

FORKS, PLASTIC, MED [z
<134.000>
M 1.0
KNIVES, PLASTIC, ME [2E
<135.000>
M 1.0
NAPKIN, 15" X 17" DI [2BA
<137.000>
M 1.0
NAPKIN, 15" X 17" DI [2BA
<138.000>
M 1.0
TABLE COVER, 54 X 10 [2
<145.000>
M 1.0
TUMBLERS, 12 OZ. CLE [z
<149.000>
M 1.0
TRASH BAGS, 22 X 16 [2F
<150.000>
M 1.0
CHEF HATS, 9" PAPER, [2
<152.000>
M 1.0
PAN LINERS, 16-3/8 X [2B.
<159.000>
M 1.0
GRILL BRICKS ACS #G [2I
<164.000>
M 1.0

COFFEE STIRRERS, 5" [2
<166.000>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

<Quote: Q014922>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

$82.00
$82.00

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001204) CIRELLI FOODS |
<Quote: Q014926>

$6.68
$6.68

$6.68
$6.68

$38.94
$38.94

$38.94
$38.94

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$134.20
$134.20

No Bid

NB

$26.26
$26.26

$1,135.83
$1,135.83

No Bid

NB

(000245) EB THOMSEN INC

<Quote: Q014927>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001873) EASTERN BAG P
<Quote: Q014928>

$6.70
$6.70
$6.70
$6.70

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$116.85
$116.85

No Bid
NB
$29.80
$29.80

No Bid
NB

No Bid

NB
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Highlight
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Bid Tab for Bid# B05021

Quote (001334) CENTRAL POLY CO

Info: <Quote: Q014922>
Item Info:
COFFEE FILTERS, 5 GA [Z No Bid
<167.000>
M 1.0 NB
COFFEE FILTERS, TO F [Z No Bid
<168.000>
M 1.0 NB
Totals: Net $ Total: $82.00
$ Discount: $0.00
$ Awarded: $0.00
Eval Codes: NI

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

(001204) CIRELLI FOODS |
<Quote: Q014926>

No Bid

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

NB

$1,630.507
$0.00
$0.00

(000245) EB THOMSEN INC
<Quote: Q014927>

No Bid

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

NB

$256.366
$0.00
$0.00

(001873) EASTERN BAG P
<Quote: Q014928>

No Bid

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

NB

$1,739.559
$0.00
$1,400.29



