Bid Tab for Bid# B04273

Quote
Info:
Item Info:
GLOCESTER [2BPQ]
<1.000>
TON 500.0

WHIPPLE AVENUE [2BA]
<2.000>

TON 1000.0

SCITUATE [2BPO]
<3.000>

TON 2000.0

CLAYVILLE [2BPO]
<4.000>

TON 1500.0

LINCOLN [2BPO]
<5.000>

TON 1000.0

CHERRY HILL [2BPO]
<6.000>

TON 500.0

SMITHFIELD (ROUTE 11 [0
<7.000>

TON 300.0

ROUTE 6 & 295 [2BPO]
<8.000>

TON 700.0

(001710) DRYBRIDGE SAND
<Quote: Q012774>

$12.65
$6,325.00

DD

$12.45
$12,450.00

DD

$12.45
$24,900.00

DD

$10.99
$16,485.00

*,DD

$11.12
$11,120.00

*,DD

$10.48
$5,240.00

*,DD

$10.37
$3,111.00

*,DD

$10.06
$7,042.00

*,DD

(001964) MATERIAL SAND
<Quote: Q012775>

$11.36
$5,680.00

DD,NB

$11.20
$11,200.00

*,.DD,NB

$11.96
$23,920.00

DD,NB

No Bid

DD,NB

$11.13
$11,130.00

DD,NB

$12.20
$6,100.00

DD,NB

$10.90
$3,270.00

DD,NB

$11.23
$7,861.00

DD,NB

(006517) RAWSON
TRUCKING
<Quote: Q012776>

$10.50
$5,250.00

*,.DD

$11.30
$11,300.00

DD

$11.30
$22,600.00

*,.DD

$11.30
$16,950.00

DD

$12.62
$12,620.00

DD

$12.62
$6,310.00

DD

$11.85
$3,555.00

DD

$11.85
$8,295.00

DD

(000633) RICHMOND SAND
<Quote: Q012777>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

DD,NB

DD,NB

DD,NB

DD,NB

$12.45
$12,450.00

DD,NB

$13.45
$6,725.00

DD,NB

$12.45
$3,735.00

DD,NB

$12.45
$8,715.00

DD,NB

(001553) SOUTH COUNTY SA
<Quote: Q012778>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB,DD

NB,DD

NB,DD

NB,DD

NB,DD

NB,DD

NB,DD

NB,DD



Bid Tab for Bid# B04273

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

ROUTE 37 AT JEFFERSO
<9.000>

TON 1000.0

MIDSTATE [2BPO]
<10.000>

TON 1000.0

SUMMIT [2BPO]
<11.000>

TON 300.0

BELLEVILLE [2BPO]
<12.000>

TON 1000.0

DILLONS CORNER [2BPO
<13.000>

TON 500.0
HOPE VALLEY [2BPO]
<14.000>

TON 1000.0
WESTERLY [2BPO]
<15.000>

TON 500.0

CHARLESTOWN [2BPO]
<16.000>

TON 500.0

(001710) DRYBRIDGE SAND
<Quote: Q012774>

$9.82
$9,820.00

*,DD

$9.62
$9,620.00

*,DD

$9.87
$2,961.00

*,DD

$8.91
$8,910.00

*,DD

$9.77
$4,885.00

*,DD

$9.72
$9,720.00

*,DD

$10.87
$5,435.00

*,DD

$9.82
$4,910.00

*,DD

(001964) MATERIAL SAND
<Quote: Q012775>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

DD,NB

DD,NB

DD,NB

DD,NB

DD,NB

DD,NB

DD,NB

DD,NB

(006517) RAWSON
TRUCKING
<Quote: Q012776>

$13.78
$13,780.00

DD

$13.78
$13,780.00

DD

$12.62
$3,786.00

DD

$15.70
$15,700.00

DD

$16.20
$8,100.00

DD

$12.62
$12,620.00

DD

$12.62
$6,310.00

DD

$15.70
$7,850.00

DD

(000633) RICHMOND SAND
<Quote: Q012777>

$11.45
$11,450.00

DD,NB

$11.45
$11,450.00

DD,NB

$11.45
$3,435.00

DD,NB

$12.45
$12,450.00

DD,NB

$11.45
$5,725.00

DD,NB

$10.45
$10,450.00

DD,NB

$12.45
$6,225.00

DD,NB

$12.45
$6,225.00

DD,NB

(001553) SOUTH COUNTY SA
<Quote: Q012778>

No Bid

NB,DD

$19.00
$19,000.00

NB,DD

$19.00
$5,700.00

NB,DD

$18.00
$18,000.00

NB,DD

$18.00
$9,000.00

NB,DD

$18.00
$18,000.00

NB,DD

$18.00
$9,000.00

NB,DD

$18.00
$9,000.00

NB,DD



Bid Tab for Bid# B04273

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

EAST PROVIDENCE [2BP(
<17.000>

TON 600.0

WARREN YARD [2BPO]
<18.000>

TON 400.0

ROUTE 6 - (EAST SHOR [2
<19.000>

TON 600.0
APEX [2BPO]

<20.000>

TON 300.0

PORTSMOUTH [2BPO]
<21.000>

TON 800.0

LAWTON VALLEY [2BPO]
<22.000>

TON 600.0

(001710) DRYBRIDGE SAND
<Quote: Q012774>

$11.12
$6,672.00

*,DD

$12.75
$5,100.00

*,DD

$11.38
$6,828.00

*,DD

$12.98
$3,894.00

DD

$14.25
$11,400.00

*,DD

$14.13
$8,478.00

*,DD

(001964) MATERIAL SAND
<Quote: Q012775>

No Bid

DD,NB

No Bid

DD,NB

$12.95
$7,770.00

DD,NB

$12.95
$3,885.00

*,.DD,NB

No Bid

DD,NB

No Bid

DD,NB

(006517) RAWSON
TRUCKING
<Quote: Q012776>

$13.78
$8,268.00

DD

$13.78
$5,512.00

DD

$13.78
$8,268.00

DD

$13.78
$4,134.00

DD

$16.20
$12,960.00

DD

$17.00
$10,200.00

DD

(000633) RICHMOND SAND
<Quote: Q012777>

$13.45
$8,070.00

DD,NB

$14.45
$5,780.00

DD,NB

$13.45
$8,070.00

DD,NB

$14.45
$4,335.00

DD,NB

$15.75
$12,600.00

DD,NB

$15.75
$9,450.00

DD,NB

(001553) SOUTH COUNTY SA
<Quote: Q012778>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB,DD

NB,DD

NB,DD

NB,DD

NB,DD

NB,DD



Bid Tab for Bid# B04273
Quote (001710) DRYBRIDGE SAND

Info: <Quote: Q012774>
Item Info:
LITTLE COMPTON [2BPO] $15.98
<23.000~ $6,392.00
TON 400.0 DD
Totals: Net $ Total: $191,698.00
$ Discount: $0.00
$ Awarded: $148,023.00

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

DD = Delivery Date Greater Than Requested Date
NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

(001964) MATERIAL SAND
<Quote: Q012775>

No Bid
DD,NB
$80,816.00
$0.00
$0.00
Eval Codes: NI

(006517) RAWSON
TRUCKING
<Quote: Q012776>

$18.00
$7,200.00

DD

$225,348.00
$0.00
$39,150.00

(000633) RICHMOND SAND
<Quote: Q012777>

(001553) SOUTH COUNTY SA
<Quote: Q012778>

$15.75 No Bid
$6,300.00
*,DD,NB NB,DD
$153,640.00 $87,700.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI



