
(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q012195>

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q012196>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04046

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

WHOLE MILK, HOMOGEN
<1.000>

21000.01/4 PT

$0.1145

$2,404.50

NB,DD

$0.1058

$2,221.80

*,DD,U

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2B
<2.000>

352500.01/4 PT.

$0.0985

$34,721.25

DD,NB

$0.093

$32,782.50

*,U,DD

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2B
<3.000>

80000.01/2 PT.

$0.1628

$13,024.00

NB,DD

$0.1598

$12,784.00

*,DD,U

WHOLE MILK, HOMOGEN
<4.000>

1250.01/2 PT.

$0.188

$235.00

DD,NB

$0.1834

$229.25

*,U,DD

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2B
<5.000>

9826.01/2 GAL.

$1.073

$10,543.298

*,NB,DD

$1.175

$11,545.55

DD,U

SKIM MILK  PLEASE  [2BP
<6.000>

1000.01/4 PT.

$0.094

$94.00

*,Tie,DD,NB

$0.094

$94.00

*,Tie,U,DD

WHOLE MILK, HOMOGEN
<7.000>

1998.01/2 GAL.

$1.25

$2,497.50

*,NB,DD

$1.36

$2,717.28

DD,U

SKIM MILK  PLEASE  [2BP
<8.000>

225.01/2 GAL.

$0.987

$222.075

*,DD,NB

$1.13

$254.25

U,DD

COFFEE MILK, LOW FAT [
<9.000>

500.01/2 PT.

$0.174

$87.00

NB,DD

$0.169

$84.50

*,DD,U

CHOCOLATE MILK, LOW  
<10.000>

500.01/2 PT.

$0.163

$81.50

DD,NB

$0.162

$81.00

*,U,DD

1/2 & 1/2 INDIVIDUAL [2BP
<11.000>

46800.03/8 OZ.

$0.0177

$828.36

NB,DD

$0.0162

$758.16

*,DD,U



(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q012195>

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q012196>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04046

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

SOUR CREAM, INDIVIDU [
<12.000>

4000.01 OZ.

$0.0724

$289.60

*,DD,NB

$0.1175

$470.00

U,DD

SOUR CREAM  1 LB.  [2BP
<13.000>

60.0LB.

$1.08

$64.80

NB,DD

$0.87

$52.20

*,DD,U

SOUR CREAM  5 LB.  [2BP
<14.000>

340.0LB.

$0.922

$313.48

DD,NB

$0.77

$261.80

*,U,DD

HEAVY CREAM  QUART [2
<15.000>

24.0QT.

$2.98

$71.52

NB,DD

$2.45

$58.80

*,DD,U

LITE CREAM  QUART [2BP
<16.000>

24.0QT.

$1.57

$37.68

DD,NB

$1.30

$31.20

*,U,DD

COTTAGE CHEESE, LOW 
<17.000>

375.0LB.

$0.88

$330.00

NB,DD

$0.72

$270.00

*,DD,U

COTTAGE CHEESE, SALT
<18.000>

60.0LB. DD,NB

No Bid $0.83

$49.80

*,U,DD

RICOTTA CHEESE  2  [2BP
<19.000>

200.0LB.

$1.43

$286.00

NB,DD

$1.35

$270.00

*,DD,U

INDIVIDUAL CREAM CHE 
<20.000>

6000.0OZ

$0.1575

$945.00

DD,NB

$0.146

$876.00

*,U,DD

CREAM CHEESE  3 OR [2B
<21.000>

320.0LB.

$1.62

$518.40

NB,DD

$1.60

$512.00

*,DD,U

YOGURT, STRAWBERRY,
<22.000>

3000.0LB.

$0.70

$2,100.00

*,DD,NB

$0.79

$2,370.00

U,DD



(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q012195>

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q012196>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04046

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

SOY MILK, CHOCOLATE, 
<23.000>

120.01/2 GAL. NB,DD

No Bid $2.00

$240.00

*,DD,U

LACTOSE FREE MILK 10 [
<24.000>

6876.0QTS.

$1.18

$8,113.68

DD,NB

$1.05

$7,219.80

*,U,DD

EGG NOG  PLEASE IN [2B
<25.000>

64.0QTS.

$1.32

$84.48

*,NB,DD

$1.45

$92.80

DD,U

MOZZARELLA CHEESE   [
<26.000>

40.0LB. DD,NB

No Bid $2.05

$82.00

*,U,DD

MOZZARELLA CHEESE-S
<27.000>

40.0LB. NB,DD

No Bid $2.05

$82.00

*,DD,U

1 Total $77,893.123 $76,490.69

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2B
<28.000>

2750000.01/2 PT.

$0.155

$426,250.00

*,DD,NB

$0.1565

$430,375.00

U,DD

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2B
<29.000>

5500.01/2 GAL.

$1.06

$5,830.00

*,NB,DD

$1.15

$6,325.00

DD,U

LACT-AID MILK, LOW F [2B
<30.000>

50.0QTS.

$1.19

$59.50

DD,NB

$1.05

$52.50

*,U,DD

COTTAGE CHEESE  5  [2B
<31.000>

100.0LB.

$0.90

$90.00

NB,DD

$0.82

$82.00

*,DD,U

YOGURT, LOW FAT, ASS 
<32.000>

50.01/2 PT.

$0.545

$27.25

*,DD,NB

$0.60

$30.00

U,DD



(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q012195>

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q012196>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04046

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

PASSOVER KOSHER MILK
<33.000>

75.01/2 GAL.

$1.06

$79.50

*,NB,DD

$1.20

$90.00

DD,U

2 Total $432,336.25 $436,954.50

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2B
<34.000>

320000.01/2 PT.

$0.1627

$52,064.00

DD,NB

$0.1598

$51,136.00

*,U,DD

LOW FAT (1%) MILK, H [2B
<35.000>

1400.01/2 GAL.

$1.083

$1,516.20

*,NB,DD

$1.175

$1,645.00

DD,U

SKIM MILK  PLEASE  [2BP
<36.000>

15600.01/2 PT.

$0.16

$2,496.00

DD,NB

$0.155

$2,418.00

*,U,DD

CHOCOLATE MILK, LOW  
<37.000>

32000.01/2 PT.

$0.163

$5,216.00

NB,DD

$0.162

$5,184.00

*,DD,U

COFFEE MILK, LOW FAT [
<38.000>

32000.01/2 PT.

$0.176

$5,632.00

DD,NB

$0.169

$5,408.00

*,U,DD

RICOTTA CHEESE  2  [2BP
<39.000>

800.0LB.

$1.43

$1,144.00

NB,DD

$1.35

$1,080.00

*,DD,U

YOGURT, LOW FAT, ASS 
<40.000>

42000.06 OZ.

$0.53

$22,260.00

DD,NB

$0.49

$20,580.00

*,U,DD

LACTOSE FREE MILK   [2B
<41.000>

1300.0QTS.

$1.18

$1,534.00

NB,DD

$1.05

$1,365.00

*,DD,U



(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q012195>

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q012196>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04046

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

CREAM CHEESE, INDIVI [2
<42.000>

1600.0LB.

$1.83

$2,928.00

DD,NB

$1.60

$2,560.00

*,U,DD

3 Total $94,790.20 $91,376.00

HOMOGENIZED MILK   [2B
<43.000>

425000.01/4 PT.

$0.114

$48,450.00

NB,DD

$0.1048

$44,540.00

*,DD,U

BULK, HOMOGENIZED MI 
<44.000>

300.0GAL.BK

$2.55

$765.00

*,DD,NB

$2.60

$780.00

U,DD

SKIM MILK  PLEASE  [2BP
<45.000>

350.01/2 GAL.

$1.0066

$352.31

*,NB,DD

$1.13

$395.50

DD,U

SKIM MILK  PLEASE  [2BP
<46.000>

125000.01/4 PT.

$0.095

$11,875.00

DD,NB

$0.09

$11,250.00

*,U,DD

SKIM MILK  24 QT.  [2BPO
<47.000>

2400.0QT.

$0.4975

$1,194.00

*,NB,DD

$0.53

$1,272.00

DD,U

CHOCOLATE MILK, LOW  
<48.000>

1000.01/2 PT.

$0.167

$167.00

DD,NB

$0.162

$162.00

*,U,DD

COFFEE MILK, LOW FAT [
<49.000>

1000.01/2 PT.

$0.178

$178.00

NB,DD

$0.169

$169.00

*,DD,U

LACTOSE FREE MILK   [2B
<50.000>

1200.01/2 GAL.

$2.36

$2,832.00

DD,NB

$2.05

$2,460.00

*,U,DD

RICOTTA CHEESE  2  [2BP
<51.000>

400.0LB.

$1.41

$564.00

NB,DD

$1.35

$540.00

*,DD,U



(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q012195>

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q012196>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04046

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

COTTAGE CHEESE  5  [2B
<52.000>

100.0LB.

$0.91

$91.00

DD,NB

$0.85

$85.00

*,U,DD

SOUR CREAM  5 LB.  [2BP
<53.000>

200.0LB.

$0.93

$186.00

NB,DD

$0.75

$150.00

*,DD,U

1/2 & 1/2 INDIVIDUAL [2BP
<54.000>

20000.03/8 OZ.

$0.018

$360.00

DD,NB

$0.0162

$324.00

*,U,DD

1/2 & 1/2 QUARTS   [2BPO
<55.000>

400.0QTS.

$1.12

$448.00

NB,DD

$1.02

$408.00

*,DD,U

YOGURT, LOW FAT, (13 [2
<56.000>

40000.01/4 PT.

$0.29

$11,600.00

DD,NB

$0.26

$10,400.00

*,U,DD

HOMOGENIZED MILK   [2B
<57.000>

100.01/2 GAL.

$1.285

$128.50

*,NB,DD

$1.36

$136.00

DD,U

SOUR CREAM (INDIVIDU 
<58.000>

17500.01 OZ.

$0.07

$1,225.00

*,DD,NB

$0.1175

$2,056.25

U,DD

4 Total $80,415.81 $75,127.75

WHOLE MILK HOMOGENI
<59.000>

100000.01/4 PT.

$0.1145

$11,450.00

NB,DD

$0.1058

$10,580.00

*,DD,U

WHOLE MILK HOMOGENI
<60.000>

100.01/2 PT.

$0.187

$18.70

DD,NB

$0.1834

$18.34

*,U,DD

WHOLE MILK HOMOGENI
<61.000>

14000.01/2 GAL.

$1.28

$17,920.00

*,NB,DD

$1.36

$19,040.00

DD,U



(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q012195>

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q012196>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04046

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

LOW FAT (1%) HOMOGEN
<62.000>

200000.01/4 PT.

$0.10

$20,000.00

DD,NB

$0.095

$19,000.00

*,U,DD

SKIM MILK  PLEASE  [2BP
<63.000>

2000.01/4 PT.

$0.097

$194.00

NB,DD

$0.093

$186.00

*,DD,U

LOW FAT (1%) HOMOGEN
<64.000>

100.01/2 PT.

$0.165

$16.50

DD,NB

$0.1598

$15.98

*,U,DD

SKIM MILK  PLEASE  [2BP
<65.000>

2000.01/2 PT.

$0.157

$314.00

NB,DD

$0.155

$310.00

*,DD,U

LACTAID MILK (LACTOS [2
<66.000>

15000.01/2 PT.

$0.321

$4,815.00

DD,NB

$0.30

$4,500.00

*,U,DD

LOW FAT (1%) HOMOGEN
<67.000>

11000.01/2 GAL.

$1.08

$11,880.00

*,NB,DD

$1.175

$12,925.00

DD,U

LACTAID (LACTOSE FRE 
<68.000>

2500.0QTS.

$1.175

$2,937.50

DD,NB

$1.05

$2,625.00

*,U,DD

SKIM MILK  PLEASE  [2BP
<69.000>

100.01/2 GAL.

$1.01

$101.00

*,NB,DD

$1.13

$113.00

DD,U

COFFEE MILK, LOW FAT [
<70.000>

16000.01/2 PT.

$0.171

$2,736.00

DD,NB

$0.169

$2,704.00

*,U,DD

CHOCOLATE MILK, LOW  
<71.000>

8000.01/2 PT.

$0.162

$1,296.00

*,Tie,NB,DD

$0.162

$1,296.00

*,Tie,DD,U

HALF & HALF  PLEAS [2BP
<72.000>

600.01/2 GAL.

$1.95

$1,170.00

DD,NB

$1.90

$1,140.00

*,U,DD



(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q012195>

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q012196>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04046

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

1/2 & 1/2 INDIVIDUAL [2BP
<73.000>

100000.03/8 OZ.

$0.0177

$1,770.00

NB,DD

$0.0162

$1,620.00

*,DD,U

HEAVY CREAM  QUART [2
<74.000>

500.0QT.

$2.87

$1,435.00

DD,NB

$2.45

$1,225.00

*,U,DD

SOUR CREAM  1 LB.  [2BP
<75.000>

500.0LB.

$1.08

$540.00

NB,DD

$0.87

$435.00

*,DD,U

SOUR CREAM, LOW FAT 
<76.000>

500.0LB DD,NB

No Bid $0.87

$435.00

*,U,DD

INDIVIDUAL CREAM CHE 
<77.000>

10000.0OZ.

$0.157

$1,570.00

NB,DD

$0.146

$1,460.00

*,DD,U

INDIVIDUAL LOW FAT C [2
<78.000>

10000.0OZ.

$0.147

$1,470.00

DD,NB

$0.146

$1,460.00

*,U,DD

CREAM CHEESE  3 LB [2B
<79.000>

600.0LB.

$1.87

$1,122.00

NB,DD

$1.60

$960.00

*,DD,U

CREAM CHEESE, LOW FA
<80.000>

600.0LB DD,NB

No Bid $1.60

$960.00

*,U,DD

COTTAGE CHEESE   5 [2B
<81.000>

200.0LB.

$0.91

$182.00

NB,DD

$0.72

$144.00

*,DD,U

COTTAGE CHEESE, LOW 
<82.000>

1000.0LB.

$0.89

$890.00

DD,NB

$0.83

$830.00

*,U,DD

RICOTTA CHEESE  2  [2BP
<83.000>

100.0LB.

$1.44

$144.00

NB,DD

$1.35

$135.00

*,DD,U



(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q012195>

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q012196>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04046

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

MOZZARELLA CHEESE   [
<84.000>

900.0LB.

$1.76

$1,584.00

*,DD,NB

$2.05

$1,845.00

U,DD

YOGURT, ALL NATURAL, 
<85.000>

200.01/2 PT.

$0.55

$110.00

*,Tie,NB,DD

$0.55

$110.00

*,Tie,DD,U

YOGURT, LOW FAT ASST
<86.000>

10000.01/2 PT.

$0.55

$5,500.00

*,Tie,DD,NB

$0.55

$5,500.00

*,Tie,U,DD

YOGURT, FAT FREE, SU [
<87.000>

12000.01/2 PT.

$0.55

$6,600.00

*,Tie,NB,DD

$0.55

$6,600.00

*,Tie,DD,U

PLAIN YOGURT  QUAR [2B
<88.000>

900.0QT.

$1.75

$1,575.00

DD,NB

$1.58

$1,422.00

*,U,DD

BUTTERMILK  QUART [2B
<89.000>

100.0QT.

$0.688

$68.80

*,NB,DD

$0.87

$87.00

DD,U

YOGURT, ASSORTED FLA
<90.000>

20.0QT.

$1.52

$30.40

DD,NB

$1.45

$29.00

*,U,DD



(005942) GARELICK FARMS
<Quote: Q012195>

(001004) GUIDA DAIRY
<Quote: Q012196>

Bid Tab for Bid# B04046

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

SPRING WATER BOTTLED
<91.000>

32000.0CS.

$0.229

$7,328.00

NB,DD

$0.225

$7,200.00

*,DD,U

EA

5 Total $106,767.90 $106,910.32

Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

DD = Delivery Date Greater Than Requested Date
NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items
U = Different Unit Of Measure

$792,203.283

$0.00

$432,336.25

$786,859.26

$0.00

$349,904.76


