Bid Tab for Bid# B03946

Quote (018195) HERSHEY
Info: CREAMER
<Quote: Q012087>

Item Info:
ICE CREAM CUPS, 4 OZ [. $0.20
<1.000> $500.00
BAG 2500.0 *
SHERBERT CUPS, 4 OZ. [ $3.48
<2.000> $2,784.00
BAG 800.0 *
SHERBERT CUPS, 4 OZ. [ No Bid
<3.000>
BAG 850.0 NB
POPSICLES, ASSORTED, $5.99
<4.000> $3,893.50
BOX 650.0
POPSICLES, SUGAR FRE No Bid

<5.000>

BOX 13.0

NB

ICE CREAM, ASSORTED
<6.000>

BAG 50.0

$6.48
$324.00

ITALIAN ICE, 6 OZ., [2BP(
<7.000>

BAG 500.0

$3.33
$1,665.00

ICE CREAM SANDWICHE:!
<8.000>

BAG 500.0

$11.97
$5,985.00

ICE CREAM, 3 GALLON [2
<9.000>

TUB 90.0

$20.33
$1,829.70

SUNDAE CUPS, 6 OZ. C [2
<10.000>

BOX 1000.0

$8.55
$8,550.00

FUDGICLES, 2.5 OZ. ( [2BI
<11.000>

BOX 100.0

$5.99
$599.00

(000995) WARWICK ICE CRE
<Quote: Q012088>



Bid Tab for Bid# B03946

Quote
Info:

Item Info:
NUTTY ICE CREAM DRUN
<12.000>
BOX 50.0
YOGURT, FROZEN, NON-

<13.000>

BOX 550.0

DIET ICE CREAM, SUGA [.
<14.000>

BAG 2600.0

FUDGESICLE , SUGARF |
<15.000>

CS 20.0

Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:
$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

(018195) HERSHEY
CREAMER
<Quote: Q012087>

$8.55
$427.50

$3.90
$2,145.00

$3.90
$10,140.00

No Bid

NB

$38,842.70
$0.00
$0.00

Eval Codes: NI

(000995) WARWICK ICE CRE
<Quote: Q012088>

$5.25
$262.50

$5.50
$3,025.00

$5.60
$14,560.00

$29.00
$580.00

$46,351.70
$0.00
$46,351.70



