Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET

Info:

Item Info:

* ASICS TN153/TN103 [2E
<1.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS TN156/TN106 [2E
<2.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS TNOBS/TNO18 [2E
<3.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS TNO55/TNO14 [2E
<4.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS TN151/TN101 [2E
<5.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS GEL CUMULUS [;
<6.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS GEL GT-2080 [2B
<7.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS GEL 1080 529 [2B
<8.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS TNOB5/TNO15 [2E
<9.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS TNO55/TN005 [2E
<10.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS GEL-110 TR-M [2E

<11.000>

PR 1.0

<Quote: Q011842>

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$58.50
$58.50

$67.50
$67.50

$48.95
$48.95

$56.75
$56.75

$46.75
$46.75

$56.75
$56.75

$50.75
$50.75

$38.50
$38.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC
<Quote: Q011843>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011844>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(000929) GROGAN

MARCIANO

<Quote: Q011845>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$58.88
$58.88

$46.20
$46.20

$48.24
$48.24

NB

NB

$54.25
$54.25

$58.88
$58.88

NB

NB

NB

$37.24
$37.24



Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET

Info:

Item Info:

* ADIDAS, CLIMACOOL [2
<12.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, CLIMACOOL [2
<13.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, SUPERNOVA [
<14.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, SUPERNOVA [
<15.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, RESPONSE C [
<16.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, RESPONSE C [
<17.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, NEPTUNE XC [;
<18.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, NEPTUNE XS [
<19.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, TEAM SLIDE [2I
<20.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, EXCELSIOR [2
<21.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, EXCELSIOR [2

<22.000>

PR 1.0

No Bid

<Quote: Q011842>

$62.50
$62.50

$52.75
$52.75

$52.75
$52.75

$52.75
$52.75

$47.25
$47.25

$47.25
$47.25

$35.25
$35.25

$38.75
$38.75

NB

$47.25
$47.25

$47.25
$47.25

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC
<Quote: Q011843>

$62.00
$62.00

$53.00
$53.00

$53.00
$53.00

$53.00
$53.00

$47.00
$47.00

$47.00
$47.00

$35.00
$35.00

$38.00
$38.00

$16.00
$16.00

$47.00
$47.00

$47.00
$47.00

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011844>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011845>

$67.88
$67.88

$56.94
$56.94

$56.94
$56.94

$56.94
$56.94

$51.88
$51.88

$51.88
$51.88

$36.24
$36.24

$40.94
$40.94

$15.18
$15.18

$51.88
$51.88

$51.88
$51.88



Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET

Info:

Item Info:

* ADIDAS, FALCON LEA [2
<23.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, FALCON LEA [2
<24.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, BLITHE LOW [2
<25.000>
PR 1.0
* ADIDAS, WOMEN~'S BL
<26.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, MEN~'S SOCCER
<27.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, MEN~'S SOCCER
<28.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, FOOTBALL, Al [2B
<29.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, FOOTBALL, SU [2E
<30.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, FOOTBALL, Al [2B
<31.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, FOOTBALL, Al [2B
<32.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, FOOTBALL, Al [2B

<33.000>

PR 1.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

<Quote: Q011842>

$38.50
$38.50

$38.50
$38.50

NB

NB

$56.25
$56.25

$71.25
$71.25

$69.50
$69.50

$53.50
$53.50

NB

$49.50
$49.50

$51.50
$51.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC
<Quote: Q011843>

$38.00
$38.00

$38.00
$38.00

NB

$40.00
$40.00

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI
<Quote: Q011844>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

$64.20
$64.20

$83.40
$83.40

$81.35
$81.35

$59.80
$59.80

NB

$55.70
$55.70

$58.20
$58.20

(000929) GROGAN

MARCIANO

<Quote: Q011845>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$40.94
$40.94

$40.94
$40.94

$43.94
$43.94

$43.94
$43.94

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

* NIKE, FOOTBALL, Al [2B
<34.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, FOOTBALL, MA [2I
<35.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, FOOTBALL, MA [2I
<36.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, FOOTBALL, G- [2B
<37.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, BASKETBALL, [2E
<38.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, BASKETBALL, [2E
<39.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, BASKETBALL, [2E
<40.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, BASKETBALL, [2E
<41.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, BASKETBALL, [2E
<42.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, BASKETBALL, [2E
<43.000>
PR 1.0
* MIZUNO WAVE EPIC 2 [

<44.000>

PR 1.0

(004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET
<Quote: Q011842>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

$84.25
$84.25

$63.75
$63.75

$27.50
$27.50

NB

$49.00
$49.00

$63.75
$63.75

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC
<Quote: Q011843>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI
<Quote: Q011844>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$49.15
$49.15

$26.25
$26.25

$26.25
$26.25

$33.75
$33.75

NB

NB

NB

NB

$50.40
$50.40

NB

NB

(000929) GROGAN

MARCIANO

<Quote: Q011845>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

$60.94
$60.94



Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET (017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC  (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011842> <Quote: Q011843> <Quote: Q011844> MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011845>
Item Info:
* MIZUNO SLIDE, #FS5 [2E No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.94
<45.000> $14.94
PR 1.0 NB NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, SH [2B No Bid $75.40 No Bid
<46.000> $75.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, IM [2BF $46.50 No Bid No Bid
<47.000> $46.50
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $65.70 No Bid
<48.000> $65.70
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF $61.50 No Bid No Bid
<49.000> $61.50
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF $52.75 No Bid No Bid
<50.000> $52.75
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF $82.75 No Bid No Bid
<51.000> $82.75
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $47.70 No Bid
<52.000> $47.70
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $75.40 No Bid
<53.000> $75.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $75.40 No Bid
<54.000> $75.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $75.40 No Bid
<55.000> $75.40
PR 1.0 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET (017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC  (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011842> <Quote: Q011843> <Quote: Q011844> MARCIANO
Item Info: <Quote: Q011845>
* NIKE, TRAINING, SH [2B No Bid $65.70 No Bid
<56.000> $65.70
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $55.85 No Bid
<57.000> $55.85
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $55.85 No Bid
<58.000> $55.85
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $55.85 No Bid
<59.000> $55.85
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $55.85 No Bid
<60.000> $55.85
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $55.85 No Bid
<61.000> $55.85
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF $52.75 No Bid No Bid
<62.000> $52.75
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF $52.75 No Bid No Bid
<63.000> $52.75
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $50.40 No Bid
<64.000> $50.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $50.40 No Bid
<65.000> $50.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $50.40 No Bid
<66.000> $50.40
PR 1.0 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET

Info:

Item Info:

* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<67.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<68.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<69.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<70.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<71.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, RACING, AIR [2BF
<72.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, RACING, AIR [2BF
<73.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, RACING, ZOOM [2
<74.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, RACING, AIR [2BF
<75.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, X-COUNTRY, K [2E
<76.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, X-COUNTRY, Z [2E
<77.000>

PR 1.0

<Quote: Q011842>

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC

<Quote: Q011843>

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI
<Quote: Q011844>

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011845>

No Bid $47.70 No Bid
$47.70
NB NB
No Bid $47.70 No Bid
$47.70
NB NB
No Bid $45.50 No Bid
$45.50
NB NB
No Bid $45.50 No Bid
$45.50
NB NB
No Bid $38.90 No Bid
$38.90
NB NB
No Bid $62.40 No Bid
$62.40
NB NB
No Bid $56.90 No Bid
$56.90
NB NB
No Bid $52.25 No Bid
$52.25
NB NB
No Bid $53.10 No Bid
$53.10
NB NB
No Bid $53.10 No Bid
$53.10
NB NB
No Bid $34.15 No Bid
$34.15
NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET  (017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC ~ (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011842> <Quote: Q011843> <Quote: Q011844> MARCIANO
Item Info: <Quote: Q011845>
* NIKE, X-COUNTRY, Z [2E $27.25 No Bid $28.65 No Bid
<78.000> $27.25 $28.65
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, X-COUNTRY, W [2 No Bid $34.15 No Bid
<79.000> $34.15
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, X-COUNTRY, W [2 No Bid $28.65 No Bid
<80.000> $28.65
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, DISTANCE, ZO [2E No Bid $59.40 No Bid
<81.000> $59.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, DISTANCE, ZO [2E No Bid $59.40 No Bid
<82.000> $59.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, DISTANCE, ZO [2E No Bid $59.40 No Bid
<83.000> $59.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, DISTANCE, ZO [2E No Bid $64.40 No Bid
<84.000> $64.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, DISTANCE, WO [2| No Bid $49.80 No Bid
<85.000> $49.80
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, DISTANCE, WO [2 No Bid $34.15 No Bid
<86.000> $34.15
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, DISTANCE, RI [2BI No Bid $34.40 No Bid
<87.000> $34.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, DISTANCE, RI [2BI No Bid $34.40 No Bid
<88.000> $34.40
PR 1.0 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET

Info:

Item Info:

* NIKE, SPRINTING, Z [2BI
<89.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, SPRINTING, Z [2BI
<90.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, SPRINTING, Z [2BI
<91.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, SPRINTING, Z [2BI
<92.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, SPRINTING, Z [2BI
<93.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, SPECIALTY, Z [2BI
<94.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, SPECIALTY, Z [2BI
<95.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, SPECIALTY, Z [2BI
<96.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, SPECIALTY, Z [2BI
<97.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, SPECIALTY, Z [2BI
<98.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, SPECIALTY, Z [2BI
<99.000>

PR 1.0

<Quote: Q011842>

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC

<Quote: Q011843>

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI
<Quote: Q011844>

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011845>

No Bid $64.40 No Bid
$64.40
NB NB
No Bid $64.40 No Bid
$64.40
NB NB
No Bid $59.85 No Bid
$59.85
NB NB
No Bid $51.60 No Bid
$51.60
NB NB
No Bid $34.40 No Bid
$34.40
NB NB
No Bid $64.60 No Bid
$64.60
NB NB
No Bid $59.85 No Bid
$59.85
NB NB
No Bid $59.85 No Bid
$59.85
NB NB
No Bid $59.85 No Bid
$59.85
NB NB
No Bid $47.70 No Bid
$47.70
NB NB
No Bid $59.85 No Bid
$59.85
NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET (017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC ~ (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011842> <Quote: Q011843> <Quote: Q011844> MARCIANO

Item Info: <Quote: Q011845>
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [ No Bid $75.40 No Bid
<100.

000> $75.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. $46.50 No Bid No Bid
<101.000> $46.50
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. No Bid $65.70 No Bid
<102.

000> $65.70
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. $61.50 No Bid No Bid
<103.000> $61.50
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. No Bid $59.85 No Bid
<104.

000> $59.85
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. $82.75 No Bid No Bid
<105.000> $82.75
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [ No Bid $47.70 No Bid
<106.

000> $47.70
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [ No Bid $75.40 No Bid
<107.

000> $75.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. No Bid $75.40 No Bid
<108.

000> $75.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. No Bid $65.70 No Bid
<109.

000> $65.70
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. No Bid $55.85 No Bid
<110.

000> $55.85
PR 1.0 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET (017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC  (001941) GEORGE PHILLI (000929) GROGAN
Info: <Quote: Q011842> <Quote: Q011843> <Quote: Q011844> MARCIANO

Item Info: <Quote: Q011845>
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. No Bid $55.85 No Bid
<111.

000> $55.85
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. No Bid $55.85 No Bid
<112.

000> $55.85
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. $52.72 No Bid No Bid
<113.000> $52.72
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. No Bid $50.40 No Bid
<114.

000> $50.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. No Bid $50.40 No Bid
<115.

000> $50.40
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. No Bid $47.70 No Bid
<116.

000> $47.70
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [ No Bid $45.50 No Bid
<117.

000> $45.50
PR 1.0 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03862
Quote (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET

Info: <Quote: Q011842>
Item Info:
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [ $34.75
<118.000> $34.75
PR 1.0 @
Totals: Net $ Total: $5,492.67
$ Discount: $0.00
$ Awarded: $3,739.45
Eval Codes: NI

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC

<Quote: Q011843>

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

$614.00
$0.00
$113.00

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI
<Quote: Q011844>

Eval Codes: NI

$38.90
$38.90

$4,584.00
$0.00
$568.45

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011845>

No Bid
NB
$1,087.91
$0.00
$142.12
Eval Codes: NI



Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

Info: <Quote: Q011846>

Item Info:

* ASICS TN153/TN103 [2E
<1.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS TN156/TN106 [2E
<2.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS TNOBS/TNO18 [2E
<3.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS TNO55/TNO14 [2E
<4.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS TN151/TN101 [2E
<5.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS GEL CUMULUS [;
<6.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS GEL GT-2080 [2B
<7.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS GEL 1080 529 [2B
<8.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS TNOB5/TNO15 [2E
<9.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS TNO55/TN005 [2E
<10.000>

PR 1.0
* ASICS GEL-110 TR-M [2E

<11.000>

PR 1.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

$50.25
$50.25

NB

NB

$41.25
$41.25

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011847>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C  (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR

Info: <Quote: Q011846> <Quote: Q011847>

Item Info:

* ADIDAS, CLIMACOOL [2 No Bid

<12.000>

PR 1.0 NB
* ADIDAS, CLIMACOOL [2 No Bid

<13.000>

PR 1.0 NB
* ADIDAS, SUPERNOVA [ No Bid No Bid

<14.000>

PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, SUPERNOVA [ No Bid No Bid

<15.000>

PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, RESPONSE C [. No Bid

<16.000>

PR 1.0 NB
* ADIDAS, RESPONSE C [. No Bid

<17.000>

PR 1.0 NB
* ADIDAS, NEPTUNE XC [ No Bid No Bid

<18.000>

PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, NEPTUNE XS [Z No Bid No Bid

<19.000>

PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, TEAM SLIDE [2I No Bid

<20.000>

PR 1.0 NB
* ADIDAS, EXCELSIOR [2 No Bid

<21.000>

PR 1.0 NB
* ADIDAS, EXCELSIOR [2 No Bid

<22.000>

PR 1.0 NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C  (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR

Info: <Quote: Q011846> <Quote: Q011847>
Item Info:
* ADIDAS, FALCON LEA [z No Bid
<23.000>
PR 1.0 NB
* ADIDAS, FALCON LEA [z No Bid
<24.000>
PR 1.0 NB
* ADIDAS, BLITHE LOW [2 No Bid No Bid
<25.000>
PR 1.0 NB NB
* ADIDAS, WOMEN~'S BL No Bid No Bid
<26.000>
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, MEN~'S SOCCER $50.75

<27.000>

PR 1.0

$50.75

* NIKE, MEN~'S SOCCER
<28.000>

PR 1.0

$63.45
$63.45

* NIKE, FOOTBALL, Al [2B
<29.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, FOOTBALL, SU [2E
<30.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, FOOTBALL, Al [2B
<31.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, FOOTBALL, Al [2B
<32.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, FOOTBALL, Al [2B
<33.000>

PR 1.0

$69.00
$69.00

$57.00
$57.00

$75.00
$75.00

$47.50
$47.50

$50.50
$50.50




Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C  (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR

Info: <Quote: Q011846> <Quote: Q011847>
Item Info:

*NIKE, FOOTBALL, Al [2B $42.00
<34.000> $42.00
PR 1.0

*NIKE, FOOTBALL, MA [2I $21.00
<35.000> $21.00
PR 1.0

*NIKE, FOOTBALL, MA [2I $22.50
<36.000> $22.50
PR 1.0

*NIKE, FOOTBALL, G- [2B $26.50
<37.000> $26.50
PR 1.0

* NIKE, BASKETBALL, [2B $81.00
<38.000> $81.00
PR 1.0

* NIKE, BASKETBALL, [2B $62.50
<39.000> $62.50
PR 1.0

* NIKE, BASKETBALL, [2B $26.00
<40.000> $26.00
PR 1.0

* NIKE, BASKETBALL, [2B $47.50
<41.000> $47.50
PR 1.0

*NIKE, BASKETBALL, [2B $50.50
<42.000> $50.50
PR 1.0

* NIKE, BASKETBALL, [2B $62.50
<43.000> $62.50
PR 1.0

* MIZUNO WAVE EPIC 2 [2 $61.20 $67.00
<44.000> $61.20 $67.00

PR 1.0




Bid Tab for Bid# B03862
Quote (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR

Info: <Quote: Q011846> <Quote: Q011847>
Item Info:
* MIZUNO SLIDE, #FS5 [2E $11.20 $15.00
<45.000> $11.20 $15.00
PR 1.0 *
* NIKE, TRAINING, SH [2B No Bid No Bid
<46.000>
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, IM [2BF No Bid No Bid
<47.000>
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid No Bid
<48.000>
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $62.50
<49.000> $62.50
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $53.00
<50.000> $53.00
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $81.00
<51.000> $81.00
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $47.50
<52.000> $47.50
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $75.00
<53.000> $75.00
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $75.00
<54.000> $75.00
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF No Bid $75.00
<55.000> $75.00

PR 1.0

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

Info: <Quote: Q011846>

Item Info:

* NIKE, TRAINING, SH [2B
<56.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<57.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<58.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<59.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<60.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<61.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<62.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<63.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<64.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<65.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF

<66.000>

PR 1.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011847>

$69.00
$69.00

$56.50
$56.50

$56.50
$56.50

$56.50
$56.50

$56.50
$56.50

$56.50
$56.50

$53.50
$53.50

$53.50
$53.50

$50.50
$50.50

$50.50
$50.50

$50.50
$50.50



Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

Info: <Quote: Q011846>

Item Info:

* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<67.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<68.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<69.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<70.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, TRAINING, Al [2BF
<71.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, RACING, AIR [2BF
<72.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, RACING, AIR [2BF
<73.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, RACING, ZOOM [2
<74.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, RACING, AIR [2BF
<75.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, X-COUNTRY, K [2E
<76.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, X-COUNTRY, Z [2E

<77.000>

PR 1.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011847>

$47.50
$47.50

$47.50
$47.50

$44.50
$44.50

$44.50
$44.50

$36.00
$36.00

$62.50
$62.50

$56.50
$56.50

NB

$53.50
$53.50

$54.50
$54.50

$33.00
$33.00



Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

Info: <Quote: Q011846>

Item Info:

* NIKE, X-COUNTRY, Z [2E
<78.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, X-COUNTRY, W [2
<79.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, X-COUNTRY, W [2
<80.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, DISTANCE, ZO [2E
<81.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, DISTANCE, ZO [2E
<82.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, DISTANCE, ZO [2E
<83.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, DISTANCE, ZO [2E
<84.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, DISTANCE, WO [2I
<85.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, DISTANCE, WO [2I
<86.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, DISTANCE, RI [2BI
<87.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, DISTANCE, RI [2BI

<88.000>

PR 1.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011847>

$27.00
$27.00

$33.00
$33.00

$27.00
$27.00

$62.50
$62.50

$62.50
$62.50

$62.50
$62.50

$69.00
$69.00

$47.50
$47.50

$33.00
$33.00

$33.00
$33.00

$33.00
$33.00



Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Item Info:

* NIKE, SPRINTING, Z [2BI

<89.000>

PR

* NIKE, SPRINTING, Z [2BI

<90.000>

PR

* NIKE, SPRINTING, Z [2BI

<91.000>

PR

Info:

1.0

1.0

1.0

* NIKE, SPRINTING, Z [2BI

<92.000>

PR

1.0

* NIKE, SPRINTING, Z [2BI

<93.000>

PR

1.0

* NIKE, SPECIALTY, Z [2BI

<94.000>

PR

1.0

* NIKE, SPECIALTY, Z [2BI

<95.000>

PR

1.0

* NIKE, SPECIALTY, Z [2BI

<96.000>

PR

1.0

* NIKE, SPECIALTY, Z [2BI

<97.000>

PR

1.0

* NIKE, SPECIALTY, Z [2BI

<98.000>

PR

1.0

* NIKE, SPECIALTY, Z [2BI

<99.000>

PR

1.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Quote (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011846>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011847>

$69.00
$69.00

$69.00
$69.00

$62.50
$62.50

$54.50
$54.50

$33.00
$33.00

$69.00
$69.00

$62.50
$62.50

$62.50
$62.50

$62.50
$62.50

$47.50
$47.50

$62.50
$62.50



Bid Tab for Bid# B03862

Quote (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

Info:

Item Info:

* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [.
<100.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [.
<101.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [.
<102.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [.
<103.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [.
<104.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [.
<105.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [.
<106.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [.
<107.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [.
<108.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [.
<109.000>
PR 1.0
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [.

<110.000>

PR 1.0

<Quote: Q011846>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011847>

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$53.50
$53.50

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$47.50
$47.50

$75.00
$75.00

$75.00
$75.00

$69.00
$69.00

No Bid

NB



Bid Tab for Bid#

Item Info:

* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [.

<111.000>

PR

* NIKE, WOMEN~

<112.000>

PR

* NIKE, WOMEN~

<113.000>

PR

* NIKE, WOMEN~

<114.000>

PR

* NIKE, WOMEN~

<115.000>

PR

* NIKE, WOMEN~

<116.000>

PR

* NIKE, WOMEN~

<117.000>

PR

B03862

Quote (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

Info: <Quote: Q011846>

1.0

'S TRAI [

1.0

'S TRAI [

1.0

'S TRAI [

1.0

'S TRAI [

1.0

'S TRAI [

1.0

'S TRAI [

1.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011847>

$56.50
$56.50

$56.50
$56.50

$53.50
$53.50

$50.50
$50.50

$50.50
$50.50

$47.50
$47.50

$44.50
$44.50



Bid Tab for Bid# B03862
Quote (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR

Info: <Quote: Q011846> <Quote: Q011847>
Item Info:
* NIKE, WOMEN~'S TRAI [. No Bid $36.00
<118.000> $36.00
PR 1.0 NB
Totals: Net $ Total: $1,282.85 $4,349.00
$ Discount: $0.00 $0.00
$ Awarded: $1,015.95 $134.00
Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items



