Bid Tab for Bid# B03853

Quote (010217) AGAR SUPPLY CO

(000147) H SHCRIER CO

(000957) US FOODSERVICE

Info: <Quote: Q011807> <Quote: Q011808> <Quote: Q011809>
Item Info:
ITEM CODE CDC #5007 [ $17.79 No Bid No Bid
<1.000> $2,668.50
cs 150.0 . NB NB
FRENCH DRESSING, DIE $12.08 $13.97
<2.000> $2,114.00 $2,444.75
cs 175.0
ITALIAN DRESSING, DI [2I $12.08 $12.97
<3.000> $1,812.00 $1,945.50
cs 150.0
MAYONNAISE PACKED Pl $15.83 $15.74
<4.000> $39,575.00 $39,350.00
cs 2500.0
PLAIN ITALIAN DRESSI [2 No Bid $31.99
<5.000> $479.85
cs 15.0 NB
ITALIAN DRESSING OXF | $22.09 $19.66
<6.000> $2,319.45 $2,064.30
cs 105.0
FRENCH DRESSING OXF: $21.21 $19.61
<7.000> $530.25 $490.25
cs 25.0
THOUSAND ISLAND DRE: $18.50 $21.98
<8.000> $462.50 $549.50
cs. 25.0
FRENCH DRESSING. CDC $7.95 $10.45
<9.000> $993.75 $1,306.25
cs 125.0
ITALIAN DRESSING. CD [2 $7.65 No Bid
<10.000~> $1,530.00
cs 200.0 NB
THOUSAND ISLAND DRE: $7.90 $11.97
<11.000> $1,975.00 $2,992.50
cs 250.0




Bid Tab for Bid# B03853

Quote (010217) AGAR SUPPLY CO

Info:
Item Info:

SALAD OIL, CONFORMIN
<12.000>
cs. 550.0

COLFAX SHORTENING, G
<13.000>

CS 550.0
Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

<Quote: Q011807>

$26.95
$14,822.50

$26.95
$14,822.50

$79,600.55
$0.00
$19,222.35

(000147) H SHCRIER CO
<Quote: Q011808>

$18.95
$10,422.50

No Bid

NB

$60,374.40
$0.00
$12,599.65
Eval Codes: NI

(000957) US FOODSERVICE
<Quote: Q011809>

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

$31.97
$17,583.50

NB

$68,081.40
$0.00
$38,225.00



