Bid Tab for Bid# B03852
Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET  (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET  (011579) CANNON SPORTS  (017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS

Info: <Quote: Q011814> <Quote: Q011815> <Quote: Q011816> <Quote: Q011817> <Quote: Q011818>

Item Info:

* ADIDAS, STYLE #72 [2B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.05
<1.000> $14.05
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB *
* ADIDAS, STYLE #72 [2B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.13
<2.000> $17.13
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB *
* ADIDAS STYLE: 3352 [2E No Bid $55.00 No Bid $55.00 362.50
<3.000> $55.00 $55.00 $62.50
EA 1.0 NB NB

* ADIDAS STYLE: 3352 [2E No Bid $30.50 No Bid $35.00 $34.40
<4.000> $30.50 $35.00 $34.40
EA 1.0 NB NB

* ADIDAS STYLE: 335 [2B No Bid $36.50 No Bid $40.00 $40.66
<5.000> $36.50 $40.00 $40.66
EA 1.0 NB NB

* ADIDAS STYLE: 251 [2B No Bid $5.95 No Bid $6.25 $6.25
<6.000> $5.95 $6.25 $6.25
EA 1.0 NB NB

* ADIDAS, ODESSEY T [2 No Bid $55.00 No Bid $55.00 362.50
<7.000> $55.00 $55.00 $62.50
EA 1.0 NB NB

* ADIDAS, SANTIAGO [2E No Bid $19.25 No Bid $55.00 $21.80
<8.000> $19.25 $55.00 $21.80
EA 1.0 NB NB

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET

Info:

Item Info:

* ADIDAS, SANTIAGO [2F
<9.000>

EA 1.0
* ADIDAS, STRIKER B [2E
<10.000>

EA 1.0
* ADIDAS, SANTIAGO [2F
<11.000>

EA 1.0
* ADIDAS, TEAM DELU [2
<12.000>

EA 1.0
* ASICS ZR853 DUFFL [2E
<13.000>

EA 1.0
* BASEBALL, SCHUTT [2
<14.000>

EA 1.0
* BASEBALL, SCHUTT [2
<15.000>

EA 1.0
* BASEBALL, JACK CO [2

<16.000>

SET 1.0

<Quote: Q011814>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET
<Quote: Q011815>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$19.25
$19.25

NB

$5.95
$5.95

NB

$22.50
$22.50

NB

NB

NB

(011579) CANNON SPORTS
<Quote: Q011816>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

$16.25
$16.25

$3.09
$3.09

$87.98
$87.98

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS
<Quote: Q011817>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$22.00
$22.00

$32.00
$32.00

$6.25
$6.25

$38.00
$38.00

NB

NB

NB

NB

<Quote: Q011818>

No Bid

$21.80
$21.80

$31.60
$31.60

$6.25
$6.25

$37.50
$37.50

NB

$16.90
$16.90

$4.00
$4.00

$189.95
$189.95

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET  (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET

Info: <Quote: Q011814> <Quote: Q011815>

Item Info:

* BASEBALL, HOLYWOO No Bid No Bid

<17.000>

EA 1.0 NB NB
* BASEBALL, 4-WAY O [2I No Bid No Bid

<18.000>

EA 1.0 NB NB
* BASEBALL, NCAA AP 2 No Bid No Bid

<19.000>

Dz 1.0 NB NB
* BASEBALLS, RAWLIN [z No Bid No Bid

<20.000>

Dz 1.0 NB NB
* BASEBALLS, SPAULD [Z No Bid No Bid

<21.000>

Dz 1.0 NB NB
* BASEBALLS, D-1 PR [2E No Bid No Bid

<22.000>

Dz 1.0 NB NB
* BASEBALLS, D-2 PR [2E No Bid No Bid

<23.000>

Dz 1.0 NB NB
* BASEBALLS, DIAMON [Z No Bid No Bid

<24.000>

Dz 1.0 NB NB

(011579) CANNON SPORTS
<Quote: Q011816>

$9.75
$9.75

$8.70
$8.70

$49.53
$49.53

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$45.77
$45.77

No Bid

NB

$26.65
$26.65

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS
<Quote: Q011818>

<Quote: Q011817>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

$93.00
$93.00

$38.00
$38.00

$48.50
$48.50

$48.00
$48.00

NB

$44.95
$44.95

$34.25
$34.25

$29.25
$29.25

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET  (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET

Info: <Quote: Q011814> <Quote: Q011815>

Item Info:

* BASKETBALL, WILSO [2 No Bid No Bid

<25.000>

EA 1.0 NB NB
* BASKETBALL WILSON [ No Bid No Bid

<26.000>

EA 1.0 NB NB
* BASKETBALL, WILSO [2 No Bid No Bid

<27.000>

EA 1.0 NB NB
* BASKETBALL, WILSO [2 No Bid No Bid

<28.000>

EA 1.0 NB NB
* BASKETBALL, COLLE [z No Bid No Bid

<29.000>

EA 1.0 NB NB
* BASKETBALL, WILSO [2 No Bid No Bid

<30.000>

EA 1.0 NB NB
* BASKETBALL, COLLE [z No Bid No Bid

<31.000>

EA 1.0 NB NB
* BASKETBALL, PROFE [: No Bid No Bid

<32.000>

EA 1.0 NB NB

(011579) CANNON SPORTS
<Quote: Q011816>

$35.57
$35.57

$27.66
$27.66

$42.99
$42.99

$27.66
$27.66

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$41.75
$41.75

No Bid

NB

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS
<Quote: Q011818>

<Quote: Q011817>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

$39.50
$39.50

$31.50
$31.50

$39.50
$39.50

$31.50
$31.50

NB

$14.75
$14.75

$33.00
$33.00

$31.00
$31.00

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852
Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET  (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET  (011579) CANNON SPORTS  (017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS

Info: <Quote: Q011814> <Quote: Q011815> <Quote: Q011816> <Quote: Q011817> <Quote: Q011818>
Item Info:
* BASKETBALL, RAWLI [2 No Bid No Bid $41.67 No Bid $33.00
<33.000> $41.67 $33.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB *
* BATTING HELMETS & [2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.00
<34.000> $21.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* BATTING HELMET - [2E No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00
<35.000> $12.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* BATTING HELMET - [2B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.00
<36.000> $23.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* BATTING HELMET - [2B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00
<37.000> $25.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* BATTING HELMET - [2B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.50
<38.000> $15.50
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* BIKE, DELUXE FOOTB [2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<39.000>
PR 1.0 NB NB NB NB NB
* BIKE, FOOTBALL HAN [2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<40.000>

PR 1.0 NB NB NB NB NB

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET  (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET

Info: <Quote: Q011814> <Quote: Q011815>

Item Info:

* FOOTBALL, (SET OF [2E No Bid No Bid

<41.000>

SET 1.0 NB NB
* FOOTBALL, (SET OF [2E No Bid No Bid

<42.000>

SET 1.0 NB NB
* FOOTBALL, THIGH P [2t No Bid No Bid

<43.000>

SET 1.0 NB NB
* FOOTBALL, THIGH P [2t No Bid No Bid

<44.000>

SET 1.0 NB NB
* FOOTBALL KNEE PAD [. No Bid No Bid

<45.000>

PR 1.0 NB NB
* FOOTBALL KNEE PAD [. No Bid No Bid

<46.000>

PR 1.0 NB NB
*FOOTBALL, RUSSELL [Z No Bid No Bid

<47.000>

SET 1.0 NB NB
*FOOTBALL, RUSSELL [Z No Bid No Bid

<48.000>

SET 1.0 NB NB

(011579) CANNON SPORTS
<Quote: Q011816>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$4.54
$4.54

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS

<Quote: Q011817>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

<Quote: Q011818>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET  (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET

Info: <Quote: Q011814> <Quote: Q011815>
Item Info:
* FOOTBALL LONG LEG [ No Bid No Bid
<49.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB
* FOOTBALL SPAULDIN [; No Bid No Bid
<50.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB
* FOOTBALL, PADS PL [2 No Bid No Bid
<51.000>
SET 1.0 NB NB
* FOOTBALL WILSON N [ No Bid No Bid
<52.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB
* FOOTBALL WILSON N [ No Bid No Bid
<53.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB
* FOOTBALL WILSON G [: No Bid No Bid
<54.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB
* FOOTBALL, WILSON [2 No Bid No Bid
<55.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB
* LACROSSE GOALS, J [z $650.00 No Bid
<60.000> $650.00
PR 1.0 NB

(011579) CANNON SPORTS
<Quote: Q011816>

No Bid

NB

$49.50
$49.50

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$35.56
$35.56

$55.99
$55.99

$55.99
$55.99

$430.24
$430.24

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS

<Quote: Q011817>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

<Quote: Q011818>

No Bid

NB

$42.00
$42.00

No Bid

NB

$48.50
$48.50

$28.00
$28.00

$45.00
$45.00

$40.00
$40.00

No Bid

NB

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET

Info: <Quote: Q011814>

Item Info:

* LACROSSE GOAL NET |
<61.000>
EA 1.0
* LACROSSE NETS, 4M [
<62.000>
PR 1.0
* LACROSSE, HELMET, [
<63.000>
EA 1.0
* LACROSSE, HELMET, [
<64.000>
EA 1.0
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S
<65.000>
PR 1.0
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S
<66.000>
PR 1.0
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S
<67.000>
DZ 1.0
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S

<68.000>

Dz 1.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$155.00
$155.00

$155.00
$155.00

NB

NB

NB

NB

$16.00
$16.00

$27.00
$27.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET
<Quote: Q011815>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(011579) CANNON SPORTS
<Quote: Q011816>

$78.07
$78.07

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

$19.22
$19.22

$19.66
$19.66

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS

<Quote: Q011817> <Quote: Q011818>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$20.25
$20.25

No Bid
NB
$22.20
$22.20

No Bid
NB

<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET

Info: <Quote: Q011814>

Item Info:

* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S
<69.000>
DZ 1.0
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S
<70.000>
DZ 1.0
* LACROSSE, BRINE CO [
<71.000>
EA 1.0
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S
<72.000>
EA 1.0
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S
<73.000>
EA 1.0
* LACROSSE, MEN~'S, [2
<74.000>
EA 1.0
* MIZUNO, VS-1 KNEE [2F
<75.000>
PR 1.0
* MIZUNO, CARRY ALL [2

<76.000>

EA 1.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$16.00
$16.00

$16.00
$16.00

NB

NB

NB

$325.00
$325.00

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET
<Quote: Q011815>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(011579) CANNON SPORTS
<Quote: Q011816>

$19.22
$19.22

$19.22
$19.22

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS

<Quote: Q011817> <Quote: Q011818>

$1.95
$1.95

$1.42
$1.42

$36.88
$36.88

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$15.66
$15.66

$37.50
$37.50

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET  (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET  (011579) CANNON SPORTS  (017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS

Info: <Quote: Q011814> <Quote: Q011815> <Quote: Q011816> <Quote: Q011817> <Quote: Q011818>
Item Info:
* MIZUNO, KNEE PADS [2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.50
<77.000> $24.50
PR 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* MIZUNO, KNEE PADS [2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.50
<78.000> $11.50
PR 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* NIKE, CHIN SHIELD, [2BI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<79.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB NB
* NIKE, B1.2 MEDIUM [2BI No Bid $16.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<80.000> $16.50
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
*NIKE, B1.1 LARGE D [2B No Bid $22.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<81.000> $22.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* NIKE, TEAM BALL BA [2F No Bid $17.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<82.000> $17.50
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* NIKE, TEAM NOTE BO [2 No Bid $14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<83.000> $14.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* NIKE, VAPOR GRIP3, [2E No Bid $50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<84.000> $50.00

EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI
<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$4.45
$4.45
$19.40
$19.40
$25.20
$25.20

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852
Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET  (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET  (011579) CANNON SPORTS  (017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS

Info: <Quote: Q011814> <Quote: Q011815> <Quote: Q011816> <Quote: Q011817> <Quote: Q011818>
Item Info:
* NIKE, MEDIUM DUFFL [2 No Bid $16.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<85.000> $16.50
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* NIKE, BALL BAGS, B [2B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<86.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB NB
* NIKE, TIEMPO DUFF [2E No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<87.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB NB
* NIKE, BRASILIA TE [2BA No Bid $22.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<88.000> $22.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* NIKE, BRASILIA TE [2BA No Bid $16.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<89.000> $16.50
EA 1.0 NB * NB NB NB
* NIKE, MAGNAGRIP 1 [2t No Bid $21.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<90.000> $21.00
PR 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* NIKE, Z-TACK GLOV [2E No Bid $24.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<91.000> $24.50
PR 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* NIKE, G-TACK GLOV [2E No Bid $26.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<92.000> $26.50

PR 1.0 NB NB NB NB

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI
<Quote: Q011819>

$19.40
$19.40

$20.20
$20.20

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$27.30
$27.30

$31.20
$31.20

$35.10
$35.10



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET  (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET

Info: <Quote: Q011814> <Quote: Q011815>
Item Info:
* NIKE, OFF SPEED S [2B No Bid No Bid
<93.000>
PR 1.0 NB NB
* NIKE, TEAM BALL B [2B No Bid No Bid
<94.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB
* SIGNAL HORN, FALC [2 $28.00 No Bid
<95.000> $28.00
EA 1.0 * NB
* SOCCER BALL #1259 [2 No Bid No Bid
<96.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB
* SOCCER BALL BRINE [Z No Bid No Bid
<97.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB
* SOCCER BALL BRINE [Z No Bid No Bid
<98.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB
* SOCCER SHIN PADS, [z No Bid No Bid
<99.000>
PR 1.0 NB NB
* SOCK GUARD (PAIR) [2 No Bid No Bid
<100.000>
PR 1.0 NB NB

(011579) CANNON SPORTS
<Quote: Q011816>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$36.18
$36.18
$14.75
$14.75

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS
<Quote: Q011818>

<Quote: Q011817>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

$34.00
$34.00

$18.00
$18.00

$16.00
$16.00

$8.00
$8.00

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI
<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$23.40
$23.40

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET  (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET

Info: <Quote: Q011814> <Quote: Q011815>
Item Info:
* SOFTBALL, DIAMOND [Z No Bid No Bid
<101.000>
Dz 1.0 NB NB
* SOFTBALL, ASA APP [2I No Bid No Bid
<102.000>
Dz 1.0 NB NB
* SOFTBALL, WILSON [2I No Bid No Bid
<103.000>
Dz 1.0 NB NB
SPIKES, ALUMAGOAL RE $8.00 No Bid
<104.000> $8.00
PKG 1.0 o NB
SPIKES, ALUMAGOAL RE $7.00 No Bid
<105.000> $7.00
PKG 1.0 NB
SPIKES, REPLACEMENT $7.00 No Bid
<106.000> $7.00
PKG 1.0 NB
* SUPPORTERS BIKE, [2 No Bid No Bid
<107.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB
* SWEEDE SWIM GOGGL No Bid No Bid

<108.000>

PR 1.0 NB NB

(011579) CANNON SPORTS
<Quote: Q011816>

No Bid

NB

$49.98
$49.98

$61.61
$61.61

No Bid

NB

$4.65
$4.65

$5.28
$5.28

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS
<Quote: Q011818>

<Quote: Q011817>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$37.00
$37.00

$52.00
$52.00

$57.00
$57.00

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852
Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET  (004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET  (011579) CANNON SPORTS  (017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS

Info: <Quote: Q011814> <Quote: Q011815> <Quote: Q011816> <Quote: Q011817> <Quote: Q011818>
Item Info:
* SWIM CAPS: WHITE [2F No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<109.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB NB
* SWIM CAPS: NAVY L [2t No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<110.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB NB
* STROKEMAKER SWIMN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<111.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB NB
* STROKEMAKER SWIMN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<112.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB NB
* STROKEMAKER SWIMN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<113.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB NB
LAP COUNTER 14" X 14 [2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<114.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB NB
* TENNIS BALL, CHAM [2I No Bid No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid
<115.000> $11.90
Dz 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* TENNIS BALL, CHAM [2I No Bid No Bid $11.29 No Bid $11.50
<116.000> $11.29 $11.50
Dz 1.0 NB NB NB

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET

Info: <Quote: Q011814>

Item Info:

* TENNIS NETS, WITH [2E
<117.000>
EA 1.0
* TENNIS WILSON #T1 [2I
<118.000>
Dz 1.0
* TENNIS WILSON #T1 [2I
<119.000>
Dz 1.0
* TENNIS WILSON #Z9 [2I
<120.000>
EA 1.0
* TENNIS WILSON #Z4 [2I
<121.000>
EA 1.0
* TENNIS WILSON #Z4 [2I
<122.000>
EA 1.0
* VOLLEYBALL, KNEE [2I
<123.000>
PR 1.0
* VOLLEYBALL, OFFIC [2I

<124.000>

EA 1.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET
<Quote: Q011815>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(011579) CANNON SPORTS
<Quote: Q011816>

$65.41
$65.41

$8.13
$8.13

$11.29
$11.29

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$32.18
$32.18

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC (001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS
<Quote: Q011818>

<Quote: Q011817>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$92.00
$92.00

$9.25
$9.25

$11.50
$11.50

NB

NB

NB

NB

$39.00
$39.00

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI

<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (015734) ALUMINUM ATHLET

Info:

Item Info:

* VOLLEYBALL, SPAUL [2
<125.000>

EA 1.0

* VOLLEYBALL, TECHN [2
<126.000>

EA 1.0

* VOLLEYBALL, SPAUL [2
<127.000>

EA 1.0

* WILSON TEAM GEAR [:
<128.000>

EA 1.0
Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

<Quote: Q011814>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$1,410.00
$0.00
$22.00

Eval Codes: NI

(004084) CAMIRE'S ATHLET
<Quote: Q011815>

(011579) CANNON SPORTS
<Quote: Q011816>

No Bid $34.93
$34.93
NB *
No Bid $42.38
$42.38
NB *
No Bid $34.93
$34.93
NB *

No Bid No Bid
NB NB
$496.90 $1,677.12
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

(017036) CHAMPIONS CHOIC

<Quote: Q011817>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

NB

NB

NB

$344.50
$0.00
$0.00

(001936) ELMWOOD SPORTS

<Quote: Q011818>

No Bid

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

$42.00
$42.00

NB

NB

$19.00
$19.00

$2,075.10
$0.00
$433.08

(001941) GEORGE PHILLI
<Quote: Q011819>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

NB

NB

NB

$205.65
$0.00
$0.00



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

* ADIDAS, STYLE #72 [2B
<1.000>
EA 1.0
* ADIDAS, STYLE #72 [2B
<2.000>
EA 1.0
* ADIDAS STYLE: 3352 [2E
<3.000>
EA 1.0
* ADIDAS STYLE: 3352 [2E
<4.000>
EA 1.0
* ADIDAS STYLE: 335 [2B
<5.000>
EA 1.0
* ADIDAS STYLE: 251 [2B
<6.000>
EA 1.0
* ADIDAS, ODESSEY T [2
<7.000>
EA 1.0
* ADIDAS, SANTIAGO [2E

<8.000>

EA 1.0

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011820>

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$59.90
$59.90

$36.88
$36.88

$36.88
$36.88

$7.48
$7.48

$59.90
$59.90

$26.88
$26.88

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011822>

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$39.95
$39.95

$24.10
$24.10

$28.95
$28.95

$4.75
$4.75

$39.95
$39.95

$15.95
$15.95

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR

<Quote: Q011823>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(000471) RECREATION EQUI

<Quote: Q011824>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (000929) GROGAN (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C  (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (000471) RECREATION EQUI
Info: MARCIANO <Quote: Q011822> <Quote: Q011823> <Quote: Q011824>
<Quote: Q011820>
Item Info:
* ADIDAS, SANTIAGO [2F $26.88 $15.95 No Bid No Bid
<9.000> $26.88 $15.95
EA 1.0 3 NB NB
* ADIDAS, STRIKER B [2E $34.42 $22.25 No Bid No Bid
<10.000> $34.42 $22.25
EA 1.0 3 NB NB
* ADIDAS, SANTIAGO [2E $34.42 $4.75 No Bid No Bid
<11.000> $34.42 $4.75
EA 1.0 3 NB NB
* ADIDAS, TEAM DELU [2 $35.98 $26.75 No Bid No Bid
<12.000> $35.98 $26.75
EA 1.0 3 NB NB
* ASICS ZR853 DUFFL [2F $19.98 $19.25 No Bid No Bid
<13.000> $19.98 $19.25
EA 1.0 3 NB NB
* BASEBALL, SCHUTT [2 $17.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<14.000> $17.24
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* BASEBALL, SCHUTT [2 $3.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<15.000> $3.68
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* BASEBALL, JACK CO [2 $179.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<16.000> $179.88

SET 1.0 NB NB NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (000929) GROGAN (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (000471) RECREATION EQUI
Info: MARCIANO <Quote: Q011822> <Quote: Q011823> <Quote: Q011824>
<Quote: Q011820>
Item Info:
* BASEBALL, HOLYWOO No Bid No Bid No Bid
<17.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* BASEBALL, 4-WAY O [2I No Bid No Bid No Bid
<18.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* BASEBALL, NCAA AP [2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<19.000>
Dz 1.0 NB NB NB
* BASEBALLS, RAWLIN [z No Bid No Bid No Bid
<20.000>
Dz 1.0 NB NB NB
* BASEBALLS, SPAULD [Z No Bid No Bid No Bid
<21.000>
Dz 1.0 NB NB NB
* BASEBALLS, D-1 PR [2E No Bid No Bid No Bid
<22.000>
Dz 1.0 NB NB NB
* BASEBALLS, D-2 PR [2E No Bid No Bid No Bid
<23.000>
Dz 1.0 NB NB NB
* BASEBALLS, DIAMON [z $32.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<24.000> $32.89
Dz 1.0 NB NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

* BASKETBALL, WILSO [2
<25.000>

EA 1.0

* BASKETBALL WILSON [
<26.000>

EA 1.0

* BASKETBALL, WILSO [2
<27.000>

EA 1.0

* BASKETBALL, WILSO [2
<28.000>

EA 1.0

* BASKETBALL, COLLE [z
<29.000>

EA 1.0

* BASKETBALL, WILSO [2
<30.000>

EA 1.0

* BASKETBALL, COLLE [z
<31.000>

EA 1.0

* BASKETBALL, PROFE [:
<32.000>

EA 1.0

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011820>

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011822>

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011823>

(000471) RECREATION EQUI

<Quote: Q011824>

No Bid $38.00 No Bid
$38.00
NB NB
No Bid $32.00 No Bid
$32.00
NB NB
No Bid $38.00 No Bid
$38.00
NB NB
No Bid $32.00 No Bid
$32.00
NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NB NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

* BASKETBALL, RAWLI [2
<33.000>
EA 1.0
* BATTING HELMETS & [2
<34.000>
EA 1.0
* BATTING HELMET - [2B
<35.000>
EA 1.0
* BATTING HELMET - [2B
<36.000>
EA 1.0
* BATTING HELMET - [2B
<37.000>
EA 1.0
* BATTING HELMET - [2B
<38.000>
EA 1.0
* BIKE, DELUXE FOOTB [z
<39.000>
PR 1.0
* BIKE, FOOTBALL HAN [2

<40.000>

PR 1.0

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011820>

$39.89
$39.89

$18.24
$18.24

$9.16
$9.16

$20.24
$20.24

$24.89
$24.89

$14.18
$14.18

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011822>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR

<Quote: Q011823>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(000471) RECREATION EQUI

<Quote: Q011824>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

* FOOTBALL, (SET OF [2F
<41.000>
SET 1.0
* FOOTBALL, (SET OF [2F
<42.000>
SET 1.0
* FOOTBALL, THIGH P [2t
<43.000>
SET 1.0
* FOOTBALL, THIGH P [2t
<44.000>
SET 1.0
* FOOTBALL KNEE PAD [
<45.000>
PR 1.0
* FOOTBALL KNEE PAD [
<46.000>
PR 1.0
* FOOTBALL, RUSSELL [:
<47.000>
SET 1.0
* FOOTBALL, RUSSELL [:

<48.000>

SET 1.0

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011820>

$9.38
$9.38

$8.72
$8.72

$9.25
$9.25

$9.89
$9.89

$3.34
$3.34

$2.98
$2.98

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011822>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR

<Quote: Q011823>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(000471) RECREATION EQUI

<Quote: Q011824>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (000929) GROGAN (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
Info: MARCIANO <Quote: Q011822>
<Quote: Q011820>
Item Info:
* FOOTBALL LONG LEG [ $14.50 No Bid
<49.000> $14.50
EA 1.0 R NB
* FOOTBALL SPAULDIN [ $44.25 No Bid
<50.000> $44.25
EA 1.0 NB
* FOOTBALL, PADS PL [2 No Bid No Bid
<51.000>
SET 1.0 NB NB
* FOOTBALL WILSON N [: $45.89 No Bid
<52.000> $45.89
EA 1.0 * NB
* FOOTBALL WILSON N [: $29.89 No Bid
<53.000> $29.89
EA 1.0 NB
* FOOTBALL WILSON G [0 $45.89 No Bid
<54.000> $45.89
EA 1.0 NB
* FOOTBALL, WILSON [2 $39.89 No Bid
<55.000> $39.89
EA 1.0 NB
* LACROSSE GOALS, J [z $569.72 No Bid
<60.000> $569.72
PR 1.0 NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011823>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$32.00
$32.00

No Bid
NB
$32.00
$32.00

No Bid

NB

(000471) RECREATION EQUI
<Quote: Q011824>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

$695.00
$695.00



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (000929) GROGAN (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C  (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (000471) RECREATION EQUI
Info: MARCIANO <Quote: Q011822> <Quote: Q011823> <Quote: Q011824>

Item Info: <Quote: Q011820>
* LACROSSE GOAL NET | No Bid No Bid No Bid
<61.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* LACROSSE NETS, 4M [2 No Bid No Bid $159.00
<62.000> $159.00
PR 1.0 NB NB
* LACROSSE, HELMET, [Z No Bid No Bid No Bid
<63.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* LACROSSE, HELMET, [Z No Bid No Bid No Bid
<64.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S $23.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<65.000> $23.98
PR 1.0 NB NB NB
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S No Bid No Bid No Bid
<66.000>
PR 1.0 NB NB NB
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S No Bid No Bid No Bid
<67.000>
DZ 1.0 NB NB NB
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S No Bid No Bid No Bid
<68.000>
Dz 1.0 NB NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S
<69.000>
DZ 1.0
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S
<70.000>
DZ 1.0
* LACROSSE, BRINE CO [
<71.000>
EA 1.0
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S
<72.000>
EA 1.0
* LACROSSE, WOMEN~'S
<73.000>
EA 1.0
* LACROSSE, MEN~'S, [2
<74.000>
EA 1.0
* MIZUNO, VS-1 KNEE [2E
<75.000>
PR 1.0
* MIZUNO, CARRY ALL [2

<76.000>

EA 1.0

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011820>

$18.94
$18.94

$18.94
$18.94

$29.98
$29.98

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$289.98
$289.98

$12.24
$12.24

$39.98
$39.98

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011822>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

$12.10
$12.10

$28.25
$28.25

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011823>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

$14.00
$14.00

$33.50
$33.50

(000471) RECREATION EQUI

<Quote: Q011824>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011820>

* MIZUNO, KNEE PADS [2
<77.000>

$18.24
$18.24

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C  (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011822>

PR 1.0

* MIZUNO, KNEE PADS [2 $9.24
<78.000> $9.24
PR 1.0

* NIKE, CHIN SHIELD, [2BI No Bid

<79.000>

EA 1.0

* NIKE, B1.2 MEDIUM [2BI No Bid

<80.000>

EA 1.0

* NIKE, B1.1 LARGE D [2B No Bid

<81.000>

EA 1.0

* NIKE, TEAM BALL BA [2E No Bid

<82.000>

EA 1.0

* NIKE, TEAM NOTE BO [2 No Bid

<83.000>

EA 1.0

* NIKE, VAPOR GRIP3, [2E No Bid $50.25

<84.000>

EA 1.0

NB

$50.25

<Quote: Q011823>

(000471) RECREATION EQUI
<Quote: Q011824>

$22.00 No Bid
$22.00
NB
$11.00 No Bid
$11.00
NB
$3.75 No Bid
$3.75
NB
$18.25 No Bid
$18.25
NB
$23.75 No Bid
$23.75
NB
$18.25 No Bid
$18.25
NB
$15.50 No Bid
$15.50
NB
No Bid

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (000929) GROGAN
Info: MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011820>

Item Info:

* NIKE, MEDIUM DUFFL [2 No Bid
<85.000>

EA 1.0

* NIKE, BALL BAGS, B [2B No Bid
<86.000>

EA 1.0

* NIKE, TIEMPO DUFF [2E No Bid
<87.000>

EA 1.0

* NIKE, BRASILIA TE [2BA No Bid
<88.000>

EA 1.0

* NIKE, BRASILIA TE [2BA No Bid
<89.000>

EA 1.0

* NIKE, MAGNAGRIP 1 [2t No Bid
<90.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, Z-TACK GLOV [2B No Bid
<91.000>

PR 1.0

* NIKE, G-TACK GLOV [2E No Bid
<92.000>

PR 1.0

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011822>

No Bid

$15.15
$15.15

$15.15
$15.15

NB

$15.15
$15.15

$20.25
$20.25

$17.50
$17.50

$19.95
$19.95

$22.50
$22.50

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011823>

$16.00
$16.00

$16.00
$16.00

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$27.50
$27.50

$24.00
$24.00

$26.50
$26.50

(000471) RECREATION EQUI

<Quote: Q011824>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (000929) GROGAN
Info: MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011820>
Item Info:
* NIKE, OFF SPEED S [2B No Bid
<93.000>
PR 1.0 NB
* NIKE, TEAM BALL B [2B No Bid
<94.000>
EA 1.0 NB
* SIGNAL HORN, FALC [2 $37.50
<95.000> $37.50
EA 1.0
* SOCCER BALL #1259 [2 $13.24
<96.000> $13.24
EA 1.0 i
* SOCCER BALL BRINE [Z $38.88
<97.000> $38.88
EA 1.0
* SOCCER BALL BRINE [Z $22.88
<98.000> $22.88
EA 1.0
* SOCCER SHIN PADS, [z $12.24
<99.000> $12.04
PR 1.0 *
* SOCK GUARD (PAIR) [2 $9.24
<100.000> $0.24
PR 1.0

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011822>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$15.15
$15.15

$15.15
$15.15

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011823>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$18.25
$18.25

$18.25
$18.25

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(000471) RECREATION EQUI

<Quote: Q011824>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

* SOFTBALL, DIAMOND [Z
<101.000>

Dz 1.0
* SOFTBALL, ASA APP [2
<102.000>

Dz 1.0
* SOFTBALL, WILSON [2I
<103.000>

Dz 1.0
SPIKES, ALUMAGOAL RE
<104.000>

PKG 1.0
SPIKES, ALUMAGOAL RE
<105.000>

PKG 1.0
SPIKES, REPLACEMENT
<106.000>

PKG 1.0
* SUPPORTERS BIKE, [2
<107.000>

EA 1.0
* SWEEDE SWIM GOGGL

<108.000>

PR 1.0

(000929) GROGAN

MARCIANO

<Quote: Q011820>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$35.98
$35.98

$48.19
$48.19

$56.24
$56.24

NB

NB

NB

$1.94
$1.94

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011822>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011823>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(000471) RECREATION EQUI
<Quote: Q011824>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote (000929) GROGAN (018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C (001220) PRIME TIME SPOR  (000471) RECREATION EQUI
Info: MARCIANO <Quote: Q011822> <Quote: Q011823> <Quote: Q011824>
<Quote: Q011820>
Item Info:
* SWIM CAPS: WHITE [2F No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<109.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* SWIM CAPS: NAVY L [2t No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<110.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* STROKEMAKER SWIMN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<111.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* STROKEMAKER SWIMN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<112.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* STROKEMAKER SWIMN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<113.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
LAP COUNTER 14" X 14 [2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<114.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
* TENNIS BALL, CHAM [2I $10.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<115.000> $10.98
Dz 1.0 * NB NB NB
* TENNIS BALL, CHAM [2I $10.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<116.000> $10.98

Dz 1.0 * NB NB NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

* TENNIS NETS, WITH [2E
<117.000>

EA 1.0

* TENNIS WILSON #T1 [2I
<118.000>

Dz 1.0

* TENNIS WILSON #T1 [2I
<119.000>

Dz 1.0

* TENNIS WILSON #Z9 [2I
<120.000>

EA 1.0

* TENNIS WILSON #Z4 [2I
<121.000>

EA 1.0

* TENNIS WILSON #Z4 [2I
<122.000>

EA 1.0

* VOLLEYBALL, KNEE [2I
<123.000>

PR 1.0

* VOLLEYBALL, OFFIC [2I
<124.000>

EA 1.0

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011820>

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C

<Quote: Q011822>

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR

<Quote: Q011823>

(000471) RECREATION EQUI

<Quote: Q011824>

No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB
No Bid No Bid No Bid

NB NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03852

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

* VOLLEYBALL, SPAUL [2
<125.000>

EA 1.0

* VOLLEYBALL, TECHN [2
<126.000>

EA 1.0

* VOLLEYBALL, SPAUL [2
<127.000>

EA 1.0

* WILSON TEAM GEAR [:
<128.000>

EA 1.0
Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

(000929) GROGAN
MARCIANO
<Quote: Q011820>

$38.21
$38.21

$299.89
$299.89

$38.21
$38.21

$19.24
$19.24

$4,022.68
$0.00
$3,137.41
Eval Codes: NI

(018020) MAYBERRY SHOE C
<Quote: Q011822>

(001220) PRIME TIME SPOR
<Quote: Q011823>

No Bid No Bid
NB NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB

No Bid No Bid
NB NB
$582.70 $555.50
$0.00 $0.00
$497.05 $45.00

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

(000471) RECREATION EQUI
<Quote: Q011824>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

$388.00
$388.00

NB

NB

$1,242.00
$0.00
$0.00



