Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C
Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>

Item Info:
TAPE, TRAINERS, PROF [ No Bid $105.12 No Bid $122.16
<1.000> $105.12 $122.16
CS 1.0 NB NB
TAPE TRAINERS, PROFE No Bid $26.16 No Bid No Bid
<2.000> $26.16
CS 1.0 NB U,NB
TAPE TRAINERS, PROFE No Bid $39.68 No Bid No Bid
<3.000> $39.68
CS 1.0 NB NB U,NB
TAPE TRAINERS, PROFE No Bid $34.88 No Bid $37.06
<4.000> $34.88 $37.06
CS 1.0 NB NB
TAPE TRAINERS, PROFE No Bid $107.28 No Bid $112.92
<5.000> $107.28 $112.92
CS 1.0 NB NB
SPORTS TAPE (UNBLEAC No Bid $28.16 No Bid $31.35
<6.000> $28.16 $31.35
CS 1.0 NB NB
PROTECTIVE TRAINERS $32.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<7.000> $32.96
CS 1.0 NB NB U,NB
TAPE CONCO, AC #9410 | No Bid $10.68 No Bid No Bid
<8.000> $10.68
BOX 1.0 NB NB U,NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA
Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609>
Item Info:
TAPE ELASTIKON BY JO | No Bid $146.40
<9.000> $146.40
CS 1.0 NB
TAPE ELASTIKON BY JO | No Bid
<10.000>
CS 1.0
TAPE COLLINS DELUXE | No Bid
<11.000>
CS 1.0
TAPE UNDERWRAP, ARR $17.45 $18.24
<12.000> $17.45 518,24
CS 1.0
TAPE ELASTIC BANDAGE No Bid
<13.000>
CS 1.0
TAPE ELASTIC BANDAGE No Bid
<14.000>
CS 1.0
TAPE ELASTIC BANDAGE No Bid
<15.000>
CS 1.0
TAPE MOLESKIN, ANDOV No Bid $94.80

<16.000>

Cs 1.0

NB

$94.80

(002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN
<Quote: Q011610>

(007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL

<Quote: Q011611>

(000997) MOORE MEDICAL C
<Quote: Q011612>

No Bid $157.20
$157.20
NB
$145.92 No Bid $157.20
$145.92 $157.20
* NB
$34.84 No Bid No Bid
$34.84
NB U,NB
No Bid $19.16
$19.16
NB
$24.60 No Bid $30.96
$24.60 $30.96
* NB
$30.60 No Bid $40.32
$30.60 $40.32
* NB
$38.40 No Bid $56.88
$38.40 $56.88
* NB
No Bid No Bid
NB NB,U




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

(003189) DIVISION OF SHA
<Quote: Q011608>

(003190) COLLINS SURGICA
<Quote: Q011609>

(002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN
<Quote: Q011610>

(007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL

<Quote: Q011611>

(000997) MOORE MEDICAL C
<Quote: Q011612>

ARROWHEAD ELASTOGL $36.48 $31.98 No Bid No Bid

<17.000> $36.48 $31.98

CS 1.0 * NB U,NB
ARROWHEAD ELASTOGL $36.48 $32.00 No Bid No Bid

<18.000> $36.48 $32.00

CS 1.0 * NB NB,U
ELASTIC TAPE ARROWH $36.80 $34.84 No Bid No Bid

<19.000> $36.80 $34.84

CS 1.0 NB U,NB
ELASTIC TAPE ARROWH $36.96 $34.80 No Bid No Bid

<20.000~> $36.96 $34.80

CS 1.0 NB NB,U
TRANSMISSION GEL AQL No Bid $12.88 No Bid No Bid

<21.000> $12.88

EA 1.0 NB NB,U
TAPE, ELASTIC BANDAG No Bid $12.54 No Bid $79.92
<22.000> $12.54 $79.92
CS 1.0 * NB

FLEX-ALL 454 (ARIMED [2 No Bid $5.00 No Bid $4.83
<23.000> $5.00 $4.83
EA 1.0 NB NB

FLEX-ALL 454 (ARIMED [2 No Bid $49.97 No Bid No Bid

<24.000> $49.97

EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C
Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>

Item Info:
CRAMER HEEL & LACE P No Bid $10.00 No Bid $16.35
<25.000> $10.00 $16.35
BOX 1.0 NB NB
J & J ORTHOPLAST SPI [2 No Bid $188.34 No Bid No Bid
<26.000> $188.34
BOX 1.0 NB NB,U
TAPE CUTTER, SHARK T No Bid $5.35 No Bid $6.85
<27.000> $5.35 $6.85
EA 1.0 NB NB
TAPE CUTTER, SHARK T No Bid $18.30 No Bid $23.67
<28.000> $18.30 $23.67
BOX 1.0 NB NB
THERA-BAND HYGENICS No Bid $5.95 No Bid No Bid
<29.000> $5.95
BOX 1.0 NB NB NB,U
THERA-BAND HYGENICS No Bid $6.60 No Bid No Bid
<30.000> $6.60
BOX 1.0 NB NB NB,U
THERA-BAND HYGENICS No Bid $7.15 No Bid No Bid
<31.000> $7.15
BOX 1.0 NB NB NB,U
THERA-BAND HYGENICS No Bid $17.40 No Bid No Bid
<32.000> $17.40
BOX 1.0 NB NB NB,U




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801
Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
CURITY BAND-AIDS #10 [ No Bid $2.64 No Bid No Bid
<33.000> $2.64
BOX 1.0 NB NB,U
SUN-GLARE PRODUCTS, No Bid $7.99 No Bid No Bid
<34.000> $7.99
PACK 1.0 NB NB NB,U
COVER ROLL STRETCH, No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid
<35.000> $11.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U
BIOHAZARD WASTE BAG. No Bid $8.22 No Bid No Bid
<36.000> $8.22
BOX 1.0 NB NB,U
BREATHE RIGHT NASAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<37.000>
BOX 1.0 NB NB NB U,NB
BREATHE RIGHT NASAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<38.000>
BOX 1.0 NB NB NB NB,U
3M SCOTCH-GUARD CAS No Bid $60.84 No Bid $38.40
<39.000> $60.84 $38.40
BOX 1.0 NB NB *
3M SCOTCH-GUARD CAS No Bid $75.49 No Bid $47.65
<40.000> $75.49 $47.65
BOX 1.0 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801
Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
CRAMER FLEXI-WRAP, # No Bid $23.50 No Bid $26.72
<41.000> $23.50 $26.72
BOX 1.0 NB NB
SCISSORS, LISTER TYP [: No Bid $1.40 No Bid $2.07
<42.000> $1.40 $2.07
EA 1.0 NB * NB
SCISSORS, HEAVYDUTY No Bid $3.80 No Bid No Bid
<43.000> $3.80
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U
CRAMER MOUTH-GUARD No Bid $0.21 No Bid No Bid
<44.000> $0.21
EA 1.0 NB NB,U
WOOD CRUTCHES, ADUL No Bid $13.90 No Bid $13.35
<45.000> $13.90 $13.35
PR 1.0 NB NB
WOOD CRUTCHES ACCE No Bid $0.95 No Bid $2.07
<46.000> $0.95 $2.07
PR 1.0 NB NB
WOOD CRUTCHES ACCE No Bid $0.95 No Bid $2.07
<47.000> $0.95 $2.07
PR 1.0 NB NB
WOOD CRUTCHES ACCE No Bid $1.40 No Bid $2.07
<48.000> $1.40 $2.07
PR 1.0 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801
Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
ALUMINUM CRUTCHES, £ No Bid $16.40 No Bid $14.15
<49.000> $16.40 $14.15
PR 1.0 NB NB *
LONG TERM REUSABLE ( No Bid $3.50 No Bid No Bid
<50.000> $3.50
PACK 1.0 NB NB NB,U
LONG TERM REUSABLE ( No Bid $3.50 No Bid No Bid
<51.000> $3.50
PACK 1.0 NB NB NB,U
SAM SPLINTS [2BPO] No Bid $8.50 $9.72 No Bid
<52.000> $8.50 $9.72
EA 1.0 NB
CONCO ORTHOPEDIC FE No Bid $23.66 No Bid No Bid
<53.000> $23.66
EA 1.0 NB NB,U
CONCO ORTHOPEDIC FE No Bid $39.83 No Bid No Bid
<54.000> $39.83
BOX 1.0 NB NB,U
CONCO LATEX FOAM RU No Bid $15.37 No Bid No Bid
<55.000> $15.37
BOX 1.0 NB NB,U
CONCO LATEX FOAM RU No Bid $16.32 No Bid No Bid
<56.000> $16.32
BOX 1.0 NB NB,U




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801
Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
PROFESSIONAL SERIES No Bid $8.95 No Bid No Bid
<57.000> $8.95
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U
TUF-SKIN TAPE ADHERE No Bid $24.72 No Bid No Bid
<58.000> $24.72
cs 1.0 NB NB,U
TUF-SKIN TAPE ADHERE No Bid $31.68 No Bid $69.60
<59.000> $31.68 $69.60
CS 1.0 * NB
DELUXE DOUBLE LENGT! No Bid $9.90 No Bid No Bid
<60.000> $9.90
BOX 1.0 NB NB NB,U
DELUXE DOUBLE LENGT! No Bid $13.20 No Bid No Bid
<61.000> $13.20
BOX 1.0 NB NB NB,U
SECOND SKIN NON-STEF No Bid $26.28 No Bid $26.57
<62.000> $26.28 $26.57
BOX 1.0 NB
AQUAPLAST 3/16", 4 S [2E No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<63.000>
CS 1.0 NB NB NB U,NB
SLING, ENVELOPE [2BPO No Bid $2.67 No Bid $4.51
<64.000> $2.67 $4.51
BOX 1.0 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL

(000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
KITS, CRAMER SOFT, B [: No Bid $67.00 No Bid No Bid
<65.000> $67.00
KIT 1.0 NB NB U,NB
KITS, CRAMER SOFT, B [ No Bid $96.00 No Bid No Bid
<66.000> $96.00
KIT 1.0 NB NB U,NB
FINGER SPLINTS PLAST | No Bid $19.96 No Bid No Bid
<67.000> $19.96
KIT 1.0 NB U,NB
WHIRLPOOL ANTISEPTIC No Bid $19.20 No Bid No Bid
<68.000> $19.20
BOX 1.0 NB NB U,NB
CUFF WEIGHTS, 2 LBS. [2 No Bid $6.20 No Bid No Bid
<69.000> $6.20
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
CUFF WEIGHTS, 5 LBS. [2 No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid
<70.000> $9.50
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
CUFF WEIGHTS, 10 LBS [; No Bid $12.65 No Bid No Bid
<71.000> $12.65
EA 1.0 NB * NB U,NB
THERABAND TUBING, 25 No Bid $7.56 No Bid No Bid
<72.000> $7.56
EA 1.0 NB U,NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
THERABAND TUBING, 25 No Bid $8.56 No Bid No Bid
<73.000> $8.56
EA 1.0 NB U,NB
THERABAND TUBING, 25 No Bid $9.37 No Bid No Bid
<74.000> $9.37
EA 1.0 NB U,NB
THERA-PUTTY,2 0OZ. R [2 No Bid $2.12 No Bid No Bid
<75.000> $2.12
EA 1.0 NB U,NB
THERA-PUTTY, 2 0Z. G [2 No Bid $2.12 No Bid No Bid
<76.000> $2.12
EA 1.0 NB U,NB
THERA-PUTTY, 2 OZ. B [2 No Bid $2.12 No Bid No Bid
<77.000> $2.12
EA 1.0 NB U,NB
KNEE IMMOBILIZERS, 2 [: No Bid $22.85 No Bid No Bid
<78.000> $22.85
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
KNEE IMMOBILIZERS, 2 [: No Bid $24.95 No Bid No Bid
<79.000> $24.95
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
ENVIRONSIDE HOSPITAL No Bid $6.12 No Bid $5.87
<80.000> $6.12 $5.87
EA 1.0 NB *




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
ENVIRONSIDE HOSPITAL No Bid $17.93 No Bid $17.39
<81.000> $17.93 $17.39
EA 1.0 NB
LIQUID SOAP, 18 OZ. 2B No Bid $3.93 No Bid $2.80
<82.000> $3.93 $2.80
EA 1.0 NB
CLAUSS PRO TRAINING No Bid $27.56 No Bid No Bid
<83.000> $27.56
EA 1.0 NB U,NB
THERMOMETERS, DIGIT# No Bid $3.24 No Bid $2.84
<84.000> $3.24 $2.84
EA 1.0 NB
THERMOMETERS, GLASS No Bid $3.36 No Bid No Bid
<85.000> $3.36
EA 1.0 NB U,NB
TAMPAX TAMPONS, #T50 No Bid $56.15 No Bid $56.07
<86.000> $56.15 $56.07
BOX 1.0 NB NB
ANKLE BRACES/MCDAVIL No Bid $12.32 No Bid No Bid
<87.000> $12.32
EA 1.0 NB U,NB
ELBOW SLEEVES/MCDAV No Bid $4.66 No Bid No Bid
<88.000> $4.66
EA 1.0 NB U,NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
ELBOW SLEEVES/MCDAV No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<89.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U
KNEE SLEEVES/MCDAVI No Bid $4.66 No Bid No Bid
<90.000> $4.66
EA 1.0 NB NB,U
KNEE SLEEVES/MCDAVI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<91.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
LUMBER SUPPORT/MCD/ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<92.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB,U NB NB,U
ICE BAGS: CRAMER, H [2 No Bid $38.00 No Bid $44.89
<93.000> $38.00 $44.89
ROLL 1.0 NB * NB
ICE BAG DISPENSER: [2 No Bid $17.39 No Bid No Bid
<94.000> $17.39
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U
LATERAL KNEE GUARDS: No Bid $19.96 No Bid No Bid
<95.000> $19.96
EA 1.0 NB NB,U
LATERAL KNEE GUARDS: No Bid $21.64 No Bid No Bid
<96.000> $21.64
EA 1.0 NB NB,U




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801
Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
LATERAL KNEE GUARDS: No Bid $33.96 No Bid No Bid
<97.000> $33.96
EA 1.0 NB NB,U
LATERAL KNEE GUARDS: No Bid $42.49 No Bid No Bid
<98.000> $42.49
EA 1.0 NB NB,U
CRAMER POWER-FLOW [ No Bid $566.00 No Bid No Bid
<99.000> $566.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U
REPLACEMENT BATTERII No Bid $31.25 No Bid No Bid
<100.000> $31.25
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U
ANDOVER POWERFLEX ( No Bid $27.25 No Bid No Bid
<101.000> $27.25
Cs 1.0 NB NB NB,U
ANDOVER POWERFLEX ( No Bid $27.25 No Bid No Bid
<102.000> $27.25
Cs 1.0 NB NB NB,U
ANDOVER POWERFLEX ( No Bid $27.25 No Bid No Bid
<103.000> $27.25
Cs 1.0 NB NB NB,U
SIMPLY STABLE SHOULD No Bid $28.50 No Bid No Bid
<104.000> $28.50
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801
Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL

(000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
IMPACT AC PADS, ARTH | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<105.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
HYDROCOLLATOR STEA! No Bid $13.10 No Bid $11.85
<106.000> $13.10 $11.85
EA 1.0 NB NB
HYDROCOLLATOR PACK No Bid $10.50 No Bid $12.39
<107.000> $10.50 $12.39
EA 1.0 NB NB
OTOSCOPE REPLACEME No Bid $29.90 No Bid $29.21
<108.000> $29.90 $29.21
EA 1.0 NB NB
TREATMENT TABLES ST/ No Bid $475.33 No Bid $255.00
<109.000> $475.33 $255.00
EA 1.0 NB *
EYE LEVEL BEAM SCALE No Bid $179.00 No Bid $156.07
<110.000> $179.00 $156.07
EA 1.0 NB NB
EXERCISE BALL RACK, [ No Bid $99.00 No Bid No Bid
<111.000> $99.00
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
EXERCISE BALLS - 45C [2 No Bid $9.55 No Bid No Bid
<112.000> $9.55
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801
Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
EXERCISE BALLS - 55C [2 No Bid $12.05 No Bid No Bid
<113.000> $12.05
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
EXERCISE BALLS - 65C [2 No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid
<114.000> $15.00
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
EXERCISE BALLS -75CM | No Bid $17.95 No Bid No Bid
<115.000> $17.95
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
EXERCISE BALLS -85CM | No Bid $24.00 No Bid No Bid
<116.000> $24.00
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
CRUTCHPACK PLUS, 55" No Bid $180.00 No Bid No Bid
<117.000> $180.00
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
SOFT: ROYLAN CONTOU No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<118.000>
PACK 1.0 NB U,NB NB NB,U
MEDIUM: ROYLAN CONT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<119.000>
PACK 1.0 NB NB,U NB U,NB
ORTHO-GEL PADDING (V No Bid $27.25 No Bid No Bid
<120.000> $27.25
KIT 1.0 NB NB U,NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801
Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
HYDROCOLLATOR HEAT No Bid $232.72 No Bid $300.00
<121.000> $232.72 $300.00
EA 1.0 NB
HYDROCOLLATOR PACK: No Bid $5.36 No Bid $5.46
<122.000> $5.36 $5.46
EA 1.0 NB
J & J DERMABOND TOPI [ No Bid $309.43 No Bid $323.50
<123.000> $309.43 $323.50
EA 1.0 NB
CRAMER BLISTER FOAM, No Bid $9.80 No Bid No Bid
<124.000> $9.80
BOX 1.0 NB NB U,NB
BIO-FREEZE/GALLON [2B No Bid $74.98 No Bid No Bid
<125.000> $74.98
GAL. 1.0 NB U,NB
LAERDAL POCKET CPR M No Bid $11.05 $9.96 $11.95
<126.000> $11.05 $9.96 $11.95
EA 1.0 NB
CRAMER RAPID FORM V/ No Bid $273.00 No Bid No Bid
<127.000> $273.00
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U
MEDI-KIT 1000 (ON WH [2 No Bid $118.39 No Bid No Bid
<128.000> $118.39
EA 1.0 NB NB,U




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C
Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>

Item Info:
CRAMER JUMBO KIT (ON No Bid $82.21 No Bid No Bid
<129.000> $82.21
EA 1.0 NB NB,U
SHARPS CONTAINER, 2 | No Bid $5.05 No Bid $2.60
<130.000> $5.05 $2.60
EA 1.0 NB NB
MABIS RI-MINI OTOSCO [; No Bid $179.99 No Bid $157.50
<131.000> $179.99 $157.50
KIT 1.0 NB NB
SUEDE-O TARSAL-LOC A No Bid $16.95 No Bid $16.80
<132.000> $16.95 $16.80
EA 1.0 NB NB
CRAMER TURF-TOE BRA! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<133.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
SUEDE-O NIGHT SPLINT | No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid
<134.000> $42.00
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
60 QUART ICE CHEST/C [ No Bid $58.63 No Bid No Bid
<135.000> $58.63
EA 1.0 NB U,NB
MUELLER WIRE CUP CAF No Bid $22.60 No Bid No Bid
<136.000> $22.60
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801
Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
CRAMER TRANSPORT KI’ No Bid $193.00 No Bid No Bid
<137.000> $193.00
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
COLLYRIUM EYE WASH, No Bid $4.30 $4.07 No Bid
<138.000> $4.30 $4.07
EA 1.0 NB
RUBBERMAID UTILITY C | No Bid $120.00 No Bid No Bid
<139.000> $120.00
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
MIST-N-GO MOBILE COO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<140.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U
3 LB. - DUMBELLS [2BPQ] No Bid $3.34 No Bid No Bid
<141.000> $3.34
EA 1.0 NB NB,U
5LB. - DUMBELLS [2BPO] No Bid $5.68 No Bid No Bid
<142.000> $5.68
EA 1.0 NB NB,U
10 LB. - DUMBELLS [2BPC No Bid $10.96 No Bid No Bid
<143.000> $10.96
EA 1.0 NB NB,U
15 LB. - DUMBELLS [2BPC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<144.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801
Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
20 LB. - DUMBELLS [2BPC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<145.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U
4 LB. - MEDICINE BAL [2B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<146.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
6 LB. - MEDICINE BAL [2B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<147.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U
9 LB. - MEDICINE BAL [2B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<148.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
KLEENEX TISSUES, 175 [: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<149.000>
BOX 1.0 NB NB NB,U
ALUMINUM ICE SCOOPS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<150.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
CHROME BASE ADJUSTA No Bid $74.30 No Bid No Bid
<151.000> $74.30
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
MEDICINE BALL STORAG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<152.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB,U




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA
Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609>

Item Info:
PLYOBACK-REBOUNDER No Bid $525.00
<153.000> $525.00
EA 1.0 NB *
SUNDRY JAR SET (5) G [2 No Bid $30.00
<154.000> $30.00
SET 1.0 NB
6" - GONIOMETERS [2BP( No Bid $4.90
<155.000> $4.90
EA 1.0 NB
8" - GONIOMETERS [2BP( No Bid $5.50
<156.000> $5.50
EA 1.0 NB
12" - GONIOMETERS [2BF No Bid $10.90
<157.000> $10.90
EA 1.0 NB
COURSON PORTABLE TA No Bid No Bid
<158.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB,U
CUFF WEIGHT STORAGE No Bid $139.00
<159.000> $139.00
EA 1.0 NB *
ROYLAN KNEE & LEG EL No Bid $42.00
<160.000> $42.00
EA 1.0 NB

(002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN
<Quote: Q011610>

No Bid

NB

$25.34
$25.34

$3.36
$3.36

$4.19
$4.19

$8.09
$8.09

No Bid

NB

$178.79
$178.79

$40.94
$40.94

(007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C
<Quote: Q011612>

<Quote: Q011611>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

U,NB

$27.89
$27.89

U,NB

U,NB

U,NB

U,NB

U,NB

U,NB



Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

BAUSH & LOMB RENU, M
<161.000>
EA 1.0
MASTEX THERAPEUTIC F
<162.000>
EA 1.0

EXERCISE BIKES/KEYS [.
<163.000>

EA 1.0
ARMOR DONJOY LIGAME
<164.000>

EA 1.0

4TITUDE DONJOY LIGA [2
<165.000>

EA 1.0
LEGEND DONJOY LIGAM
<166.000>

EA 1.0
SE 4 POINT DONJOY L [2t
<167.000>

EA 1.0
AIRCAST CRYO-CUFF/AN

<168.000>

EA 1.0

(003189) DIVISION OF SHA

<Quote: Q011608>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(003190) COLLINS SURGICA
<Quote: Q011609>

$3.60
$3.60
$78.00
$78.00

No Bid
NB,U

No Bid
NB,U

No Bid
NB,U

No Bid
NB,U

No Bid
NB,U
$46.00
$46.00

(002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN
<Quote: Q011610>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

$101.96
$101.96

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

$47.56
$47.56

(007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C
<Quote: Q011612>

<Quote: Q011611>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB,U

$102.33
$102.33

NB,U

NB,U

NB,U

NB,U

NB,U

NB,U



Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL ~ (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C
Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
COOL DRAFT Il MISTIN [2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<169.000>
EA 1.0 NB
MABIS DUAL HEAD STET No Bid $4.35 $3.59 No Bid
<170.000> $4.35 $3.59
EA 1.0 NB
MABIS SINGLE HEAD ST | No Bid $3.08 $2.72 No Bid
<171.000> $3.08 $2.72
EA 1.0 NB
CRAMER FANNY PACK/S" No Bid $17.00 No Bid No Bid
<172.000> $17.00
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
CRAMER FANNY PACK/DI No Bid $27.99 No Bid No Bid
<173.000> 627 99
EA 1.0 NB NB U,NB
HEEL CUPS, TULI~'S [2BF No Bid $4.77 No Bid $5.11
<174.000> $4.77 $5.11
EA 1.0
PENLIGHTS/DISPOSABLE No Bid $4.55 $4.96 No Bid
<175.000> $4.55 $4.96
PACK 1.0 NB
EXERTOOLS DYNA-DISCS No Bid $21.32 No Bid No Bid
<176.000> 6213

EA 1.0

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

EXAMINATION LAMP, RE
<177.000>

EA 1.0
PRON-PILLO [2BPO]
<178.000>

EA 1.0

SKYNDEX ELECTRONIC ¢
<179.000>
EA 1.0
FLEXI-WRAP (6 ROLLS/ [2
<180.000>
CASE 1.0
MEDI-LYES ELECTROLYT
<181.000>
PACK 1.0

LEUKOTAPE P SPORTST/
<182.000>

RL 1.0
INTELECT LEGEND SERI
<183.000>

EA 1.0
INTELECT LEGEND SERI
<184.000>

EA 1.0

(003189) DIVISION OF SHA

<Quote: Q011608>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(003190) COLLINS SURGICA
<Quote: Q011609>

$65.60
$65.60

$74.00
$74.00

$365.00
$365.00

$17.99
$17.99

$13.20
$13.20

$5.95
$5.95

$2,050.00
$2,050.00

$1,050.00
$1,050.00

(002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN
<Quote: Q011610>

$54.42
$54.42

$70.92
$70.92

$368.19
$368.19

$21.39
$21.39

$11.93
$11.93

$5.56
$5.56

$1,357.67
$1,357.67

$1,034.19
$1,034.19

(007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL

<Quote: Q011611>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

BOX

<Quote: Q011612>

$53.33

$53.33
No Bid

NB,U
No Bid

NB,U

$25.45

$25.45

NB,U

$11.42

$11.42
No Bid

NB,U
No Bid

NB,U
No Bid

NB,U



Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA
Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609>
Item Info:
TONGUE DEPRESSORS, No Bid $3.75
<185.000> $3.75
BX

CcSs 1.0 NB * U,NB
POLY FILLED PILLOW, [2 No Bid $5.80
<186.000> $5.80
EA 1.0 NB
DISPOSABLE PILLOW CA No Bid $21.95
<187.000> $21.95
BOX 1.0 NB * Tie
AGILITY LADDERS [2BPO No Bid $69.00
<188.000> $69.00
EA 1.0 NB *
PRO-POWER SLIDE BOAF No Bid No Bid
<189.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB,U
SPORTS QR 32, SINGLE [ No Bid $41.30
<190.000> $41.30
EA 1.0 NB
WIPPS MOUTHPIECES N No Bid $5.40
<191.000> $5.40
EA 1.0 NB *
KENDAL WEBRIL BANDA( No Bid $9.50
<192.000> $9.50

BOX 1.0 NB *

(002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN
<Quote: Q011610>

$35.90
$35.90

$3.96
$3.96

$24.91
$24.91

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

$40.53
$40.53

No Bid

NB

$61.92
$61.92

(007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C
<Quote: Q011612>

<Quote: Q011611>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$24.10
$24.10

U,NB

$21.95
$21.95

*Tie

NB,U

NB,U

NB,U

U,NB

$59.76
$59.76



Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

KENDALWEBRIL BANDAC
<193.000>
BOX 1.0
KENDAL WEBRIL BANDA(
<194.000>
BOX 1.0
3M SCOTCHCAST PLUS (
<195.000>
CS 1.0
3M SCOTCHCAST PLUS (
<196.000>
CS 1.0
KLING GAUZE (3 IN X [2B
<197.000>
BOX 1.0
KLING GAUZE (4 IN X [2B
<198.000>
BOX 1.0
KLING GAUZE (6 IN X [2B
<199.000>
BOX 1.0
ORTHOPEDIC STOCKINE

<200.000>

CS 1.0

(003189) DIVISION OF SHA

<Quote: Q011608>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(003190) COLLINS SURGICA

BOX

<Quote: Q011609>

$13.10
$13.10

$12.55
$12.55

$49.00
$49.00

$58.00
$58.00

$1.40
$1.40

$2.60
$2.60

$2.05
$2.05

$5.65
$5.65

U,NB

(002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN
<Quote: Q011610>

$79.68
$79.68

$57.12
$57.12

$75.49
$75.49

$97.67
$97.67

$11.92
$11.92

$15.84
$15.84

$16.64
$16.64

$5.13
$5.13

(007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

<Quote: Q011611>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

BOX

BOX

<Quote: Q011612>

$77.88
$77.88

$55.20
$55.20

$47.65
$47.65

*,UNB

$62.33
$62.33

U,NB

$10.24
$10.24

$12.56
$12.56

$13.68
$13.68

$60.72
$60.72



Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

ORTHOPEDIC STOCKINE

<201.000>

CS 1.0

ORTHOPEDIC STOCKINE

<202.000>

CS 1.0

SURGIGRIP TUBLAR ELA

<203.000>

CS 1.0

SURGIGRIP TUBLAR ELA
<204.000>

CS 1.0
SPENCO ORTHOTIC ARC
<205.000>

EA 1.0
SPENCO ORTHOTIC ARC
<206.000>

EA 1.0

BAPS BOARD SYSTEM [2I
<207.000>

EA 1.0

3 M TRANSPORE PERFOI
<208.000>

CS 1.0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(003189) DIVISION OF SHA
<Quote: Q011608>

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

(003190) COLLINS SURGICA
<Quote: Q011609>

$6.90

$6.90
BOX

*,UNB

$10.35

$10.35
BOX

*,UNB

$22.70

$22.70
BOX

NB,U

$32.75

$32.75
BOX

U,NB
$13.35

$13.35
PR

NB,U
$14.40

$14.40
PR

U,NB
$430.00
$430.00

$8.00

$8.00
BOX

*,U,NB

(002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN
<Quote: Q011610>

$7.19
$7.19

$10.98
$10.98

$22.29
$22.29

$32.12
$32.12

$13.22
$13.22

$14.29
$14.29

$423.34
$423.34

$134.90
$134.90

(007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C
<Quote: Q011612>

<Quote: Q011611>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

BOX

BOX

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$71.00
$71.00

NB,U

$27.81
$27.81

U,NB

$41.20
$41.20

NB,U

U,NB

NB,U

NB,U

$70.32
$70.32



Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote (003189) DIVISION OF SHA  (003190) COLLINS SURGICA  (002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN  (007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL (000997) MOORE MEDICAL C

Info: <Quote: Q011608> <Quote: Q011609> <Quote: Q011610> <Quote: Q011611> <Quote: Q011612>
Item Info:
POWER PLYO-BOX (12 1 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<209.000>
SET 10 NB NB NB,U
POWER PLYO-BOX (12 1 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<210.000>
EA 10 NB NB U.NB
POWER PLYO-BOX (18 | [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<211.000>
EA 10 NB NB NB,U
POWER PLYO-BOX (24 | [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<212.000>
EA 10 NB NB U.NB
POWER PLYO-BOX (30 | [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<213.000>
EA 10 NB NB NB,U
POWER PLYO-BOX (36 | [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<214.000>
EA 10 NB NB U.NB
J & J STERI-PAD STER [2I No Bid $3.30 $77.76 No Bid
<215.000> $3.30 $77.76

BOX

cs 10 NB * UNB NB
ANATOMY CHARTS, LAMI No Bid No Bid $34.00 No Bid
<216.000> $34.00
EA 10 NB NB,U




Bid Tab for Bid# B03801

Quote
Info:

Item Info:

GATORADE NUTRIONAL !

<217.000>

CS 1.0

GATORADE THIRST QUEI

<218.000>

CS 1.0

CRAMER SKIN-LUBE LUB

<219.000>

EA 1.0

CRAMER SKIN-LUBE LUB
<220.000>

EA 1.0
Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items
U = Different Unit Of Measure

(003189) DIVISION OF SHA
<Quote: Q011608>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

(003190) COLLINS SURGICA
<Quote: Q011609>

$26.00
$26.00

$47.90
$47.90

$3.50
$3.50

$15.10
$15.10

$13,514.57
$0.00
$5,754.84
Eval Codes: NI

(002752) HENRY SCHEIN IN
<Quote: Q011610>

Eval Codes: NI

$24.16
$24.16

$43.94
$43.94

$3.36
$3.36

$15.37
$15.37

$10,674.94
$0.00
$6,485.75

(007460) LAERDAL MEDICAL
<Quote: Q011611>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB

NB

NB

NB

$45.95
$0.00
$0.00

(000997) MOORE MEDICAL C
<Quote: Q011612>

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

NB,U

NB,U

NB,U

NB,U

$3,531.22
$0.00
$491.48



