Bid Tab for Bid# B03789

Quote (000418) KAMCO SUPPLY CO

(000710) L SWEET LUMBER

Info: <Quote: Q011598> <Quote: Q011599>
Item Info:
ARMSTRONG, NO. 895 F | $41.00
<1.000> $32,800.00
PKG 800.0
ARMSTRONG, NO. 896 F | $59.00
<2.000> $94,400.00
PKG 1600.0
ARMSTRONG, NO. 2766 [ $110.00
<3.000> $88,000.00
PKG 800.0
ARMSTRONG, NO. 2753D $152.00
<4.000> $60,800.00
PKG 400.0
ARMSTRONG, NO. 2765C $85.00
<5.000> $34,000.00
PKG 400.0
CELOTEX NO.CM 454 F [ No Bid
<6.000>
PKG 140.0 NB
ARMSTRONG NO. 584 F | $75.00
<7.000> $10,800.00
PKG 144.0
#8300-WH 12~' MAIN TE [2 $140.00
<8.000> $5,600.00
PKG 40.0
#7802-WH 10~' WALL AN [ $122.00
<9.000> $3,660.00
PKG 30.0
#AL-7801 WH 10~' WALL [: No Bid
<10.000>
PKG 30.0 NB
#HD-8220 WH HD 2~'T [2 No Bid No Bid
<11.000>
PKG 10.0 NB NB




Bid Tab for Bid# B03789

Quote (000418) KAMCO SUPPLY CO

Info:

Item Info:

#8324 WH TEES, 2~' [2BF
<12.000>

PKG 10.0

#8340-WH 4~' TEES PA [2|
<13.000>

PKG 16.0

12~' TIE WIRE (50#/BU [2E
<14.000>

BDL 50.0

TECTUM S/E WALL PANE
<15.000>

PANEL 10.0

24" X 48" X 5/8" VIN [2BA]
<16.000>

PANEL 10.0

1 GAL TINS ACOUSTICA [.
<17.000>

GAL 10.0

4 GALLON TINS ACOUST
<18.000>

4 GAL 10.0

Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:
$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

<Quote: Q011598>

$56.40
$564.00

$112.80
$1,804.80

$39.00
$1,950.00

$32.00
$320.00

No Bid

NB

$10.95
$109.50

$39.00
$390.00

$208,543.58
$0.00
$208,543.58
Eval Codes: NI

(000710) L SWEET LUMBER
<Quote: Q011599>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$140.00
$7,000.00

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB
$337,060.00
$0.00
$0.00

Eval Codes: NI



