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RIC Craig Lee Hall Furniture
Part 2- Classroom Furniture

Furniture and Equipment for Craig Lee Hall

Rhode Island College

Date: 5/30/2018
Contact: Meaghan Kennedy
mkennedy@Ilbarch.com

Part 2- Classroom Furniture

MK | No. | Item, Description Manufacturer Product Name Model/ Sizel Materials, Finishes, Color Components, Location Q. Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Catalog # D Features
Chairs Correctional Indusrty Sheehans Office Concepts AFD Contract Furniture WB Mason
C 9 Classroom Chair Alisteel Seek K-MUCO-S-BLCK-3 28"w x 22"d x 35 1/2"h x 19"sh Upholstery: Allsteel Burst- Slate Mesh back Classrooms throughout 459 28593 | $ 131,241.87
Mesh back: Allsteel Dusk Upholstered seat
Frame Finish: Silver Multi surface casters
Polymer Color: Black Arm Chair
no bid added alt. not approved for Part 2,3 & 4
C | 9-ALT [Classroom Chair- ALTERNATE Kimball Flip Nesting Chair K76CMUCA 28"w x 22"d x 35 1/2"h x 19"sh ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Classrooms throughout 459 310.00 | $ 142,290.00
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID
C | 9-ALT [Classroom Chair- ALTERNATE KI/OEI Torsion Air Nesting TANWA/SX/S/IGRP3/NFR/GRMH  [23.875"W x 24.25"D x 33.5"H, 18" SH|ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Classrooms throughout 459( $ 235.00 | $ 107,865.00
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID
Cc 11 |Conference Room Chairs Allsteel Seek K-MUCO-S-BLCK-3 28"w x 22'd x 35 1/2"h x 19"sh Upholstery:Allsteel Seed- Cinder  |Mesh back Conference Room 068, 059, 154, 177 28593 | $ 50,609.61
Mesh back: Allsteel Dusk Upholstered seat 254, 354, 454
Frame Finish: Silver Multi surface casters Meeting Room 054, 165, 265, 365,
Polymer Color: Black Arm Chair 465
Psychology Labs 009A-K
Study Room 344, 444, 445 no bid
C [ 11- ALT | Conference Room Chairs- ALTERNATE Kimball Flip Nesting Chair K76CMUCA 28"w x 22"d x 35 1/2"h x 19"sh ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Conference Room 068, 059, 154, 177 285.00 | $ 50,445.00
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED 254, 354, 454
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST Meeting Room 054, 165, 265, 365,
BID 465
Psychology Labs 009A-K
Study Room 344, 444, 445
C | 11- ALT [Conference Room Chairs- ALTERNATE KI/OEI Torsion Air Nesting TANWA/SX/S/GRP3/NFR/GRMH  [23.875"W x 24.25"D x 33.5"H, 18" SH|ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Conference Room 068, 059, 154, 177| $ 235.00 | $ 41,595.00
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED 254, 354, 454
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST Meeting Room 054, 165, 265, 365,
BID 465
Psychology Labs 009A-K
Study Room 344, 444, 445
C 15 |Classroom ADA Chair- glides Alisteel Seek K-MUGO-S-BLCK-3 28"w x 22"d x 35 1/2"h x 19"sh Upholstery: Allsteel Burst- Slate Mesh back Classrooms (dispered to rooms 37 28593 | $ 10,579.41
Mesh back: Allsteel Dusk Upholstered seat 'with Node chairs in Craig Lee-26
Frame Finish: Silver Glides and Gaige Hall-11)
Polymer Color: Black Arm Chair
no bid
C | 15- ALT [Classroom ADA Chair- glides- ALTERNATE Kimball Flip Nesting Chair K76CMUCA 28"w x 22"d x 35 1/2"h x 19"sh ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Classrooms (dispered to rooms 37 285.00 | $ 10,545.00
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED with Node chairs in Craig Lee-26
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST and Gaige Hall-11)
BID
C | 15- ALT [Classroom ADA Chair- glides- ALTERNATE KI/OEI Torsion Air Nesting TANWA/SX/G/GRP3/NFR/GRMH  23.875"W x 24.25"D x 33.5"H, 18" SH|ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Classrooms (dispered to rooms 37!$ 235.00 | $ 8,695.00
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED with Node chairs in Craig Lee-26
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST and Gaige Hall-11)
BID
Tables/Surfaces
T 10  |Meeting Table- Rectangle Allsteel Aware AW3LK2460V 60"w x 24"d x 30"h Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple |Laminate Top Grad Students 152, 252, 352, 452 17 414.13 | $ 7,040.21
Base: Fossil Knife Edge Tutoring/Testing 253, 353, 453
Medium T Table Base Admin 141, 241, 341, 441
stationary- no flip
T | 10- ALT |Meeting Table- Rectangle- ALTERNATE ERG International Drake, DR2460 60"w x 24"d x 30"h ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Laminate Top Grad Students 152, 252, 352, 452 17
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED |Knife Edge Tutoring/Testing 253, 353, 453
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST  |Medium T Table Base Admin 141, 241, 341, 441
BID stationary- no flip 642.54 | $ 10,923.18
T | 10- ALT |Meeting Table- Rectangle- ALTERNATE Berco Anyway Nesting Training Table AN1-2460-REC-LAM 60"w x 24"d x 30"h ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Laminate Top Grad Students 152, 252, 352, 452 17 685.00 [ $ 11,645.00
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED (Knife Edge Tutoring/Testing 253, 353, 453
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST  |Medium T Table Base Admin 141, 241, 341, 441
BID stationary- no flip
T | 10- ALT |Meeting Table- Rectangle- ALTERNATE KI/OEI Pirouette Fixed Rect Table PIFR2460T/KN/NNN/NMP/EKM/LK| 24"D x 60"W x 29"H ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Laminate Top Grad Students 152, 252, 352, 452 17| $ 435.00 | $ 7,395.00
M/GR/4XX BE SELECTED AND APPROVED |Knife Edge Tutoring/Testing 253, 353, 453
(518197356) BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST  |Medium T Table Base Admin 141, 241, 341, 441
BID stationary- no flip
T 12 |Classroom Flip Top Table Allsteel Aware AW3LT1860T 60"w x 18"d x 30"h Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple |modesty panel Classrooms 002, 020, 018, 122, 159 389.78 | $ 61,975.02
AW2TS18N60C Base: Fossil flip top 120, 118, 100, 101, 103-109, 111-
AW4HME0 casters 113, 222, 220, 218, 200, 201, 203-
Tleg 209, 211-213
Observe 009J, 009G, 0098
Psychology Labs 009
T | 12- ALT |Classroom Flip Top Table- ALTERNATE ERG International Drake, DR1860 60"w x 18"d x 30"h ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO  [modesty panel Classrooms 002, 020, 018, 122, 159 $ 72114 | $ 114,661.26
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED |flip top 120, 118, 100, 101, 103-109, 111-
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST  [casters 113, 222, 220, 218, 200, 201, 203-
BID Tleg 209, 211-213
Observe 009J, 009G, 009B
Psychology Labs 009
T | 12- ALT |Classroom Flip Top Table- ALTERNATE Berco Anyway Nesting Training Table AN1-1860-REC-LAM 60"w x 18"d x 30"h ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO modesty panel Classrooms 002, 020, 018, 122, 159 685.00 [ $ 108,915.00
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED |flip top 120, 118, 100, 101, 103-109, 111-
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST  |casters 113, 222,220, 218, 200, 201, 203-
BID Tleg 209, 211-213
Observe 009J, 009G, 0098
Psychology Labs 009
T | 12- ALT |Classroom Flip Top Table- ALTERNATE KI/OEI Pirouette Nesting Rect Table PINR1860T-74P/NNN/FMP/EKM/LF 18"D x 60"W x 29"H ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO  [modesty panel Classrooms 002, 020, 018, 122, 159| $ 565.00 | $ 89,835.00
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED |flip top 120, 118, 100, 101, 103-109, 111-
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST  [casters 113, 222, 220, 218, 200, 201, 203-
BID Tleg 209, 211-213
Observe 009J, 009G, 009B
Psychology Labs 009
T 13 High Tech Classroom Table Teknion Solutions Woodwork Custom nla 78" round x 30"h Surface Finish-Foundation laminate | SHOP DRAWINGS FOR THIS ITEM WILL |Classroom 110, 210 8
Flat Edge-Finish-3mm edge band |BE REVIEWED AND APPROVED BY
Base Finish-Foundation Laminate |ARCHITECT PRIOR TO ORDERING
Single Pedestal Base- hollow to cover and
route power cubes to floor outlet- access
door for maintenance- additional supports
(3 additional feet extending from pedestal
base)
Furniture manufacturer to provide cut outs in
furntiure to mount 5 duplexes and 9 T/D
connections, size of AV will be provided by
owner for coordination
Surface Thickness-1-3/16"
Added Alt. not approved




RIC Craig Lee Hall Furniture
Part 2- Classroom Furniture

T|13-ALT

High Tech Classroom Table- ALTERNATE

ARNOLD

CUSTOM ROUND TABLE-SINGLE PEDESTAL
BASE

SPECIAL

78" ROUND x 29"H

ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID

SHOP DRAWINGS FOR THIS ITEM WILL BE
REVIEWED AND APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT PRIOR TO ORDERING

TABLE WILL BE SUPPORTED BY 1 DRUM
BASE THAT IS CLAD IN MAPLE THE GRAIN
ON THE DRUM BASE WILL BE LEFT/RIGHT

THE BASE WILL HAVE A PULL OFF
SERVICE DOOR

TOP WILL 3 BYRNE AXIL Z UNITS #BE02520-
2-2-7-706-U1-72 EACH UNIT IS POWERED
BY A 72" CORD WITH 3 PRONG PLUG

Classroom 110, 210

Date: 5/30/2018

Contact: Meaghan Kennedy
mkennedy@Ilbarch.com

T|13-ALT

High Tech Classroom Table- ALTERNATE

Kimball

Dock Round Table

SPECIAL

78" ROUND x 29"H

ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID

SHOP DRAWINGS FOR THIS ITEM WILL
BE REVIEWED AND APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT PRIOR TO ORDERING

DOCK,TABLE TOP,ROUND,LAMINATE 78
DIA MODIFIED, DOCK, CYLINDER
ACCESS BASE,HPLMODIFIED (REF
4K2428CYAL)

Classroom 110, 210

$

3,435.00

$

27,480.00

T[13-ALT

High Tech Classroom Table- ALTERNATE

ERG International

Beta

BE78D

78" ROUND x 29"H

ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID

SHOP DRAWINGS FOR THIS ITEM WILL
BE REVIEWED AND APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT PRIOR TO ORDERING

Single Pedestal Base- hollow to cover and
route power cubes to floor outlet- access

door for maintenance- additional supports
(3 additional feet extending from pedestal
base)

Furniture manufacturer to provide cut outs in
furntiure to mount 5 duplexes and 9 T/D
connections, size of AV will be provided by
owner for coordination

Surface Thickness-1-3/16"

Classroom 110, 210

Classroom ADA Station Table

Allsteel

Aware

AW3LT1848T
AW2TS18N48C
AW4HM48

48"w x 18"d x 30"h

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple
Base: Fossil

modesty panel
flip top
casters

Tleg

Classrooms (dispered to rooms
with Node chairs in Craig Lee-26
and Gaige Hall-11)

37

T|21-ALT

Classroom ADA Station Table- ALTERNATE

ERG International

Drake

DR1848

48"w x 18"d x 30"h

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple
Base: Fossil

modesty panel
flip top
casters

Tleg

Classrooms (dispered to rooms
with Node chairs in Craig Lee-26
and Gaige Hall-11)

37

$ 690.05 [ $

25,531.85

T|21-ALT

Classroom ADA Station Table- ALTERNATE

Berco

Anyway Nesting Training Table

AN1-1848-REC

48"w x 18"d x 30"h

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple
Base: Fossil

modesty panel
flip top
casters

Tleg

Classrooms (dispered to rooms
with Node chairs in Craig Lee-26
and Gaige Hall-11)

37

760.00

$

28,120.00

T|21-ALT

Classroom ADA Station Table- ALTERNATE

KI/OEI

Pirouette Nesting Rect Table

PINR1848T-74P/NNN/FMP/EKM/LH

18"D x 48"W x 29"H

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple
Base: Fossil

modesty panel
flip top
casters

Tleg

Classrooms (dispered to rooms
with Node chairs in Craig Lee-26
and Gaige Hall-11)

37

535.00

$

19,795.00

Computer Classroom Table

Allsteel

Aware

AW3LT2460T
AW2TSPGB60
AW4HME0
AWAW60
AWCVRG
AWA4QBI
AW4QJ36
AW4GANG

60"w x 24"d x 30"h

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple
Base: Fossil

modesty panel

casters

Tleg

34" wire trough for 60" table

wire manager cover for aware leg
Interlink 1Q power base infeed
Interlink 1Q power Jumper 36"
Ganging Hardware

Classroom 011, 012

34

no bid

Added Alt. not approved

D Shaped Table

Surfaceworks

Custom- D Shaped Table with Panel Legs

n/a

144"w x 60"d x 30"h

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple

SHOP DRAWINGS FOR THIS ITEM WILL
BE REVIEWED AND APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT PRIOR TO ORDERING

Panel legs mounted to top with steel L
brackets and have (2) 1-3/8" diameter stell
inserts per panel

Wire management down leg and
underneath top to route power to floor outlet

Top constructed with 1- 1/8” M3 Industrial
Grade 47# density particle board

8 worksurface mounted power and T/D
outlets

Furniture manufacturer to provide cut outs in
furntiure to mount (9) owner provided AV
receptacles, size of AV will be provided by
owner for coordination

Flat Edge Finish: 3mm edge band

Classroom 102, 202

S

35,320.00

Added Alt. not approved

4,195.48 | $ 33,563.84
352.60 | $ 13,046.20
49482 | $ 16,824.04

2,083.20 [ $ 16,665.60




RIC Craig Lee Hall Furniture
Part 3- Lounge Furniture

Date: 5/30/2018

Contact: Meaghan Kennedy
mkennedy@Ilbarch.com

Rhode Island College
Furniture and Equipment for Craig Lee Hall
Part 3- Lounge Furniture
| M. | No. | Item, Description Manufacturer Product Name Model/ Sizel Materials, Finishes, Color Components, Location Qty. Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Catalog # Dimension: Features
Chairs Office Concepts Inc. Sheehans WB Mason
C | 1-A |Lounge Chair Arcadia Nios Mid-Back Lounge Chair Swivel Pedestal 2552 33"w x 31 1/2"d x 32"h x 16 3/4"sh Base: Polished Aluminum #92 Swivel base Lounge 021, 030, 032, 121, C-100A| 24 963.94 | $ 23,13456 | $ 970.68 | $ 23,296.32 | $ 1,110.00 | $ 26,640.00 $ 898.35 | $ 21,560.40
Base Upholstery: Momentum Fringe 1, 221, C-200A-2
Cane added alt. not approved for Part 2,3 & 4
C | 1-B |Lounge Chair Arcadia Nios Mid-Back Lounge Chair Swivel Pedestal 2552 33"w x 31 1/2"d x 32"h x 16 3/4"sh Base: Polished Aluminum #92 Swivel base Lounge 021, 030, 032, 121, C-100A 24 963.94 | $ 23,13456 | $ 970.68 | $ 23,296.32 | $ 970.00 | $ 23,280.00 $ 898.35 | $ 21,560.40
Base Upholstery: Momentum Fringe 1, 221, C-200A-2
Platinum
C | 1-C |Lounge Chair Arcadia Nios Mid-Back Lounge Chair Swivel Pedestal 2552 33"w x 31 1/2"d x 32"h x 16 3/4"sh Base: Polished Aluminum #92 Swivel base Open Office South 049 19 1,04557 | $ 19,865.83 | $ 1,129.32 | $ 21,457.08 | $ 1,185.00 | $ 22,515.00 $ 967.71 | $ 18,386.49
Base Upholstery: Momentum Crossing Open Office- North 060
Colors Sunbeam English Dept Reception 140
Mathematics Dept Recpetion 240
Corridor C-104-1, C-204-2, C-303-
3, C-403-4
Psycology Dept. Reception 340
History Dept. Reception 440
C | 2-A |Pull up Lounge Chair Stylex Nestle NS2182 25 3/4"w x 23 3/4"d x 33"h (18"sh) Base: Standard Powder Coat- Mitered Sled Base Lounge 030 4 786.61 | $ 3,146.44 | $ 816.61 | $ 3,266.44 | $ 760.00 | $ 3,040.00 $ 67258 | $ 2,690.32
Metallic Silver- MS
Upholstery: Momentum Row Blaze
C | 2-B |Pull up Lounge Chair Stylex Nestle NS2182 25 3/4"w x 23 3/4"d x 33"h (18"sh) Base: Standard Powder Coat- Mitered Sled Base Lounge 021, 121, C-100A-1, 221, 28 690.07 | $ 19,321.96 | $ 816.61 | $ 22,865.08 | $ 720.00 | $ 20,160.00 $ 635.29 | $ 17,788.12
Metallic Silver- MS C-200A-2
Upholstery: Luum Textiles Magnify
Telescope
C | 2-C |Pull up Lounge Chair Stylex Nestle NS2182 25 3/4"w x 23 3/4"d x 33"h (18"sh) Base: Standard Powder Coat- Mitered Sled Base Open Office South 049 32 756.86 | $ 2421952 | $ 94119 | $ 30,118.08 | $ 790.00 | $ 25,280.00 $ 700.08 | $ 22,402.56
Metallic Silver- MS Open Office- North 060
Upholstery: Maharam Abacus English Dept Reception 140
Festive Mathematics Dept Recpetion 240
Psycology Dept. Reception 340
History Dept. Reception 440
C | 3-A |Sectional-Two Seat- Lounge Height Stylex Share SH1126-L1-SG-MS-U2 56"w x 28"d x 29"h (16"sh) Base: Standard Powder Coat- lounge height Lounge 030 4 1,716.93 | $ 6,867.72 | $ 2,078.14 | $ 8,312.56 | $ 1,810.00 | $ 7,240.00 $ 1,609.77 | $ 6,439.08
Metallic Silver-MS dual color waterline
Upholstery Main: Maharam Cycle
Auger
Upholstery Below Waterline:
Momentum Beeline Nimbus
C | 3-B |Sectional-Two Seat- Task Height Stylex Share SH112-8-L1-SG-MS-U2 56"w x 28"d x 29"h (18"sh) Base: Standard Powder Coat- task height Lounge 021, 121, C-100A-1, 221, 20 2,008.77 | $ 40,175.40 | $ 2,464.07 | $ 49,281.40 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 42,000.00 $ 1,785.48 | $ 35,709.60
Metallic Silver-MS dual color waterline C-200A-2
Upholstery Main: Momentum Fold
Steel
Upholstery Below Waterline:
Momentum Beeline Nimbus
C | 3-C |Sectional-Two Seat- Task Height Stylex Share SH112-8-L1-SG-MS-U2 56"w x 28"d x 29"h (18"sh) Base: Standard Powder Coat- task height Open Office South 049, Open 16 1,850.48 | $ 29,607.68 | $ 2,305.93 | $ 36,894.88 | $ 2,050.00 | $ 32,800.00 $ 1,735.77 | $ 27,772.32
Metallic Silver-MS dual color waterline Office North 060, English Dept
Upholstery Main: Maharam Reception 140, Mathematics Dept
Parquet Cityscape Recpetion 240, Psycology Dept.
Upholstery Below Waterline: Reception 340, History Dept.
Crew Cork Reception 440
C | 4-A |Sectional-End Cap Narrow-Lounge Heighi Stylex Share Single End Cap- Mono- Color Waterline SH030-6-L1-SG-MS-U1 19"w x 28" d x 16"h Base: Standard Powder Coat- lounge height Lounge 030 8 614.12 | $ 4,912.96 | $ 631.02 | $ 5,048.16 | $ 665.00 | $ 5,320.00 $ 593.37 | $ 4,746.96
Metallic Silver-MS mono color waterline
Upholstery: Momentum Beeline
Nimbus
C | 4-B |Sectional-End Cap Narrow-Task Height |Stylex Share Single End Cap- Mono- Color Waterline SH030-8-L1-SG-MS-U1 19"w x 28" d x 18"h Base: Standard Powder Coat- task height Lounge 021, 121, C-100A-1, C- 20 615.06 | $ 12,301.20 | $ 637.63 | $ 12,752.60 | $ 670.00 | $ 13,400.00 $ 588.44 | $ 11,768.80
Metallic Silver-MS mono color waterline 100B-1, 221, C-200A-2, C-200B-2
Upholstery: Momentum Beeline
Nimbus
C | 4-C |Sectional-End Cap Narrow-Task Height |Stylex Share Single End Cap- Mono- Color Waterline SH030-8-L1-SG-MS-U1 19"w x 28" d x 18"h Base: Standard Powder Coat- task height English Dept Reception 140, 4 701.20 | $ 2,804.80 | $ 763.22 | $ 3,052.88 | $ 745.00 | $ 2,980.00 $ 630.52 | $ 2,522.08
Metallic Silver-MS mono color waterline Mathematics Dept Recpetion 240,
Upholstery: Maharam Crew Cork Psycology Dept. Reception 340,
History Dept. Reception 440
C | 5-A |Sectional-Low Knee Wall- Middle Stylex Share 24" Low Knee Wall- Mono-Color Waterline |SH24-1-M-U1-P10 9"w x 28"d x 24"h Upholstery: Momentum Beeline mono color waterline Lounge 030, 021, 121, C-100A-1, C- 23 730.83 | $ 16,809.09 | $ 761.19 | $ 17,507.37 | $ 785.00 | $ 18,055.00 $ 701.93 | $ 16,144.39
Nimbus 9' power cord 100B-1, 221, C-200A-2, C-200B-2
C | 5-B |Sectional-Low Knee Wall- Left Stylex Share 24" Low Knee Wall- Mono-Color Waterline |SH24-1-L-U1 9"w x 28"d x 24"h Upholstery:Maharam Crew Cork | mono color waterline Open Office South 049, Open 10 549.84 | $ 5,498.40 | $ 677.80 | $ 6,778.00 | $ 665.00 | $ 6,650.00 $ 53353 | $ 5,335.30
Office North 060, English Dept
Reception 140, Mathematics Dept
Recpetion 240, Psycology Dept.
Reception 340, History Dept.
Reception 440
C | 5-C |Sectional-Low Knee Wall-Right Stylex Share 24" Low Knee Wall- Mono-Color Waterline |SH24-1-R-U1 9"w x 28"d x 24"h Upholstery:Maharam Crew Cork | mono color waterline Open Office South 049, Open 4 549.78 | $ 2,199.12 | $ 677.80 | $ 2,711.20 | $ 670.00 | $ 2,680.00 $ 535.85 | $ 2,143.40
Office North 060
C| 6 |Stool Hightower FourCast Line High Bar Stool FC13900 213/4"wx 19 1/4"d x 38 1/2"h x Polyamide Seat: Olive (V) Lounge 030, 032 10 399.22 | $ 3,992.20 | $ 401.16 | $ 4,011.60 | $ 480.00 | $ 4,800.00 $ 371.67 | $ 3,716.70
25"sh Base: Chrome
C| 7 |Café Chair Landscape Forms Parc Centre Chair without Arms 21"w x 22"d x 33"h Powder coated Metal: Titanium Lounge 032 28 44424 | $ 12,438.72 | $ 433.35 | $ 12,133.80 | $ 455.00 | $ 12,740.00 $ 44130 | $ 12,356.40
C| 12 |Sectional-One Seat - task height Stylex Share Single Seater- Dual-Color Waterline SH1118-L1-SG-MS-U2 28"w x 28"d x 29"h (18"sh) Base: Standard Powder Coat- task height Open Office North 060 2 1,21811 | $ 2,436.22 | $ 1,380.00 | $ 2,760.00 | $ 1,290.00 | $ 2,580.00 $ 1,071.73 | $ 2,143.46
Metallic Silver-MS dual color waterline
Upholstery Main: Maharam
Parquet Cityscape
Upholstery Below Waterline:
hi Crew-Cork
C| 13 |Sectional-90 Corner- task height Stylex Share 90 Degree Corner- Dual-Color Waterline ~ |SH-1228-L1-SG-MS-U2 56"w x 28"d x 29"h (18"sh) Base: Standard Powder Coat- task height Open Office North 060, English 5 2,939.76 | $ 14,698.80 | $ 3,488.14 | $ 17,440.70 | $ 3,060.00 | $ 15,300.00 $ 2,591.37 | $ 12,956.85
Metallic Silver-MS dual color waterline Dept Reception 140, Mathematics
Upholstery Main: Maharam Dept Recpetion 240, Psycology
Parquet Cityscape Dept. Reception 340, History Dept.
Upholstery Below Waterline: Reception 440
Maharam Crew-Cork
T| 1 |Lounge Table Hightower Ruby Side Table- Round Top HT6580 18"diameter x 18"h Premium Powder Coat Color: Lounge 030, 032, 021, 121, C- 37 373.26 | $ 13,810.62 | $ 362.20 | $ 13,401.40 | $ 405.00 | $ 14,985.00 $ 359.97 | $ 13,318.89
Grey 100A-1, C-100B-1, 221, C-220A-2,
C200B-2
Open Office-North 060,
Corridor C-104-1, C-204-2, C-303-
3, C-403-4
English Dept Reception 140, Math
Dept Reception 240, Psychology
Dept Reception 340, History Dept
Reception 440
T 3 |Café Table Landscape Forms Parc Centre 24" round x 30"h Powder coated Metal: Titanium Surface Mounted Lounge 032 14 807.06 | $ 11,298.84 | $ 789.46 | $ 11,052.44 | $ 845.00 | $ 11,830.00 $ 786.95 | $ 11,017.30




RIC Craig Lee Hall Furniture
Part 3- Lounge Furniture

=]

Lounge Meeting Table- Coffee Table

Keilhauer

Talk- Large Hexagonal Table Lounge Height

8727

49"w x 29.25"d x 25.25"h

Black Laminate top- 606
Black Base

.75" thick plastic laminate w/
MDF core, reversed bevel
edge painted

Base- Steel with .5" thick
rubber glides

Lounge 030

1,297.78

5,191.12

$

1,266.13

$

5,064.52

1335

5,340.00

Date: 5/30/2018

Contact: Meaghan Kennedy
mkennedy@Ilbarch.com

$

1,179.47 | $

4,717.88



RIC Craig Lee Hall Furniture
Part 4- Office Furniture

Date: 5/30/2018

Contact: Meaghan Kennedy

mkennedy@Ilbarch.com

Rhode Island College
Furniture and Equipment for Craig Lee Hall
Part 4- Office Furniture
MK | No. | Item, Description Manufacturer Product Name Model/ Sizel Materials, Finishes, Color Components, Location Q. Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Catalog # D Features
Chairs Correctional Industry Sheehans Office Concepts Inc. AFD Contract Furniture WB Mason
C 8 Task Chair Alisteel Access Work Chair EBW-MW-2-0-BLACK-BLACK- 26"w x 25"d x 37 3/4-42 1/4"h Frame Color: Black Upholstered seat Offices throughout 253.66 | $ 38,556.32
AM10 Base: Black Mesh back
Mesh: Access Mesh AM10 Basic Synchro-Multi-
Seat Upholstery: Hotspot- Pumice |adjustable
Armrests- Height and Width
Adjustable
Pneumatic Cylinder
Casters
added alt. not approved for Part 2,3 & 4
C| 8-ALT [Task Chair- ALTERNATE Steelcase Series 1 435A00 18-1/2 d x 23-1/2-27" w x36-1/2 -41- |ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO BE Offices throughout 152
14h SELECTED AND APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT AND RIC POST BID
C| 8-ALT [Task Chair- ALTERNATE 9to 5 Seating Neo 3160 3160-W1-A23-PGG-M32-B-BA9G-(| 26"w x 25"d x 37 3/4-42 1/4"h ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO BE Offices throughout 152 23333 | $ 35,466.16
SELECTED AND APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT AND RIC POST BID
290[ $ 44,080.00
C | 8-ALT [Task Chair- ALTERNATE KI/OEI Oath Task Chair OHB84QB/NFR/OMBL/GRP2 27.5"W x 26"D x 39.5-44"H ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO BE Offices throughout 152 265.00 | $ 40,280.00
SELECTED AND APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT AND RIC POST BID
Cc 10 |Office Guest Chairs Allsteel Inspire Sled Base Stack Chair INSL-NA-NO-4-N-PR6-BU 21 1/4"w x 22 3/4"d x 34"h x 18 1/4"sh|Frame Finish: Silver PR6 Poly seat and back Offices throughout 204 160.70 | $ 32,782.80
Polymer Shell Color: Surf BU Armless
No glides
C | 10- ALT |Office Guest Chairs- ALTERNATE Siton It Lumin, Wire Rod Frame, Plastic 1011FT2.PS 21x23-3/4dx32-1/2h ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO BE Offices throughout 204
Seat & Back, Armless SELECTED AND APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT AND RIC POST BID
136[ $ 27,744.00
C | 10- ALT |Office Guest Chairs- ALTERNATE Highmark Ergo Intu 1412CF 21x23-3/4dx32-1/2h ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO BE Offices throughout 204
SELECTED AND APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT AND RIC POST BID
71.48 14581.92
C | 10- ALT |Office Guest Chairs- ALTERNATE KI/OEI Strive Sled-Base Stack Chair SSNAP/SX/PSPING/NFR 20.25"W x 21.25"D x 33.25"H ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO BE Offices throughout 204 $ 22,440.00
SELECTED AND APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT AND RIC POST BID
110.00
Tables/Surfaces
T 2 Round Study Table Allsteel Merge Round Table, knife edge, Disc Base ALN36RND 36"diameter x 30" h Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple |Laminate Top Lounge 021, 030, 121, 221 10 477.66 | $ 4,776.60
ABD26F Base: Black/ Textured Silver Knife Edge Open Office South 049, Psychology Labs
MDB-CW. 009,
T | 2-ALT |Round Study Table- ALTERNATE ERG International Corsa COR36D 36" dia with knife edge ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Lounge 021, 030, 121, 221 10
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED Open Office South 049, Psychology Labs
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST 009,
BID 437 4370
T | 2-ALT |Round Study Table- ALTERNATE Berco Discus 36" Round DSX-36-RND-L 36" dia with knife edge ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Lounge 021, 030, 121, 221 10
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED Open Office South 049, Psychology Labs
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST 009,
BID 415( S 4,150.00
T | 2-ALT |Round Study Table- ALTERNATE KI/OEI Athens AH4 Disc Base Table AH3R3629P/KN/EKM/SX/LKM 36"Diam x 29"H ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Lounge 021, 030, 121, 221 10 368| $ 3,680.00
(S18197381) BE SELECTED AND APPROVED Open Office South 049, Psychology Labs
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST 009,
BID
T 4 Office Table Alisteel Merge Special M2773385 36"w x 20"d x 29 1/2"h Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple |lockable casters Offices throughout 98 21459 | $ 21,029.82
Base: Black/ Textured Silver Flat Edge
X Base with Casters
T | 4-ALT |Office Table- ALTERNATE ERG International Drake, DRH36S 36" square table with wheels ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Offices throughout 98
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID 420] $ 41,160.00 424.79 41629.42
T 5 Office Desk Allsteel Stride T52478S 78"w x 24"d x 29 1/2"h Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple |Laminate Top Flat Edge with |Offices throughout 98 22570 | $ 22,118.60
Base: Loft Grommets
Plastic Grommet
Fixed Post Support Legs
T | 5-ALT |Office Desk- ALTERNATE Universal top and supports us2478 78"w x 24"d x 29 1/2"h ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO  [Laminate Top Flat Edge with |Offices throughout 98 214.48 | $ 21,019.04
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED (Grommets
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST  |Plastic Grommet
BID Fixed Post Support Legs
T | 5-ALT |Office Desk- ALTERNATE Berco 24"x84 (78)" Rect. Top 2484-REC-LAM (Top) , 6-R7L (Leg{24"x84 (78)" Rect. Top ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Laminate Top Flat Edge with |Offices throughout 98
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED |Grommets
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST  |Plastic Grommet
BID Fixed Post Support Legs 485[$ 47,530.00
T | 5-ALT |Office Desk- ALTERNATE KI/OEI Connection Zone Desk CZBWR24781NM- 24"D x 78"W x 29"H ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO  [Laminate Top Flat Edge with |Offices throughout 98 480.00 | $ 47,040.00
74P/EKM/LKM/GLG BE SELECTED AND APPROVED (Grommets
CZBSS247296/F/LG/GCL BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST  |Plastic Grommet
BID Fixed Post Support Legs
T 6 Meeting Table- Square Allsteel Merge Square Table, knife edge, Disc Base ALN36SQR 36"w x 36"d x 29 1/2"h Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple |Laminate Top Open Office-North 060, Observe 009J 29 396.45 | $ 11,497.05
ABD26F Base: Black/ Textured Silver Knife Edge and 009F
Lounge C-100A-1, C-100B-1, C-200A-2,
C-200B-2
Dept Chair Office 142, 242, 342, 442
English Dept Reception 140,Math Dept
Reception 240, Psychology Dept
Reception 340, History Dept Reception
440
T | 6-ALT |Meeting Table-Square -ALTERNATE ERG International Corsa CORO36DT 36" diameter ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Open Office-North 060, Observe 0093 29 482.69 13998.01
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED and 009F
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST Lounge C-100A-1, C-100B-1, C-200A-2,
BID C-200B-2
Dept Chair Office 142, 242, 342, 442
English Dept Reception 140,Math Dept
Reception 240, Psychology Dept
Reception 340, History Dept Reception
440
T | 6-ALT |Meeting Table-Square -ALTERNATE Berco Discus 36"x36" Square DSX-3636-SQR 36" diameter ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Open Office-North 060, Observe 009J 29
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED and 009F
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST Lounge C-100A-1, C-100B-1, C-200A-2,
BID C-200B-2
Dept Chair Office 142, 242, 342, 442
English Dept Reception 140,Math Dept
Reception 240, Psychology Dept
Reception 340, History Dept Reception
440 470| $ 13,630.00
T | 6-ALT |Meeting Table-Square -ALTERNATE KI/OEI Athens AH4 Disc Base Table AH3S3629P/74P/EKM/SX/LKM 36"W x 36"D x 29"H ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Open Office-North 060, Observe 009J 29 424.00 | $ 12,296.00
(518197382) BE SELECTED AND APPROVED and 009F
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST Lounge C-100A-1, C-100B-1, C-200A-2,
BID C-200B-2
Dept Chair Office 142, 242, 342, 442
English Dept Reception 140,Math Dept
Reception 240, Psychology Dept
Reception 340, History Dept Reception
440
T 7 |Conference Room Table - 9x6 Surfaceworks Vector Table CNV.R.CUST.72108.PK4 108"w x 72"d x 29 1/2'h Laminate Top/Edge:Clear Maple | SHOP DRAWINGS FOR Conference Room 068, 059 2 3850/ § 7,700.00 302410 | $ 6,048.20




RIC Craig Lee Hall Furniture
Part 4- Office Furniture

T| 7-ALT [Conference Room Table - 9x6- ALTERNATE

ERG International

Drake,

DR72108

72x108 table with 3 bases

ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID

SHOP DRAWINGS FOR
THIS ITEM WILL BE
REVIEWED AND
APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT PRIOR TO
ORDERING

2 piece top with field joint
Laminate Top

Knife Edge

Medium T Table Base

2 power units center/middle:
(1) M2X 4 power, 4 open
data (1) M2X 4 power, 1
Dual USB, 3 open data

Conference Room 068, 059

$

$

6,089.96

Date: 5/30/2018
Contact: Meaghan Kennedy
mkennedy@Ilbarch.com

T 8 Conference Room Table- 10ft

Surfaceworks

Vector Table

CNV.R.42120.PK4

120"w x 42"d x 29 1/2"h

Laminate Top/Edge:Clear Maple
21

Base: Innertone Light 387

SHOP DRAWINGS FOR
THIS ITEM WILL BE
REVIEWED AND
APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT PRIOR TO
ORDERING

PK4 Edge

2 power units center/middle:
(1) M2X 4 power, 4 open
data (1) M2X 4 power, 1
Dual USB, 3 open data

Conference Room 154, 254, 354, 454

T| 8-ALT [Conference Room Table- 10ft- ALTERNATE

ERG International

Drake

DR42120

120"w x 42"d x 29 1/2"h

ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID

SHOP DRAWINGS FOR
THIS ITEM WILL BE
REVIEWED AND
APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT PRIOR TO
ORDERING

PK4 Edge

2 power units center/middle:
(1) M2X 4 power, 4 open
data (1) M2X 4 power, 1
Dual USB, 3 open data

Conference Room 154, 254, 354, 454

$

$

14,874.32

T 9 Conference Room Table- 9ft

Surfaceworks

Vector Table

108"w x 42"d x 29 1/2"h

Laminate Top/Edge:Clear Maple
21

Base: Innertone Light 387

SHOP DRAWINGS FOR
THIS ITEM WILL BE
REVIEWED AND
APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT PRIOR TO
ORDERING

PK4 Edge

2 power units center/middle:
(1) M2X 4 power, 4 open
data (1) M2X 4 power, 1
Dual USB, 3 open data

Study Room 344, 444, 445

T| 9-ALT [Conference Room Table- 9ft- ALTERNATE

ERG International

Drake

DR108x42

108"w x 42"d x 29 1/2"h

ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID

SHOP DRAWINGS FOR
THIS ITEM WILL BE
REVIEWED AND
APPROVED BY
ARCHITECT PRIOR TO
ORDERING

PK4 Edge

2 power units center/middle:
(1) M2X 4 power, 4 open
data (1) M2X 4 power, 1
Dual USB, 3 open data

Study Room 344, 444, 445

$

$

8,024.79

T 11 Dept. Head Desk- 7ft

Allsteel

Stride

TT629SC
Z5SC84
T624FB
Z6PL29FL
Z6PL29FP
T52484S
SPLA-WSMG

84"w x 24"d x 29 1/2"h with 36"w x
24"d x 29 1/2" rounded end return

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple
Base: Loft

Flat Edge Laminate with
Grommets

Support Column

Fixed Post Support Legs

Dept Chair Office 142, 242, 342, 442

T | 11- ALT | Dept. Head Desk- 7ft- ALTERNATE

Steelcase

Universal top and supports

us2484

84"w x 24"d x 29 1/2"h with 36"w x
24"d x 29 1/2" rounded end return

ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID

Flat Edge Laminate with
Grommets

Support Column

Fixed Post Support Legs

T | 11- ALT | Dept. Head Desk- 7ft- ALTERNATE

Berco

Desk Configuration

(1) 2484-REC-LAM 2, (1) 2448-HRI]

84"w x 24"d x 29 1/2"h with 36"w x
24"d x 29 1/2" rounded end return

ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID

Dept Chair Office 142, 242, 342, 442

$

2,110.76

Flat Edge Laminate with
Grommets

Support Column

Fixed Post Support Legs

Dept Chair Office 142, 242, 342, 442

T 14 |Admin Office Desks

Allsteel

Stride

9120R12018
9120R10824
T612FB
Z5SC84
Z6PL29FL
Z6PL29FR

L shaped desk 107"w x 24"d x 29
1/2"h +123"wx20"d x 29 1/2"h

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple
Base: Loft

Laminate desk with Flat Edge|
Laminate with Grommets
Fixed Post Support Legs

Admin Office 141, 241, 341, 441

T | 14- ALT [Admin Office Desks- ALTERNATE

Universal top and supports

L shaped desk 107"w x 24"d x 29
1/2"h +123"wx 20"d x 29 1/2"h

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple
Base: Loft

Laminate desk with Flat Edge|
Laminate with Grommets
Fixed Post Support Legs

Admin Office 141, 241, 341, 441

$

2,204.80

T | 14- ALT [Admin Office Desks- ALTERNATE

Berco

Desk Configuration

L shaped desk 107"w x 24"d x 29
1/2"h +123"wx 20"d x 29 1/2"h

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple
Base: Loft

Laminate desk with Flat Edge
Laminate with Grommets
Fixed Post Support Legs

Admin Office 141, 241, 341, 441

T 15  |Adjunct Desks

Allsteel

Stride

832442M
Z6PL29FL
Z6PL29FR

42"w x 24"d x 29 1/2"h

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple
Base: Loft

Laminate Top Flat Edge with
Grommets

Plastic Grommet

Fixed Post Support Legs

Adjunct Offices 151, 251, 351, 451

23

T | 15- ALT |Adjunct Desks- ALTERNATE

Steelcase

Universal top and supports

42"w x 24"d x 29 1/2"h

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple
Base: Loft

Laminate Top Flat Edge with
Grommets

Plastic Grommet

Fixed Post Support Legs

T | 15- ALT |Adjunct Desks- ALTERNATE

Berco

Desk with Legs

2442-REC-LAM 24"x42" Rect. Top,

42"w x 24"d x 29 1/2"h

Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple
Base: Loft

Adjunct Offices 151, 251, 351, 451

23

5,181.90

$ 9,871.28
$ 7,807.02
$ 1,771.28
$ 2,289.12
$ 6,108.57

Laminate Top Flat Edge with
Grommets
Plastic Grommet

Fixed Post Support Legs

Adjunct Offices 151, 251, 351, 451

23
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Date: 5/30/2018

Contact: Meaghan Kennedy

mkennedy@Ilbarch.com

BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID

T 16  |Workstations Alisteel Stride 42S-F124 87" x 78" overall Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple | Front transaction counter Open Office North and South 060, 049 2
42S-F136 42"h panels Storage and Panel Trim finish: Loft|Footed panels with flat top
42S-F160 Panel Fabric: Appoint Nimbus trim
Z324PT BBF Ped File
34211 42"h Tower Lateral FF Unit
Z342PEF
Z342PL
Z372PT
Z384PT
Z3UCON3
Z6LB
ZDHC1524RGL
ZDT422424LFL
T52436S
T52472S8
T6BK
T6CB24R
Z51572S
T | 16- ALT |Workstations- ALTERNATE Kimball Nararate Workstation 53KE2415PUBBFL 87" x 78" overall ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Front transaction counter Open Office North and South 060, 049 2
PRIORITY,PEDESTAL,UNDERSU [42"h panels BE SELECTED AND APPROVED [Footed panels with flat top
RFACE,BBF,LAMINATE, BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST  |trim
53KE2442VWHRFFFL BID BBF Ped File
PRIORITY,STORAGE/WARDROB 42"h Tower Lateral FF Unit
E,RIGHT,FF,FINISHED
BK,LAMINATE, PANELS,
TRANSACTION TOP,
SS1572WSTCLL
FOOTPRINT,15DX72W,SURFAC
E,13/16T, TRANS COUNTER,LAM
(TFL), SS2436WSSLL3
FOOTPRINT,24DX36W,SURFAC
E,13/16T,STR,LAM(TFL),WIRE
MGR PF, SS2472WSSLL3
FOOTPRINT,24DX72W,SURFAC
E,13/16,STR,LAM(TFL),WIRE
MGR PF
2845) $ 5,690.00
T | 16- ALT |Workstations- ALTERNATE Answer Thin trim panels, universal tops and | 87" x 78" overall ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Front transaction counter Open Office North and South 060, 049 2 $ 243210 | $ 4,864.20
42"h panels BE SELECTED AND APPROVED |Footed panels with flat top
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST  |trim
BID BBF Ped File
42"h Tower Lateral FF Unit
T 18 Meeting Table- Square Alisteel Merge Square Table, knife edge, Disc Base ALN42SQR 42"'wx 42"d x 29 1/2"h Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple |Laminate Top 5
ABD26F Base: Black/ Textured Silver Knife Edge Meeting Room 165, 265, 365, 465
Tutoring and Testing 153
T | 18-ALT |Meeting Table- Square- ALTERNATE ERG International Corsa COR42SQ 42"w x 42"d x 29 1/2"h ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO 5
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED Meeting Room 165, 265, 365, 465
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST Tutoring and Testing 153
BID 650.07 3250.35
T | 18-ALT [Meeting Table- Square- ALTERNATE Berco Discus 42"x42" Square DSX-4242-SQR- LAM 42"'wx42'd x 29 1/2"h ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO 5
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED Meeting Room 165, 265, 365, 465
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST Tutoring and Testing 153
BID 520) $ 2,600.00
T | 18-ALT |Meeting Table- Square- ALTERNATE KI/OEI Athens AH4 Disc Base Table AH4S4229P-T4P/EKM/SX/LKM 42"'D x 42"W x 29"H ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO 5 474.00 | $ 2,370.00
(518197386) BE SELECTED AND APPROVED Meeting Room 165, 265, 365, 465
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST Tutoring and Testing 153
BID
T 19  |Office Desk Allsteel Stride T52472S 72"'w x24"d x 29 1/2"h Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple |Laminate Top Flat Edge with |Physchology Labs 6
Base: Loft Grommets
Plastic Grommet
Fixed Post Support Legs
T | 19- ALT |Office Desk- ALTERNATE Universal tops and supports 72"w x 24"d x 29 1/2"h Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple |Laminate Top Flat Edge with |Physchology Labs 6 $ 21191 | $ 1,271.46
Base: Loft Grommets
Plastic Grommet
Fixed Post Support Legs
T | 19- ALT |Office Desk- ALTERNATE Berco Desk with Post Legs 2472-REC-LAM 24"x72" Rect. Top, [ 72"w x 24"d x 29 1/2"h Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple |Laminate Top Flat Edge with | Physchology Labs 6
6-R7L Reese Base Base: Loft Grommets
Plastic Grommet
Fixed Post Support Legs 3731 $ 2,238.00
T | 19- ALT |Office Desk- ALTERNATE KI/OEI Connection Zone Desk CZBWR24721NM- 24"D x72"W x 29"H Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple |Laminate Top Flat Edge with |Physchology Labs 6 446.00 | $ 2,676.00
T4P/EKM/LKM/GLG Base: Loft Grommets
CZBSS244872/FILGIGCL Plastic Grommet
Fixed Post Support Legs
T 20  |Physchology Testing Station HON Empower HH871272 72"'w x 48"'d x 29 1/2" Laminate Top/Edge: Natural Maple |Laminate Top Flat Edge Lab 1 009A 1
HH871501 20'h privacy screens Base: Loft Fixed Legs
HH871502 Screens: Frosted Glass center Center Wire Trough
HMP144 screen, Fabric side screen- Appoint|Duplex Power per station fed
HMPDFS2420 Nimbus to one plug and play
HMPEL4828 connection at wall
HMPFG7220 Fabric Side Screens
HMPTROUGH7 Frosted Glass center screen
HMPUB272
HWR2472PN 2610[ $ 2,610.00
T | 20- ALT [Physchology Testing Station- ALTERNATE Frame 1 72"'w x 48'd x 29 1/2" ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO  [Laminate Top Flat Edge Lab 1 009A 1 $ 2,665.44 | $ 2,665.44
20'h privacy screens BE SELECTED AND APPROVED |[Fixed Legs
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST  [Center Wire Trough
BID Duplex Power per station fed
to one plug and play
connection at wall
Fabric Side Screens
Frosted Glass center screen
S 1 Pedestal File Allsteel Essentials Support Pedestal BBF PF197-203B 18"w x 20"d x 28"h Metal Color: Loft Offices throughout 124
S| 1-ALT |Pedestal File- ALTERNATE Universal Storage RPF2427af 15" wx 22-5/8"d x 27" h ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Offices throughout 124 $ 176.57 | $ 21,894.68
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID
S| 1-ALT |Pedestal File- ALTERNATE Metal Arc Ped BBF PWS27h22d-BBF 15w x 22d supporting ped ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Offices throughout 124 180
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID $ 22,320.00
S| 1-ALT |Pedestal File- ALTERNATE ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Offices throughout 124 177.00 | $ 21,948.00
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
KIOEI U-Series 20" BBF Support Ped VIN/1520WBBF/LG/NB/KS/USP 15"W x 17.75"D x 27.75"H BID
S 2 Lateral File- 4 drawer Allsteel Essentials Lateral File ELF430N 30"w x 20"d x 54"h Metal Color: Loft 4 drawers Offices throughout 106
S| 2-ALT |Lateral File- 4 drawer- ALTERNATE Universal Storage RLF18304f 18" d x 30" w x 4 drawer ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Offices throughout 106 $ 54229 | $ 57,482.74
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID
S| 2-ALT [Lateral File- 4 drawer- ALTERNATE Metal Arc 4 Drawer Lateral File OLF04h30w 51.5h x 30w x 18d ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Offices throughout 106 430
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID $ 45,580.00
S| 2-ALT |Lateral File- 4 drawer- ALTERNATE KI/OEI U-Series 30" 4-Drw Lat File VL304D/LG/CBW/KS/USP 30"W x 18"D x 50"H ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Offices throughout 106 534.00 | $ 56,604.00
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID
S 3 Lateral File- 2 drawer Allsteel Essentials Lateral File ELF230N 30"w x 20"d x 27 1/4"h Metal Color: Loft 2 drawers Offices throughout 12
S| 3-ALT |Lateral File- 2 drawer- ALTERNATE Universal Storage RLF18302F 18" d x 30" w x 2 drawer ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Offices throughout 12 $ 25567 | $ 3,068.04

2,695.96 | $ 5,391.92
465.66 | $ 2,328.30
257.44 | $ 1,544.64

2,695.83 | $ 2,695.83
13933 | $ 17,276.92
38411 | $ 40,715.66
23556 | $ 2,826.72
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Date: 5/30/2018
Contact: Meaghan Kennedy
mkennedy@Ilbarch.com

S| 3-ALT |Lateral File- 2 drawer- ALTERNATE Metal Arc 2 Drawer OLF02h30w 27.5h x 30w x 18d ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Offices throughout 12 270
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID 3,240.00
S| 3-ALT |Lateral File- 2 drawer- ALTERNATE KI/OEI U-Series 30" 2-Drw Lat File VL302D/LG/CBW/KS/USP 30"W x 18"D x 27"H ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO Offices throughout 12 371.00 | $ 4,452.00
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
BID
S 4 Bookcases Allsteel Essentials Bookcase EBC72 34 1/2'wx 12 5/8"d x 71"h Metal Color: Loft 5 shelves Offices throughout 208
S| 4-ALT |Bookcases- ALTERNATE ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO |5 shelves Offices throughout 208 388.00 | $ 80,704.00 565 $ 24021 | $ 49,963.68
BE SELECTED AND APPROVED
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST
KI/OEI 700-Series 36"W 5-High Bookcase CIB-36630-12/LG 36'W x 12D x 66'H BID 117,520.00
S 5 Lockers Ki Connection Zone Steel Personal Locker, Standard (CZSLKSTD3060 30"w x 63 3/4"h Metal Color: Cool Grey CG 30" wide units Adjunct Offices 151, 251, 351, 451 11 1,108.00 | $ 12,188.00 1285 added alt. not approved
2x4 w/ Standard Lock steel construction with steel  |Office 146
doors
lockers are individually keyed
U series pull
14,135.00
S 6 Keyboard Trays ESI Ergonomic Solutions Solution 2CC Keyboard Platform PL003-25 25"wx10.5"d black Offices throughout 152 155.00 | $ 23,560.00 205 17779 | $ 27,024.08
AA360 31,160.00

24143 | $ 50,217.44
1,127.39 | $ 12,401.29
16229 | $ 24,668.08




RIC Craig Lee Hall Furniture
Part 5- Classroom Desk

Rhode Island College

Date: 5/30/2018
Contact: Meaghan Kennedy
mkennedy@I|lbarch.com

Furniture and Equipment for Craig Lee Hall
Part 5- Classroom Desk
Mk.[  No. Item, Description Manufacturer Product Name Sizel Materials, Finishes, Color Components, Location Unit Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Dimensions Features
Chairs AFD Contract Furniture WB Mason
C 14  |Modern Desk Steelcase Node w/ Tripod Base and Personal Work surface 480120 27 1/4"-32 3/4"w x 25"-31 1/2"d x Poly shell: 6259 Midnight Cup holder Classrooms 002, 018, 100, 103-108, 832 $ 336.77 | $
35"h (18 1/4" sh) Tripod Base color: 6249 Platinum | Tablet stand 111, 112, 118, 122, 200, 203, 204, 206-
Metal color: 4799 Platinum Metallic | Casters 208, 212, 218, 222
Work surface color: 6249 Platinum
C | 14-ALT |Modern Desk- ALTERNATE Haskel Ethos ESiC2 27 1/4"-32 3/4"w x 25"-31 1/2"d x ALL ALTERNATE FINISHES TO |Cup holder Classrooms 002, 018, 100, 103-108, 832 $ 260.00 | $ 216,320.00
35"h (18 1/4" sh) BE SELECTED AND APPROVED | Tablet stand 111, 112, 118, 122, 200, 203, 204, 206-
BY ARCHITECT AND RIC POST |Casters 208, 212, 218, 222
BID
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