STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Department of Administration

DIVISION OF PURCHASES Tel: (401) 574-8100
One Capitol Hill Fax: (401) 574-8387
Providence, R1 02908-5855 Website: www.purchasing.ri.gov

CONTRACT USER GUIDE
AMMUNITION
MASTER PRICE AGREEMENT (“MPA”) #31

BID SOLICITATION # 7550559
TERM: 6/1/2016 — 7/31/2017 with one six-month renewal option
Available at the sole discretion of the State.

BACKGROUND:
No spend caps have been included based on the various quantities of ammunition required.
Deliveries are made as requested on a per order basis.

WHO CAN USE THIS CONTRACT:
STATEWIDE APPLICABILITY - Political Subdivisions (cities, towns, schools, quasi-

public agencies), as authorized by law, may participate in this Agreement. All ordering and
billing shall be between the vendor and the political subdivision (only).

VENDOR AWARDS CONTACT INFORMATION:

Purchase Order # 3472493

Vendor Name: EAGLE POINT GUN/TJ MORRIS & SON
Account
Contact Name: Thomas Morris 111
Tel: (856) 848-6945
Email: majortjmorrisiii@comcast.net

Purchase Order # 3472491

Vendor Name: Kiesler Police Supply Inc.
Account
Contact Name: Crystal Laasanen
Tel: (800) 444-2950
Email: crystal@kiesler.com

Purchase Order # 3472490

Vendor Name: International Cartridge Corp.
Account
Contact Name: Michael J. Hoskavich
Tel: (814) 938-6820

Email: mikeh@iccammo.com



STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Department of Administration

DIVISION OF PURCHASES Tel: (401) 574-8100
One Capitol Hill Fax: (401) 574-8387
Providence, R1 02908-5855 Website: www.purchasing.ri.gov

Purchase Order # 3479376

Vendor Name: George J. Petronis Enterprises Inc.
Account
Contact Name: Joe Fiorillo
Tel: (609) 859-1997
Email: logistics@policeammo.com

DIVISION OF PURCHASES CONTACT:
Name: J. Anthony Cowell, Jr.

Title:  Buyer Il

Tel: (401) 574-8114

Email: John.Cowell@purchasing.ri.gov



’

Note: a Quote Price reporting the denomination .001, .0001 and .00001 signifies “No bid”

Award RFQ: AMMUNITION - MPA #31

RFQ 75505859

RFQ Currency USD

Close Date 6/19/2016 13:30

Quotes Recslved
Active Quotes
Shorllisted Quotes

4
4
4

Invited Suppliers 20
Intent to Participate 0
Responded 4

Line Summary

LI . : “ Suppll L ik | ote.Pr el
T MPA-33 611716 - 7731117 - MILTEC, 8 O GEORGE JPETRONIS — [Case 5 T ~=0.00001] 2547229
31 611176 - 713117 - .8 TERNATIONAL CARTRID|Case 5 2 0.0007 2547206

3 6- - .8 [ER POLICE SUPPLY[Case 5 3 0.0001 2547207
[TMPA-31 611716 - 7731117 - MILTEC, 8 O EAGLE POINT GUN Case 5 q 0.0007 2547208
2 31 611716 - 713117 - [GEORGE JPETRONIS_ [Each 75 1 0.00001 2547229
2 - - - TERNATIONAL CARTRID|Each 75 p 0.0001 2547200
2 = 7T - KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Each 75]- 3 G.07 2547207}
2 316 = - [EAGLE POINT GUN Each 75 ey 7.05 2547208|
- G- 71317 - GEORGE J PETRONIS _ [Each 50 1 0.00007 2547229

3 316 - 7317 - INTERNATIONAL CARTRIDEach 50 7 0.0001 2547206
-3 G- - [KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY |Each 50 3 0.91 2547207

-31 6/1116 - 7 - [EAGLE POINT GUN Each 50 q T05] 2547208

31 61116 - - [GEORGE J PETRONIS Each 75 T 0.00001 2547229

% 3T 616 - 73107 - INTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Each 75 Z 0.0007 2547206
316 =737 - [KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY |Each 75 3 114 2547207

= 6- - [EAGLE POINT GUN Fach 75 ! 13 2547208
[EMPA-3T 61716 - 7131137 - CLEANING P GEORGE J PETRONIS Package [ bl 0.00001 2547229
- 6- 713117 - TERNATIONAL CARTRIDPackage [ 7 0.0001 2547206
IEMPA-3T 613716 - 7131717 - CLEANING P, EAGLE POINT GUN Package 3 3 0.8 2547208
5 31 6/1716 - - GP KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Package 6 q 76 2547207 |
[6 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131717 - CLEANING Fj GEORGE J PETRONIS Package 30 i} 0.00001 2547229
3 =31 616 - 7113117 - G P TNTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Package 2 0.0001 2547206
[ETPA-3T 611776 - 7131717 - CLEANING P| EAGLE POINT GUN Package 30 3 0.9 2547208
6 MPA-31 61716 - 7731717 - CLEANING P KIESCER POLICE SUPPLY |[Package 30 [ 9.12 2547207
31 6, T - GECRGE JPETRONIS Package 25 T 0.00001 2547220

7 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - CLEANING P TNTERNATIONAL CARTRID{Package 75 2 0.0001 2547206
(7 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - CLEANING P RIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Package — 25 3 0.0001 2547207
[7MPA3T 611716 - 7731717 - CLEANING P EAGLE POINT GUN Package 25 7 0.0001 2547208
] 31 6, ~7B31A7 - ) GEORGE JPETRONIS Box 14 i 0.00001 2647220
8 MIPA-31 6/1/16 - 7131117 - EAR PLUGS, INTERNATIONAL CARTRIDBox 17 2 0.0001 2547205
8 MPA-31 611716 - 7131717 - EAR PLUGS, KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Box 14 3 0.0001 2547207
- 6-7) = X EAGLE POINT GUN Box 14 3 0.0007 2547208

9 -3 - - Carlon [ T 0.00001 2547229
) 3T 6/116 - 713 = Carton E) 2 0.0001 2547206
9 -31 6/1716 - 713 - [KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Carton 8 3 0.0001 2547207
316 ~713 - [EAGLE POINT GUN Carton ) £l 54 2547208

[10 MPA-3T 611776 - 7/31717 - NO. 8 SOLV GEORGE JPETRONIS —_ [Quart 3 T 0.00001 2647220
0 3 - - uart 5 2 0.0001 2547206




Note: a Quote Price reporting the denomination .001, .0001 and .00001 signifies “No bid”

10 MPA-3T6/1716 - 7131717 - NO. 9 SOLV
[T0 MPA-3T 671716 - 7133717 - NO. 9 SOLV!

RIESLER POLICE SUPPLY[Quarl

3 10.68] 2547207

- = TNO. EAGLE POINT GUN Quart 7 14] 2547208

7T MPA-31 671716 - 7131717 - ROUNDS B GEORGE JPETRONIS __ |Thousand 1 0.00001 2547229
T MPA-31 6/1/16 - 7131717 - ROUNDS B INTERNATIONAL CAR TRID{ Thousand 2 0.0001 2547206
= p - [ESTER POLICE SUPPLY [Thousand 3 3448 2547207

316 = - EAGLE POINT GUN Thousand Z 360.5|  2547208]

[T2 MPA-31 671116 - 7734117 - ROUNDS 40 GEORGE JPETRONIS ~_ [Thousand 1 0.00001 2547229
2 MPA-31 611716 - 7731117 - ROUNDS 40 Thousand 2 0.0001 2547206
12 MPA-3T 611716 - 713117 - ROUNDS 40, EAGLE POINT GUN Thousand 3 264.36| 2647208
[TZ MPA-31 611716 - 7131177 - ROUNDS 40 KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY {Thousand ! 315. 2547207
13 MPA-31 611716 - 7151117 - GAUGE 2 3 GEORGE J PETRONIS Thousand 1 0.00001 2547229
T3 MPA-316/1/16 - 7731117 - GAUGE 23 TERNATIONAL CARTRID| Thousand 2 0.0001 2547206
T3 MPA-371 611116 - 7131117 - GAUGE 2 3 RIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Thousand 3 733.0 2547207
T3 MPA-31 6/1116 - 7731117 - GAUGE 23 EAGLE POINT GUN Thousand T 267.72| 2547208
T4 MPA-31 611716 - 7731717 - ROUNDS, 12 GEORGE JPETRONIS Thousand T 0.00007 7547229
4 MFPA-3T 67116 - 7131117 - ROUNDS, 12 INTERNATIONAL CARTRID Thousand 2 0.0001 2547206
T4 MPA-31 611716 - 7131/17 - ROUNDS, 13 EAGLE FOINT GUN Thousand 3 ~362.44 7547208
31 6/1/16 - 7131177 - , 14 KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Thousand 4 £73.88| 2547207

15 MPA-31 611716 - 7131717 - ROUNDS 12| GEORGE J PETRONIS Case 1 0.00001 7547229
15 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7731117 - ROUNDS 12 INTERNATIONAL CARTRIDICase K3 0.0001 2647206
75 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7731717 - ROUNDS 12 EAGLE POINT GUN Case 3 120.16 2547208
96 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131717 - ROUNDS 12 [ESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case L 167.75 2547207
31 6716~ = Hundred 1 0.00001 2547229

16 MPA-3T 671716 - 713177 - ARMY ™" T, TERNATIONAL CARTRIDHundred 2 0.0001 2547206
[16 MPA-31 671716 - 7731717 - ARMY "L T, KIESCER POLICE SUPPLY [Hundred 3 024 2547207 |
16 MPA-31 6/17116 - 7131117 - ARMY "L" 1, EAGLE POINT GUN Hundred 7 25 2547208
(17 MPA-31 6/1116 - 7131117 - POLICE SILH GEORGE JPETRONIS  |Hundred 7 0.00001 2547229
7 - = = ERNATIONAL CARTRIDHundred 7 0.0001 2547206
17 MPA-31 671716 - 7131717 - POLICE SILH TESCER POLICE SUPPLY [Hundred 3 0.0001 2547207
- = = EAGLE FOINT GUN Hundred T 0.0001 2547208

118 MPA-3T 671716 - 7131717 - POLICE SILK GEORGE JPETRONIS _ {Each T 0.00001| 2647220
18 MPA-31 671716 - 7131117 - POLICE SILH ach Z 0.0001 2547206
[T8 MPA3T 6/1116 - 7131117 - POLICE SIL KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Each 3 0.0001 2547207 |
] 31 611716 - = EAGLE POINT GUN Fach q 0.0001 2547208
T0 MPA-31 6/1116 - 713117 - TARGET T GEORGE J PETRONIS Hundred T 0.00001 2547229
19 MPA-31 671716 - 713117 - TARGET F TERNATIONAC CARTRID[Hundred 2 0.0001 2547206
19 MPA-3T 6116 - 7731717 - TARGET KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Hundred 3 0.18 2547207
TOMPA-31 6/116 - 713117 - TARGET F EAGLE POINT GUN Hundred s 28.5| 2547208
20 MPA-3T 616 - 7731117 - TARGETF GEORGE JPETRONIS Each i 0.00001 2547229
70 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - TARGET I TERNATIONAL CARTRID[Each 2 0.0001 2547208
20 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7731717 - TARGET F EAGLE POINT GUN Each ) 0.75] 2547208
20 MPA3T 671716 - 7131117 - TARGET F KIESLER POLICE-SUPPLY |Each 7 6,83 2547207
(2T MPA3T 6/1716 - 713717 - TARGET - GEORGE JPETRONIS Hundred T 0.00007 2547229
21 MPA-31 6/116 - 7131117 - TARGET - INTERNATIONAC CARTRID|Hundred 2 0.0001 2547206
21 MPA-3T 66 - 7131117 - TARGET - ER POLICE SUPPLY |Hundred 3 02 2547207 |
21 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - TARGET - EAGLE POINT GUN Hundred 4 65| 2547208
22 -31 6/1716 - 713 - GEORGE JPETRONIS Hundred T 0.00001 2547229
22 37 614716 - 7131017 - TERNATIONAC CARTRID{Hundred 2 0.0001 2547206
22 31 611716 - 7131717 - 3 RIESLER POLICE SUPPLY |Hundred 3 —0.21 2547207
22 -31 6/116 - 713117 - EAGLE POINT GUN Hundred 4 38 2547208




Noté: a Quote Price reporting the denomination .001, .0001 and .00001 signifies “No bid”

23 MPA-31 8/1/16 - 7131717 - TARGETS,

- =113 - .35

GEORGE JPETRONIS Each 0.00007 2547220

- - - A 'I};\IITERNATIONAL CARTRIOEach 0.0001 2547206

23 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131717 - TARGETS, PLY[Each 02 2547207
23 MPA-3TO/716 - 7151117 - TARGETS, EAGLE POINT GUN Each 0.33 2547208
24 WPA-3T 6/TAG - 7131717 - SPEER .357 GEORGE J PETRONIS Thousand 0.00001 2547229
- 6- - Thousand 0.0001 2547206

Thousand

277.66 2547208]

24 MPA-31 61116 - 713117 - SPEER 357

TESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Thousand

378.42 2047207

1

K3

3

s

1

3

3

3
125 MPA-3T 61176 - 77131117 - SPEER .35 GEORGE JPETRONIS  [Thousand il 0.00001 2647229
(25 MPA-3T 611716 - 713117 - SPEER .35 TERNATIONAC CARTRID{Thousand K3 0.0001]  25472085]
125 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - SPEER .35 EAGLE POINT GUN Thousand 3 427,74 2547208
[25 MPA-31T 6/TA6 - 7731117 - SPEER .35 KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY {Thousand ) 473 2547207
26 MPA-3T 611716 - 7131717 - WINCHEST! GEORGE J PETRONIS  [Case T 0.00007 2547279
76 -31 611716 - 7131177 - ERNATIONAL CARTRID[Case 2 0.0001 2547206
25 31 eMA6 - 73117 - ER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 3 0.0001 2547207
126 MPA-3T 611116 - 7731717 - WINCHEST! EAGLE POINT GUN Case T 0.0007 2647208
27 MPA-3T 611716 - 7731117 - CHAMBER GEORGE J PETRONIS Fach i 0.00007 2547229
27 MPA-31 61716 - 7/31/17 - CHAMBER INTERNATIONAL CARTRIDEach A 0.0001 2547206
27 MPA-3T 61716 - 7731117 - CHAMBER PPLY|Each 3 0.0001 2547207
27 MPA-31 611716 - 7131717 - CHAMBER EAGLE POINT GUN Fach 4 0.0007| 2547208]
[Z8 MPA-3T 611716 - 71317 - TWISTER C GEORGE JPETRONIS  |Each il 0.00001[ 2547229
2 -316MA6 - 713117 - TERNATIONAL CARTRIDEach 2 0.0001 2547206
31 611716 - 7131117 - PPLY|Each 3 0.0001 2547207
28 MPA-3T 6116 - 7731717 - TWISTER C EAGLE POINT GUN Each T 0.0001 2547208
20 MPA-31 611716 - 7731117 - PATCH HOL GEORGE J PETRONIS _ [Fach T 0.00001 2547229
29 MPA-31 671716 - 7731717 - PATCH HOL| INTERNATIONAL CARTRIDEach 2 0.0001 2547206
26 MPA-31 611716 - 7131717 - PATGH HOL RIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Each 3 0.0007 2547207
29 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7731717 - PATCH HOL| EAGLE POINT GUN Fach q 0.0001 2547208
31 671716 - 7131117 - GEORGE J PETRORIS __ |Each 1 0.00001 2547228
31 6/1776 - 7733117 - INTERNATIONAL CARTRIDIEach 2 0.0001 2547206
30 MPA-31 6/1/16 - 7131117 - NYLON BRI KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY |Each 3 0.0001 2547207
30 -3 - - [EAGLE POINT GUN Each 4 0.0001 2547208
31T MPA-3T 6/116 - 7131117 - STAINLESS GEORGE J PETRONIS Each i 0.00001 2547229
31 611716 - 7133717 - ach 2 0.0001 2547206
[3TMPA-3T 67116 - 7131717 - STAINLESS KIESTER POLICE SUPPLY [Each 3 0.0007| 2547207
-316/1/16 - 713177 - EAGLE POINT GUN Each 7 0.0001 2547208
32 MPA-3T 611716 - 7131117 - MAGAZINE GEORGE J PETRONIS Each i 0.00001 2547229
32 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - MAGAZINE TERNATIONAL CARTRID|Each Z 0.0001] 2547206
[32MPA-3T 616 - 1731117 - MAGAZINE KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Each 3 0.0001 2547207
32 MPA-37T 671716 - 7131117 - MAGAZINE FAGLE POINT GUN Each ) 0.6001 2547200
33 MPA-31 611716 - 7731117 - CHAMBER GEORGE J PETRONIS Fach 1 0.00001 2547229
33 MPA-31 6/1776 - 7131717 - CHAMBER ‘?;TERNAHONAL CARTRIDEach 2 0.0007 2547206
3 MPA-31 611776 - 7731717 - CHAMBER TESTER POLICE SUPPLY |Each 3 0.0001 2547207
33 MPA-37 6/1/16 - 7131177 - CHAMBER EAGLE POINT GUN Each q 2.3 2547208
34 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - ACCUBON GEORGE J PETRONIS Case 1 0.00007 2547229
34 MPA-31 671716 - 71317117 - ACCUBON TERNATIONAL CARTRIDCase 2 0.0001 2547206
MPA-3T 61716 - 713117 - ACCUBON KIESLER FOLICE SUPPLY [Case 3 0.0007 2547207
34 MPA-31 611716 < 7131117 - ACCUBON EAGLE FOINT GUN Case q 0.0001| 2547208
[35 MPA-31 6/1116 - 7131117 - FEDERAL 13 GEORGE JPETRONIS _ [Case T 0.00007 2547279

35 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - FEDERAL 14 [TERNATIONAL CARTRIDCase 2

0.0001

~2547208




Note: a Quote Price reporting the denomination .001,.0001 and .00001 signifies “No bid”

35 MPA-31 671716 - 7731117 - FEDERAL 1

EAGLE POINT GUN Case 5 3 14137 2547208] -
35 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - FEDERAL 12 KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 5 ) 167.75 2547207
[36 MPA-3T 6/1710 - 7731777 - MILIMECH G GEORGE J PETRONIS Package 3 ] 0.00001 2547228
[36 MPA-31T6/3776 - 71317 - MILTTECH G INTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Package 3 2 0.0007 2547206
(38 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - MILITECH G KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY |Package 3 3 0.0001 2547207 |
[36 MPA-3T 6/T16 - 7131777 - MILITECH G FAGLE POINT GUN Package 3 ) 0.0001 2547200
37 MPA-31 671716 - 7131717 - MONTANA ollle 20 1 0.00001 2547229
37 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131717 - MONTANA INTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Bottle 20 2 0.0001| 2547206
37 MPA-3T 6/1/16 - 7131177 - MONTANA KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Boille 20 3 0.0007 2547207
37 MPA-3T OG- 713117 - MONTANA EAGLE POINTGUN _ |Bofile 720 3 0.0001 2547208
38 MPA-31 6/1/16 - 71317 - MONTANA GEORGE JPETRONIS — [Boflle 10 1 0.00001 2547228
38 MPA-31 6/1/16 - 7131717 - MONTANA TNTERNATIONAL CARTRIDBotlle 10 7 0.0001 2547206
(38 MPA-3T 6116 - 7131717 - MONTANA KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Bofile 10 3 0.0001 2547207
[38 MPA-31 6717786 - 7731717 - MONTANA EAGLE POINTGUN _|Bollle 10 q 0.000 7547208
39 MPA-31 6/1116 - 7731117 - UVEX GEN GEORGE J FETRONIS Box 3 7 0.00001| 2547229
38 MPA-31 6/1/16 - 7731117 - UVEX GEN TERNATIONAL CARTRIDBox 3 3 0.000 2547200
30 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131717 - UVEX GEN TESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Box 3 3 0.0001 2547207
[39 MPA-31 6/1776 - 7131117 - UVEX GEN EAGLE POINT GUN Box 3 7 0.0001f 2547208
40 MPA-3T 6/1716 - 7131117 - UVEX GEN GEORGE J PETRONIS Each 20 1 0.00001 2547229
40 MPA-31 611716 - 7/31117 - OVEX GEN TNTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Each 20 2 0.0001 2547208
30 MPA-31 671116 - 7731717 - UVEX GEN [ER POLICE SUPPLY|Each 70 3 0.0001| 2547207
0 MPA-31 671716 - 7731717 - UVEX GEN EAGLE POINT GUN Each 20 ! 0.0007 2547208
4T MPA3T 611716 - 7731717 - TASCO HEA GEORGE JPETRONIS_ {Case 25 i 0.00001 2547229
- = - TERNATIONAL CARTRIDICase 25 K3 0,0001 2547206
AT MPA-31 6/1/16 - 713117 - TASCO H KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 25 3 0.000 2547207
= = - (FAGLE POINT GUN Case p1 3 0.0001] 2547208
135 MPA-31 6/1/16 - 7131717 - FEDERAL .2 GEORGE JPETRONIS _ |Case 75 T 0.00001 2547229
42 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131717 - FEDERAL 2 TERNATIONAL CARTRID[Case 15 2 0.0001 2547206
[42 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - FEDERAL .2} EAGLE POINTGON Case 15 3 273.9 2547208
42 MPA-31 6/1716 - 713117 - FEDERAL .2 KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 15 g 275.9 2547207
[43 MPA-31 6/1116 - 713117 - FEDERAL .1 GEORGE J PETRONIS Box 35 T 0.00007] 2547229]
43 MPA-31 6/116 - 7131117 - FEPERAL .3 INTERNATIONAL CARTRIDBox 45 Z 0.000T[ 2547206
3 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - FEDERAL . PPLY {Box a5 3 339.5 2547207
43 MPA-316/1716 - 7131117 - FEDERAL .3 EAGLE POINTGUN Box 45 3 354490 2547208
44 MPA-37 61716 - 7131717 - FEDERAL .1 GEORGE JPETRONIS Case [ 1 0.00001 2547229
A3 MPA3T6/A716 - 7731717 - FEDERAL .1 INTERNATIONAL CARTRIDCase [ i3 0.0001 2547206
A4 MPA3TG/1I6 - 713117 - FEDERAL 7 R POLICE SUPPLY [Case 6 3 58.27 2547207
(34 TAPA-31 6/3716 - 7131717 - FEDERAL .1 EAGLE POINT GUN Case 6 7 66.00] 2547208
5 MPA-31 611176 - 7131117 - FEDERAL 13 GEORGE JPETRONIS Case 8 T 0.00001 2547229
45 MPA-31 6/1/16 - 7131117 - FEDERAL 13 INTERNATIONAL CARTRIDCase 3 7 G.0001 BEA7206|
[45 MPA-3T6/7716 - 7131117 - FEDERAL 14 KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case [ 3 158,02 2547207
45 MPA-316/1716 - 7131117 - FEDERAL 13 EAGLE POINT GUN Case (3 [} 199,38 2547200
[46 MPA-31 6/17/76 - 7/31117 - SPEER .35 GEORGE JPETRONIS Case [ 1 0.00001 2547229
3 31 6116 - 713117 - 35 TERNATIONAL CARTRID[Case 5 2 0.0007 2547208
46 MPA-31 671716 - 7131117 - SPEER .35 % Case 5 3 427.74 2547208
- - - - PPLY|Case 5 ! 373 2547207
47 MPA-31 671716 - 7/31717 - SPEER .35 GEORGE JPETRONIS Case 20 T 0.00001 2547229
47 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - SPEER .35 INTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Case 70 2z 0.0001 2547208
7 MPA31 671716 - 71317117 - SPEER .35 EAGLE FOINT GUN Case 20 3 277.66 2547208(
47 MPA-37 671116 - 7131117 - SPEER .35 iT(lESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 20 7 379.42 2547207




Note: a Quote Price reporting the denomination .001, .0001 and .00001 signifies “No bid” -

48 MPA-31 6M1/16 - 713177 - SPEER .40

GEORGE JPETRONIS  [Case il 0.00001 2547228
48 MPA-31 6/1116 - 713417 - SPEER .40 INTERNATIONAL CARTRIOCase 2 0.0001| 2547206
[48 MPA-37 61116 - 7131117 - SPEER .40 EAGLE POINT GUN Case 3 350.49| 2547208
48 MPA-31 611716 - 713137 - SPEER .40 PPLY[Case q 459,32 2547207
49 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - SPEER .40 GEORGE JPETRONIS _ [Case T 0.00001 2547229
3 6- 7- TERNATIONAL CARTRID[Case 2 0.0007 2547206
9 -31 611176 - 7134177 - . TGUN Case 3 2501 2547208
49 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - SPEER .40 TESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case s 315.85 2547207
3 G- 713117 - 40 1 Case 1] "0.00001 2547228
50 -31 61716 - 7131177 - - Case 2z 0.0007 2547206
[50 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - SPEER .40 KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 3 0.0007 2547207
0 MPA-31 671716 - 7131117 - SPEER .40 EAGLE POINT GUN Case q 261.54 2547208
151 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - SPEER 357 GEORGE J PETRONIS Case | 0.00007 2547229
5T MPA-37 611716 - 7131117 - SPEER 357 TERNATIONAL CARTRID{Case 2 0.0001 2547208
m TGUN Case 3 289.32] 2547208
[BTMPA-37T 611716 - 7137117 - SPEER 357 | PPLY [Case S 356.02| 2547207
B2 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - FEDERAL S GEORGE J PETRONIS _ [Case 1 0.00001 2547229
52 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - FEDERAL 5 TERNATIONAL CARTRIDCasé 2 0.0001 2547206
52 MPA-31 6/1/16 - 7131717 - FEDERAL 5 | PPLY [Case K) —330.8| 2547207
52 MPA-37 671716 - 7131117 - FEDERAL 5 EAGLE POINT GUN Case 7 35449 2547208
53 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7/31/17 - FEDERAL { GEORGE JPETRONIS _ |Case 1 0.00001 2547220
[53 MPA-31 61716 - 7131117 - FEDERAL { TERNATIONAL CARTRID{Case 2 0.0001 2547206
3 - - - TGUN Case 3 126,17 2547208
53 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131717 - FEDERAL{ TESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case ) 14347 2547207
A MPA-31 6/1116 - 7131117 - .40 CALIBE GEORGE J PETRONIS Case ) 0.00007 2547220
(54 MIPA-31 6/1716 - 7131717 - .40 CALIBE INTERNATIONAL CARTRIDICase 2 0.0001 2547208
E4 MPA-31 6/17116 - 7131117 - .40 CALIBE EAGLE POINT GUN Case 3 261.54 2547208
54 MPA-3T 61716 - 713317 - 40 CALIBE] KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 4 9. 2547207
[55 MPA-3T6/1/16 - 7131117 12 GAUGEF G Case T 0.00007 2547229
[FE MPA-3T 61716 - 7131717 12 GAUGE F KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 2 0.0001 2547207
5 MPA-31 6/116 - 7131117 12 GAUGE F| EAGLE POINT GUN Case 3 T75{ 2547208
55 MPA-31 6/1116 - 7131717 12 GAUGEF TERNATIONAL CARTRID|Case [ 394 2547206
56 MPA-31 6/1/16 - 7131117 - 12 GAUGE GEORGE J PETRONIS Case 1 0.00001 2547229
56 MPA-3T6/1/16 - 7131117 - 12 GAUGE FAGLE POINT GUN Case 2 160 2547208
(56 MPA-31 611716 - 7131717 - 12 GAUGE KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 3 167.75 2547207
[E6 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - 12 GAUGE INTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Case 7 305 2547206
57 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - .45 CALIBE GEORGE J PETRONIS __ |Each 1 0.00004 2547279
57 MPA-3T 671716 - 7131177 - .45 CALIBE| EAGLE POINT GUN Fach 2 0.0001 2547208
316 TTI3AT - PPLY[Each 3 579.39 2547207
57 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - .45 CALIBE TERNATIONAL CARTRIDEach q 601 2547206
[58 MPA-37 6/1716 - 7731117 - PIPE CLEA GEORGE JPETRONIS Package T 0.00001|  2547229|
58 MPA-3T 6/1716 - 7/31/17 - PIPE CLEA TNTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Package 7 0.0007 2547206
= ~TBIAT - PPLY |Package 3 0.0007 2547207
58 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - PIPE CLEAN EAGLE POINT GUN Package ) 0.0001 2547208
59 MPA-37 6/1716 - 7131117 - GAUGE 2 3/ GEORGE J PETRONIS Thousand 1 0.00001f  2547229|
58 MPA-31 6/1716 - 77131117 - GAUGE 2 37 ";l]TERNATIONAL CARTRID Thousand 2 0.0001 2547200
= = = PPLY [Thousand 3 233.06 2547207
50 MPA-31 611116 - 7131117 - GAUGE 2 3/; EAGLEPOINTGUN  [Thousand [} 267.72| 2547208
60 MPA-31 6/1/16 - 7131117 - ROUNDS 12| GEORGE JPETRONIS | Thousand T 0.00001 7547229
[60 MPA-37 611716 - 7731137 - ROUNDS 12 INTERNATIONAL CARTRID Thousand 3 0.0001 2547206




Note: a Quote Price reporting the denominatien-001; .0001 and--00001 signifies “No bid”

50 3 6- =

T GUN Thousand 3 3 362.44] 2547208
0 -3 = = LER POLICE SUPPLY | Thousand 3 T 573.08| 2547207
MPA-31 611716 - 7131/17 - ROUNDS 14 GEORGE J PETRONIS _ |Case a0 i 0.00001] 2547229
[6TMPA-3T 6/1716 -~ 7131717 - ROUNDS 13 ase 40 2 0.000 2547206
-3 - 7 TGUN Case 40 3 120.16 7547208
- =773 - 13 KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 40 4 167.75 2547207
2 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131717 - FEDERAL .2 GEORGE J PETRONIS Case 2 T 0.00001 2547229
- —73 7 - 2 TERNATIONAL CARTRIDCase 2 2 0.0007 206
62 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - FEDERAL .2 PPLY|[Case Z 3 0.0007 2547207 |
A-31 611116 - 7131117 - FEDERAL 2} EAGLE POINT GUN Case Z S 261.96| 2547208
- - - [GEORGE JPETRONIS  |Case 3 T 0.00007 2547229
= - = TERNATIONAL CARTRIOCase P 2 0.0001 2547206
-31 611116 - 7131117 - TESLER POLICE SUPPLY |[Case 2 3 —49.34 2547207
5 = = - [FAGLE POINT GUN Case 2 T 50| 2547208
4 MIPA-31 611716 - 7131717 - INTERNATI GEORGE JPETRONIS[Case 75 i 0.00001 2547229
64 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7131117 - INTERNATT EAGLE POINT GUN Case 75 2 0.0001|  2547208|
6 - TIBAT - TERNATIONAL CARTRIO|Case 75 3 558 2547206
- 16 - - NATI KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 75 q 567.07| 2547207
MPA-3T 61716 - 7131777 - INTERNATT GEORGE JPETRONIS Case 30 i 0.00007 2547229
6 -31 611716 - 7131717 - INTERNATI EAGLE POINT GUN Case 30 Z 0.0001 2547208
6 31 61116 - 7131117 - TERNATIONAL CARTRIOCase 30 3 601 2547206
65 MPA-31 611716 - 7131717 - INTERNATI KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 30 4 610.83 2547207
[66 MPA-37 GI1116 - 7131777 - INTERNATI GEORGE J PETRONIS Case 25 1 0.00001 2547220
[66 MPA-31 6/1/16 - 731717 - INTERNATT EAGLE POINT GUN Case 25 2 0.0001 2547208}
MPA-3T 673716 - 7131717 - INTERNATT INTERNATIONAL CARTRIT[Case 25 3 304 2547206
316 713117 - ATT RIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 25 4 4007 2547207
67 MPA-31 6/1716 - 773117 - INTERNATI GEORGE JPETRONIS  [Case g 1 0.00001 2547229
67 MPA-31 671716 - 7131717 - INTERNAT] EAGLE POINT GUN Case 4 2 0.0007 2547208
MPA-37 611716 - 7731717 - INTERNATI INTERNATIONAL CARTRIDICase 4 3 305 2547206
[67 MPA-31 6/1116 - 7731717 - INTERNATI KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 7 4 309.69 2547207
[68 MPA-31 6/116 - 713117 - INTERNATI GEORGE JPETRONIS Case 50 1 0.00007 2547229
{68 MPA-31 6/1776 - 7131717 - INTERNATT EAGLE POINT GUN Case 50 2 0.0001 2547208
68 MPA-31 611716 - 7131717 - INTERNATT INTERNATIONAL CARTRID[Case 50 3 718 2547208
68 MPA-31 6/1/16 - 7131117 - INTERNATI KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 50 q 720.69( 254720
69 MPA-371 6/1716 - 7/31/17 - INTERNATI GEORGE JPETRONIS __ |Case 25 i 0.00001| 2547229
PA-31 611776 - 713117 - INTERNATI EAGLE POINT GUN Case 25 2 0.0007 2547208
3161716 - 713117 - TERNATIONAL CARTRIC|Case 25| 3 544 2547206
B -31 611716 - 7131717 - ER POLICE SUPPLY[Case 75 q 554.46 2547207
70 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - INTERNATI GEORGE JPETRONIS _ [Case 2 1 0.00001 2547220
70 MPA-31 671716 - 7131117 - INTERNATT EAGLE POINT GUN Case 25 2 0.0001 2547208
- - - mﬂml Case 25 3 609 2547206
70 MPA-31 671716 - 7731117 - INTERNATI PPLY|Case 25 q t18.87 2547207
71 MPA-3T 61716 - 7731117 -FEDERAL .3 GEORGE J PETRONIS ~_ [Case 10 il 0.00001 2547229
71 NMPA-31 6116 - 713117 -FEDERAL 3 INTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Case 10 2 0.0001 2547208
7T MPA-31 6/1716 - 7731117 - FEDERAL .3 EAGLE POINT GUN Case 10 3 165.76 2547208
71 MPA-31 6/1116 - 7731117 - FEDERAL 3 RIESLER POLICE SUFPLY [Case 10 S 179.89 2547207
72 -31 6176 - 71317 - ) [GEORGE JPETRONIS  [Box 70 T 0.00001 2547229
- ~7I3TA7 - : TNTERNATIONAL CARTRIDBox 20 2 0.0001 7547200
2 - - < . [Y|Box 20 3 0.0001 2547207
72 -31 611716 - B ; TGUN Box 20 q 337.24 2547208




Note: a Quote Price reporting the-denomination001,-.

[7TAWMPA3T BTG - 7151117 - LAW ENFOR

0001 and 00001 signifies “No bid”

Fach 60 il 0.00007 2547220

73 MPA-31 611116 - 7131117 - LAW ENFO (Each 60 V3 0.0001| 2547206
73 MPA3T 671716 - 7131717 - LAW ENFO EAGLE POINT GUN Each B0 3 0.0001 2547208
- 713117 - PPLY [Each 60 ! — 39.18 2547207

(74 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - LAWENFO GEORGE JPETRONIS Each 2000 i] 0.00007 2547228
74 MPA-31 6/1716 - 7731117 - TAW ENFO! ﬂwrmm 2000 2 —0.0001 2547206
74 MPA-31 611716 - 7131117 - LAW ENFO EAGLE FOINT GUN Each 2000 3 0.71 2547208
7 - —7I317 - TESLER POLICE SUPPLY |Each 20600 s 0.2 2547207
31 66 - 713117 - 31 3, Fach 2000 T 0.00001 2547229

5 - - - - Each 2000 2 0.0001 2547206 |
75 MPA-31 611716 - 7131717 - MPA-3T 3T EAGLE POINT GUN Fach 000 3 0.0001 2547208
75 MPA-31 611116 - 7131/17 - MPA-3T 317 PPLY[Each 2000 7 0.20 25647207 |
76 MPA-316/1/16 - 7731117 FEDERAL#H GEORGE JPETRONIS Case 25| i 0.00001 25472725
[76 MPA-3T 6116 - 7731717 FEDERAL# [NTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Case 25 2 0.0001 2547206
76 MPA-31 611116 - 7131717 FEDERAL# PPLY [Case 75 3 536 2547207
76 MPA-31 8/1/16 - 7/31/177 FEDERAL# EAGLE POINT GUN Case 75| ey 32062 2547208
[77 MPA-371 61116 - 7131717 - SPEER #53 GEORGE JPETRONIS_ |Case 5 1 0.00001 2547229
316 7 7534 TERNATIONAL CARTRIDICase 5 2 0.0001 2547206
[EAGLE POINT GUN Case ] 3 206.49] 2547200

KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 5 4 229.77 2547207

IGEORGE JPETRONIS _ [Case 2 1 0.00001 2547229

< T - TERNATIONAL CARTRIDICase Z V3 0.0001 2547206

[78 MPA-31 611716 - 7131717 - SPEER #53 EAGLE POINT GUN Case 2 3 330.88| 2547208
176 MPA-31 6/1116 - 7131717 - SPEER #53 KIESLER FOLICE SUFPLY [Case 2 q 4256.87 2547207
|GEORGE JPETRONIS [Case 2 T 8.00001 2547220

TERNATIONAL CARTRID{Case 2 2 0.0001 2547206

[EAGLE POINT GUN Case Z 3 39397 2547208}

79 MPA-31 61716 - 7131117 - SPEER #23 KIESTER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 2 ) 409.71] 2547207
B = - - 3 GEORGE JFETRONIS _ [Case 6 T 0.00001 2547229
3 6- 7731017 - 3 TERNATIONAC CARTRID|Case [ 2 0.0001 2547200

B - 6- 713117 - 3 TGUN Case 3 3 279.98 2547208
31 61716 - 713117 - 534 PPLY [Case 6 4 358.23 2547207

31 611716 - - [GEORGE JPETRONIS _ [Case 3 1 0.06001 2547229

8 -31 6/1A6 - 713 - 3 INTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Case 3 2 0,0007 2547206
] 316/116 - - TGUN Case 3 3 384.89 2547208
= G- - 3 PPLY{Case 3 % 476.87 2547207

[ - 6- 713117 - 3 GEORGE J PETRONIS __ [Case ] T 0.00001 2547229
31611116 - 713117 - 3 INTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Case 4 K3 0.0001 2547200

82 3 — 713117 - [EAGLE POINT GUN Case 4 3 229,32, 2547208
82 - = - 53 KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case ] 7 347.41 2547207
83 - 6- 713117 - 53 GEORGE JPETRONIS _ [Case 2 i 0.00007 2547229
83 3 - 7- TERNATIONAL CARTRIDICase 2 2 0.0001 2547200
B3 -316/1116- - 3 [KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 2 3 347 41 2547207
3 -3 G- = 3 [EAGLE POINT GUN Case pJ 4 543.68[ 2547208
3161 - - 3 [GEORGE JPETRONIS_ [Case 2 1 0.00007 2547229

-31 611116 - 7131117 - INTERNATIONAL CARTRIDCase 2 3 0.0001 2547206

B 316116 - 7137117 - [EAGLE POINT GUN Case Z 3 455.79]  2547208|
8 316 = - KIESLER POLICE SUPPLY [Case 2 3 474 2547207
PA-31 61116 < 7131717 - SPEER #23 GEORGE JPETRONIS __ [Case 2 1 0.00001| 2547229

31 611716 - 7133117 - 239 INTERNATIONAL CARTRID|Case 2 K3 0.0001 2547206
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