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This solicitation has been awarded to the following vendor(s): 

 

 

Vendor Name PO Number 

SHIPMANS FIRE EQUIPMENT CO INC 3466041 

 

 

 

 



LINE Group Model # Brand QUANTITY

 CONFIRM 

BRAND  UNIT PRICE  TOTAL PRICE 

 CONFIRM 

BRAND  UNIT PRICE  TOTAL PRICE 

 CONFIRM 

BRAND  UNIT PRICE  TOTAL PRICE 

CONFIRM 

BRAND  UNIT PRICE  TOTAL PRICE 

 CONFIRM 

BRAND  UNIT PRICE  TOTAL PRICE 

6

7

Proseries PMP 

single blue 300441 CMC Rescue 10  CMC 99.30$         993.00$              CMC 117.06$        1,170.60$        CMC 106.15$        1,061.50$         CMC 100.80$             $        1,008.00 N/A NO BID -$                

8

PMP Swivel 

pulley 300430 CMC Rescue 6  CMC 110.35$       662.10$              CMC 130.06$        780.36$           CMC 118.00$        708.00$            CMC  $            112.00 672.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

9 Proseries swivel 300701 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 85.90$         343.60$              CMC 101.27$        405.08$           CMC 91.85$          367.40$            CMC  $              87.20 348.90$            N/A NO BID -$                

10

Proseries PMP 

Double *Gold 300442 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 137.15$       274.30$              CMC 161.65$        323.30$           CMC 146.60$        9.00$                 CMC  $            139.20 278.40$            N/A NO BID -$                

11

Kootenay Ultra 

Pulley Carriage 300391 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 155.45$       310.90$              CMC 253.64$        507.28$           CMC 230.00$        460.00$            CMC  $            210.00 420.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

12

Swivel double 

pulley 300432 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 122.95$       491.80$              CMC 144.93$        579.72$           CMC 131.45$        525.80$            CMC  $            124.80 499.20$            N/A NO BID -$                

13

CSR Pulley 

System 500102 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 1,158.00$   2,316.00$          CMC 1,365.73$     2,731.46$        CMC 1,238.85$     2,477.70$         CMC  $         1,176.00 2,352.00$        N/A NO BID -$                

14

15 Rescue Rack 300890 CMC Rescue 3  CMC 131.60$       394.80$              CMC 155.16$        465.48$           CMC 140.70$        422.10$            CMC  $            133.60 400.80$            N/A NO BID -$                

16

Petzl ID General 

Use:Red CMC 345D23 CMC Rescue 3  CMC 179.95$       539.85$              PETZL 203.96$        611.88$           CMC-PTZL 204.00$        612.00$            PETZL  $            183.67 551.01$            N/A NO BID -$                

17 Rescue 8 300840 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 55.95$         223.80$              CMC 65.96$           263.84$           CMC 59.80$          239.20$            CMC  $              56.80 227.20$            N/A NO BID -$                

18 CMC MPD 333000 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 571.45$       2,285.80$          CMC 685.00$        2,740.00$        CMC 611.00$        2,444.00$         CMC 580.00$            2,320.00$        N/A NO BID -$                

19

NFPA 6 Bar U-

Rack NFPA14600 SMC Gear 2  SMC 99.50$         199.00$              SMC 88.25$           176.50$           SMC 93.00$          186.00$            SMC 102.07$            204.14$            N/A NO BID -$                

20

21 Born Entry Ease 735100 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 229.40$       458.80$              WM BORN 183.16$        366.32$           CMC 245.25$        490.50$            CMC 233.00$            466.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

22 Roof Roller 149000 SMC Gear 2  SMC 236.50$       473.00$              SMC 209.93$        419.86$           SMC 221.00$        442.00$            SMC  $            250.07 500.14$            N/A NO BID -$                

23 Edge Roller 148500 SMC Gear 4  SMC 155.90$       623.60$              SMC 138.31$        553.24$           SMC 145.55$        582.20$            SMC  $            159.51 638.04$            N/A NO BID -$                

24

Ultra Pro Edge 

Protectors 294044 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 110.35$       220.70$              CMC 130.06$        260.12$           CMC 118.00$        236.00$            CMC  $            112.20 224.40$            N/A NO BID -$                

25

26

Steel Locking D 

carabiners 300110 CMC Rescue 30  CMC 33.10$         993.00$              CMC 39.03$           1,170.90$        CMC 35.35$          1,060.50$         CMC 33.60$               1,008.00$        N/A NO BID -$                

27

Alum screw lock 

XL brite caribiner 300241 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 50.45$         201.80$              CMC 59.46$           237.84$           CMC 53.90$          215.60$            CMC 51.20$               204.80$            N/A NO BID -$                

28

Lite series 

caribiner SMC NFPA100001 SMC 10  SMC 28.95$         289.50$              SMC 25.82$           258.20$           SMC 27.15$          271.50$            SMC  $              28.47 284.70$            N/A NO BID -$                

29

Oval non locking 

carabiner 300083 CMC 40  CMC 13.40$         536.00$              CMC 15.80$           632.00$           CMC 14.30$          572.00$            CMC  $              13.60 544.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

30

31

Auto Lock 

Carabiner 300233 CMC 10  CMC 39.40$         394.00$              CMC 46.45$           464.50$           CMC 42.10$          421.00$            CMC  $              40.00 400.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

32

Manual Lock 

Carabiner 300262 CMC 20  CMC 43.35$         867.00$              CMC 51.90$           1,038.00$        CMC 46.35$          927.00$            CMC 44.00$               880.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

33

XL Steel locking 

carabiner 371290 CMC 6  CMC 31.50$         189.00$              OMEGA PACIFIC 26.98$           161.88$           CMC -O/P 31.30$          187.80$            OMEGA 29.70$               178.20$            N/A NO BID -$                

34 Delta Quick Link 382101 CMC Rescue 8  CMC 7.40$           59.20$                MALLION 8.45$             67.60$             CMC 7.90$             63.20$               CMC  $                 7.50  $              60.00 N/A NO BID -$                

35

36

1/2" NE Ropes: 

KM III RED KO1160 CMC Rescue 1500 FT  CMC 1.18$           1,770.00$          NEW ENGLAND 1.022$           1,533.00$        CMC-NE 1.10$             1,650.00$         CMC  $                 1.29 1,935.00$        N/A NO BID -$                

37

1/2" NE Ropes: 

KM III  BLUE KO3160 CMC Rescue 1500 FT  CMC 1.18$           1,770.00$          NEW ENGLAND 1.022$           1,533.00$        CMC-NE 1.10$             1,650.00$         CMC  $                 1.29 1,935.00$        N/A NO BID -$                

38

Rope bag 3 Red, 

250-300 feet 430303 CMC Rescue 6  CMC 67.00$         402.00$              CMC 78.97$           473.82$           CMC 71.60$          429.60$            CMC  $              68.00 408.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

 BRIGHAM INDUSTRIES, INC.  BID 7550251 ROPE RESCUE ITEMS, RIEMA  SHIPMANS FIRE EQUIPMENT CO., INC.  J.E. WEINEL, INC. NEWBURGH RESCUE SUPPLY LLC. The Fire Store (Witmer Public Safety Group)

 ALL ITEMS BRAND CONFIRM  DID NOT BID ON ALL ITEMS 

PULLEYS

DESCENDERS

EDGE PROTECTION

CARABINERS

CARABINERS 

MAIN & BELAY LINES WITH BAGS



39

Rope bag 3 Blue, 

250-300 feet 430302 CMC Rescue 6  CMC 67.00$         402.00$              CMC 78.97$           473.82$           CMC  71.60$          429.60$            CMC 68.00$               408.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

40

41

1/2" NE Ropes  

ORANGE KO5160 CMC Rescue 1000 FT  CMC 1.18$           1,180.00$          NEW ENGLAND 1.022$           1,022.00$        CMC-NE 1.10$             1,100.00$         CMC  $                 1.29  $        1,290.00 N/A NO BID -$                

42

1/2" NE Ropes  

GREEN KO2160 CMC Rescue 800 FT  CMC 1.18$           944.00$              NEW ENGLAND 1.022$           817.60$           CMC-NE 1.10$             880.00$            CMC  $                 1.29 1,032.00$        N/A NO BID -$                

43

Rope bag 1 

Yellow, 50-120 

feet 430107 CMC Rescue 16  CMC 43.35$         893.60$              CMC 51.09$           817.44$                      46.35$          741.60$            CMC  $              44.00 704.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

44

Rope bag 3 Red, 

150-200 feet 430207 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 43.35$         173.40$              CMC 69.68$           278.72$           CMC 63.20$          252.80$            CMC  $              60.00 240.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

45

46

Sterling HTP 

1/2" Red COLOR CODE 08 STERLING ROPE 600 FT  STERLING 0.92$           552.00$              STERLING 0.783$           469.80$           STERLING 0.93$             558.00$            STERLING 466.39$            466.39$            

 

STERLING/SPO

OL 569.00$       569.00$          

47

Sterling HTP 

1/2" Blue COLOR CODE 06 STERLING ROPE 600 FT  STERLING 0.92$           552.00$              STERLING 0.783$           469.80$           STERLING 0.93$             558.00$            STERLING  466..39  $           466.39 

 

STERLING/SPO

OL 569.00$       569.00$          

48

Sterling HTP 

1/2" Orange COLOR CODE 07 STERLING ROPE 600 FT  STERLING 0.92$           552.00$              STERLING 0.783$           469.80$           STERLING 0.93$             558.00$            STERLING  $            466.39 466.39$            

 

STERLING/SPO

OL 569.00$       569.00$          

49

Sterling HTP 

1/2" Green COLOR CODE 19 STERLING ROPE 600 FT  STERLING 0.92$           552.00$              STERLING 0.783$           469.80$           STERLING 0.93$             558.00$            STERLING  $            466.39 466.39$            

 

STERLING/SPO

OL 569.00$       569.00$          

50

Sterling HTP 

1/2" Yellow COLOR CODE 09 STERLING ROPE 600 FT  STERLING 0.92$           552.00$              STERLING 0.783$           469.80$           STERLING 0.93$             558.00$            STERLING  $            466.39 466.39$            

 

STERLING/SPO

OL 569.00$       569.00$          

51

Rope bag 3 

Orange, 250-300 

feet 430301 CMC RESCUE 10  CMC 67.00$         670.00$              CMC 78.97$           789.70$           CMC 71.60$          716.00$            CMC 68.00$               680.00$             N/A NO BID -$                

52

53

Web, 1” Tubular, 

Red 200103 CMC Rescue 600 FT  CMC 0.38$           228.00$              

RIBBON 

WEBBING 0.285$           171.00$           CMC 0.29$             174.00$            CMC  $                 0.39  $           234.00 N/A NO BID -$                

54

Web, 1” Tubular, 

Yellow 200107 CMC Rescue 600 FT  CMC 0.38$           228.00$              

RIBBON 

WEBBING 0.285$           171.00$           CMC 0.29$             174.00$            CMC 0.39$                 234.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

55

Web, 1” Flat, 

Orange 200111 CMC Rescue 600 FT  CMC 0.45$           270.00$              CMC 0.51$             306.00$           CMC 0.45$             270.00$            CMC  $                 0.46 276.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

56

57

Prusik Cord 8mm 

red 293038 CMC Rescue 400 FT  CMC 0.55$           220.00$              CMC 0.66$             264.00$           CMC 0.61$             244.00$            CMC 0.62$                 248.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

58

Prusik Cord 8mm 

green 293018 CMC Rescue 400 FT  CMC 0.55$           220.00$              CMC 0.66$             264.00$           CMC 0.61$             244.00$            CMC 0.62$                 248.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

59

5mm cord - Dark 

Green 293008 CMC Rescue 900 FT  CMC 0.36$           324.00$              CMC 0.40$             360.00$           CMC 0.37$             333.00$            CMC 0.38$                 342.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

60

Rope bag 1 

Orange, 50-120 

feet 430101 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 43.35$         173.40$              CMC 51.09$           204.36$           CMC 46.35$          185.40$            CMC 44.00$               176.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

61

8mm sewn cord 

(long blue-06) SC080-06 STERLING ROPE 20  STERLING 9.45$           189.00$              STERLING 7.96$             159.20$           STERLING 9.25$             185.00$            STERLING 8.31$                 166.20$            STERLING 9.49$           189.80$          

62

8mm sewn cord 

(short red-08) SC080-08 STERLING ROPE 20  STERLING 9.30$           186.00$              STERLING 7.80$             156.00$           STERLING 9.05$             181.00$            STERLING  $                 8.79  $           175.80 STERLING 9.30$           186.00$          

63

64

Marathon Mega 

11.2  60meter mmorange-07 Sterling 4  STERLING 156.75$       627.00$              STERLING 144.33$        577.32$           STERLING 167.60$        670.40$            STERLING 159.00$            636.00$            STERLING 173.56$       694.00$          

65

Super Chute 

Rope Bag BD359997RCLYALL1 Black Diamond 4

 BLACK 

DIAMOND 59.95$         239.80$              NO BID -$               -$                 STERLING 31.05$          124.20$            NO BID -$                   -$                  N/A NO BID -$                

66

Blue 12mm Sling 

10” WB127DYSL-06 Sterling 20  STERLING 5.35$           107.00$              STERLIING 4.69$             93.80$             STERLING 4.75$             95.00$               STERLING 4.50$                 90.00$              STERLING 4.99$           99.80$            

67

Orange 12mm 

Sling 24” WB127DYSL-07 Sterling 40  STERLING 7.75$           310.00$              STERLING 7.31$             292.40$           STERLING 7.40$             296.00$            STERLING  $                 7.00  $           280.00 STERLING 7.35$           294.00$          

68

Black 12mm 

Sling 48” WB127DYSL-04 Sterling 20  STERLING 11.60$         232.00$              STERLING 11.25$           225.00$           STERLING 11.35$          227.00$            STERLING 10.80$               216.00$            STERLING 11.45$         229.00$          

WEBBING

ADDITIONAL ANCHORING ROPE

HIGHLINE ROPE WITH BAGS

ACCESSORY CORD

LEAD CLIMBING



69

RockO Autolock 

WireEye Rock Exotica 80

 ROCK 

EXOTICA 19.40$         1,552.00$          ROCK EXOTICA 18.70$           1,496.00$        ROCK EXOTICA 17.00$          1,360.00$         ROCK N RESCUE 117.00$            9,360.00$        N/A NO BID -$                

70 Petzl GriGri 2 D1420 Petzl 2  PETZL 70.55$         141.10$              PETZL 79.96$           159.92$           PETZL 75.45$          150.90$            PETZL 79.96$               159.92$            N/A NO BID -$                

71 Petzl GriGri 2 D142B Petzl 2  PETZL 70.55$         141.10$              PETZL 79.96$           159.92$           PETZL 75.45$          150.90$            PETZL 79.96$               159.92$            N/A NO BID -$                

72 Grillion Hook L52H005 Petzl 4  PETZL 155.25$       621.00$              PETZL 175.96$        703.84$           PETZL 166.00$        664.00$            PETZL 158.00$            632.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

73

AlumiTech 6' 

Shock Absorbing 

Lanyard 8240Y3A Fall Tech 4  FALL TECH 139.00$       556.00$              NO BID -$               -$                 NO BID -$               -$                   NO BID -$                   -$                  N/A NO BID -$                

74

75

Aztek set of 

fours 500104 CMC Rescue 6  CMC 342.85$       2,057.10$          CMC 404.15$        2,424.90$        CMC 366.50$        2,199.00$         CMC  $            348.00  $        2,088.00 N/A NO BID -$                

76

Enforcer Load 

Cell 300750 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 658.00$       1,316.00$          CMC 680.00$        1,360.00$        CMC 703.70$        1,407.40$         CMC 668.00$            1,336.00$        N/A NO BID -$                

77

Petzl handled 

ascender, R 345024 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 66.50$         266.00$              PETZL 65.56$           262.24$           CMC -PETZL 61.85$          247.40$            CMC 77.00$               308.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

78

Petzl handled 

ascender, L 345025 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 66.50$         266.00$              PETZL 65.56$           262.24$           CMC -PETZL 61.85$          247.40$            CMC 74.00$               296.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

79 Azorp 727400 CMC Rescue 1  CMC 459.00$       459.00$              CMC 490.00$        490.00$           CMC 493.00$        493.00$            CMC 470.00$            470.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

80

Etrier w tie in, 

blue 201122 CMC Rescue 8  CMC 43.35$         346.80$              CMC 51.09$           408.72$           CMC 46.35$          370.80$            CMC 44.00$               352.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

81

Multi loop straps 

yellow 201013 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 20.50$         41.00$                CMC 24.16$           48.32$             CMC 21.90$          43.80$               CMC 20.80$               41.60$              N/A NO BID -$                

82

Fast Link Pickoff 

Strap 201107 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 114.60$       458.40$              CMC 135.64$        542.56$           CMC 123.00$        492.00$            CMC 116.80$            467.20$            N/A NO BID -$                

83

Load release 

straps 201108 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 52.80$         211.20$              CMC 62.25$           249.00$           CMC 56.45$          225.80$            CMC 53.60$               214.40$            N/A NO BID -$                

84

Fast Link Anchor 

Strap 201064 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 78.80$         315.20$              CMC 92.90$           371.60$           CMC 84.25$          337.00$            CMC 80.00$               320.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

85

Anchor Straps 

Lrg 201024 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 43.35$         86.70$                CMC 51.09$           102.18$           CMC 46.35$          92.70$               CMC 44.00$               88.00$              N/A NO BID -$                

86

Anchor Straps 

Med 201023 CMC Rescue 4  CMC 41.75$         167.00$              CMC 49.24$           196.96$           CMC 44.65$          178.60$            CMC 42.40$               169.60$            N/A NO BID -$                

87 Edge guard LRG 294029 CMC Rescue 10  CMC 31.50$         315.00$              CMC 37.16$           371.60$           CMC 33.70$          337.00$            CMC  $              32.00  $           320.00 N/A NO BID -$                

88 Sure Clip 360305 CMC 2  PETZL 515.00$       1,030.00$          CMC 550.00$        1,100.00$        CMC 550.00$        1,100.00$         CMC 525.00$            1,050.00$        N/A NO BID -$                

89 Petzl Paw Large P63L Petzl 2  PETZL 56.40$         112.80$              PETZL 63.96$           127.92$           CMC 60.30$          120.60$            PETZL 70.07$               140.14$            N/A NO BID -$                

90

Petzl Paw 

Medium P63M Petzl 2  PETZL 38.75$         77.50$                *PETZL/P63S 43.96$           87.92$             CMC 41.45$          82.90$               PETZL 44.79$               89.58$              N/A NO BID -$                

91 Petzl Paw Small P63M Petzl 2  PETZL 21.15$         42.30$                PETZL 23.96$           47.92$             CMC 22.60$          45.20$               PETZL 23.67$               47.34$              N/A NO BID -$                

92

SkyHook Winch: 

Basic CMC Rescue 1  CMC 4,295.00$   4,295.00$          SKEDCO 2,660.00$     2,660.00$        CMC 4,576.00$     4,576.00$         CMC 4,576.00$         4,576.00$        N/A NO BID -$                

93

94 Rope Cutter 293203 CMC Rescue 1  CMC 144.70$       144.70$              PEARSON IND 113.90$        113.90$           CMC 154.70$        154.70$            CMC 151.20$            151.20$            N/A NO BID -$                

95 Rope End Dip 294007 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 9.50$           19.00$                

MARIRE 

DEVELOP 7.22$             14.44$             CMC 9.25$             18.50$               CMC 8.80$                 17.60$              N/A NO BID -$                

96 Rope ID markers 294012 CMC Rescue 1  CMC 29.95$         29.95$                PANDUIT 22.10$           22.10$             CMC 32.00$          32.00$               CMC 30.40$               30.40$              N/A NO BID -$                

97 Cordage Meter 267030 CMC Rescue 1  CMC 279.00$       279.00$              PERSON IND 232.73$        232.73$           CMC 298.85$        298.85$            CMC 284.00$            284.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

98

99

Petzl AVAO  Fast 

Harness Size 0 C71AFN-0U Petzl 2  PETZL 314.95$       629.90$              PETZL 359.96$        719.92$           PETZL 339.55$        679.10$            PETZL 323.51$            647.02$            N/A NO BID -$                

100

Petzl AVAO  Fast 

Harness Size 1 C71AFN-1U Petzl 8  PETZL 314.95$       2,519.60$          PETZL 359.96$        2,879.68$        PETZL 339.55$        2,716.40$         PETZL 323.51$            2,588.08$        N/A NO BID -$                

101

Petzl AVAO  Fast 

Harness Size 2 C71AFN-2U Petzl 4  PETZL 314.95$       1,259.80$          PETZL 359.96$        1,439.84$        PETZL 339.55$        1,358.20$         PETZL 323.51$            1,294.04$        N/A NO BID -$                

102 Yates Speck Pack 721903 CMC 2  CMC 1,595.00$   3,190.00$          YATES 1,482.82$     2,965.64$        CMC - YATES 1,760.00$     3,520.00$         CMC 1,749.00$         3,498.00$        N/A NO BID -$                

103

Petzl Victim 

Diaper Pitagor Petzl 2  PETZL 112.20$       224.40$              PETZL 127.16$        254.32$           PETZL 119.95$        239.90$            PETZL 114.00$            228.00$            N/A NO BID -$                

104

Life Saver Victim 

Harness 202405 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 198.60$       397.20$              CMC 234.12$        468.24$           CMC  212.35$        424.70$            CMC 201.60$            403.20$            N/A NO BID -$                

105

Life Saver Victim 

Chest Harness 202404 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 84.30$         168.60$              CMC 99.41$           198.82$           CMC 90.15$          180.30$            CMC 85.60$               171.20$            N/A NO BID -$                

106

AUXILLARY ITEMS

ACCESSORIES

PPE/PT PACKAGING

STORAGE BAG



107 Truck Cache Bag 440541               3  CMC 213.60$       640.80$              CMC 251.77$        755.31$           CMC 228.35$        685.05$            CMC  $            216.80  $           650.40 N/A NO BID -$                

108 RAT Pack 440554 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 221.45$       442.90$              CMC 261.06$        522.12$           CMC 236.80$        473.60$            CMC 224.80$            449.60$            N/A NO BID -$                

109

Large Red Duffel 

Bag 440243 CMC Rescue 8  CMC 78.00$         624.00$              CMC 91.97$           735.76$           CMC 83.40$          667.20$            CMC 79.20$               633.20$            N/A NO BID -$                

110

Heavy Rescue 

Organizer, Red 770401 CMC Rescue 2  CMC 99.20$         198.40$              CMC 116.92$        233.84$           CMC 106.05$        212.10$            CMC 108.80$            217.60$            N/A NO BID -$                

TOTAL 54,502.20$        54,908.56$     55,607.60$      62,905.12$      4,537.60$      

                                                                                                               

 *LINES 46-50 TOTAL PRICE INCORRECT ON 

VENDORS BID (TOTAL BID $468.00 SHOULD 

BE $552.00) 


