OPENING DATE & TIME: 12/18/2015 AT 2PM
BLANKET REQUIREMENTS: 02/01/2016 to 08/31/18

ATTACHMENT "A" SERTEX SYNET THIRD MILLENNIUM AMERICAN TELECONNECT AZ CORP SIGNET Telecom
Line DESCRIPTION Extended
QTY| Unit| Unit Price |Extended Price| Unit Price |Extended Price| Unit Price | Extended Price| Unit Price Price Unit Price |Extended Price| Unit Price |Extended Price| Unit Price [Extended Price|
Labor Rates: SERTEX SYNET THIRD MILLENNIUM AMERICAN TELECONNECT AZ CORP SIGNET Telecom
TSA Telecom Installation Apprentice rate 1-01-
1 |161t012-31-16
240 |Hour| 69 $16,560.00 $56.00 $13,440.00 $56.00 $13,440.00 $65.00 $15,600.00 $65.49 $15,717.60 $140.00 $33,600.00 $85.00 $20,400.00
TSA Telecom Installation Apprentice rate 1-01-;
2 |17t012-31-17
240 [Hour|  $71.00 $17,040.00 $58.00 $13,920.00 $58.00 $13,920.00 $65.00 $15,600.00 $68.77 $16,504.80 $140.00 $33,600.00 $90.00 $21,600.00
TSA Telecom Installation Apprentice rate 1-01-
3 |181t08-31-18
240 |Hour|  $72.00 $17,280.00 $60.00 $14,400.00 $60.00 $14,400.00 $70.00 $16,800.00 $72.21 $17,330.40 $140.00 $33,600.00 $95.00 $22,800.00
TST Telecom Installation Technician rate 1-01-
4 [16to 12-31-16
800 [Hour|  $88.00 $70,400.00 $68.00 $54,400.00 $68.00 $54,400.00 $70.00 $56,000.00 $65.49 $52,392.00 $140.00 $112,000.00 $90.00 $72,000.00
TST Telecom Installation Technician rate 1-01-
5 |17t012-31-17
800 |Hour|  $90.00 $72,000.00 $70.00 $56,000.00 $70.00 $56,000.00 $70.00 $56,000.00 $68.77 $55,016.00 $140.00 $112,000.00 $95.00 $76,000.00
TST Telecom Installation Technician rate 1-01-
6 [18t0 8-31-18
800 [Hour|  $92.00 $73,600.00 $72.00 $57,600.00 $72.00 $57,600.00 $70.00 $56,000.00 $72.21 $57,768.00 $140.00 $112,000.00 $100.00 $80,000.00
TST Telecom Service Technician rate 1-01-16
7 |to 12-31-16
800 |Hour|  $94.00 $75,200.00 $72.00 $57,600.00 $72.00 $57,600.00 $70.00 $56,000.00 $65.49 $52,392.00 $140.00 $112,000.00 $90.00 $72,000.00
TST Telecom Service Technician rate 1-01-17
8 |[to12-31-17
800 [Hour|  $96.00 $76,800.00 $73.00 $58,400.00 $73.00 $58,400.00 $70.00 $56,000.00 $68.77 $55,016.00 $140.00 $112,000.00 $95.00 $76,000.00
TSA Telecom Service Technician rate 1-01-18
9 |to8-31-18
800 |Hour|  $98.00 $78,400.00 $75.00 $60,000.00 $75.00 $60,000.00 $95.00 $76,000.00 $72.21 $57,768.00 $140.00 $112,000.00 $100.00 $80,000.00
Telecommunications Engineering rate 1-01-16
10 [to 12-31-16
400 |Hour|  $82.00 $32,800.00 $95.00 $38,000.00 $95.00 $38,000.00 $95.00 $38,000.00 $125.00 $50,000.00 $140.00 $56,000.00 $90.00 $36,000.00
Telecommunications Engineering rate 1-01-17
11 [to 12-31-17
400 [Hour|  $84.00 $33,600.00 $98.00 $39,200.00 $98.00 $39,200.00 $95.00 $38,000.00 $130.00 $52,000.00 $140.00 $56,000.00 $95.00 $38,000.00
Telecommunications Engineering rate 1-01-18
12 [to 8-31-18
400 |Hour|  $87.00 $34,800.00 $105.00 $42,000.00 $105.00 $42,000.00 $95.00 $38,000.00 $135.00 $54,000.00 $140.00 $56,000.00 $100.00 $40,000.00
Telecommunications Project Manager rate 1-
13 [01-16 to 12-31-16
240 |Hour| $100.00 $24,000.00 $75.00 $18,000.00 $75.00 $18,000.00 $95.00 $22,800.00 $125.00 $30,000.00 $125.00 $30,000.00 $90.00 $21,600.00
Telecommunications Project Manager rate 1-
14 [01-17 to 12-31-17
240 [Hour| $103.00 $24,720.00 $79.00 $18,960.00 $79.00 $18,960.00 $95.00 $22,800.00 $130.00 $31,200.00 $125.00 $30,000.00 $95.00 $22,800.00
Telecommunications Project Manager rate 1-
15 [01-18to 8-31-18
240 |Hour| $106.00 $25,440.00 $82.00 $19,680.00 $82.00 $19,680.00 $95.00 $22,800.00 $135.00 $32,400.00 $125.00 $30,000.00 $100.00 $24,000.00
AutoCAD Documentation Tech rate 1-01-16 to
16 [12-31-17
160 |Hour|  $57.00 $9,120.00 $85.00 $13,600.00 $85.00 $13,600.00 $95.00 $15,200.00 $125.00 $20,000.00 $140.00 $22,400.00 $80.00 $12,800.00
AutoCAD Documentation Tech rate 1-01-17 to
17 [12-31-17
160 |Hour|  $60.00 $9,600.00 $88.00 $14,080.00 $88.00 $14,080.00 $95.00 $15,200.00 $130.00 $20,800.00 $140.00 $22,400.00 $85.00 $13,600.00
AutoCAD Documentation Tech rate 1-01-18 to
18 [8-31-18
160 |Hour|  $62.00 $9,920.00 $92.00 $14,720.00 $92.00 $14,720.00 $95.00 $15,200.00 $135.00 $21,600.00 $140.00 $22,400.00 $90.00 $14,400.00
19 |Fusion Splicer Per Hour 1-01-16 to 12-31-16
160 |Hour| $105.00 $16,800.00 $95.00 $15,200.00 $95.00 $15,200.00 $50.00 $8,000.00 $65.49 $10,478.40 $110.00 $17,600.00 $90.00 $14,400.00
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ATTACHMENT "A" SERTEX SYNET THIRD MILLENNIUM AMERICAN TELECONNECT AZ CORP SIGNET Telecom
20 |Fusion Splicer Per Hour 1-01-17 to 12-31-17
160 |Hour| $107.00 $17,120.00 $97.00 $15,520.00 $97.00 $15,520.00 $50.00 $8,000.00 $68.77 $11,003.20 $110.00 $17,600.00 $95.00 $15,200.00
21 |Fusion Splicer Per Hour 1-01-18 to 8-31-18
160 |Hour| $110.00 $17,600.00 $105.00 $16,800.00 $105.00 $16,800.00 $50.00 $8,000.00 $72.21 $11,553.60 $110.00 $17,600.00 $100.00 $16,000.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour Telecom
22 |Installation Apprentice 1-01-16 to 12-31-16
160 |Hour|  $88.00 $14,080.00 $77.00 $12,320.00 $77.00 $12,320.00 $97.50 $15,600.00 $91.69 $14,670.40 $210.00 $33,600.00 $110.00 $17,600.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour Telecom
23 _|Installation Apprentice 1-01-17 to 12-31-17
160 |Hour|  $90.00 $14,400.00 $79.00 $12,640.00 $79.00 $12,640.00 $97.50 $15,600.00 $96.28 $15,404.80 $210.00 $33,600.00 $115.00 $18,400.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour Telecom
24 |Installation Apprentice 1-01-18 to 8-31-18
160 |Hour|  $92.00 $14,720.00 $80.00 $12,800.00 $80.00 $12,800.00 $105.00 $16,800.00 $101.09 $16,174.40 $210.00 $33,600.00 $120.00 $19,200.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour TST Telecom
25 _|Installation Technician 1-01-16 to 12-31-16
160 |Hour| $107.00 $17,120.00 $93.00 $14,880.00 $93.00 $14,880.00 $105.00 $16,800.00 $91.69 $14,670.40 $210.00 $33,600.00 $110.00 $17,600.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour TST Telecom
26 [Installation Technician 1-01-17 to 12-31-17
160 |Hour| $110.00 $17,600.00 $95.00 $15,200.00 $95.00 $15,200.00 $105.00 $16,800.00 $96.28 $15,404.80 $210.00 $33,600.00 $115.00 $18,400.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour TST Telecom
27 _|Installation Technician 1-01-18 to 8-31-18
160 |Hour| $113.00 $18,080.00 $98.00 $15,680.00 $98.00 $15,680.00 $105.00 $16,800.00 $101.09 $16,174.40 $210.00 $33,600.00 $120.00 $19,200.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour Telecom Service
28 |[Technician 1-01-16 to 12-31-16
160 |Hour| $115.00 $18,400.00 $95.00 $15,200.00 $95.00 $15,200.00 $105.00 $16,800.00 $91.69 $14,670.40 $210.00 $33,600.00 $110.00 $17,600.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour Telecom Service
29 |Technician 1-01-17 to 12-31-17
160 |Hour| $118.00 $18,880.00 $96.00 $15,360.00 $96.00 $15,360.00 $105.00 $16,800.00 $96.28 $15,404.80 $210.00 $33,600.00 $115.00 $18,400.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour Telecom Service
30 [Technician 1-01-18 to 8-31-18
160 |Hour| $121.00 $19,360.00 $98.00 $15,680.00 $98.00 $15,680.00 $105.00 $16,800.00 $101.09 $16,174.40 $210.00 $33,600.00 $120.00 $19,200.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour
Telecommunications Engineering 1-01-16 to
31 [12-31-16
160 |Hour|  $82.00 $13,120.00 $110.00 $17,600.00 $110.00 $17,600.00 $142.50 $22,800.00 $125.00 $20,000.00 $210.00 $33,600.00 $110.00 $17,600.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour
Telecommunications Engineering 1-01-17 to
32 [12-31-17
160 |Hour|  $84.00 $13,440.00 $112.00 $17,920.00 $112.00 $17,920.00 $142.50 $22,800.00 $130.00 $20,800.00 $210.00 $33,600.00 $115.00 $18,400.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour
Telecommunications Engineering 1-01-18 to 8-
33 |31-18
160 |Hour|  $87.00 $13,920.00 $115.00 $18,400.00 $115.00 $18,400.00 $142.50 $22,800.00 $135.00 $21,600.00 $210.00 $33,600.00 $120.00 $19,200.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour
Telecommunications Project Manager 1-01-16
34 |to 12-31-16
160 |Hour| $100.00 $16,000.00 $97.00 $15,520.00 $97.00 $15,520.00 $142.50 $22,800.00 $125.00 $20,000.00 $187.50 $30,000.00 $110.00 $17,600.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour
Telecommunications Project Manager 1-01-17
35 [to12-31-17
160 |Hour| $103.00 $16,480.00 $99.00 $15,840.00 $99.00 $15,840.00 $142.50 $22,800.00 $130.00 $20,800.00 $187.50 $30,000.00 $115.00 $18,400.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour
Telecommunications Project Manager 1-01-18
36 |to 8-31-18
160 |Hour| $106.00 $16,960.00 $101.00 $16,160.00 $101.00 $16,160.00 $142.50 $22,800.00 $135.00 $21,600.00 $187.50 $30,000.00 $120.00 $19,200.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour AutoCAD
37 _|Documentation Tech 1-01-16 to 12-31-16
160 |Hour|  $77.00 $12,320.00 $105.00 $16,800.00 $105.00 $16,800.00 $142.50 $22,800.00 $125.00 $20,000.00 $210.00 $33,600.00 $105.00 $16,800.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour AutoCAD
38__|Documentation Tech 1-01-17 to 12-31-17
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160 Hour|  $80.00 | $12,800.00 | $108.00 | $17.280.00 | $108.00 | $17.280.00 | $14250 | $22,800.00 | $130.00 | $20,800.00 | $210.00 | $33.600.00 | $110.00 | $17.600.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour AUtoCAD
39 [Documentation Tech 1-01-18 to 8-31-18
160 [Hour| $84.00 | $13.440.00 | $110.00 | $17,600.00 | $110.00 | $17.600.00 | $14250 | $22,800.00 | $135.00 | $21,600.00 | $210.00 | $33,600.00 | $115.00 | $18,400.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour Fusion Splicer 1-
40 |01-16 to 12-31-16
160 [Hour| $126.00 | $20,160.00 | $125.00 | $20,000.00 | $12500 | $20,00000 | $7500 | $12,000.00 | $91.69 | $14,670.40 | $16500 | $26.400.00 | $115.00 | $18,400.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour Fusion Splicer 1-
41 |01-17 to 12-31-17
160 [Hour|  $129.00 | $20,640.00 | $120.00 | $20,640.00 | $129.00 | $20640.00 | $75.00 | $12,000.00 | $96.28 | $15404.80 | $165.00 | $26.400.00 | $120.00 | $19,200.00
OVERTIME RATE Per Hour Fusion Splicer 1-
42 |01-18108-31-18
160 [Hour| $132.00 | $21120.00 | $132.00 | $21.120.00 | $132.00 | $2112000 | $75.00 | $12.000.00 | $101.09 | $16,174.40 | $16500 | $26.400.00 | $125.00 | $20,000.00
Material & Equipments Rates: SERTEX SYNET THIRD MILLENNIUM | AMERICAN TELECONNECT AZ CORP SIGNET Telecom
Telescopic or Stinger Boom Bucket Truck 29'
43 _|to 32' per hour 1-01-16 1o 12-31-16 240 |Hour| _ $32.00 $7,680.00 | $125.00 | $30,000.00 | $125.00 | $30,000.00 | $80.00 | $19,200.00 | $26.00 $6,240.00 | $125.00 | $30,000.00 NA no bid
Telescopic or Stinger Boom Bucket Truck 29'
44|10 32’ per hour 1-01-17 to 12-31-17 240 | Hour| _ $33.00 $7.920.00 | $150.00 | $36,000.00 | $150.00 | $36,000.00 | $80.00 | $19,200.00 | $28.00 $6,720.00 | $125.00 | $30,000.00 NA no bid
Telescopic or Stinger Boom Bucket Truck 29'
to 32' per hour 1-01-18 to 8-31-18 )
45 _{to 32 per hour 0 240 | Hour| _ $34.00 $8.160.00 | $175.00 | $42,000.00 | $17500 | $42,000.00 | $80.00 | $19,200.00 | $30.00 $7,200.00 | $125.00 | $30,000.00 NA no bid
Line Truck with a Telescopic or Stinger Boom
46 _{Bucket per hour 1-01-16 to 12-31-16 80 |Hour| $45.00 $3,600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $100.00 |  $8,000.00 NA no bid $125.00 | $10,000.00 NA no bid
Line Truck with a Telescopic or Stinger Boom
47 _{Bucket per hour 1-01-17 to 12-31-17 80 |Hour| $47.00 $3,760.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $100.00 |  $8,000.00 NA no bid $125.00 | $10,000.00 NA no bid
Line Truck with a Telescopic or Stinger Boom
Bucket per hour 1-01-18 to 8-31-18 ) )
48 _Bucket per hour 0 80 |Hour| $48.00 $3,840.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $100.00 |  $8,000.00 NA no bid $125.00 | $10,000.00 NA no bid
4000W-5000W Portable Generator Per Hour 1-
49 _101-161012-31-16 160 [Hour| _ $10.00 $1,600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $25.00 $4,000.00 $5.00 $800.00 N/A NIA NA no bid
4000W-5000W Portable Generator Per Hour 1-
50_101-171012-31-17 160 [Hour| _ $11.00 $1,760.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $25.00 $4,000.00 $6.00 $960.00 N/A NIA NA no bid
4000W-5000W Portable Generator Per Hour 1-
51 |01-18108-31-18
160 [Hour| _$12.00 $1,020.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $25.00 $4,000.00 $7.00 $1,120.00 N/A NIA NA no bid
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ATTACHMENT "A" SERTEX SYNET THIRD MILLENNIUM AMERICAN TELECONNECT AZ CORP SIGNET Telecom
SERTEX SYNET THIRD MILLENNIUM AMERICAN TELECONNECT AZ CORP SIGNET Telecom
Provide % Mark-Up on Materials over cost: PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
Provide % Mark-Up on Materials over cost 1-
52 101-16 to 12-31-16
15 10 10 10 10 20% 15% 15% 5%
Provide % Mark-Up on Materials over cost 1-
53 01-17 to 12-31-17
15 12 12 12 12 20% 15% 15% 5%
Provide % Mark-Up on Materials over cost 1-
54 101-18 to 8-31-18
15 14 14 14 14 20% 15% 15% 5%
SERTEX SYNET THIRD MILLENNIUM AMERICAN TELECONNECT AZ CORP SIGNET Telecom
Provide % Mark-Up on Manutactures
Equipment over cost: PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
$15.00 $15.00
55 |ADC 15.00% $15.00 $15.00 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
56 |3M 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
57 __|American Power Conversion 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
58 |AMP 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
59 |Belden 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
60 |NEXAN 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
61 |B-Line 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
62 |Carlon 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
63 | Chatsworth 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
64 |Commscope 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
65 |Corning 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
66 __|Eaton 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
67 |Fluke 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
68 |Geist 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
69 |General Cable 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
70 |Guardian Telecom 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
71 |Hubbell 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
72 |Leviton 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
73 |Maxcell 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
74 _|Middle Atlantic 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
75 |Mohawk 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
76 _|Molex 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
77__|Ortronics 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
78 _|Panduit 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
79 |Rittal 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
80 _|Superior Essex 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
81 |Systimax 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
82 |Tripp Lite 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
83 |Wiremold 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
84 |Mitel 15.00% 15 15 20.00% 15% 15% 5%
Minimum % Mark-Up for Manufactures
85 |Equipment Cost not listed. 15.00% 15.00% 15.00% 20.00% 15% 15% 5%




	Sheet1

