STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Department of Administration
DIVISION OF PURCHASES
One Capitol Hill

Providence, R1 02908-5855

Tel: (401) 574-8100
Fax: (401) 574-8387
Website: www.purchasing.ri.gov

CONTRACT USER GUIDE
NON-ALTERNATIVE FUEL VEHICLES 2016 MODEL YEAR
MASTER PRICE AGREEMENT (“MPA”) #4782016

BID SOLICITATION #7549881
CONTRACT TERM 11/1/2015 - 12/31/2018
WITH NO RENEWAL OPTIONS

BACKGROUND:

The Division of Purchases issued Non-Alternative Fuel Vehicles Model Year 2016 bid
solicitation #7549881 in response to agency procurement needs and current mass-produced
technologies. The request for quotes included a comprehensive listing of current Non-
Alternative Fuel Vehicles makes and models. There are five suppliers awarded various non-
alternative fuel vehicle types including conventional/unleaded fuel vehicles include the
following types of vehicles: passenger, Mini Cargo Van, SUV, Passenger Car, Pick -Up
Trucks, Cargo Van, and Passenger Van. Contract Amendments will be posted to the State
Website for 2017 and 2018 model year vehicle pricing when applicable.

WHO CAN USE THIS CONTRACT:

STATEWIDE APPLICABILITY - Political Subdivisions (cities, towns, schools, quasi-
public agencies), as authorized by law, may participate in this Agreement. All ordering and
billing shall be between the vendor and the political subdivision (only).

STATE AGENCY REQUIREMENTS:

e Any State Agency requesting a vehicle purchase must coordinate the purchase
request through the Office of Fleet Operations.

Contact Connie Resendes, State Fleet Operations
Tel:  401-222-6227

e Upon approval the agency must perform a contract
release against the appropriate Purchase Order.

AGENCIES SHOULD BE AWARE OF THE FOLLOWING CONDITIONS;
CONTAINED IN THE ORIGINAL SOLICITATION:

1. Order Confirmation: Vendor is to provide written confirmation of order to the Office
of State Fleet Operations / Connie Resendes within (30) days of order placement and
must include am anticipated delivery date.

2. Keys: Each vehicle is to be delivered with two (2) sets of keys.
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3. Warranty: Standard Manufactures warranty and operators manual shall be furnished in
the glove compartment of each vehicle. All written warranties and warranty cards are to
be furnished in the glove compartment of each vehicle delivered.

4. All deliveries must include a minimum of % tank of fuel. Fuel gauges which fail to register a
minimum of ¥ tank of fuel will be charges for the actual cost of fuel (to reach % full) plus $100
labor charge per vehicle. This amount, where applicable will be deducted from the invoice.

5. All vehicles are to be delivered without dealer’s name or advertising of any type visible on the
body.

6. Delivered vehicles will not be accepted with an odometer reading greater than 150 miles.

7. Delivery location, unless otherwise specified with order placement will be:

STATE FLEET PARKING LOT
SPRING BROOK ROAD
SCITUATE, RI

8. All deliveries must be coordinated with Connie Resendes (401-222-6227) at least two (2)
days in advance.

9. Preparation for Delivery: At time of delivery, the vehicle will be inspected to ensure that
all specifications have been met. The cooling system of each vehicle is to be protected
with permanent type anti-freeze to a temperature of at least thirty-four degrees below zero
(F). Vehicles must be delivered with all equipment in place, cleaned, lubricated, services
and ready for operation.

10. A Certificate of Origin / window sticker must accompany each vehicle at the time of
delivery. In addition, completed registration paperwork must be provided. For instructions
on title assignment, contact Connie Resendes at 401-222-6227.

VENDOR AWARDS CONTACT INFORMATION:

Purchase Order # 3439779

Vendor Name: Balise, C LLC dba Balise Chevrolet of Warwick
Contact Name: Peter Delgado
Tel: 401-780-3634
Email: pdelgado@baliseauto.com

Purchase Order # 3439812

Vendor Name: Colonial Ford
Contact Name: Eric Uliano
Tel: 978-263-1000
Email: eric@colonialautomotive.com

Purchase Order # 3439809

Vendor Name: Gordon Chevrolet Geo Inc. d/b/a Colonial Chevrolet
Contact Name: Eric Uliano
Tel: 978-263-1000

Email: eric@colonialautomotive.com
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Purchase Order # 3439784

Vendor Name: Liberty Chevrolet
Contact Name: Kevin Nugent
Tel: 781-246-1919
Email: libertychev@nedda.com

Purchase Order # 3439770

Vendor Name: Tasca Automotive
Contact Name: Daniel Rawson
Tel: 860-829-3768
Email: drawson@tasca.com

DIVISION OF PURCHASES CONTACT:
Name: Gary P. Mosca

Title:  Senior Buyer

Tel: 4011-574-8124

Email: gary.mosca@purchasing.ri.gov
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STATE OF RHODE ISLAND Solicitation #7549881

2016 MODEL YEAR VEHICLE INDEX NON - ALTERNATIVE FUEL

CONVENTIONAL/UNLEADED (MPA4782016)

i ) . Ma:gfe:cltfzrer S&E;Cklzy S,\ﬁzzlg MPG Anticipated Delivery | Last Available
Section | Spec# DESCRIPTION Fuel Type Supplier Base Price Liter City/Highway | GVW-LBS | from time of order Order Date
200 VAN MINI PASSENGER CONVENTIONAL/UNLEADED
200.1 VAN, MINI, 5-7 PASSENGER - 2WD UNLEADED /4 CYL UNLEADED Tasca $21,120.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford Transit Connect Wagon 2.5(19/21 4820 |22-24 weeks TBD
200.2 VAN, MINI, 5-7 PASSENGER - 2WD UNLEADED /6 CYL UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
200.3 VAN, MINI, 5-7 PASSENGER - AWD UNLEADED /4 CYL UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
200.4 VAN, MINI, 5-7 PASSENGER - AWD UNLEADED /6 CYL UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
201 VAN MINI CARGO CONVENTIONAL/UNLEADED
201.1 VAN MINI-CARGO 2WD- UNLEADED /4 CYL UNLEADED Tasca $19,140.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford Transit Connect Van 2.5(20/28 5020 | 22-24 weeks TBD
201.2 VAN MINI-CARGO 2WD UNLEADED/, 6CYL UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
201.3 VAN MINI-CARGO AWD- UNLEADED /4 CYL UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
201.4 VAN MINI-CARGO AWD UNLEADED/, 6CYL UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
202 SUV SM 2WD, 4WD, AWD CONVENTIONAL/UNLEADED
202.1 SUV SM, 2WD 4 PASSENGER UNLEADED /4 CYL UNLEADED Colonial Chevrolet $17,824.00 | General Motors Chevrolet Trax 1.4/26/34 N/A <200 Days N/A
202.2 SUV SM, 4WD/AWD, 4PASSENGER UNLEADED/ 4 CYL, UNLEADED Colonial Chevrolet $19,219.00 | General Motors Chevrolet Trax 1.4(24/31 N/A <200 Days N/A
202.3 SUV SM, 2WD 4 PASSENGER UNLEADED/ 6 CYL UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
202.4 SUV SM, 4WD/AWD 4 PASSENGER UNLEADED/ 6 CYLINDER UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
203 SUV MID 2WD, 4WD, AWD CONVENTIONAL/UNLEADED
203.1 SUV MID 2WD 5PASSENGER UNLEADED /4 CYLINDER UNLEADED Colonial Chevrolet| $ 19,582.00 | General Motors Chevrolet Equinox 2.4(22/32 N/A <120 Days N/A
203.2 SUV MID 4WD/AWD 5PASSENGER UNLEADED/ 4 CYLINDER UNLEADED Colonial Chevrolet| $ 21,192.00 |General Motors Chevrolet Equinox 2.4(20/27 N/A <120 Days N/A
203.3 SUV MID 2WD, 5PASSENGER UNLEADED/ 6 CYLINDER UNLEADED Liberty Chevrolet $23,987.00 |General Motors Chevrolet Traverse 3.6(17/24 6,411{8-10 weeks 2016 Model Year
203.4 SUV MID 4WD/AWD, 5PASSENGER UNLEADED/ 6CYLINDER UNLEADED Colonial Chevrolet $25,491.00 | General Motors Chevrolet Equinox 3.6]16/23 N/A <120 Days N/A
204 PASSENGER CAR CONVENTIONAL/UNLEADED
204.1 PASSENGER CAR COMPACT (MIN 4CYL/WHEELBASE MIN 94", MAX 108.5") UNLEADED Tasca $14,820.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford Fiesta SE 1.6(27/37 N/A 14-16 weeks TBD
204.2 PASSENGER CAR MIDSIZE (MIN 4CYL/WHEELBASE MIN 100", MAX 113") UNLEADED Tasca $15,525.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford Focus SE 2|27/40 N/A 14-16 weeks TBD
204.3 PASSENGER CAR MIDSIZE (MIN 6CYL/WHEELBASE MIN 100", MAX 114”) UNLEADED Colonial Chevrolet] $17,281.00 |General Motors Chevrolet Impala 3.5/18/30 N/A <120 Days N/A
205 PICKUPS 2WD CONVENTIONAL/UNLEADED
‘GVWR:Min 6000LBS, 2WD- CONVENTIONAL /UNLEADED
205.1 REG CAB/SHORT BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $17,989.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-150 3.5/18/25 6010{14-16 weeks TBD
205.2 REG CAB/LONG BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $18,250.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-150 3.5/18/25 6100{14-16 weeks TBD
205.3 EXTENDED CAB/SHORT BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $19,940.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-150 3.5/18/25 6100{14-16 weeks TBD
205.4 EXTENDED CAB/LONG BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $ 20,912.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-150 2.7 Eco Boost |19/26 6500(14-16 weeks TBD
205.5 CREW CAB/SHORT BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $22,088.00 | Ford Motor Company Ford F-150 3.5/18/25 6150{14-16 weeks TBD
205.6 CREW CAB LONG BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca 23,059.00 Ford Motor Company Ford F-150 2.7 Eco Boost |19/26 635014-16 weeks TBD
GVWR: Min 8600 LBS, 2WD- CONVENTIONAL /UNLEADED
205.7 REG CAB/SHORT BED 2WD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
205.8 REG CAB/LONG BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $20,963.00 | Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 9900{10-12 weeks TBD
205.9 EXTENDED CAB/SHORT BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $23,073.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2[N/A 9900 [10-12 weeks TBD
205.10 EXTENDED CAB/LONG BED 2WD UNLEADED Colonial Ford $23,247.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 9900<120 Days TBD
205.11 CREW CAB/SHORT BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $23,690.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 9900{10-12 weeks TBD
205.12 CREW CAB LONG BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $23,865.00 | Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 9900{10-12 weeks TBD
GVWR: Min 10,000 LBS, 2WD- CONVENTIONAL /UNLEADED
205.13 REG CAB/SHORT BED 2WD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
205.14 REG CAB/LONG BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $20,963.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
205.15 EXTENDED CAB/SHORT BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $23,073.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
205.16 EXTENDED CAB/LONG BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $23,247.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
205.17 CREW CAB/SHORT BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $23,690.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
205.18 CREW CAB LONG BED 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $23,865.00 | Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
206 PICKUPS 4WD CONVENTIONAL/UNLEADED
‘GVWR:Min 6000LBS, 4WD- CONVENTIONAL /UNLEADED
206.1 REG CAB/SHORT BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $20,853.00 | Ford Motor Company Ford F-150 3.5/17/23 6050{14-16 weeks TBD
206.2 REG CAB/LONG BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $21,116.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-150 3.5/17/23 6100{14-16 weeks TBD
206.3 EXTENDED CAB/SHORT BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $22,938.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-150 3.5/17/23 6300{14-16 weeks TBD
206.4 EXTENDED CAB/LONG BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $24,552.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-150 5[15/21 7000{14-16 weeks TBD
206.5 CREW CAB/SHORT BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $25,160.00 | Ford Motor Company Ford F-150 3.5/17/23 6350{14-16 weeks TBD
206.6 CREW CAB LONG BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $26,699.00 | Ford Motor Company Ford F-150 5[15/21 7050{14-16 weeks TBD
GVWR: Min 8600 LBS, 4WD- CONVENTIONAL /UNLEADED
206.7 [REG CAB/SHORT BED_4WD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
206.8 |REG CAB/LONG BED 4wD UNLEADED Tasca $23,195.00 | Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000]10-12 weeks TBD
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206.9 EXTENDED CAB/SHORT BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $25,309.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
206.10 EXTENDED CAB/LONG BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $25,487.00 | Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
206.11 CREW CAB/SHORT BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $26,127.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
206.12 CREW CAB LONG BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $26,305.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
GVWR: Min 10,000 LBS, 4WD- CONVENTIONAL /UNLEADED
206.13 REG CAB/SHORT BED 4WD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
206.14 REG CAB/LONG BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $23,195.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
206.15 EXTENDED CAB/SHORT BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $25,309.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
206.16 EXTENDED CAB/LONG BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $25,487.00 | Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
206.17 CREW CAB/SHORT BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $26,127.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
206.18 CREW CAB LONG BED 4WD UNLEADED Tasca $26,305.00 | Ford Motor Company Ford F-250 6.2|N/A 10000(10-12 weeks TBD
207 CARGO VANS 2WD CONVENTIONAL/UNLEADED
207.1 CARGO VAN 2WD MIN 125" WHEELBASE 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $21,077.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford Transit Van 3.7]14/18 8600 [10-12 weeks TBD
207.2 CARGO VAN MIN 135” WHEELBASE 2WD UNLEADED Colonial Chevrolet $20,633.00 | General Motors Chevrolet Express 4.8[N/A 8600 (<120 Days N/A
207.3 CARGO VAN MIN 155" WHEELBASE 2WD UNLEADED Colonial Chevrolet $22,307.00 | General Motors Chevrolet Express 4.8[N/A 8600 (<120 Days N/A
207.4 CARGO VAN EXTENDED LENGTH MIN 155” WHEELBASE 2WD UNLEADED Balise Chevrolet $22,824.00 | General Motors Chevrolet Express 4.8L TBD 8600 [8-16 weeks
208 CARGO VANS 4WD. AWD CONVENTIONAL/UNLEADED
208.1 CARGO VAN MIN 125" WHEELBASE 4WD/AWD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
208.1 CARGO VAN MIN 135" WHEELBASE 4WD/AWD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
208.1 CARGO VAN MIN 155” WHEELBASE 4WD/AWD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
208.1 CARGO VAN EXTENDED LENGTH MIN 155" WHEELBASE 4WD/AWD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
209 PASSENGER VANS 2WD CONVENTIONAL/UNLEADED
209.1 PASSENGER VAN MIN 125" WHEELBASE 2WD UNLEADED Tasca $22,863.00 |Ford Motor Company Ford Transit Wagon 3.7]14/18 8550(10-12 weeks TBD
209.2 8 PASSENGER VAN MIN 135” WHEELBASE 2WD UNLEADED Balise Chevrolet $22,451.00 | General Motors Chevrolet Express 2500 4.8L 11/17 MPG 8600 [8-16 weeks N/A
209.3 10 PASSENGER VAN MIN 135" WHEELBASE 2WD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
209.4 12 PASSENGER VAN LENGTH MIN 135” WHEELBASE 2WD UNLEADED Colonial Chevrolet $22,860.00 | General Motors Chevrolet Express 2500 4.8[N/A 8600 (<120 Days N/A
209.5 15 PASSENGER VAN EXTENDED LENGTH MIN 155" WHEELBASE 2WD UNLEADED Colonial Chevrolet| $26,062.00 |General Motors Chevrolet Express 3500 4.8|N/A 9600<120 Days N/A
210 PASSENGER VANS 4WD/AWD CONVENTIONAL/UNLEADED
210.1 PASSENGER VAN MIN 125" WHEELBASE 4WD/AWD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
210.2 8 PASSENGER VAN MIN 135" WHEELBASE 4WD/AWD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
2103 10 PASSENGER VAN MIN 135" WHEELBASE 4WD/AWD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
2104 12 PASSENGER VAN LENGTH MIN 135" WHEELBASE 4WD/AWD UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
210.5 15_PASSENGER VAN EXTENDED LENGTH MIN 155" WHEELBASE 4WD/AWD _|UNLEADED No Bid No Bid
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