State of Rhode Island, Department of Administration
Division of Purchases

One Capitol Hill

Providence, Rhode Island 02908
www.purchasing.ri.gov (401)574-8100

This solicitation has been awarded to the following vendor(s):

Vendor Name PO Number

ELOT ELECTRONICS RECYCLING INC 3453527



7549848 MPA 432 UNIVERSAL WASTE RECYCLING OF LAMPS AND BATTERIES

OPENED 10/13/15 AT 10:30 AM

AMERICAN LAMP |ELOT NLR VEOLIA
1 11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE PER FOOT FOR STRAIGHT FLUORESCENT LAMPS, LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS 1.00 Foot
BELOW,
0.14 0.10 0.06 0.07
2 7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE PER FOOT FOR STRAIGHT 1.00 Foot
FLUORESCENT LAMPS. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS
BELOW. 0.14 0.10 0.06 0.07
3 7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE PER FOOT FOR 1.00 Foot
STRAIGHT FLUORESCENT LAMPS. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS
BELOW 0.14 0.11 0.06] 0.07
4 11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE EACH FOR U-TUBE, 1.00 Each ||
CIRCLINE FLUORESCENT LAMPS. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 0.60 0.33 0.32 0.35
5 7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE EACH FOR U-TUBE, 1.00 Each |L
CIRCLINE FLUORESCENT LAMPS. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 0.60 0.34 0.32 0.35
6 7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE EACH FOR U-TUBE, 1.00 Each
CIRCLINE FLUORESCENT LAMPS. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 0.60 0.35 0.32 0.35
7 11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE EACH FOR COMPACT FLUORESCENT LAMPS. LIST QUANTITY 1.00 Each
BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 0.55 0.33 0.32 0.35
8 7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE EACH FOR COMPACT 1.00 Each ||
FLUORESCENT LAMPS. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 0.55 0.34 0.32 0.35
7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE EACH FOR COMPACT 1.00 Each
FLUORESCENT LAMPS. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 0.55 0.35 0.32 0.35
10 11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR 1.00 Pound
AKALINE BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW.
1.00 0.32 0.60 0.65
11 7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR AKALINE 1.00 Pound
BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW.
1.00 0.33 0.60 0.65
12 7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR 1.00 Pound
AKALINE BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW.
1.00 0.34 0.60 0.65
13 11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR 1 Pound “ "
AKALINE WITH MERCURY BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 6.50 0.55 0.60 4.50
14 7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR AKALINE 1.00 Pound || ||
WITH MERCURY BATTERIES, LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 6.50 0.60 0.60 4.50]
15 7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR 1.00 Pound ||
AKALINE WITH MERCURY BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 6.50 0.65 0.60 4.50
16 11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR LITHIUM 1.00 Pound || I
BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 7.00 0.55 2.25 5.50
17 7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR LITHIUM 1.00 Pound H l
BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 7.00 0.60 2.25 5.50
18 7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR LITHIUM 1.00 Pound |
BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 7.00 0.65 2.25 5.50
19 11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR SILVER OXIDE BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY 1.00 Pound " |
BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW, 3.50|{N/C. No Chd 2.25 3.50
20 7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR SILVER 1.00 Pound "
OXIDE BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 3.50[IN/C. No Chq 2.25 3.50
21 7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR SILVER 1.00 Pound || J|
OXIDE BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW, 3.50|N/C. No Ch 225 3.50]
22 11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR 1.00 Pound " I
MERCURY BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW. 6.50 0.75 2.50 4.50




23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

33

34

35

36

37

38

39

40

41

42

7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR

MERCURY BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW.

7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR

MERCURY BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW.

11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE FOR ALL TYPES OF HID

LAMPS. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW

7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE FOR ALL TYPES OF HID

LAMPS. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW

7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE FOR ALL TYPES OF HID LAMPS. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND
COMMENTS BELOW

11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR ALL

TYPES ELECTRICAL BALLASTS WITH PCB'S. LIST QUANTITY BREAK AND COMMENTS
BELOW

7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR ALL

TYPES ELECTRICAL BALLASTS WITH PCB'S. LIST QUANTITY BREAK AND COMMENTS
BELOW

7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR ALL

TYPES ELECTRICAL BALLASTS WITH PCB'S. LIST QUANTITY BREAK AND COMMENTS
BELOW

11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR ALL

TYPES ELECTRICAL BALLASTS WITH NO PCB'S. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW

7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR ALL
TYPES ELECTRICAL BALLASTS WITH NO PCB'S. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW

7/1/16 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR ALL
TYPES ELECTRICAL BALLASTS WITH NO PCB'S. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS BELOW

11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR ALL
TYPES OF CONDENSERS WITH PCB'S. LISTS QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS

BELOW
7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR ALL TYPES OF CONDENSERS WITH PCB'S. LISTS

QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS

BELOW

7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR ALL

TYPES OF CONDENSERS WITH PCB'S. LISTS QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS
BELOW

11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR ALL

TYPES OF CONDENSERS WITH NO PCB'S. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS
BELOW

7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR ALL

TYPES OF CONDENSERS WITH NO PCB'S. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS
BELOW

7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID A PRICE PER POUND FOR ALL

TYPES OF CONDENSERS WITH NO PCB'S. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS
BELOW

11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID PRICE PER POUND FOR LEAD

ACID BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS

BELOW

7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID PRICE PER POUND FOR LEAD ACID

BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS

BELOW

7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID PRICE PER POUND FOR LEAD ACID BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS
AND COMMENTS BELOW

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

Pound

Pound

Each

Each

Each

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

6.50" 0.75 z.so" 4.50|
6.50" 0.75 2.50" 4.so|
1.50 1.05 0.75 0.7o|
1.50" 1.10" 0.75 o.70|
1.50 115 0.75 o.70|
1.00 0.55 0.45 0.65
1.00 0.55 0.45 0.65
1.00 0.55 0.45 0.65
0.25|IN/C. No Ch4 0.25 0.15
0.25||N/C. No Ch4 025 0.15
1.25{[N/C. No Chd 0.25 0.15
0.55 0.45 1.35

0.55 0.45 1.35

0.55 0.45 1.35)

N/C. No Chd 0.25 0.35
IN/C. No Ch4 0.25 0.35
N/C. No Chd 025 035
0.25IN/C. No Ch 0.10 0.10}
0.25IN/C. No Chd 0.10 0.10|
O.ZSHN/C. No Ch3 0.10" o.m
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11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID PRICE PER POUND FOR MIXED
BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS
BELOW

7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID PRICE PER POUND FOR MIXED
BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS

BELOW

7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID PRICE PER POUND FOR MIXED

BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS

BELOW

11/1/15 - 6/30/16 BID PRICE PER POUND FOR SEALED

NICKEL CADIUM BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS
BELOW

7/1/16 - 6/30/17 BID PRICE PER POUND FOR SEALED

NICKEL CADIUM BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS
BELOW

7/1/17 - 10/30/17 BID PRICE PER POUND FOR SEALED

NICKEL CADIUM BATTERIES. LIST QUANTITY BREAKS AND COMMENTS
BELOW

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Pound

Sorting Fee:

$1.25/LB then

charged by type 0.75 1.45|I[NO BID

Sorting Fee:

$1.25/LB then

charged by type 0.80 1.45|INO BID

Sorting Fee: -

$1.25/LB then

charged by type 0.85 1.45||[NO BID
0.60, 0.10 0.10 0.64
0.60, 0.15] 0.10 0.64
0.60|| 0.20, 0.10, 0.64




