State of Rhode Island, Department of Administration
Division of Purchases

One Capitol Hill

Providence, Rhode Island 02908
www.purchasing.ri.gov (401)574-8100

This solicitation has been awarded to the following vendor(s):

Vendor Name PO Number
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES INC 3417519
EH TURF SUPPLY INC 3417517

TURF ENHANCEMENT ENTERPRISES 3417515



BID - 7549349
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GRASS SEED - GREENS - PENN TRIO CREEPING
19 BENTGRASS 25 LB - NO SUBSTITUTIONS s|PAIL $204.17 NO BID NO BID
GRASS SEED - TEES BARENGRUG RPR PERRENNIAL
20 RYEGRASS 50 LB - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 10|BAG $103.33 NO BID) NO BID
FATRWAYS AND ROUGH - PARK AND ATHLETIC
MIXTURES SEED AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS 50 LBS
34.31% NOTABLE PERRENNIAL RYE GRASS - 29.77%
GLADSTONE (3257) KENTUCKEY BLUEGRASS - 19.49% SUN & SHADE PARK PARK AND ATHLETIC
CRRPING RED FESCUE - 14.74% BRITTANY CLHEWING SEED MIX 50 LB : MIX SUBSTITUTE
21 FESCUE - NO SUBS 65|BAG BAG $87.50|- $97.06 NO BID NO BID
FERTILIZER - GREENS - COUNTRY CLUB MD 18-03-18
22 MICRO GREENS 50LB SGN 100 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 30{BAG $50.00 $50.00 NO BID, NO BID!
MILORGANITE GREENS GRADE FERTILIZER 6-2-0 WITH MILORGANITE
23 4% IRON 50 LB 10|BAG REENS GRADE 6-2-0 $13.00 NO BID NO BID
ROWTH PRODUCTS
GROTH PRODUCTS - 18-03-06 THE CLASSIC 2.5GAL - NO 8-3-6 SUBSTITUTE
24 SUBSTITUTIONS 15|GALLON ORON 18-3-6 $32.50 NO BID NO BID|
25 FERTILIZER 28-2-10 - 50 LB - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 60[BAG $26.90 NO BID|
GREENS MICRONUTRIENTS - ASTRON - NO
26 SUBSTITUTIONS 1fcase NO BID) NOBID[H  MICRELTOTAL|  $208.68 $425.00
27 PERAMAX - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 0.5|CASE NO BID NO BID|] CAL-TEC9%|  NOBID $385.00 $192.50]°
28 KNIFE PLUS - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2|case NO BID NO 8ID}{: $70.60| $141.20[|NECTAR $302.00 $604.00|-
: PERK UP SUBSTITUTE
2 PERK UP - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2|case NO BID NO BID|: $126.00] _$252.00}|RENOVA $400.00 ssoo.ool
30 POWER 23-0-0+MO - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6]CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID|  NO BIDJS|POWER 23-0-0 + MO NO BID NO BID
31 POWER 0-0-22 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2|case NO BID NO BID 0-0-25] _ $106.00] $212.00) $150.00) $300.00)
PK FIGHT 00 28
SUBSTITUTE ELE-
32 P K. FIGHT {{0-0-28) NO SUBSTITUTIONS 1{cAsE NO BID NO BID, MAX 0-0-30 $300.00 $300.00
CALPHLEX
SUBSTITUTE LIQUID
33 CALPHLEX - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 1|casE NO BID $225.00 $225.00
FULL MEASURE
34 TRICAL 35 SP - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 3|CASE NO BID! CAL TRICAL 35 SP NO BID, NO BID.
DEFENSE MAG
SUBSTITUTE ELE -
35 DEFENSEMAG - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 1.5|CAsE NO BID NO BID|:|MAX MAGNESIUM FI $165.00 $247.50
PROTESYN
36 PROTESYN - NO SUBSTITITIONS 1|CASE NO BID! SUBSTITUTE KENDAL $325.00 $325.00
UIME - GREENS - CALCITIC LIME - GREENS GRADE 50LB - "{GREENS GRADE
37 NO SUBSTITUTIONS 30|BAG $6.20 E|caLcimic uME $6.25 $187.50}:!
LIME - GREENS - DOLOMITIC LIME - GREENS GRADE GREENS GRADE
38 50LB - NO SUBSTITITIONS 30[BAG $5.75 $172.50|: DOLOMITIC LIME $5.80 $174.00 NO BID NO BID
SOIL CONDITIONERS - PRO CHOICE CERAMIC -
39 GRANULES 50LB - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 10[8AG NO BID! NO BID|: NO BID NO BID NO BID) NO BID
NSECTICIDE - PROVAUNT - INDOXACARB - 120Z CONT. -
40 20.0% ACTIVE INGREDIENT 6|BAG $85.00 $510.00 PROVAUNT $78.60 $471.60} NO BID, NO BID!
41 GREENS MICRONUTRIENTS - P-48 - NO SUBSTITITIONS 2pAiL NO BID! NO BID]. NO BID NO am




BID - 7549349

BID 7549349 STATE PARK GOLF COURSE
CHEMICALS
EH TURF HELENA TURF
JOHN DEERE SUPPLY, CHEMICAL ENHANCEMENTS
LANDSCAPES INC Co. ENTERPRISES
COMMENT/ITEM EXTENDED EXTENDE [|COMMENT/ITEM EXTENDED COMMENT/ITEM EXTENDED
PROPOSED UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE {D PRICE PROPOSED UNIT PRICE PRICE PROPOSED UNIT PRICE PRICE
LINE DESCRIPTION QUANTITY uom
SPECTATOR ULTRA
SUBSTITUTE
SPECTATOR ULTRA - PROPICONAZOLE 1 GAL 14.3% PROPICONAZOLE
1 ACTIVE INGREDIENT - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6|BAG $62.00] $372.00|5|14.3% $60.45 NO BID NO BID
EMERALD - BOSCOLID .49 LB PACKETS 70.0% ACTIVE
2 INGREDIENT 20]EACH agency product $145.40f $2,508.00 $145.04 $2,900.80 NO BID NO BID
PRODIGY SIGNATURE - ALUMINUM TRIS - 5.5 LBS
3 80.0% ACTIVE INGREDIENT - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 241EACH FOSETYL - Al $81.62 $77.51 $1,860.28 NO BID NO BID
MANICURE ULTRA - CHOROTHALONIL 5L8 82.5%
4 ACTIVE INGREDIENT - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 40{BAG $23.45 $45.00 NO BID NO BID
T-STORM THIOPHANANTE METHYL 2.5 GSLLON 46.2%
5 ACTIVE INGREDIENT 4|JuG $166.70 $143.50 NO BID NO BID
TRINITY TRITICONAZOLE 2.5 GALLON 19.2% ACTIVE
6 INGREDIENT NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2|CONTAINER $430.00 $430.56 NO BID NO BID
DISARM 480 S - FLUOXASTROBIN 160UNCES 40.3%
7 ACTIVE INGREDIENT - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 4|CONTAINER $288.00 $285.91, NO BID NO BID
-
MEDALLION - FLUDIOXONIL O.5GAL 11.80 % ACTIVE
8 INGREDIENT - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6|CASE agency product $255.25 $550.00 NO BID NO BiD
SECURE - FLUAZINAM 1/2 GALLON 40.0% ACTIVE
9 INFREDIENT - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6]GALLON agency product NO BiD $290.50 NO BID NO BID
CHIPCO 26 GT
CGUOC 26 GT - IPRODIONE 2.5 GALLON 23.3% ACTIVE SUBSTITUTE 1PRO
10 INGREDIENT - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 4|GALLON $118.00 - $293.13 NO BID NO BID
INSECTICIDE - MERIT - IMIDACLOPRID 2F 1 GALLON
11 21.4% ACTIVE INGREDIENT 4|GALLON BANDIT 2F 1 GAL $57.29 NO BID NO BID
12 INSECTICIDE - MERIT - GRANULAR BAGS 30 LBS 10|BAG BANDIT 5G 30 LBS $22.49 $22.43 NO BID NO BID
CROSSCHECK PLUS
13 BIFENTHRIN 1 GALLON 4]GALLON 1GAL $36.00 $31.63 NO BID NO BID
DYLOX - TRICHLORFON 2.5 GALLON 37.3% ACTIVE
14 INGREDIENT - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2JCONTAINER $169.38 $338.76 $142.75: NO BiD, NO BID
15 HERBICIDE - DIMENSION 2.5 GAL - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2|CONTAINER 2EW $500.00| $1,000.0f $531.25 $1,062.50 : NO BID NO 8ID
TUPERSAN - SIDURON 4 LBS 50.0% - NO s
16 SUBSTITUTIONS 10{BAG $139.00| $1,390.0f $101.10 $1,010.99 NO BID NO BID
. COLORANTS - LESCO TRACKER BLUE 4.9 LB - NO UPER SIGNAL SPRAY INDICATOR N
17 SUBSTITUTIONS 2|CASE BLUEGLB $175.00]  $350.00 % WSP 6.7 LBS/CASE $280.00 $560.00} NO BID NO BID|
LESCO WET PLUS -
WETTING AGENT - LESCO WET PLUS 2.5 GAL - NO AQUATROLS SUBSTITUTE SOAKER
18 SUBSTITUTIONS 4]|CASE $164.63]  $658.52|F|PLUS $87.50 NO BID. NO BID

PAGE 1 0OF 2



