State of Rhode Island, Department of Administration
Division of Purchases

One Capitol Hill

Providence, Rhode Island 02908
www.purchasing.ri.gov (401)574-8100

This solicitation has been awarded to the following vendor(s):

Vendor Name PO Number

EH TURF SUPPLY INC 3410297
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I
GRANULAR FERTILIZERS - Price per 501b Bag

PRICE

PRICE

PRICE

PRICE

Fertilizer product having 20-30% Nitrogen by weight and must also include
potassium. Product must contain at least 50% siowly available Nitrogen
using Umaxx®, Uflexx®, MESA® or particle coating technology other than
sulfur. Product must be suitable for use on turfgrasses. Particle SGN alalysis
must be between 140 and 190. DELIVERED. Include product {abel with
Bid.

50

Bag

$ 31.00

1,5650.00

$ 27.00

$ 1,350.00

Starter fertilizer product containing minimum 20-30% Phosphates by weight,
also containing nitrogen and potassium. Nitrogen sources, if present, must
be slowly available derived from Umaxx®, Uflexx®, MESA® or particle coating
technology other than sulfur. Product must be suitable for use on
turfgrasses. Particle SGN size must be between 140 and 190. DELIVERED.
Include product label with Bid.

50

Bag

$ 18.75

937.50

NO BID

NO BID

Fertilizer product having a minimum 30% Nitrogen by weight and must also
include potassium. Product must contain at least 50% slowly available
Nitrogen using Umaxx®, Uflexx®, MESA® or particle coating technology
other than sulfur. Product must be suitabie for use on turfgrasses. Particle
SGN size must be between 140 and 190. DELIVERED. Include product
label with Bid.

50

Bag

$ 23.35

1,167.50

$ 2215

$ 1,107.50

Fertilizer product containing postemergent broadleaf herbicides and
preemergent herbicide. Product must include nitrogen and potassium
sources, dithiopyr, and broadleaf herbicide. Product must be suitable for use
on turfgrasses. Particle SGN size must be between 140 and 250.
DELIVERED. Include product label with Bid.

50

Bag

$ 37.50

1,875.00

$ 1,863.00

Fertilizer product containing imidacloprid insecticide. Product must also
include nitrogen and potassium sources. Product must be suitable for use on
turfgrasses. Particle SGN size must be between 140 and 250. DELIVERED.
Include product label with Bid.

50

Bag

$ 26.42

1,321.00

$ 24.81

$ 1,240.50

Milorganite 6-2-0 fertilizer or similar biosotid fertilizer containing
approximately 4% iron. Product must be suitable for use on turfgrasses.
DELIVERED. Include product label with bid.

10

Bag

$ 13.70

137.00

$ 11.90

3 119.00

SOLU-CAL lime. Product must contain uitra-fine ground pelletized calcium
carbonate (38%), and also containing polyhydroxycarboxylic acid (2%).
Product must be suitable for use on turfgrasses. DELIVERED. Include

200

Bag

$ 12.50

2,500.00

$ 12.50

$ 2,500.00

product tabel with bid.
|

LIQUID FERTILIZERS - Price per Container

Growth Products: Starter Plus 8-32-5. 55 Gallon Drum DELIVERED. Include
product label with bid.

Drum

$ 1,200.00

1,200.00

NO BID

NO BID

]
Growth Products: TKO Phosphite solution 0-29-26, 55 Gallon Drum
DELIVERED. Include product label with bid.

[

Drum

$ 1,750.00

1,750.00

$978.57/ 30 GAL
DRUM

$ 1,957.14

10

Growth Products: 20-3-3 Quick Response. 55 Gallon Drum DELIVERED.,
Include product label with bid.

10

Drum

$ 715.00

7,150.00

NO BID

NO BID

Growth Products: Nitro 30 SRN 30-0-0. 55 Gallon Drum DELIVERED.
Include product label with bid.

10

Drum

$ 795.00

7,950.00

$504.07/30 GAL
DRUM

$ 8,677.33

Growth Products: X-Xtra Iron 6-0-0 w/ 9% Iron 55 Gallon Drum DELIVERED.
Include product label with bid.

Drum

$ 880.00

880.00

$ 595.50

$ 596.50

Growth Products: Re-Store Plus 3-0-2 55 Galton Drum DELIVERED.
Include product label with bid.

Drum

$ 1,650.00

1,650.00

NO BID

NO BID
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