State of Rhode Island, Department of Administration
Division of Purchases

One Capitol Hill

Providence, Rhode Island 02908
www.purchasing.ri.gov (401)574-8100

This solicitation has been awarded to the following vendor(s):

Vendor Name PO Number

LAWN BEAUTICIANS INC 3407381



Solicitation No. 7549203 |

I

[

Titled: Provide Material, Equipment and Labor to Mechanically Apply Shredded Bark Mulch

Solicitation Closing Date & Time; 12-Jan- 2015 @ 10;00 AM

Vendor(s) Proposals

Superior Lawn
Maintenance

The Lawn
Beauticians Inc.

Mulch & More

Line

Description

Qty

Unit

Unit Price

Total

Unit Price

Total

Unit Price

Total

2/1/15 - 12/31/15; Provide material, equipment and
labor to mechanically apply shredded bark mulch
prior to commencement in mid-May. Vendor to
supply mulch per the specifications.

450

Cubic Yard

$50.00

$ 22,500.00

$48.00

$21,600.00

no bid

2/1/15 - 12/31/15; Alternate to item 1: Provide
equipment and labor only to mechanically apply
shredded bark mulch prior to commencement in mid-|
May. URI to supply mulch per the specifications.

450

Cubic Yard

$30.00

$13,500.00

$28.00

$12,600.00

no bid

2/1/15 - 12/31/15; Provide material, equipment and
labor to mechanically apply shredded bark mulch as
needed. Vendor to supply mulch. Installed by
vendor for the term of the contract. Quantity will
vary depending on the need.

50

Cubic Yard

$50.00

$ 2,500.00

$48.00

$ 2,400.00

no bid

2/1/15 - 12/31/15; Alternate to item 3: Provide
equipment and labor only to mechanically apply
shredded bark mulch as needed. URI to supply
mulch. Installed by vendor for the term of the
contract. Quantity will vary depending on the need.

50

Cubic Yard

$30.00

$ 1,500.00

$28.00

$ 1,400.00

no bid

2/1/15 - 12/31/15; Furnish and deliver mulch only to
URI Kingston Campus. URI will apply mulch.

50

Cubic Yard

$22.00

$ 1,100.00

$25.00

$ 1,250.00

$ 18.00

2/1/5 - 12/31/15 Provide material, equipment and
labor to mechanically apply Playground mulch as
needed. Vendor to supply mulch. Installed by
vendor for the term of the contract. Quantity will
vary depending on the need.

30

Cubic Yard

$60.00

$ 1,800.00

$55.00

$ 1,650.00

no bid

1/1/16 - 12/31/16; Provide material, equipment and
labor to mechanically apply shredded bark muich
prior to commencement in mid-May. Vendor to
supply mulch per the specifications.

450

Cubic Yard

$52.00

$ 23,400.00

$48.00

$21,600.00

no bid

1/1/16 - 12/31/16; Alternate toitem 7: Provide
equipment and labor only to mechanically apply
shredded bark mulch prior to commencement in mid-|
May. URI to supply mulch per the specifications.

450

Cubic Yard

$32.00

$ 14,400.00

$28.00

$12,600.00

no bid

1/1/16 - 12/31/16; Provide material, equipment and
labor to mechanically apply shredded bark muich as
needed. Vendor to supply mulch. Installed by
vendor for the term of the contract. Quantity will
vary depending on the need.

50

Cubic Yard

$52.00

$ 2,600.00

$48.00

$ 2,400.00

no bid

10

1/1/16 - 12/31/16; Alternate to item 9: Provide
equipment and Iabor only to mechanically apply
shredded bark mulch as needed. URI to supply
mulch. Installed by vendor for the term of the
contract. Quantity will vary depending on the need.

50

Cubic Yard

$32.00

$ 1,600.00

$28.00

$ 1,400.00

no bid

11

1/1/16 - 12/31/16; Furnish and deliver mulch only to
URI Kingston Campus. URI will apply mulch.

50

Cubic Yard

$23.00

$ 1,150.00

$25.00

$ 1,250.00

$ 18.00

12

1/1/16 - 12/31/16 Provide material, equipment and
labor to mechanically apply Playground mulch as
needed. Vendor to supply mulch. Installed by
vendor for the term of the contract. Quantity will
vary depending on the need.

30

Cubic Yard

$63.00

$ 1,850.00

$55.00

$ 1,650.00

no bid




