STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Department of Administration
DIVISION OF PURCHASES
One Capitol Hill

Providence, R1 02908-5855

Tel: (401) 574-8100
Fax: (401) 574-8387
Website: www.purchasing.ri.gov

CONTRACT USER GUIDE
WINTER SAND
MASTER PRICE AGREEMENT (“MPA”) #123

CONTRACT TERM 11/1/2014 - 10/31/2015
WITH 1 RENEWAL OPTION(S) FOR 1-YEAR TERM(S) AT THE SOLE OPTION OF
THE STATE

BACKGROUND:
This Master Price Agreement has been established as a result of Public Solicitation #7549082
and has yielded four (4) awards.

CONTRACT SUMMARY:
The pricing structure for this MPA is based on regional divisions in accordance with the
Department of Transportation’s Maintenance Division. Pricing is attached.

WHO CAN USE THIS CONTRACT:

STATEWIDE APPLICABILITY - Political Subdivisions (cities, towns, schools, quasi-
public agencies), as authorized by law, may participate in this Agreement. All ordering and
billing shall be between the vendor and the political subdivision (only).

State agencies using this MPA are to utilize the lowest price vendor for the related line item
type to be ordered. State agencies are not required to get three quotes from this award before
issuing an order.

VENDOR AWARDS CONTACT INFORMATION:

Purchase Order # 3401658

Vendor Name: Cardi Corporation
Contact Name: Carl Engle
Tel: 401-793-8300
Email: sacardi@cardi.com

Purchase Order # 3401671

Vendor Name: Material Sand & Stone Corporation
Contact Name: Raymond Gaboury
Tel: 401-232-3010

Email: ray@materialconcrete.com



STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Department of Administration
DIVISION OF PURCHASES
One Capitol Hill

Providence, R1 02908-5855

Tel: (401) 574-8100
Fax: (401) 574-8387
Website: www.purchasing.ri.gov

Purchase Order # 3401653

Vendor Name: Drybridge Sand & Stone Co.
Contact Name: Mark Hawkins
Tel: 401-232-3010
Email: jeemhawk@aol.com

Purchase Order #3401640

Vendor Name: P J Keating Company
Contact Name:  Michael Yaseen
Tel: 401-942-7300
Email: myaseen@pjkeating.com

ALL ATTACHMENTS ARE DENOTED BY X, AND APPEAR IN THE FOLLOWING
ORDER:

CONTRACT USER GUIDE

SAMPLE AGENCY NOTIFICATION LETTER TO VENDOR

CHANGE ORDER TO ORIGINAL PURCHASE

ALL PR'OR CHANGE ORDERS TO OR'G'NAL PURCHASE (sequential order is most recent to #1)
ORIGINAL PURCHASE AWARD (VENDOR AWARD)

VENDOR AMENDMENT/S

PRODUCT AND PRICING (IF NOT INCLUDED ON PURCHASE ORDER)

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS

TERMS AND CONDITIONS

SUPPLEMENTAL ANALYSIS INFO - SEE MPA SEARCH RESULTS WEBPAGE
OTHER - DESCRIPTION:

OO0XOOOOoOoodX

DIVISION OF PURCHASES CONTACT:
Name: Lisa Hill

Title:  Chief Buyer

Tel: 401-574-8118

Email: lisa.hill@purchasing.ri.gov



Material Sand &
Stone Corp.

Cardi
Corporation

P J Keating
Company

Drybridge Sand
and Stone Inc.

Line

Description

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 - Winter Sand - Northwest Division -
Includes Gloster (Appox 3,000 Tons) Clayville (Approx
1,700 Tons)

S 15.72

16.96

no bid

no bid

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 - Winter Sand - Providence Division -
(Lincoln (Approx 5,400 Tons), Smithfield (RT 116 & 7)
Approx 4,000 Tons), RT 6 & 295 9Approx 2,000 Tons),
Smithfield & 295 GWHighway (2,000 Tons)

S 14.47

16.49

no bid

S 18.78

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 Winter Sand Kent Division, RT 37
Jefferson Blvd. (Approx 1,700 Tons) Mid State (Approx
4,500 Tons) Summit Stockpile (Approx 500)

no bid

13.39

14.25

no bid

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 -Winter Sand - Washington North
Division (includes 4 & 4A) - Belleville (Aproxx 4,100
Tons) Dillons Corner (Aproxx 700 Tons)

no bid

no bid

15.50

S 16.49

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 -Winter Sand - Washington South
Division - Hope Valley (Approx 1,500 Tons) Westerly
(Approx 1,200 Tons) Charlestown (Approx 1,000 Tons)

no bid

no bid

no bid

S 16.49

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 - Winter Sand - Newport Division -
Porthsmouth (Approx 1,500 Tons) Lawton Valley
(Approx 500 Tons) Little Compton (approx 1,000 Tons)
Warren Yard (approx 500 Tons)

no bid

19.98

no bid

S 19.39

11/1/14 - 10/31/15 - Winter Sand Bristol Division - East
Shore Expressway (Approx 2,200 Tons) Pawtucket

Stockpile (Aproxx 300 Tons)

S 17.63

14.10

15.50

no bid
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